
 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 1 of 19 

 

ORDINANCE NO. 2024-034 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

WOLFFORTH, TEXAS, AMENDING CHAPTER 3, ARTICLE I – 

PLUMBING REGULATIONS OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES BY 

ADOPTING THE 2021 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING 

CODE, PROVIDING A SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR 

THE REPEAL OF ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH; 

PROVIDING FOR PUBLICATION; AND PROVIDING FOR AN 

EFFECTIVE DATE. 

 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WOLFFORTH, TEXAS, 

THAT: 

Part 1. Enacted 

 

THAT, Chapter 3, Article I PLUMBING REGULATIONS of the Code of Ordinances is hereby 

amended by amending Sec. 3.01.001, which shall read as follows: 

 

Sec. 3.01.001 Adoption of Code 

 

The International Plumbing Code, 2021 edition, as published by the International Code 

Council, is hereby adopted by reference as the city plumbing code as if fully set out in this article 

with the additions, deletions, insertions and changes as follows.  

 

Amendments- 

(a) Protection against physical damage. Section 305.6 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

305.6 Protection against physical damage. In concealed locations where piping, other than cast 

iron or galvanized steel, is installed through holes or notches in studs, joints, rafters or similar 

members less than 1.5 inches (38 mm) from the nearest edge of the member, the pipe shall be 

protected by steel shield plates. Such shield plates shall have a thickness of not less than 0.0575 

inch (1.463 mm) (No. 16 gage). Such plates shall cover the area of the pipe where the member is 

notched or bored. 

(b) Over-excavation. Section 306.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

306.2.1 Over-excavation. Where trenches arc excavated below the installation level of the pipe 

such that the bottom of the trench does not form the bed for the pipe, the trench shall be 

backfilled to the installation level of the bottom of the pipe placed in layers of 6 inches (152 mm) 

maximum depth and such backfill shall be compacted after each placement. The backfill material 

may consist of sand or fine gravel, or excavated material that complies with Section 306.3. 

(c) Drainage and vent water test. Section 312.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

312.2 Drainage and vent water test. A water test shall be applied to the drainage system either in 

its entirety or in sections. If applied to the entire system, all openings in the piping shall be 

tightly closed, except the highest opening, and the system shall be filled with water to the point 

of overflow. If the system is tested in sections, each opening shall be tightly plugged except the 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 2 of 19 

 

highest openings of the section under test, and each section shall be filled with water, but no 

section shall be tested with less than a 5-foot (1524 mm) head of water above floor height. In 

testing successive sections, at least the upper 10 feet (3048 mm) of the next preceding section 

shall be tested so that no joint or pipe in the building, except the uppermost 10 feet (3048 mm) of 

the system, shall have been submitted to a test of less than a 5-foot head of water above floor 

height. The water shall be kept in the system, or in the portion under test, for at least 15 minutes 

before inspection starts. The system shall then be tight at all points. 

(d) Gravity sewer test. Section 312.6 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

312.6 Gravity sewer test. Gravity sewer tests shall consist of plugging the end of the building 

sewer at the point of connection with the public sewer, filling the building sewer with water, 

testing with not less than a 5-foot (1524 mm) head of water and maintaining such pressure for 15 

minutes. 

(e) Ductless mini-split system traps. Section 314.2.4.1 is hereby deleted in its entirety. 

(f) Sheet lead. Section 402.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

402.4 Sheet lead. Sheet lead for pans shall not weigh less than two and one-half (2-1/2) pounds 

per square foot (12.2 kg/m2) and shall be coated with an asphalt paint or other approved coating. 

(g) Sheet lead. Section 421.5.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

421.5.2.3 Sheet lead. Sheet lead shall weigh not less than two and one-half (2- 1 /2) pounds per 

square foot (12.2 kg/m2) and shall be coated with an asphalt paint or other approved coating. 

The lead sheet shall be insulated from conducting substances other than the connecting drain by 

15-pound (6.80 kg) asphalt felt or an equivalent. Sheet lead shall be joined by burning. 

(h) Water hammer. Section 604.9 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

604.9 Water hammer. The flow velocity of the water distribution system shall be controlled to 

reduce the possibility of water hammer. An air chamber or a water­ hammer arrestor shall be 

installed where quick-closing valves are utilized, unless otherwise approved. Water-hammer 

arrestors shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions. Water-hammer 

arrestors shall conform to ASSE 1010. 

(i) Solvent cementing. Section 605.2 l.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

605.21.3 Solvent cementing. Joint surfaces shall be clean and free from moisture. A purple 

primer that conforms to ASTM F656 shall be applied. Clear primer in lieu of purple is acceptable 

where joints are accessible. Solvent cement not purple in color and conforming to ASTM D2564 

or CSA CAN/CSA-B 137.3 shall be applied to all joint surfaces. The joint shall be made while 

the cement is wet and shall be in accordance with ASTM D2855. Solvent-cement joints shall be 

permitted above or below ground. 

(j) Location of full-open valves. Section 606.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

606.1  Location of full-open valves. Full-open valves shall be installed in the following 

locations: 

1. On the building water service pipe from the public water supply. 

2. On the water distribution supply pipe at the entrance into the structure if the water 

meter is more than 100 feet from the building. 

3. On the water supply pipe to a gravity or pressurized water tank. 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 3 of 19 

 

4. On the water supply pipe to every water heater. 

(k) Location of shutoff valves. Section 606.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

606.2  Location of shutoff valves. Shutoff valves shall be installed in the following locations: 

1. On the fixture supply to each plumbing fixture in other than bathtubs and showers in 

one- and two-family and multiple-family residential occupancies, and other than in 

individual sleeping units that are provided with unit shutoff valves in hotels, motels, 

boarding houses and similar occupancies. 

2. On the water supply pipe to each appliance or mechanical equipment. 

(l) Slope of horizontal drainage pipe. Table 704.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

TABLE 704.1 

SLOPE OF HORIZONTAL DRAINAGE PIPE 

 

Size (inches)                                       Minimum slope (inch per foot) 

                          2-1/2 or less      1/4a   

        3 to 5     1/8a 

                6 or larger      1/16a 

a. Slopes for piping draining to a grease interceptor shall comply with Section 704.1. 

(m) Solvent cementing. Section 705.10.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

705.10.2 Solvent cementing. Joint surfaces shall be clean and free from moisture. A purple 

primer that conforms to ASTM F656 shall be applied. Clear primer in lieu of purple primer is 

acceptable where joints are accessible. Solvent cement not purple in color and conforming to 

ASTM D2564 CSA CAN/CSA- 8137.3, CSA CAN/CSA-8181.2 or CSA CAN/CSA-BV182.1 

shall be applied to all joint surfaces. The joint shall be made while the cement is wet and shall be 

in accordance with ASTM D2855. Solvent-cement joints shall be permitted above or below 

ground. 

Exception: A primer is not required where both of the following conditions apply: 

1. The solvent cement used is third-party certified as conforming to ASTM D2564. 

2. The solvent cement is used only for joining PVC drain, waste and vent pipe and 

fittings in non-pressure applications in sizes up to and including 4 inches (102 mm) in 

diameter. 

(n) Installation of fittings. Section 706.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

706.3 Installation of fitting. Fittings shall be installed to guide sewage and waste in the direction 

of flow. Change in direction shall be made by fittings installed in accordance with Table 706.3. 

Change in direction by combination fittings, side inlets or increasers shall be installed in 

accordance with Table 706.3 based on the pattern of flow created by the fitting. Double sanitary 

tee patterns shall not receive the discharge of back-to-back water closets and fixtures or 

appliances with pumping action discharge. 

(o) Building drains and sewers. Table 710.1(1) is hereby amended to read as follows: 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 4 of 19 

 

 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 5 of 19 

 

 

(p) Roof extension unprotected. Section 903.1. l is hereby amended to read as follows: 

903.1.1 Roof extension unprotected. Open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be 

terminated not less than 10 inches (254 mm) above the roof. 

(q) Storm drainage-general (tests). Section 1101.4 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1101.4 Tests. The building storm drain shall be tested in accordance with Section 312 and within 

the building only and shall not require 5-foot head, but roof drain level only. 

(r) Roof design. Section 1101.7 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

1101.7 Roof design. Roofs shall be designed for the maximum possible depth of water that wit I 

pond thereon as determined by the relative levels of roof deck and overflow weirs, scuppers, 

edges or serviceable drains in combination with the deflected structural elements in accordance 

with Section 1611 of the International Building Code. In determining the maximum possible 

depth or water, all primary roof drainage means shall be assumed to be blocked. The maximum 

possible depth of water on the roof shall include the height or the water required above the inlet 

of the secondary roof drainage means to achieve the required flow rate of the secondary drainage 

means to accommodate the design rainfall as required by Section 1106. 

(w) Strainers. A new Section 1105.3 is hereby added to read as follows: 

1105.3 Strainers. Roof drains shall have strainers extending not less than 4 inches (102 mm) 

above the surface of the roof immediately adjacent to the roof drain. Strainers shall have an 

available inlet area, above roof level, of not less than one and one-half times the area of the 

conductor or leader to which the drain is connected. 

(x) Flat decks. A new Section 1105.4 is hereby added to read as follows: 

1105.4 Flat decks. Roof drain strainers for use on sun decks, parking decks and similar areas that 

are normally serviced and maintained shall comply with Section 1105.3 or shall be of the flat-



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 6 of 19 

 

surface type, installed level with the deck, with an available inlet area not less than two times the 

area of the conductor or leader to which the drain is connected. 

(y) Size of conductors, leaders and storm drains. Section 1106 is hereby deleted and replaced 

with the following: 

SECTION 1106 

SIZE OF CONDUCTORS, LEADERS AND STORM DRAINS 

1106. l General. The size of the vertical conductors and leaders, building storm drains, building 

storm sewers, and any horizontal branches of such drains or sewers in Wolfforth, Texas, shall be 

based on a minimum 100-ycar hourly rainfall rate of 3.3 inches (84 mm) per hour. 

1106.2 Vertical conductors and leaders. Vertical conductors and leaders shall be sized for the 

maximum projected roof area, in accordance with Table Ll106.2(1) and Table L1106.2(2). 

TABLE L1106.2(1) 

SIZE OF CIRCULAR VERTICAL CONDUCTORS AND LEADERS 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

         Diameter of leader  Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 

 

a. Sizes indicated are the diameter of circular piping. This table is applicable to piping of other 

shapes, provided the cross-sectional shape fully encloses a circle of the diameter indicated in this 

table. For rectangular leaders, sec Table L1106.2(2). Interpolation is permitted for pipe sizes that 

fall between those listed in this table. 

b. The Rate of Rainfall for Wolfforth, Texas, is 3.3 inches per hour, as shown in Appendix B of 

the 2021 International Plumbing Code. 

TABLE Ll106.2(2) 

SIZE OF RECTANGULAR VERTICAL CONDUCTORS AND LEADERS 

 

Dimensions Of Common   Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet)  

   Leader Sizes width x     Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 7 of 19 

 

             length  

    

  (inches)a,b       3      3.3     4 

 1-3/4 x 2-1/2   1,130   1,046   850 

    2 x 3   1,840   1,702   1,380 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

TABLE L1106.2(1) 

SIZE OF CIRCULAR VERTICAL CONDUCTORS AND LEADERS 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

         Diameter of leader  Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 8 of 19 

 

 

a. Sizes indicated are nominal width x length of the opening for rectangular piping. 

b. For shapes not included in this table, Equation 11-1 shall be used to determine the equivalent 

circular diameter, De, of rectangular piping for use in interpolation using the data from Table 

L1106.2(l). 

De (width x length) 1/2 (Equation 11-1)  

where: 

De = equivalent circular diameter; De, width, and length are in inches. 

c. The Rate of Rainfall for Wolfforth, Texas, is 3.3 inches per hour, as shown. 

 

 

 

TABLE L1106.2(1) 

SIZE OF CIRCULAR VERTICAL CONDUCTORS AND LEADERS 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

         Diameter of leader  Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 

  (inches)a       3      3.3     4 

 a. in Appendix B of the 2021 International Plumbing Code. 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 9 of 19 

 

1106.3 Building storm drains and sewers. The size of the building storm drain, building storm 

sewer and their horizontal branches having a slope of one-half unit or less vertical in 12 units 

horizontal (4-perccnt slope) shall be based on the maximum projected roof area in accordance 

with Table L1106.3. The slope of horizontal branches shall be not less than one-eighth unit 

vertical in 12 units horizontal (I-percent slope) unless otherwise approved. 

 

TABLE Ll106.3 

SIZE OF HORIZONTAL STORM DRAINAGE PIPING 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

        Size of Horizontal Piping  Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 

 Inches    3           3.3  4 

*1/8 unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1 percent slope) 

 

 

 

TABLE L1106.3 

SIZE OF HORIZONTAL STORM DRAINAGE PIPING 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

        Size of Horizontal Piping  Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 10 of 19 

 

 

 

 

TABLE L1106.3 

SIZE OF HORIZONTAL STORM DRAINAGE PIPING 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

        Size of Horizontal Piping  Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 11 of 19 

 

 

1106.4 Vertical walls. In sizing roof drains and storm drainage piping, one-half of the area of any 

vertical wall that diverts rainwater to the roof shall be added to the projected roof area for 

inclusion in calculating the required size of vertical conductors, leaders and horizontal storm 

drainage piping. 

1106.5 Parapet wall scupper location. Parapet wall roof drainage scupper and overflow scupper 

location shall comply with the requirements of Section 1502 of the International Building Code. 

1106.6 Size of roof gutters. The size of semicircular gutters shall be based on the maximum 

projected roof area in accordance with Table L1106.6. 

TABLE L1106.6 

SIZE OF SEMICIRCULAR ROOF GUTTERS 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

        Size of Horizontal Piping  Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 

 Inches    3           3.3  4 

*1/16 unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (0.5 percent slope) 

 

 

 

TABLE L1106.6 

SIZE OF SEMICIRCULAR ROOF GUTTERS 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

             Diameter of Gutters   Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 12 of 19 

 

 

 

 

TABLE L1106.6 

SIZE OF SEMICIRCULAR ROOF GUTTERS 

Horizontally Projected Roof Area (square feet) 

             Diameter of Gutters   Rainfall Rate (inches per hour) 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 13 of 19 

 

 

The rate of rainfall for Wolfforth, Texas, is 3.3 inches per hour, as shown in appendix B of the 

2021 International Plumbing Code. 

(z) Secondary (Emergency) Roof Drains. Section 1108 is hereby deleted and replaced with the 

following: 

SECTION 1108 

SECONDARY (EMERGENCY) ROOF DRAINS 

 

1108.1 Secondary (emergency overflow) drains or scuppers. Where roof drains are required, 

secondary (emergency overflow) roof drains or scuppers shall be provided where the roof 

perimeter construction extends above the roof in such a manner that water will be entrapped if 

the primary drains allow buildup for any reason. 

1108.2 Separate systems required. Secondary roof drain systems shall have the end point of 

discharge separate from the primary system. Discharge shall be above grade, in a location that 

would normally be observed by the building occupants or maintenance personnel. 

1108.3 Sizing of secondary drains. Secondary (emergency) roof drain systems shall be sized in 

accordance with Section 1106 based on the rainfall rate for which the primary system is sized in 

Tables L1106.2(l), L1106.2(2), L1106.3 and LI 106.6. Scuppers shall be sized to prevent the 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 14 of 19 

 

depth of ponding water from exceeding that for which the roof was designed as determined by 

Section 1101.7. Scuppers shall be sized in accordance with Tables L1108.3(1) and L1108.3(2) so 

that the rain load on the roof docs not exceed 20 psf. Notify the structural engineer when the roof 

and wall areas contributing to the scuppers exceed the values shown in Table L1108.3(2) so that 

the structure can be designed for increased rain load. Scuppers shall have an opening dimension 

of not less than 4 inches (102 mm). The flow through the primary system shall not be considered 

when sizing the secondary roof drain system. 

 

 

 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 15 of 19 

 

 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 16 of 19 

 

 

A - Maximum allowable horizontally-projected roof areas plus one-half of the vertical wall areas 

contributing to the roof drainage area so that the maximum rain load on the roof, R, does not 

exceed 20 psf. 

ds = Depth of rainwater from the primary roof drain up to the bottom of the scupper inlet (also 

referred to as static head), inches. For this Table: ds = 2". 

11 = Maximum depth of additional rainwater above the bottom of the scupper inlet (also referred 

to as I hydraulic I lead), inches. For this Table: 11 = l .846" maximum. 

(11 = 20 psf/5.2 psf/in. of thickness - ds = 3.846" -2" - 1.846") 

i = The rate of rainfall for Wolfforth, Texas is 3.3 inches per hour, as shown in Appendix B of 

the 202 l IPC. The rate of rainfall is based on a storm of one hour duration and a 100-year return 

period. 

 

 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 17 of 19 

 

 

Q = 3.33 x (L – 0.2 x H) x H1.5 A = Q/i 

Q = Flow rate through the scupper, gallons per minute (gpm) 

Note: the minimum scupper height shall be 4”.  Scupper heights greater than 4” do not change 

the values in the table. 

(aa) Combined Sanitary and Storm Public Sewer. Section 1109 is hereby deleted in its entirety. 

(bb) Medical gas certification. Section 1202 is hereby amended by adding a new Section 1202.2, 

as follows: 

1202.2 Certification required. A medical gas certification must be furnished to the building 

inspection department before a final inspection will be approved. 

 

Part 2. Open Meetings Act 

 

This meeting was open to the public as required by law and that public notice of the time, place, 

and purpose of said meeting was given as required. 

 

Part 3. Severability Clause 

 

If any section, sub-section, clause, phrase, or portion of this ordinance shall be held 

unconstitutional or invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such section, sub-section, 

sentence, clause, phrase, or portion shall be deemed to be a separate, distinct and independent 

provision and such invalidity shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions.   

 

Part 4. Repeal 

 

All ordinances or parts of ordinances and sections of any of the City Code of Ordinances in conflict 

with this Ordinance are hereby repealed. 

 

 

 

Part 5.  Effect on Pending Proceedings 

 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-034 Adopting Plumbing Code      Page | 18 of 19 

 

 That nothing in this legislation or in the Plumbing Code hereby adopted shall be construed 

to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, 

or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed 

as cited in Part 4 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be 

lost, impaired or affected by this legislation. 

 

Part 6.  Publication  

 

The City Secretary is authorized and directed to publish the caption and penalty 

prescribed by this ordinance in accordance with State Law.  

 

Part 7.  Enforcement 

 

Any person, firm or individual who shall violate any of the provisions of this Ordinance 

shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction shall be fined not less than one dollar 

($1.00) or more than two thousand dollars ($2,000.00) in accordance with Code of Ordinance Sec. 

1.01.009.  Each day the violation continues shall constitute a separate and distinct offense. 

 

Part 8.  Effective Date  

 

 This Ordinance shall be in force and effect from and after October 1, 2024. 

 

 

CITY OF WOLFFORTH 

 

              

CHARLES ADDINGTON II, MAYOR 

 

ATTEST: 

 

________________________________________ 

Terri Robinette, City Secretary 

 


