
 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-033 Adopting Fire Code      Page | 1 of 9 

ORDINANCE NO. 2024-033 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 

WOLFFORTH, TEXAS, AMENDING CHAPTER 5, ARTICLE II –FIRE 

CODE OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES BY ADOPTING THE 2021 

EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, PROVIDING A 

SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF 

ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT HEREWITH; PROVIDING FOR 

PUBLICATION; AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 

 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF WOLFFORTH, TEXAS, 

THAT: 

Part 1. Enacted 

 

THAT, Chapter 5, Article II INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE of the Code of Ordinances is hereby 

amended by amending Sec. 5.02.001, which shall read as follows: 

 

Sec. 5.02.001 Adoption; purpose and intent 

 

A certain document, a copy of which is on file in the office of the city secretary, being 

marked and designated as the International Fire Code, 2021 edition, as published by the Interna-

tional Code Council, is hereby adopted as the fire code of the city for regulating and governing 

the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, 

handling and use of hazardous substances materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous 

to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises; providing for the issuance of 

permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 

conditions and terms of said fire code on file in the office of the city secretary are hereby referred 

to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this article, with the additions, deletions, 

insertions and changes, if any, prescribed in section 5.02.002 if this article.  

 

Sec. 5.02.002 Amendments 

 The following sections of the fire code are hereby amended as follows. 

Amendments: 

The provisions of the International Fire Code, 2021 edition, are hereby specifically amended as 

follows: 

(1) Marking. Section 503.3 is hereby amended by the addition of subsections 503.3.1, 503.3.2, 

503.3.3, and 503.3.4, to read as follows: 

503.3.1. Maintenance. The owner or person in control of any building for which fire lanes 

have been designated shall mark and maintain said fire lanes by painting stripes on the 

surface of said roadways to designate the fire lane for fire apparatus in accordance with 

the specifications of section 503.3 and in such a manner so as to be visible to a 

reasonably observant person. 

503.3.2. Specifications for marking. All required fire lanes shall be provided and 

maintained with fire lane striping which consists of a six (6) inch wide red background 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-033 Adopting Fire Code      Page | 2 of 9 

stripe with four (4) inch high white letters stating "FIRE LANE NO PARKING" or "NO 

PARKING FIRE LANE" to be painted upon the red stripe every forty (40) feet along the 

entire length of the fire lane, showing the exact boundary of the fire lane. The words 

"FIRE LANE NO PARKING" or "NO PARKING FIRE LANE" must be grouped 

together as a phrase. Separating the words "NO PARKING" and "FIRE LANE" spacing 

them forty (40) feet apart does not meet the intention of this section. Fire lane markings 

shall be upon the vertical surface of the curb unless otherwise approved by the chief. 

503.3.3.  Alternate markings. When, due to a building's particular use, the chief 

determines that fire lane markings are impractical, the words "LOADING ZONE/NO 

PARKING," painted black, may be substituted for the words "FIRE LANE/NO 

PARKING," and the six-inch (6") red stripe must be painted yellow, but all other 

provisions of chapter 5 shall apply. 

503.3.4. Alternate signs allowed or required. If the chief or authorized representative 

determines that other means of notice are ineffective to designate a fire lane, signs may 

be required by written notice to the property owner. These signs shall be in accordance 

with the requirements of the Texas Manual of Uniform Traffic-Control Devices. When 

required, these signs shall be erected and maintained bearing a red legend stating "No 

Parking Fire Lane" with letters of at least two inches (2") in height on a white reflective 

background at least twelve inches (12") wide by eighteen inches (18") tall. Signs shall be 

permanently affixed to a stationary post and the bottom of the sign shall be six feet, six 

inches (6' 6") above the finished grade. Signs shall be spaced not more than fifty feet 

(50') apart. Signs may be installed on permanent buildings or walls as approved by the 

chief or authorized representative. Additional signs may also be required by written 

notice from the chief. 

(2) Key boxes. Section 506 is hereby amended by the addition of subsection 506.1.1.1, to read as 

follows: 

506.1.1.1 Approved. When required by the fire department, a KNOX lock box, KNOX 

padlock, and/or KNOX key switch must be installed on any structure or gate at a location 

approved by the fire department. The key box shall contain keys as required by the code 

authority or his designee. 

(3) Delete Appendices J and L. 

(4) Section 105.6.25 is hereby amended by the addition of the paragraphs set forth below, to read 

as follows: 

A construction permit is required for the installation or modification of an electronic 

access control system, as specified in Chapter 5. A separate construction permit is 

required for the installation or modification of a fire alarm system that may be connected 

to the electronic access control system. 

Exception: Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered a 

modification and does not require a permit. 

(5) Definitions. The following definitions of Section 202 are hereby amended to read as 

follows: 

ATRIUM. A vertical space hat is enclosed at the top, connecting two or more stories in Group 1-

2 and 1-3 occupancies or three or more stories in all other occupancies. 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-033 Adopting Fire Code      Page | 3 of 9 

FIRE WATCH. A temporary measure intended to ensure continuous and systematic surveillance 

of a building or portion thereof by one or more qualified individuals or standby personnel when 

required by the fire code official, for the purposes of identifying and controlling fire hazards, 

detecting early signs of unwanted fire, raising an alarm of fire and notifying the fire department. 

STANDBY PERSONNEL. Qualified fire service personnel, approved by the Fire Code Official. 

When utilized, the number required shall be as directed by the Fire Code Official. Charges for 

utilization shall be as normally calculated by the jurisdiction. 

UPGRADED OR REPLACED FIRE ALARM SYSTEM. A fire alarm system that is upgraded 

or replaced includes, but is not limited to the following: 

• Replacing one single board or fire alarm control unit component with a newer model, 

• Installing a new fire alarm control unit in addition to or in place of an existing one 

• Conversion from a horn system to an emergency voice/alarm communication system, or 

• Conversion from a conventional system to one that utilizes addressable or analog 

devices. 

The following are not considered an upgrade or replacement: 

• Firmware updates 

• Software updates 

• Replacing boards of the same model with chips utilizing the same or newer firmware 

(6) Definitions. The first paragraph of the following definition in Section 202 is amended to read 

as follows: 

FIREWORKS. Any composition or device for the purpose of producing a visible or an audible 

effect for entertainment purposes by combustion, deflagration, or detonation, and/or activated by 

ignition with a match or other heat producing device that meets the definition of 1.3G fireworks 

or 1.4G fireworks. 

(7) Definitions. A new definition in Section 202 is hereby added as follows: 

DEFEND IN PLACE. A method of emergency response that engages building components and 

trained staff to provide occupant safety during an emergency. Emergency response involves 

remaining in place, relocating within the building, or both, without evacuating the building. 

(8) Prohibited open burning. Section 307.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

307.1.1 Prohibited open burning. Open burning shall be prohibited when: 

1. atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make such fires hazardous; 

2. the burning is offensive or objectionable because of smoke emissions. 

(9) Location open burning. 307.4, 307.4.1, and 307.4.4 are hereby amended to read as follows: 

307.4  Location. The location for open burning shall not be less than 300 feet (91 440 

mm) from any structure, and provisions shall be made to prevent the fire from spreading 

to within 300 feet (91 440 mm) of any structure. 

Exceptions:  

1. Delete 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-033 Adopting Fire Code      Page | 4 of 9 

2. Delete 

307.4.1 Bonfires. A bonfire shall not be conducted within 300 feet (91440 mm), or 

greater distance as determined by the fire code official, of a structure or combustible 

material, unless the fire is contained in a barbecue pit. Conditions that could cause a fire 

to spread within the required setback of a structure shall be eliminated prior to ignition. 

307.4.4 Permanent Outdoor Firepit. Permanently installed outdoor firepits for 

recreational fire purposes shall not be installed within 10 feet of a structure or 

combustible material. 

Exception: Permanently installed outdoor fireplaces constructed in accordance 

with the International Residential Code or International Building Code. 

(10) False and nuisance alarms. Section 401.5 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Section 401.5 False and nuisance alarms. False alarms and nuisance alarms shall not be given, 

signaled, transmitted, or caused or permitted to be given, signaled, or transmitted in any manner. 

(11) Dimensions. Section 503.2.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less 

than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance 

with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 14 feet (4267 mm). 

(12) Group F-1 distilled spirits. Section 903.2.4.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

903.2.4.2 Group F-1 distilled spirits. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout 

a Group F-1 fire area used for the manufacture of distilled spirits involving more than 120 

gallons of distilled spirits (>16% alcohol) in the fire area at any one time. 

(13) Group S- l distilled spirits or wine. Section 903.2.9.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

903.2.9.3 Group S-1 distilled spirits or wine. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided 

throughout a Group S-1 fire area used for the bulk storage of distilled spirits or wine involving 

more than 120 gallons of distilled spirits or wine (>16% alcohol) in the fire area at any one time. 

(14) NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. The first paragraph and exceptions thereto of Section 

903.3.1.2 is amended to read as follows: 

903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems in Group R occupancies 

shall be permitted to be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R where the Group R 

occupancy meets all of the following conditions: 

1. Four stories or less above grade plane. 

2. The floor level of the highest story is 35 feet (9144 10668 mm) or less above the 

lowest level of fire department vehicle access. 

3. The floor level of the lowest story is 35 feet (9144 10668 mm) or less below the lowest 

level of fire department vehicle access. 

The number of stories of Group R occupancies constructed in accordance with Sections 

510.2 and 510.4 of the International Building Code shall be measured from grade plane. 

(15) NFPA 13D Sprinkler Systems. Section 903.3.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-033 Adopting Fire Code      Page | 5 of 9 

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D Sprinkler Systems. Automatic sprinkler systems installed in one- and two-

family dwellings; Group R-3; Group R-4, Condition 1; and townhouses shall be permitted to be 

installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D or in accordance with state law. 

(16) Freeze protection. Section 903.3.1.4 is hereby amended by adding Subsections 903.3.1.4.1 

and 903.3.1.4.2 to read as follows: 

903.3.1.4 Freeze protection. Freeze protection systems for automatic fire sprinkler 

systems shall be in accordance with the requirements of the applicable referenced NFPA 

standard and this section. 

903.3.1.4.1 Attics. Only dry pipe, preaction, or listed antifreeze automatic fire sprinkler 

systems shall be allowed to protect attic spaces. 

Exception: Wet-pipe fire sprinkler systems shall be allowed to protect non-ventilated attic 

spaces where: 

1. The attic sprinklers are supplied by a separate floor control valve assembly to 

allow ease of draining the attic system without impairing sprinklers throughout 

the rest of the building, and 

2. Adequate heat shall be provided for freeze protection as per the applicable 

referenced NFPA standard, and 

3. The attic space is a part of the building's thermal, or heat, envelope, such that 

insulation is provided at the roof deck, rather than at the ceiling level. 

903.3.1.4.2 Heat trace/insulation. Heat trace/insulation shall only be allowed where 

approved by the fire code official for small sections of large diameter water-filled pipe. 

(17) Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. Section 903.4 is hereby amended by adding a 

second paragraph after the exceptions to read as follows: 

903.4 Sprinkler system supervision and alarms. 

Sprinkler and standpipe system water-flow detectors shall be provided for each floor tap to the 

sprinkler system and shall cause an alarm upon detection of water flow for more than 45 

seconds. All control valves in the sprinkler and standpipe systems except for fire department 

hose connection valves shall be electrically supervised to initiate a supervisory signal at the 

central station upon tampering. Buildings without a fire alarm system shall have their valves 

locked in their normal position. 

(18) Water supplies. 903.3.5 is hereby amended by adding a second paragraph to read as follows: 

903.3.5 Water supplies. 

Water supply as required for such systems shall be provided in accordance with the supply 

requirements of the respective standard; however, every water-based fire protection system shall 

be designed with a 10psi safety factor. Reference Section 507.4 for additional design 

requirements. 

(19) Group E. Section 907.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

907.2.3 Group E... A manual fire alarm system that initiates the occupant notification signal 

utilizing an emergency voice/alarm communication system meeting the requirements of Section 

907.5.2.2 and installed in accordance with Section 907.6 shall be installed in Group E 

educational occupancies. 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-033 Adopting Fire Code      Page | 6 of 9 

When automatic sprinkler systems or smoke detectors are installed, such systems or detectors 

shall be connected to the building fire alarm system. An approved smoke detection system shall 

be installed in Group E day care occupancies. Unless separated by a minimum of 501 open 

space, all buildings, whether portable buildings or the main building, will be considered one 

building for alarm occupant load consideration and interconnection of alarm systems. 

Exceptions: 

1. A manual fire alarm system shall not be required in Group E occupancies with an 

occupant load of 50 or less. 

1.1. Residential In-Home day care with not more than 12 children may use 

interconnected single station detectors in all habitable rooms. (For care of more 

than five children 2 1/2 or less years of age, see Section 907.2.6.) 

2. Emergency voice/alarm communication systems meeting the requirements of Section 

907.5.2.2 and installed in accordance with Section 907.6 shall not be required in Group E 

occupancies with occupant loads of 100 or less, provided that activation of the manual 

fire alarm system initiates an approved occupant notification signal in accordance with 

Section 907.5. 

3. Manual fire alarm boxes shall not be required in Group E occupancies where all of the 

following apply: 

3.1. Interior corridors are protected by smoke detectors. 

3.2. Auditoriums, cafeterias, gymnasiums and similar areas are protected by heat 

detectors or other approved detection devices. 

3.3. Shops and laboratories involving dusts or vapors are protected by heat 

detectors or other approved detection devices. 

3 4. Manual activation is provided from a normally occupied location. 

4. Manual fire alarm boxes shall not be required in Group E occupancies where all of the 

following apply:  

4.1. The building is equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler 

system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1. 

4.2. The emergency voice/alarm communication system will activate on sprinkler 

water flow. 

4.3. Manual activation is provided from a normally occupied location. 

(20) Construction. Section 1020.2 shall be hereby amended to read as follows: 

1020.2 Construction. Corridors shall be fire-resistance rated in accordance with Table 1020.2. 

The corridor walls required to be fire-resistance rated shall comply with Section 708 of the 

International Building Code for fire partitions. 

Exceptions: 

1. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in an occupancy in Group E 

where each room that is used for instruction has not less than one door opening 

directly to the exterior and rooms for assembly purposes have not less than one-



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-033 Adopting Fire Code      Page | 7 of 9 

half of the required means of egress doors opening directly to the exterior. 

Exterior doors specified in this exception are required to be at ground level. 

2. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors contained within a dwelling 

unit or sleeping unit in an occupancy in Groups I-1 and R. 

3. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in open parking garages. 

4. A fire-resistance rating is not required for corridors in an occupancy in Group 

B that is a space requiring only a single means of egress complying with Section 

1006.2. 

5. Corridors adjacent to the exterior walls of buildings shall be permitted to have 

unprotected openings on unrated exterior walls where unrated walls are permitted 

by Table 705.5 of the International Building Code and unprotected openings are 

permitted by Table 705.8 of the International Building Code. 

6. In unsprinklered group B occupancies, corridor walls and ceilings need not be 

of fire-resistive construction within a single tenant space when the space is 

equipped with approved automatic smoke- detection within the corridor. The 

actuation of any detector must activate self-annunciating alarms audible in all 

areas within the corridor. Smoke detectors must be connected to an approved 

automatic fire alarm system where such system is provided. 

 

Part 2. Open Meetings Act 

 

This meeting was open to the public as required by law and that public notice of the time, place, 

and purpose of said meeting was given as required. 

 

Part 3. Severability Clause 

 

If any section, sub-section, clause, phrase, or portion of this ordinance shall be held 

unconstitutional or invalid by a court of competent jurisdiction, such section, sub-section, 

sentence, clause, phrase, or portion shall be deemed to be a separate, distinct and independent 

provision and such invalidity shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions.   

 

Part 4. Repeal 

 

All ordinances or parts of ordinances and sections of any of the City Code of Ordinances in conflict 

with this Ordinance are hereby repealed. 

 

Part 5.  Effect on Pending Proceedings 

 

 That nothing in this legislation or in the Fuel Gas Code hereby adopted shall be construed 

to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, 

or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed 

as cited in Part 4 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be 

lost, impaired or affected by this legislation. 

 



 

 

 

(unapproved draft)   

ORD 2024-033 Adopting Fire Code      Page | 8 of 9 

Part 6.  Publication  

 

The City Secretary is authorized and directed to publish the caption and penalty 

prescribed by this ordinance in accordance with State Law.  

 

Part 7.  Enforcement 

 

Any person, firm or individual who shall violate any of the provisions of this Ordinance 

shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction shall be fined not less than one dollar 

($1.00) or more than two thousand dollars ($2,000.00) in accordance with Code of Ordinance Sec. 

1.01.009.  Each day the violation continues shall constitute a separate and distinct offense. 

 

Part 8.  Effective Date  

 

 This Ordinance shall be in force and effect from and after October 1, 2024. 

 

 

CITY OF WOLFFORTH 

 

              

CHARLES ADDINGTON II, MAYOR 

 

ATTEST: 

 

________________________________________ 

Terri Robinette, City Secretary 

 


