
Cleveland Asphalt Products Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions
P Squared Emulsion Plant 

LLC
Texas Materials Group, Inc. Waller County Asphalt, Inc.

$2.68 Pick up at $1.75 $3.29 N/A No Bid

$2.59 Pick up at $1.75 $3.29 N/A

No Charge $100.00/load $80.00 N/A

$100.00 $100.00/hour $80.00 N/A

$0.24/gallon N/A

Cleveland Asphalt Products Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions
P Squared Emulsion Plant 

LLC
Texas Materials Group, Inc. Waller County Asphalt, Inc.

$2.92 Pick up at $1.75 $2.96 N/A No Bid

$2.68 Pick up at $1.75 $2.96 N/A

No Charge $100.00/load $80.00 N/A

$100.00 $100.00/hour $80.00 N/A

Cleveland Asphalt Products Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions
P Squared Emulsion Plant 

LLC
Texas Materials Group, Inc. Waller County Asphalt, Inc.

No Bid No Bid N/A $110.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A $120.00

No Bid No Bid N/A $120.00

Cleveland Asphalt Products Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions
P Squared Emulsion Plant 

LLC
Texas Materials Group, Inc. Waller County Asphalt, Inc.

No Bid Pick up $500.00 $100.00 $95.00

No Bid Pick up $500.00 No Bid $115.00 $105.00

No Bid Pick up $500.00 $125.00 $105.00

$551.00 $125.00

Material ($/Ton) No Bid $500.00/ton $100.00 $95.00

Delivery ($/mile) No Bid $51.00/ton N/A $0.35

CRS - 2

Pump and Hose Charge

Demurrage after 2 hours ($/hour)

3,000 to 4,999 Gallons

SS1 Emulsion - Hempstead Yard

5,000 to 10,000 Gallons

1,500 to 2,999 Gallons

3,000 to 6,000 Gallons

Pump and Hose Charge

FOB Jobsite Delivery ($/mile)

FOB Jobsite

Demurrage after  2 hours ($/hour)

ASPPM - DMS 9202

FOB Hempstead Yard

FOB Brookshire Yard

Asphalt - CMA

Asphalt - Dense Graded HMA, Type D, SAC B, PG 64-22

Plant Location

Hempstead Yard

Brookshire Yard

Waller County Pricing Form
Bid 26-002

Term Contract for Oils and Asphalts

Term:  January 1, 2026 through December 31, 2026

Recommendation: All bidders meeting specifications

Brookshire Yard: 5004 Gassner Rd, Brookshire, Texas 77423

All prices are F.O.B. Waller County Road and Bridge Department

(unless indicated)

Hempstead Yard: 775 Bus 290 East, Hempstead, Texas 77445 

or


