Hi Tod. Thank you for checking back with me! Unfortunately, I am in the process of
cutting things for the event, as I am going over budget. I will keep their information on
hand. Maybe next year's event.

Thank you again.

Best wishes,

Lynda Owens, Manager
Town of Tyrone

Parks and Recreation

From: Tod Elmore <Tod@rcsproductions.com>
Sent: Monday, August 11, 2025 4:05 PM

To: Lynda Owens <lynda.owens@tyronega.gov>
Subject: RE: band - Run Katie Run - Tyrone - OCT 4

Caution: This email originated from an external sender. Verify the source before opening
links or attachments.

Lynda — following up on RUN KATIE RUN for OCTOBER 4. Thank you!

From: Tod Elmore

Sent: Monday, August 4, 2025 2:31 PM

To: Lynda Owens <lynda.owens@tyronega.gov>

Subject: RE: band - Run Katie Run - Tyrone - OCT 4

Great, thanks!

The band is available, and their fee is $1,750 if not providing PA.
How long do you need them to play?

They have a ton of originals, but | assume you want mostly covers with a few originals sprinkled in?

Tod Elmore

RCS Productions
RCS Productions Linktree

2312 Peachford Rd Ste A
Dunwoody, GA 30338
0. 770-306-9155 | m. 404-822-3520


https://rcsproductions.com/
https://linktr.ee/rcsproductions

