Town of Tusten

2021

Highway Department

2021 BIDS FOR STONE
MATERIAL NEEDED
Non- Collusion (Price Per Ton) Date
EOMEaNY Bidding Cert. Crusher Run | Gabions (R-3, R- 6-S AASHTO #57 Rev'd | PateOpeoed
4)
Deckelman LLC YES $11.00 $172.75 $18.00 $13.95 4/5/2021 - 4/6/2021
R & H Gorr YES $13.50 $19.50 $20.00 $19.50 4/5/2021 4/6/2021
Rutlege YES $13.25 $19.95 No Bid $15.75 4/5/2021 4/6/2021
E.R. Linde YES $21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid 4/5/2021 4/6/2021
Bids Have been read & reviewed by:
Donald Neiger 4/8/21
Don Neiger, Highway Superintendent Date

Deckelman LLC

for the amount(s) highlighted above.

Tuesday at the April 13, 2021 Regular Town Board Meeting, The Tusten Town Board has awarded the 2021 Stone to



Town of Tusten
2021

Highway Department

2021 BIDS FOR ANI-SKID SAND

Non- Collusion Bidding MALERLAL NEELER
COMPANY Tt -SAND- Date Revd Date Opened
Brown Grey
Deckelman LLC YES $14.90 $16.85 4/5/2021 4/6/2021
R & H Gorr YES $14.97 $14.50 4/5/2021 4/6/2021
. No Bid No Bid
Bedrock Quarries YES 4/5/2021 4/6/2021
E.R. Linde No Bid No Bid
Construction YES 4/5/2021 4/6/2021

Bids Have been read & reviewed by:

Donald Neiger 4/8/21

Don Neiger, Highway Superintendent Date

Tuesday at the April 13,2021 Regular Town Board Meeting, The Tusten Town Board has awarded the 2021 Sand Bid to

Deckelman LLC _ for the amount(s) highlighted above.




