TUPELO WATER & LIGHT DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION - WATER MATERIALS (6 MONTH SUPPLY BID)

BID NUMBER 2025-002WL
FEBRUARY 4, 2025

Vendors
Consolidated Southern
ITEM Product Pipe Pipe
1 ¥ x 3 Repair Clamp $7.00 $8.06
2 ¥ x 6 Repair Clamp $13.00 $15.25
3 1 x 3 Repair Clamp $7.50 $8.85
4 1 x 6 Repair Clamp $13.50 $16.25
5 1% x 3 Repair Clamp $8.00 $9.75
6 1% x 6 Repair Clamp $15.00 $18.50
7 1%, x 3 Repair Clamp $8.00 $9.08
8 1%4 x 6 Repair Clamp $15.00 $16.86
9 2 x 3 Repair Clamp $9.00 $10.61
10 2 X 6 Repair Clamp $17.00 $19.21
11 2 x 12 Repair Clamp $34.00 $39.03
12 3 x 12 Emergency Clamp $152.00 No Bid
13 4 x 12 Emergency Clamp $163.00 No Bid
14 6 x 12 Emergency Clamp $198.00 No Bid
15 6 x 18 Emergency Clamp $351.00 No Bid
16 8 x 12 Emergency Clamp $231.00 No Bid
17 8 x 18 Emergency Clamp $313.00 No Bid
18 10 x 12 Emergency Clamp $294.00 No Bid
19 10 x 18 Emergency Clamp $410.00 No Bid
20 12 x 12 Emergency Clamp $356.00 No Bid
21 12 x 18 Emergency Clamp $482.00 No Bid
22 4" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $996.00 No Bid
23 6" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $1,394.00 No Bid
24 8" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $2,085.00 No Bid
25 10" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $3,146.00 No Bid
26 12" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $4,753.00 No Bid
27 6 x 4 Tapping Tee $418.00 $442.00
28 6 x 6 Tapping Tee $477.00 $465.00
29 8 x 4 Tapping Tee $471.00 $485.14
30 8 x 6 Tapping Tee $494.00 $530.73
31 8 x 8 Tapping Tee $623.00 $699.68
32 10 x 4 Tapping Tee $496.00 $601.71
33 10 x 6 Tapping Tee $518.00 $632.65
34 10 x 8 Tapping Tee $629.00 $784.00
35 10 x 10 Tapping Tee $1,066.00 $939.00
36 12 x 4 Tapping Tee $531.00 $611.32
37 12 x 6 Tapping Tee $571.00 $641.35
38 12 x 8 Tapping Tee $580.00 $834.62
39 12 x 10 Tapping Tee $1,114.00 $964.80
40 12 x 12 Tapping Tee $1,212.00 $1,287.20
41 2" Coupling $134.00 $134.41




TUPELO WATER & LIGHT DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION - WATER MATERIALS (6 MONTH SUPPLY BID)
BID NUMBER 2025-002WL
FEBRUARY 4, 2025

Vendors
Consolidated Southern
ITEM Product Pipe Pipe

42 3" Coupling $175.00 $177.31
43 4" Coupling $225.00 $232.26
44 6" Coupling $295.00 $300.91
45 8" Coupling $335.00 $339.73
46 10" Coupling $450.00 $462.10
47 12" Coupling $615.00 $617.15
48 3" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $706.00 No Bid
49 4" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $788.00 No Bid
50 6" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $995.00 No Bid
51 8" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $1,602.00 No Bid
52 10" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $2,441.00 No Bid
53 12" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $3,162.00 No Bid
54 5.25 x 3' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,059.00 No Bid
55 5.25 x 3.5" Bury Fire Hydrant $3,133.00 No Bid
56 5.25 x 4' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,209.00 No Bid
57 5.25 x 4.5' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,283.00 No Bid
58 5.25 x 5' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,357.00 No Bid
59 5.25 x 5.5" Bury Fire Hydrant $3,432.00 No Bid
60 5Y%4" Fire Hydrant 1' Extension Kit $1,064.00 No Bid
61 5% Fire Hydrant 1'-6" Extension Kit $1,205.00 No Bid
62 5Y%4" Fire Hydrant 2'-6" Extension Kit $1,357.00 No Bid
63 5% Fire Hydrant 3'-6" Extension Kit $1,930.00 No Bid
64 5Y%4" Fire Hydrant 4' Extension Kit $2,128.00 No Bid
65 5% Fire Hydrant Flange Repair Kit $775.00 No Bid
66 5Y%4" Fire Hydrant Main Valve Repair Kit $787.00 No Bid
67 5% Fire Hydrant Bonnet Repair Kit $125.00 No Bid
68 ¥," Corp Stop $41.00 $38.30
69 ¥," Curb Stop $49.00 $70.52
70 %" Meter Connector $11.39 $11.45
71 ¥, Copper Union $22.48 $21.40
72 %" Male Coupling $18.24 $17.54
73 %" Female Coupling $19.22 $18.50
74 ¥," Quarter Bend Union $28.76 $27.60
75 1" Corp Stop $62.20 $57.90
76 1" Curb Stop $90.36 $106.97
77 1" Meter Connector $17.90 $17.55
78 1" Copper Union $25.78 $24.45
79 1" Male Coupling $21.78 $20.80
80 1" Female Coupling $37.09 $25.05
81 1" Quarter Bend Union $37.66 $35.50
82 1%5" Curb Valve $212.41 $194.15




TUPELO WATER & LIGHT DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION - WATER MATERIALS (6 MONTH SUPPLY BID)
BID NUMBER 2025-002WL
FEBRUARY 4, 2025

Vendors
Consolidated Southern
ITEM Product Pipe Pipe

83 114" Male Coupling $61.44 $56.92
84 1%" Female Coupling $78.57 $72.81
85 114" Copper Union $88.26 $81.80
86 1" Quarter Bend Union $122.98 $113.91
87 2" Curb Valve $309.26 $282.80
88 2" Male Coupling $89.52 $82.94
89 2" Female Coupling $93.63 $86.69
90 2" Copper Union $119.20 $110.42
91 2" Quarter Bend Union $251.29 $230.45
92 1%2" x %" IPS Service Saddle $21.00 No Bid
93 1%" x 1" IPS Service Saddle $21.00 No Bid
94 2" X ¥" IPS Service Saddle $21.00 $23.95
95 2" X ¥" PVC Service Saddle $21.00 $29.09
96 2" x 1" IPS Service Saddle $21.00 $22.20
97 2" x 1" PVC Service Saddle $28.00 $29.09
98 4" x 3" PVC Service Saddle $28.00 $36.27
99 4" x 1" PVC Service Saddle $28.00 $36.27
100 4" x 1%" PVC Service Saddle $28.00 $47.93
101 4" x 2" PVC Service Saddle $28.00 $49.95
102 6" X %" DIPS Service Saddle $37.00 $45.00
103 6" x 1" DIPS Service Saddle $34.00 $45.00
104 6" x 1%2" DIPS Service Saddle $37.00 $52.60
105 6" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $44.00 $52.60
106 8" x %" DIPS Service Saddle $42.00 $48.79
107 8" x 1" DIPS Service Saddle $42.00 $48.79
108 8" x 1¥%." DIPS Service Saddle $48.00 $62.76
109 8" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $48.00 $62.76
110 10" x 1%2" DIPS Service Saddle $64.00 $61.34
111 10" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $64.00 $61.34
112 12" x 1%" DIPS Service Saddle $75.00 $76.56
113 12" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $76.00 $76.56




Minute Entry Sign Up Sheet

Date: 2/4/2025
Time: 10:00
Bid # 2025-002WL Department: WL

Water Materials (6 Month Bid)

Project:
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WATER MATERIALS
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID

City of Tupelo, Mississippi

BID # 2025-002WL

Publication Dates:.........ccccoovommmermrirrreeieeeeeeeennns January 9, 2025, and January 16, 2025

BID Response Deadline: .............cccccceiinininnnannne February 4, 2025, at 10:00 AM



ADVERTISEMENT FOR PROPOSALS

NOTICE is hereby given that the City of Tupelo, Mississippi will receive bids for:

WATER MATERIALS
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID
Bid # 2025-002WL

Until 10:00 o’clock A.M. local time on February 4, 2025
Bids can be submitted via sealed bid at the Purchasing Office, City Hall 1%t Floor, 71 East Troy Street,

Tupelo, Mississippi, 38804 or electronically at www.tupelomsbids.com. Bid Documents and
Specifications can be viewed and obtained online at www.tupelomsbids.com.

Any questions regarding electronic bidding or access to bid documents should be directed to PH Bidding
Group at 662-407-0193 or admin@phbidding.com.

The City of Tupelo is an equal opportunity employer and hereby notifies all bidders that it will
affirmatively insure that, in any contract entered unto pursuant to this advertisement, minority business
enterprises will be afforded full opportunity to submit bids in response to this invitation and will not be
discriminated against on the grounds of race, color, sex, age, disability or national origin in
consideration for an award.

The City of Tupelo reserves the right to reject any and or all bids, waive technicalities, informalities or
irregularities in the bids received, solicit new bids or to choose that bid which is deemed to be in the
best interest of the City of Tupelo.

BY ORDER OF THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TUPELO, MISSISSIPPI.

Traci Dillard
Controller

Publishing Dates: January 9, 2025
January 16, 2025



WATER MATERIALS
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID
Bid # 2025-002WL

GENERAL

The City of Tupelo will accept competitive sealed proposals until 10:00 AM, February 4,
2025, at City Hall, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, Mississippi 38804. All proposals must be
equal in performance and quality to the specifications.

If City Hall is closed for business at the time of the deadline, proposals will be accepted and
opened on the next business day of the City, at the originally scheduled hour.

TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS & BID FORM
The City of Tupelo will be accepting proposals for Water Materials. This is a six (6) month
supply bid.

Specifications

Item | Description Equal or Equivalent to Unit Price
1 | % x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 +.00
2 | % x 6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 1%2.00
3 | 1x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 +.50
4 | 1 x 6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 3.50
5 |1 % x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 =),
6 | 1% x6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 |5 .00
7 | 1% x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 §-oo
8 [1 % x6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 |1S-00
9 | 2x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 g.00
10 | 2 x 6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 3. on
11 | 2 x 12 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 3Y.00
12 | 3 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series jy2-00
13 | 4 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series ]£%.00
14 | 6 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series )a&- oo
15 | 6 x 18 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series 25 l-o
16 | 8 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series 2%(.00
17 | 8 x 18 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series 3213, oo
18 | 10 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series 21 - oo
19 | 10 x 18 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series Ll10-00
20 | 12 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series 2 Sl -t
21 | 12 x 18 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series Ue2. oo
22 | 4" Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 4494 .00
23 | 6” Tapping Valve —Less Acc Mueller H-677 1399%. 00
24 | 8" Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 2085 -od




25 | 10” Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 BI16. 00
26 | 12” Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 Y#53 .eo
27 | 6 x4 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 UWik.oop
28 | 6 x 6 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 Y3} F-o00
29 | 8 x4 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 YF\.00
30 | 8 x 6 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 Ya.oo
31 | 8 x 8 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 62%. 00
32 | 10 x 4 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 Y&G-o a
33 [ 10 x 6 Tapping Tee Muelier H-615 Cl%- o0
34 | 10 x 8 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 67900
35 | 10 x 10 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 106 b-oo
36 | 12 x4 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 $2100
37 [ 12 x 6 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 SHL006
38 | 12 x 8 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 6 80. 00
39 | 12 x 10 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 [1IM.00
40 |12 x 12 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 l2\Z2-00
41 | 2" Coupling Hymax 124. 00
42 | 3" Coupling Hymax I FS 00
43 | 4” Coupling Hymax 225-00
44 |6” Coupling Hymax 729 5. 0o
45 | 8” Coupling Hymax 225.00
46 | 10” Coupling Hymax Y90.00
47 | 12” Coupling Hymax 61500
48 | 3" MJxMJ Gate Valve —Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20 F06-00
49 | 4" MJxMJ Gate Valve —Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20 F8%€-00
50 | 6" MJxMJ Gate Valve —Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20 agqi.o0
51 | 8" MJxMJ Gate Valve —Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20 160 2-0 0
52 | 10" MJxMJ Gate Valve-Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20 2\MHi.00
53 | 12" MJxMJ Gate Valve-Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20 3)62-00
54 | 5.25 x 3’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423 2059.00
55 |5.25 x 3.5’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423 213500
56 | 5.25 x 4’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423 2320%.00
57 |5.25 x 4.5’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423 228% oo
58 | 5.25 x 5’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423 3354 - 00
59 | 5.25 x 5.5’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423 2432, vo
60 | 5% Fire Hydrant 1’ Extension Kit Mueller Super Centurion JO 6M-00
61 | 5% Fire Hydrant 1’-6” Extension Kit | Mueller Super Centurion 1208 - oo
62 | 5% Fire Hydrant 2'-6” Extension Kit | Mueller Super Centurion 1357 .00
63 | 5% Fire Hydrant 3'-6” Extension Kit | Mueller Super Centurion | 430, vo
64 | 5%4" Fire Hydrant 4’ Extension Kit Mueller Super Centurion Z\Z&- oo
65 | 5% Fire Hydrant Flange Repair Kit Mueller Super Centurion 275 -0o0
5Y4” Fire Hydrant Main Valve Repair | Mueller Super Centurion

66 | Kit 7877 00
67 5%4” Fire Hydrant Bonnet Repair Kit | Mueller Super Centurion 125 - 0o




ALL BRASS SHALL BE LEAD-FREE PER ASTM C89833

68 | %" Corp Stop Mueller H-15008 Uui.oo
69 |3’ Curb Stop Mueller B-25170 Yq.vo
70 | 34" Meter Connector Muelier H-10890 11.39
71 | %" Copper Union Mueller H-15403 zZ.M¥
72 | %" Male Coupling Mueller H-15428 182
73 | %" Female Coupling Mueller H-15451 14.22
74 | 3" Quarter Bend Union Mueller H-15526 ARG A
75 | 1" Corp Stop Mueller H-15008 2.0
76 | 1” Curb Stop Mueller B-25170 gp.3 6
77 | 1” Meter Connector Mueller H-10890 1F-90
78 | 1" Copper Union Mueller H-15403 25.9%
79 | 1” Male Coupling Mueller H-15428 Al 4
80 | 1" Female Coupling Mueller H-15451 27.09
81 | 1” Quarter Bend Union Mueller H-15526 5F. 64
82 | 1%." Curb Valve Mueller B-20200 Z212.\4 |
83 | 1%” Male Coupling Mueller H-15428 ARL
84 | 12" Female Coupling Mueller H-15451 3L.57F
85 | 1% Copper Union Mueller H-15403 [d A
86 | 1%%" Quarter Bend Union Mueller H-15526 122 .9¢
87 | 2" Curb Valve Mueller B-20200 209. 26
88 | 2" Male Coupling Mueller H-15428 £§9. 52
89 | 2” Female Coupling Mueller H-15451 9%.6%3
90 | 2" Copper Union Mueller H-15403 14,70
91 | 2” Quarter Bend Union Mueller H-15526 25).z9
92 | 1%" x %" IPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Zl-oc 0o
93 | 1%2" x 1" IPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Z1-6A
94 | 2" x %" IPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 2Z\-006
95 | 2" x %" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Z[-00
96 | 2" x 1” IPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Z\.00
97 | 2" x 1" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 2. 00
98 | 4" x %" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 28-00
99 | 4" x 1" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 ?8.00
100 | 4" x 1%" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Z¥-0o0
101 | 4" x 2" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 25 00
102 | 6" x %" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 33. 0o
103 | 6” x 1" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 24. 00
104 | 6” x 1%%” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 3. 00
105 | 6” x 2” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Ud-o o
106 | 8” x %" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Uz2.o00
107 | 8" x 1” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 U2 o0
108 | 8" x 1%.” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 yf.oo
109 | 8” x 2” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 yQ.oo
110 | 10" x 1%2” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 £Y4. .00
111 | 10” x 2” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 bY.o°




112

12” x 1% DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 75.00

113

12” x 2" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 76 00

General Bidders Requirements/Information

1.

The City of Tupelo reserves the right to reject any and all bids, to waive any informalities
in the bid, or award the bid to whomsoever they may choose.

The specifications, as stated, are minimum requirements and may be exceeded by the
bidder. However, no additional consideration shall be given for exceeding the minimum
requirements and all bids will be evaluated against the specifications set forth in this bid
package.

Manufacturer’s part or item numbers are shown only to describe the item and to determine
the level of acceptable quality. Other manufacturer's “equal” items may be bid. The
acceptance of “equal” items lies with the Council of the City of Tupelo whose decision
shall be final. All items shall be delivered FOB to the location specified on the purchase
request in Tupelo, Mississippi 38801.

All bid prices shall be net, FOB destination, with transportation charges prepaid by
vendor.

The bid solicitation is for a supply contract of six (6) months with the City to have the
option, at the end of the initial six (6) month period, to renew the contract for an additional

six (6) months with no price increase if agreeable with vendor.

All items will be ordered on an as needed basis during the life of the contract(s) resulting
from this bid process. Minimum order quantities shall be for truckload quantities.

No bidder is required to bid on all items. However, the successful bidder(s) shall be
determined by item compliance to minimum specifications requirements.

Delivery will be a consideration in the awarding of this bid.

The burden of proof of specifications is the responsibility of the bidder.




QUESTIONS

Failure to examine any specifications and instructions will be at bidder's risk. All procedural
and technical questions, or if the attached specifications are incomplete, not clear, or not
standardized, shall be made in writing and addressed to the following.

General questions regarding this request should be directed to Traci Dillard, Controller, at
the City of Tupelo Purchasing Department, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, MS 38804. The
phone number is 662-841-6513 Ext: 114.

Email: traci.dillard@tupeloms.gov

For questions concerning the technical specifications, prospective bidders may contact
Drew Kyle Tupelo Water & Light Department. The phone number is 662-841-6460. Email:
drew.kyle@tupeloms.gov

Questions regarding the website or electronic bidding should be directed to PH Bidding at
662-407-0193 or admin@phbidding.com.

No oral explanations by any member of the city staff will be binding. Receipt of addenda
must be acknowledged in writing. Submitting vendors shall be responsible for ensuring
that they have received any and all addenda.

OPENING:

Proposal openings, whether electronic or traditional paper method, shall be conducted
any time after they are received and shall be conducted by at least two procurement
officials. From that point forward, proposals will be considered under advisement. The
City of Tupelo may conduct written or oral discussions with potential bidders.

The City of Tupelo reserves the right to determine responsive offers or proposals, waive
minor informalities in the process, to reject any and all offers or proposals, and to invite
priced bids from those companies believed most advantageous to the City.



BIDDER INFORMATION FORM

WATER MATERIALS
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID
BID # 2025-002WL

The undersigned proposes to provide water materials which meet the specifications provided.
The undersigned certifies that the minimum specifications, terms and conditions contained in
this BID have been considered and understood. By submitting a proposal, I/We do certify that
the commodities offered do meet the specifications contained in this Invitation to Bid.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES receipt of the following ADDENDA:

NUMBER: DATE:
NUMBER: DATE:
NUMBER: DATE:

BIDDER INFORMATION:

Company Name: ﬂm\ soli g a_'\-rf) (}\ [\c’ X SOQO\\J\
Company Representative: }\Joér\r\ou\r\ 'D A‘C\\'C_ -

Tite: _ Sale S

Business Address:

Steet  250S M atrox 5"'

city: _ \we O _ State:_ NS, Zipp . RBKO |
Signature of|Bidder' 4%/5%5%( O

Date: { /3' /z /
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WATER MATERIALS

6-MONTH SUPPLY BID
City of Tupelo, Mississippi

BID # 2025-002WL

Publication Dates:................ccooevoooii January 9, 2025, and January 16, 2025

BID Response Deadline: ... February 4, 2025, at 10:00 AM



ADVERTISEMENT FOR PROPOSALS

NOTICE is hereby given that the City of Tupelo, Mississippi will receive bids for:

WATER MATERIALS
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID
Bid # 2025-002WL

Until 10:00 o’clock A.M. local time on February 4, 2025
Bids can be submitted via sealed bid at the Purchasing Office, City Hall 1%t Floor, 71 East Troy Street,

Tupelo, Mississippi, 38804 or electronically at www.tupelomsbids.com. Bid Documents and
Specifications can be viewed and obtained online at www.tupelomsbids.com.

Any questions regarding electronic bidding or access to bid documents should be directed to PH Bidding

Group at 662-407-0193 or admin@phbidding.com.

The City of Tupelo is an equal opportunity employer and hereby notifies all bidders that it will
affirmatively insure that, in any contract entered unto pursuant to this advertisement, minority business
enterprises will be afforded full opportunity to submit bids in response to this invitation and will not be
discriminated against on the grounds of race, color, sex, age, disability or national origin in
consideration for an award.

The City of Tupelo reserves the right to reject any and or all bids, waive technicalities, informalities or
irregularities in the bids received, solicit new bids or to choose that bid which is deemed to be in the
best interest of the City of Tupelo.

BY ORDER OF THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TUPELO, MISSISSIPPI.

Traci Dillard
Controller

Publishing Dates: January 9, 2025
January 16, 2025



WATER MATERIALS
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID
Bid # 2025-002WL

GENERAL

The City of Tupelo will accept competitive sealed proposals until 10:00 AM, February 4,
2025, at City Hall, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, Mississippi 38804. All proposals must be
equal in performance and quality to the specifications.

If City Hall is closed for business at the time of the dead line, proposals will be accepted and
opened on the next business day of the City, at the originally scheduled hour.

TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS & BID FORM

The City of Tupelo will be accepting proposals for Water Materials. This is a six (6) month
supply bid.

Specifications

ltem | Description Equal or Equivalent to Unit Price
1 | % x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 L B0 |
2 | % x 6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 , \S.3S
3 | 1x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 %. 55
4 | 1 x 6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 5B \\e.as
5 | 1% x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 K a.as
6 | 1% x6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 \Z.S6
7 |1 % x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 A.5¥%
8 |1 % x 6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 e. Sle
9 [2x 3 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 :
10 | 2 x 6 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 2
11 |2 x 12 Repair Clamp Smith Blair 245 or Mueller 230 o
12 | 3 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
13 |4 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
14 | 6 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
15 | 6 x 18 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
16 | 8 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
17 | 8 x 18 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
18 | 10 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
19 | 10 x 18 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
20 | 12 x 12 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
21 |12 x 18 Emergency Clamp Mueller 520 Series
22 | 4” Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 N B
23 | 6" Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 |
24 | 8” Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 \




25 | 10" Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 \
26 | 12" Tapping Valve — Less Acc Mueller H-677 NA
27 |6 x4 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 P U4 .= ]
28 | 6 x 6 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 B aes. ==
29 |8 x 4 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 B QS &
30 |8 x 6 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 $ 1s30.73
31 | 8 x 8 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 (249 .\e¥
32 _| 10 x 4 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 Leny .1
33 | 10 x 6 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 & | Y
34 | 10 x 8 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 | 34w 2
35 | 10 x 10 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 % grq . 22
36 | 12 x 4 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 L. S
37 |12 x 6 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 e\ . 3S
38 | 12 x 8 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 B3I . e
39 | 12 x 10 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 Qutk . %o
40 |12 x 12 Tapping Tee Mueller H-615 R NA1 . 20
41 |2’ Coupling _ Hymax R0
42 | 3" Coupling Hymax X111 =\
43 | 4” Coupling Hymax R [ 23) 2\
44 | 6” Coupling Hymax 4 [S20.1]\
45 |8’ Coupling Hymax B354, 13
46 | 10" Coupling Hymax B [uwa. 0
47 [12" Coupling _ Hymax Bl ..s
48 | 3" MJxMJ Gate Valve —Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20 NR
49 | 4” MJxMJ Gate Valve —Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20
50 | 6” MJxMJ Gate Valve —Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20
51 | 8" MJxMJ Gate Valve —Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20
52 | 10" MJxMJ Gate Valve-Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20
53 | 12" MJxMJ Gate Valve-Less Acc Mueller A-2360-20
94 | 5.25 x 3’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423
55 | 5.25 x 3.5’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423
56 | 5.25 x 4’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423
57 | 5.25 x 4.5 Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423
58 |5.25 x 5’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423
99 |5.25 x 5.5’ Bury Fire Hydrant Mueller A-423
60 | 5%’ Fire Hydrant 1’ Extension Kit Mueller Super Centurion
61 | 5%’ Fire Hydrant 1’-6” Extension Kit | Mueller Super Centurion
62 | 5%" Fire Hydrant 2’-8” Extension Kit | Mueller Super Centurion
63 | 5%’ Fire Hydrant 3-6” Extension Kit | Mueller Super Centurion
64 | 5% Fire Hydrant 4’ Extension Kit Mueller Super Centurion
65 | 5% Fire Hydrant Flange Repair Kit Mueller Super Centurion

574" Fire Hydrant Main Valve Repair | Mueller Super Centurion
66 | Kit
67 | 97 Fire Hydrant Bonnet Repair Kit | Mueller Super Centurion Nﬁ(




ALL BRASS SHALL BE LEAD-FREE PER ASTM C89833

68 | % Corp Stop Mueller H-15008 .22
69 | %’ Curb Stop Mueller B-25170 0. 22
70 | %" Meter Connector Mueller H-10890 & /. 45
71 | %’ Copper Union Mueller H-15403 Bl 49
72_| %" Male Coupling Mueller H-15428 % 11, sS4
73 | %" Female Coupling Mueller H-15451 « ‘DO
74 | %" Quarter Bend Union Mueller H-15526 A1, Lo
75 [ 1” Corp Stop Mueller H-15008 S1.499
76 | 1” Curb Stop Mueller B-25170 0

77 | 1” Meter Connector Mueller H-10890 sSE
78 | 1” Copper Union Mueller H-15403 AW 9US
79 | 1” Male Coupling Mueller H-15428 A, B0
80 | 1” Female Coupling Mueller H-15451 Has.os
81 | 1” Quarter Bend Union Mueller H-15526 35, S
82 | 1% Curb Valve Mueller B-20200 $ 194 ‘s
83 | 1%” Male Coupling Mueller H-15428 BSle . 4
84 | 14" Female Coupling Mueller H-15451 b ., ¥l
85 | 1" Copper Union Mueller H-15403 g3\, %0
86 | 1% Quarter Bend Union Mueller H-15526 %\ A\
87 | 2" Curb Valve Mueller B-20200 AR 8O
88 | 2" Male Coupling Mueller H-15428 ¥, 94
89 | 2" Female Coupling Mueller H-15451 4
90 | 2” Copper Union Mueller H-15403 110, 4
91 | 2" Quarter Bend Union Mueller H-15526 B 330,45
92 | 1% x %" IPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 NA

93 | 1% x 1” IPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 N &

94 | 2" x %’ IPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 B J5 A
95 | 2" x %" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 ™ 4.04
96 | 2" x 1" IPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 an. |
97 [2"x 1" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 s dANOA
98 | 4" x %" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 ; ‘-ﬂ 8.1
99 [ 4" x 1" PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 B 3.0
100 | 4" x 1%’ PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 % U A3
101 | 4" x 2” PVC Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 u4a as
102 | 6" x %’ DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Rus. =
103 | 6” x 1” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 us 2o
104 | 6” x 1%” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 &‘6&. wo
105 | 6” x 2" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 sa. o
106 | 8” x %" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 .7
107 | 8” x 1” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 . 1A
108 | 8” x 1%” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 Lu,a e
109 | 8” x 2" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 E (. Ne
110 | 10” x 1%” DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 (ol . 2
111 | 10” x 2" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 8 e\. 94




112

12" x 1%2" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 1. Sie

113

12" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle Smith Blair 313 . Sta

General Bidders Requirements/information

1.

The City of Tupelo reserves the right to reject any and all bids, to waive any informalities
in the bid, or award the bid to whomsoever they may choose.

The specifications, as stated, are minimum requirements and may be exceeded by the
bidder. However, no additional consideration shall be given for exceeding the minimum
requirements and all bids will be evaluated against the specifications set forth in this bid
package.

Manufacturer’s part or item numbers are shown only to describe the item and to determine
the level of acceptable quality. Other manufacturer's ‘equal” items may be bid. The
acceptance of “equal” items lies with the Council of the City of Tupelo whose decision
shall be final. All items shall be delivered FOB to the location specified on the purchase
request in Tupelo, Mississippi 38801.

All bid prices shall be net, FOB destination, with transportation charges prepaid by
vendor.

The bid solicitation is for a supply contract of six (6) months with the City to have the
option, at the end of the initial six (6) month period, to renew the contract for an additional
six (6) months with no price increase if agreeable with vendor.

All items will be ordered on an as needed basis during the life of the contract(s) resulting
from this bid process. Minimum order quantities shall be for truckload quantities.

No bidder is required to bid on all items. However, the successful bidder(s) shall be
determined by item compliance to minimum specifications requirements.

Delivery will be a consideration in the awarding of this bid.

The burden of proof of specifications is the responsibility of the bidder.




QUESTIONS

Failure to examine any specifications and instructions will be at bidder's risk. All procedural
and technical questions, or if the attached specifications are incomplete, not clear, or not
standardized, shall be made in writing and addressed to the following.

General questions regarding this request should be directed to Traci Dillard, Controller, at
the City of Tupelo Purchasing Department, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, MS 38804. The
phone number is 662-841-6513 Ext: 114.

Email: traci.dillard@tupeloms.gov

For questions concerning the technical specifications, prospective bidders may contact
Drew Kyle Tupelo Water & Light Department. The phone number is 662-841-6460. Email:

drew.kyle@tupeloms.gov

Questions regarding the website or electronic bidding should be directed to PH Bidding at
662-407-0193 or admin@phbidding.com.

No oral explanations by any member of the city staff will be binding. Receipt of addenda
must be acknowledged in writing. Submitting vendors shall be responsible for ensuring
that they have received any and all addenda.

OPENING:

Proposal openings, whether electronic or traditional paper method, shall be conducted
any time after they are received and shall be conducted by at least two procurement
officials. From that point forward, proposals will be considered under advisement. The
City of Tupelo may conduct written or oral discussions with potential bidders.

The City of Tupelo reserves the right to determine responsive offers or proposals, waive
minor informalities in the process, to reject any and all offers or proposals, and to invite
priced bids from those companies believed most advantageous to the City.



BIDDER INFORMATION FORM
WATER MATERIALS
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID
BID # 2025-002WL

The undersigned proposes to provide water materials which meet the specifications provided.
The undersigned certifies that the minimum specifications, terms and conditions contained in
this BID have been considered and understood. By submitting a proposal, I/We do certify that
the commodities offered do meet the specifications contained in this Invitation to Bid.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES receipt of the following ADDENDA:

NUMBER;: DATE:
NUMBER: DATE:
NUMBER: DATE:

T

BIDDER INFORMATION:
Company Name:  SSeouthern, @ip\e le gog?ka
Company Representative: L,cc. enlowv

Title: __ (Sconcla Me{

Business Address:

street: Y 0AY ?\o\o Orive

City: ”E"\o.eta State: _ (NS Zip: RO\
Signature of Bidder: %ﬁ. (/\/
Date: g_-—%—-;lfs'
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