
1TUPELO WATER & LIGHT DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION
BID NO. 2021-033WL - SOURCES OF SUPPLY
DECEMBER 16, 2021 Vendors

Paul Smithey M&M UG
Construction Video

Materials

Section 1: Part 1: PVC Sewer Pipe Installation
Bid Price per

Diameter Est. Qty. Length Linear Ft
4" 0' - 6' cut 0' - 300' $16.50 No Bid
4" 0' - 6' cut 301' - 700' $16.00 No Bid
4" 0' - 6' cut 701' + $15.57 No Bid
4" 6' - 10' cut 0' - 300' $18.44 No Bid
4" 6' - 10' cut 301' - 700' $18.00 No Bid
4" 6' - 10' cut 701' + $17.50 No Bid
4" 10' - 16' cut 0' - 300' $29.69 No Bid
4" 10' - 16' cut 301' - 700' $29.25 No Bid
4" 10' - 16' cut 701' + $28.82 No Bid
4" Ductile Iron Pipe Add-On      Lump Sum $1.75 No Bid

6" 0' - 6' cut 0' - 300' $20.33 No Bid
6" 0' - 6' cut 301' - 700' $19.88 No Bid
6" 0' - 6' cut 701' + $19.50 No Bid
6" 6' - 10' cut 0' - 300' $22.19 No Bid
6" 6' - 10' cut 301' - 700' $21.75 No Bid
6" 6' - 10' cut 701' + $21.32 No Bid
6" 10' - 16' cut 0' - 300' $33.50 No Bid
6" 10' - 16' cut 301' - 700' $33.00 No Bid
6" 10' - 16' cut 701' + $32.57 No Bid
6" Ductile Iron Pipe Add-On      Lump Sum $2.00 No Bid

8" 0' - 6' cut 0' - 300' $33.82 No Bid
8" 0' - 6' cut 301' - 700' $33.38 No Bid
8" 0' - 6' cut 701' + $33.00 No Bid
8" 6' - 10' cut 0' - 300' $41.57 No Bid
8" 6' - 10' cut 301' - 700' $41.13 No Bid
8" 6' - 10' cut 701' + $40.63 No Bid
8" 10' - 16' cut 0' - 300' $52.88 No Bid
8" 10' - 16' cut 301' - 700' $52.50 No Bid
8" 10' - 16' cut 701' + $52.07 No Bid
8" Ductile Iron Pipe Add-On      Lump Sum $2.30 No Bid
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Section 1: Part 1: PVC Sewer Pipe Installation (cont'd)
Bid Price per

Diameter Est. Qty. Length Linear Ft
10" 0' - 6' cut 0' - 300' $35.94 No Bid
10" 0' - 6' cut 301' - 700' $35.50 No Bid
10" 0' - 6' cut 701' + $35.00 No Bid
10" 6' - 10' cut 0' - 300' $43.44 No Bid
10" 6' - 10' cut 301' - 700' $42.94 No Bid
10" 6' - 10' cut 701' + $42.50 No Bid
10" 10' - 16' cut 0' - 300' $54.75 No Bid
10" 10' - 16' cut 301' - 700' $54.32 No Bid
10" 10' - 16' cut 701' + $54.00 No Bid
10" Ductile Iron Pipe Add-On      Lump Sum $2.80 No Bid

12" 0' - 6' cut 0' - 300' $37.82 No Bid
12" 0' - 6' cut 301' - 700' $37.38 No Bid
12" 0' - 6' cut 701' + $36.88 No Bid
12" 6' - 10' cut 0' - 300' $45.38 No Bid
12" 6' - 10' cut 301' - 700' $44.94 No Bid
12" 6' - 10' cut 701' + $44.50 No Bid
12" 10' - 16' cut 0' - 300' $56.69 No Bid
12" 10' - 16' cut 301' - 700' $56.25 No Bid
12" 10' - 16' cut 701' + $55.82 No Bid
12" Ductile Iron Pipe Add-On      Lump Sum $3.15 No Bid

Section 1: Part 2: Miscellaneous Sewer Services
Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit

Manhole Installation
Standard Installation Bid/Vertical Ft. $228.38 No Bid
Installation Over Existing Line Bid/Vertical Ft. $274.07 No Bid
Tieing into Existing Manhole Lump Sum $850.50 No Bid
Tieing into Existing Sewer Line Lump Sum $472.50 No Bid
4" Sewer Tap Lump Sum $660.00 No Bid
6" Sewer Tap Lump Sum $850.50 No Bid
Install New Manhole Ring & Cover Lump Sum $283.50 No Bid
Installation of Misc. Sewer Fittings per Hour $141.75 No Bid
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Construction Video
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Section 1: Part 2: Miscellaneous Sewer Services (cont'd)

Manhole Height Adjustment
MH Height Adj. w/Cast Iron Riser Ring Lump Sum $66.25 No Bid
MH Height Adj. w/Brick and Mortar Lump Sum $283.50 No Bid
MH Height Adj. w/Concrete Donut Riser Lump Sum $283.50 No Bid
MH Height Adj. - Riser 0 - 2 Feet Lump Sum $472.50 No Bid
MH Height Adj. - Riser 2 - 4 Feet Lump Sum $660.00 No Bid
MH Height Adj. - Riser 4 - 6 Feet Lump Sum $802.50 No Bid

Sewer Pipe Bores
4" to 6" Pipe per LF $45.00 No Bid
8" to 10" Pipe per LF $63.13 No Bid
12" to 16" Pipe per LF $78.75 No Bid

                                    TOTAL SECTION 1 $8,137.17
.

Section 2: Sewer Inspections and Cleaning

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit Bid Price/Unit
Color TV/Video Inspection
Minimum Service Charge Lump Sum No Bid $450.00
8" to 12" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $1.50
15" to 18" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $2.00
21" to 24" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $2.50
Reverse Set-up Lump Sum No Bid $250.00

Pipe/Manhole Cleaning
Clean 8" to 10" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $1.50
Clean 12" to 15" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $2.00
Clean 18" to 21" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $2.50
Clean 24" and Larger Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $3.00
Manhole Cleaning per Hour No Bid $185.00



4TUPELO WATER & LIGHT DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION
BID NO. 2021-033WL - SOURCES OF SUPPLY
DECEMBER 16, 2021 Vendors

Paul Smithey M&M UG
Construction Video

Materials

Section 2: Sewer Inspections and Cleaning (cont'd)

Root Removal in Sewers
8" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $1.95
10" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $2.50
12" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $3.00

Smoke Testing Sewer Lines
8" - 15" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $1.00
18" - 36" Sewer Lines per LF No Bid $1.25

                                    TOTAL SECTION 2 No Bid $909.70

Section 3: Sewer Line Open-Cut Point Repairs

Diameter Est. Depth Length of Repair Bid Price per LF
8" 0' - 10' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
8" 10' - 14' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
8" 14' - 18' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
8" 0' - 10' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid
8" 10' - 14' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid
8" 14' - 18' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid

10" 0' - 10' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
10" 10' - 14' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
10" 14' - 18' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
10" 0' - 10' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid
10" 10' - 14' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid
10" 14' - 18' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid

12" 0' - 10' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
12" 10' - 14' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
12" 14' - 18' cut 0 - 10' $2,415.00 No Bid
12" 0' - 10' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid
12" 10' - 14' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid
12" 14' - 18' cut 10' - 20' $2,893.75 No Bid
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Section 3: Sewer Line Oper-Cut Point Repairs (cont'd)

Diameter Est. Depth ` Bid Price per LF
15" 0' - 10' cut 0 - 10' $2,607.50 No Bid
15" 10' - 14' cut 0 - 10' $2,607.50 No Bid
15" 14' - 18' cut 0 - 10' $2,607.50 No Bid
15" 0' - 10' cut 10' - 20' $3,081.25 No Bid
15" 10' - 14' cut 10' - 20' $3,081.25 No Bid
15" 14' - 18' cut 10' - 20' $3,081.25 No Bid

18" 0' - 10' cut 0 - 10' $2,607.50 No Bid
18" 10' - 14' cut 0 - 10' $2,607.50 No Bid
18" 14' - 18' cut 0 - 10' $2,607.50 No Bid
18" 0' - 10' cut 10' - 20' $3,081.25 No Bid
18" 10' - 14' cut 10' - 20' $3,081.25 No Bid
18" 14' - 18' cut 10' - 20' $3,081.25 No Bid

21" 0' - 10' cut 0 - 10' $2,985.00 No Bid
21" 10' - 14' cut 0 - 10' $2,985.00 No Bid
21" 14' - 18' cut 0 - 10' $2,985.00 No Bid
21" 0' - 10' cut 10' - 20' $3,742.50 No Bid
21" 10' - 14' cut 10' - 20' $3,742.50 No Bid
21" 14' - 18' cut 10' - 20' $3,742.50 No Bid

24" 0' - 10' cut 0 - 10' $2,985.00 No Bid
24" 10' - 14' cut 0 - 10' $2,985.00 No Bid
24" 14' - 18' cut 0 - 10' $2,985.00 No Bid
24" 0' - 10' cut 10' - 20' $3,742.50 No Bid
24" 10' - 14' cut 10' - 20' $3,742.50 No Bid
24" 14' - 18' cut 10' - 20' $3,742.50 No Bid
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Section 3: Sewer Line Oper-Cut Point Repairs (cont'd)

Diameter Est. Depth Length of Repair Bid Price per LF
27" 0' - 10' cut 0 - 10' $3,173.75 No Bid
27" 10' - 14' cut 0 - 10' $3,173.75 No Bid
27" 14' - 18' cut 0 - 10' $3,173.75 No Bid
27" 0' - 10' cut 10' - 20' $3,930.00 No Bid
27" 10' - 14' cut 10' - 20' $3,930.00 No Bid
27" 14' - 18' cut 10' - 20' $3,930.00 No Bid

                                    TOTAL SECTION 3 $143,587.50

Section 4: Part 1: Water Pipe Installation

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit
3/4" Copper Service Line per LF $5.63 No Bid
1" Copper Service Line per LF $5.63 No Bid
1 1/2" Copper Service Line per LF $5.63 No Bid
2" Copper Service Line per LF $5.63 No Bid
2" PVC Water Line per LF $5.63 No Bid
4" PVC Water Line per LF $6.63 No Bid
6" DIP Water Line per LF $11.82 No Bid
8" DIP Water Line per LF $13.75 No Bid
10" DIP Water Line per LF $15.63 No Bid
Installation of Misc. MJ Fittings per Hour $141.88 No Bid

Section 4:  Part 2:  Miscellaneous Water Services

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit
New Fire Hydrant Installation w/Valve Lump Sum $1,133.75 No Bid
6"x4" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $945.00 No Bid
8"x4" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $945.00 No Bid
6"x6" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $945.00 No Bid
8"x6" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $945.00 No Bid
10"x6" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $1,043.75 No Bid
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Section 4:  Part 2:  Miscellaneous Water Services (cont'd)

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit
12"x6" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $1,043.75 No Bid
8"x8" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $1,133.75 No Bid
10"x8" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $1,228.75 No Bid
12"x8" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $1,228.75 No Bid
10"x10" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $1,417.50 No Bid
12"x10" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $1,512.50 No Bid
12"x12" Water Tap w/valve and box Lump Sum $1,890.00 No Bid

Section 4:  Part 3:  Water Service Connections

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit
3/4" Water Tap w/meter and box Lump Sum $662.50 No Bid
1" Water Tap w/meter and box Lump Sum $662.50 No Bid
1 1/2" Water Tap w/meter and box Lump Sum $756.25 No Bid
2" Water Tap w/meter and box Lump Sum $756.25 No Bid
Tie into Existing Water Service Line Lump Sum $141.88 No Bid

Section 4:  Part 4:  Water and Pipe Bores

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit
3/4" to 1 1/2" Pipe per LF $28.38 No Bid
2" to 6" Pipe per LF $34.07 No Bid
8" to 10" Pipe per LF $47.25 No Bid
12" to 16" Pipe per LF $71.75 No Bid

                                    TOTAL SECTION 4 $18,791.19
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Section 5: Miscellaneous Work

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit
Dump Truck and Operator (12 cyl) per Hour $86.25 No Bid
Dump Truck and Operator (20 cyl) per Hour $106.25 No Bid
Trackhoe and Operator per Hour $150.00 No Bid
Backhoe and Operator per Hour $103.75 No Bid
D5 Dozer (or equal) and Operator per Hour $114.38 No Bid
General Labor per Hour $45.00 No Bid
Service Truck per Hour $86.25 No Bid
Asphalt Cutting and Removing per Foot $8.75 No Bid
Concrete Cutting and Removing per Foot $8.75 No Bid
Haul off Dig-Out per Hour $416.25 No Bid
Haul Dirt (20 yds) per Hour $143.75 No Bid
Haul Dirt (14 yds) per Hour $106.25 No Bid
Fertilizing Seeding & Mulching Square Yard $1.25 No Bid

                                    TOTAL SECTION 5 $1,376.88

Section 6:  Fire Hydrant Repairs

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit
Replace Existing Fire Hydrant Lump Sum $1,325.00 No Bid
Replace Existing Fire Hydrant and Valve Lump Sum $1,701.25 No Bid
Raise Existing Fire Hydrant (12" to 18") Lump Sum $568.75 No Bid
Raise Existing Fire Hydrant (18" to 24") Lump Sum $568.75 No Bid

                                    TOTAL SECTION 6 $4,163.75
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Section 7:  Internal Cured-In-Place Point Repair

Work Description Bid Unit Bid Price/Unit
6" x 3' Long Each $2,670.00 No Bid
Additional LF - 6" per LF $125.00 No Bid
8" x 3' Long Each $2,985.00 No Bid
Additional LF - 8" per LF $132.50 No Bid
10" x 3' Long Each $3,300.00 No Bid
Additional LF - 10" per LF $132.50 No Bid
12" x 3' Long Each $3,615.00 No Bid
Additional LF - 12" per LF $145.00 No Bid

                                    TOTAL SECTION 7 $13,105.00
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