
Vendors
Consolidated Southern 

ITEM Product Pipe Pipe
1 ¾ x 3 Repair Clamp       $7.06 $8.75
2 ¾ x 6 Repair Clamp       $13.19 $16.05
3 1 x 3 Repair Clamp          $7.72 $9.15
4 1 x 6 Repair Clamp $14.04 $17.24
5 1½ x 3 Repair Clamp $8.53 $33.96
6 1½ x 6 Repair Clamp $16.07 $66.91
7 1¼ x 3 Repair Clamp $7.72 $33.26
8 1¼ x 6 Repair Clamp $14.04 $66.12
9 2 x 3 Repair Clamp $9.32 $11.80
10 2 x 6 Repair Clamp $16.88 $21.35
11 2 x 12 Repair Clamp $34.33 $43.36
12 3 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $112.00 $111.00
13 4 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $121.00 $120.00
14 6 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $156.00 $161.00
15 6 x 18 Emergency Clamp   $196.00 $266.07
16 8 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $172.00 $192.15
17 8 x 18 Emergency Clamp   $245.00 $312.87
18 10 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $218.00 $246.35
19 10 x 18 Emergency Clamp   $303.00 $278.50
20 12 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $265.00 $385.27
21 12 x 18 Emergency Clamp   $355.00 $449.65
22 4" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $747.00 $905.00
23 6" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $953.00 $1,280.00
24 8" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $1,519.00 $1,905.00
25 10" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $2,371.00 $2,875.00
26 12" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $2,997.00 $4,345.00
27 6 x 4 Tapping Tee $554.00 $645.00
28 6 x 6 Tapping Tee $630.00 $645.00
29 8 x 4 Tapping Tee $580.00 $610.00
30 8 x 6 Tapping Tee $650.00 $683.00
31 8 x 8 Tapping Tee $747.00 $865.00
32 10 x 4 Tapping Tee $650.00 $668.00
33 10 x 6 Tapping Tee $705.00 $718.95
34 10 x 8 Tapping Tee $820.00 $873.00
35 10 x 10 Tapping Tee $1,309.00 $1,492.00
36 12 x 4 Tapping Tee $655.00 $744.00
37 12 x 6 Tapping Tee $750.00 $801.70
38 12 x 8 Tapping Tee $907.00 $937.25
39 12 x 10 Tapping Tee $1,455.00 $1,557.50
40 12 x 12 Tapping Tee $1,486.00 $1,695.00
41 2" Coupling $151.00 $131.00
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42 3" Coupling $200.00 $172.00
43 4" Coupling $250.00 $221.00
44 6" Coupling $338.00 $292.00
45 8" Coupling $381.00 $330.00
46 10" Coupling $491.00 $425.00
47 12" Coupling $579.00 $560.00
48 3" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $587.00 $630.00
49 4" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $656.00 $715.00
50 6" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $836.00 $915.00
51 8" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $1,333.00 $1,450.00
52 10" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $2,080.00 $2,265.00
53 12" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $2,629.00 $2,875.00
54 5.25 x 3' Bury Fire Hydrant $2,556.00 No Bid
55 5.25 x 3.5' Bury Fire Hydrant $2,618.00 No Bid
56 5.25 x 4' Bury Fire Hydrant $2,680.00 No Bid
57 5.25 x 4.5' Bury Fire Hydrant $2,742.00 No Bid
58 5.25 x 5' Bury Fire Hydrant $2,804.00 No Bid
59 5.25 x 5.5' Bury Fire Hydrant $2,867.00 No Bid
60 5¼" Fire Hydrant 1' Extension Kit $893.00 No Bid
61 5¼" Fire Hydrant 1'-6" Extension Kit $1,011.00 No Bid
62 5¼" Fire Hydrant 2'-6" Extension Kit $1,619.00 No Bid
63 5¼" Fire Hydrant 3'-6" Extension Kit $1,999.00 No Bid
64 5¼" Fire Hydrant 4' Extension Kit $2,208.00 No Bid
65 5¼" Fire Hydrant Flange Repair Kit $250.00 No Bid
66 5¼" Fire Hydrant Main Valve Repair Kit $690.00 No Bid
67 5¼" Fire Hydrant Bonnet Repair Kit $107.00 No Bid
68 ¾" Corp Stop $56.00 $38.40
69 ¾" Curb Stop $103.00 $46.70
70 ¾" Meter Connector $16.00 $11.40
71 ¾" Copper Union $32.00 $21.36
72 ¾" Male Coupling $27.00 $17.54
73 ¾" Female Coupling $28.00 $18.45
74 ¾" Quarter Bend Union $39.00 $27.61
75 1" Corp Stop $85.00 $57.89
76 1" Curb Stop $158.00 $83.26
77 1" Meter Connector $24.00 $17.54
78 1" Copper Union $35.00 $24.44
79 1" Male Coupling $31.00 $20.78
80 1" Female Coupling $40.00 $25.04
81 1" Quarter Bend Union $50.00 $35.46
82 1½" Curb Valve $287.00 $194.15
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83 1½" Male Coupling $84.00 $56.92
84 1½" Female Coupling $107.00 $72.81
85 1½" Copper Union $120.00 $81.80
86 1½" Quarter Bend Union $167.00 $113.91
87 2" Curb Valve $418.00 $282.81
88 2" Male Coupling $120.00 $82.94
89 2" Female Coupling $127.00 $86.69
90 2" Copper Union $161.00 $110.42
91 2" Quarter Bend Union $337.00 $230.45
92 1½" x ¾" IPS Service Saddle $22.05 No Bid
93 1½" x 1" IPS Service Saddle $22.05 No Bid
94 2" x ¾" IPS Service Saddle $22.14 $29.09
95 2" x ¾" PVC Service Saddle $22.14 $29.09
96 2" x 1" IPS Service Saddle $22.14 $29.09
97 2" x 1" PVC Service Saddle $22.14 $29.09
98 4" x ¾" PVC Service Saddle $28.81 $63.40
99 4" x 1" PVC Service Saddle $28.81 $63.40
100 4" x 1½" PVC Service Saddle $36.40 $70.15
101 4" x 2" PVC Service Saddle $37.28 $70.15
102 6" x ¾" DIPS Service Saddle $38.29 $42.27
103 6" x 1" DIPS Service Saddle $38.29 $42.27
104 6" x 1½" DIPS Service Saddle $47.21 $51.48
105 6" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $47.21 $51.48
106 8" x ¾" DIPS Service Saddle $41.81 $44.26
107 8" x 1" DIPS Service Saddle $41.81 $44.26
108 8" x 1½" DIPS Service Saddle $52.15 $57.73
109 8" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $52.15 $57.73
110 10" x 1½" DIPS Service Saddle $68.79 $60.01
111 10" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $68.79 $60.01
112 12" x 1½" DIPS Service Saddle $80.84 $74.90
113 12" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $82.47 $74.90
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