

Nanley

BID FORM

This Bid is submitted for: MATERIALS AND DELIVERY – RIP RAP, SURGE AND GABION STONE, #1 STONE, CRUSHER RUN, MANUFACTURED SAND, CLAY GRAVEL, FILL SAND, RED DIRT - 12 MONTH SUPPLY

This bid is submitted to: City of Tupelo, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, MS 38804
(Owner)

The undersigned, in compliance with the request for bids hereby proposes to furnish **MATERIALS AND DELIVERY – RIP RAP, SURGE AND GABION STONE, #1 STONE, CRUSHER RUN, MANUFACTURED SAND, CLAY GRAVEL, FILL SAND, RED DIRT - 12 MONTH SUPPLY** for the City of Tupelo in accordance with the specifications provided for the following **UNIT PRICE** amount:

Item Description	Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Extension
Item 1: 300 LBS RIP RAP	5000	TONS	\$ 31.50/Ton	= \$ 157,500.00
Item 2: 100 LBS RIP RAP	5000	TONS	\$ 31.50/Ton	= \$ 157,500.00
Item 3: SURGE 8 inch	2500	TONS	\$ 30.50/Ton	= \$ 76,250.00
Item 4: GABION 6 inch	2500	TONS	\$ 31.50/Ton	= \$ 78,750.00
Item 5: #1 STONE 3 inch ROCK	2500	TONS	\$ 29.50/Ton	= \$ 73,750.00
Item 6: CRUSHER RUN	15000	TONS	\$ 26.50/Ton	= \$ 397,500.00
Item 7: MANUFACTURED SAN	1500	TONS	\$ 26.50/Ton	= \$ 39,750.00
Item 8: CLAY GRAVEL	5000	TONS	\$ 19.50/Ton	= \$ 97,500.00
Item 9: FILL SAND	2500	TONS	No Bid	—
Item 10: RED DIRT	2500	YARDS	No Bid	—

Bidder acknowledges that estimated quantities are not guaranteed and are solely for the purpose of comparison of Bids, and final payment for all Unit Price Bid items will be based on actual quantities, determined as provided in the Contract Documents.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES receipt of the following **ADDENDA**:

NUMBER: Bid # 2022-029 PW DATE: 8/29/22
 NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____
 NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____

Thank you
[Signature] 8/29/22

Cross Way
Trucking

BID FORM

This Bid is submitted for: MATERIALS AND DELIVERY – RIP RAP, SURGE AND GABION STONE, #1 STONE, CRUSHER RUN, MANUFACTURED SAND, CLAY GRAVEL, FILL SAND, RED DIRT - 12 MONTH SUPPLY

This bid is submitted to: City of Tupelo, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, MS 38804
(Owner)

The undersigned, in compliance with the request for bids hereby proposes to furnish MATERIALS AND DELIVERY – RIP RAP, SURGE AND GABION STONE, #1 STONE, CRUSHER RUN, MANUFACTURED SAND, CLAY GRAVEL, FILL SAND, RED DIRT - 12 MONTH SUPPLY for the City of Tupelo in accordance with the specifications provided for the following UNIT PRICE amount:

Item Description	Qty.	Unit	Unit Price	Extension
Item 1: 300 LBS RIP RAP	5000	TONS	31.75	158,750
Item 2: 100 LBS RIP RAP	5000	TONS	31.75	158,750
Item 3: SURGE 8 inch	2500	TONS	28.75	71,875
Item 4: GABION 6 inch	2500	TONS	N/A	—
Item 5: #1 STONE 3 inch ROCK	2500	TONS	28.25	63,125
Item 6: CRUSHER RUN	15000	TONS	26.25	393,750
Item 7: MANUFACTURED SAN	1500	TONS	26.25	39,375
Item 8: CLAY GRAVEL	5000	TONS	17.50	87,500
Item 9: FILL SAND	2500	TONS	N/A	—
Item 10: RED DIRT	2500	YARDS	N/A	—

Bidder acknowledges that estimated quantities are not guaranteed and are solely for the purpose of comparison of Bids, and final payment for all Unit Price Bid items will be based on actual quantities, determined as provided in the Contract Documents.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES receipt of the following ADDENDA:

NUMBER: #1 DATE: 8/23/22
 NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____
 NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____

~~* Fuel Surcharge is on other Bid form.
Explained~~

* Fuel Surcharge not to be added

Cross Way Trucking LLC

607 W Chambers Dr.
Suite # 1 Booneville, Ms 3889

Office Manager
Cici Geno (662)720-9970

Orders and Dispatch
Josh Smart (662)882-9467

Limestone, Gravel, Sand, Dirt
Bid for the City of Tupelo 2022-2023 (12 Month Supply)

Prices include Hauling and Material and are by the TON

Crush and Run	\$26.25
#1,4,6,56,57,67	\$28.25
# 7	\$30.25
Manufactured Sand (#9)	\$26.25
#89	\$30.25
Surge	\$28.75
100,200, 300lb Rip Rap	\$31.75
Clay Gravel	\$17.50

With the extreme fluxuation of Fuel Prices

*Fuel Surcharge IF the Mississippi State average (not nation wide) reaches \$5 per gallon there will be an additional \$1 per ton added to each price per ton. This is with no CAP

\$5 MS average = \$1 Fuel Surcharge

\$6 MS average = \$2 Fuel Surcharge

and so on.

Co Owner Josh Smart



BIDDER INFORMATION

Company Name: CROSSWAY TRUCKING LLC.

Company Representative: Josh Smart

Title: OWNER

Business Address:

Street: 607 W Chambers DR Suite #1

City: Booneville State: MS Zip: 38829

Phone: 662-882-9467 Email: joshua.smart@crosswaytrucking.com

Signature of Bidder:  _____

Date: 8/29/22

Tim May
May Farms

BID FORM

This Bid is submitted for: MATERIALS AND DELIVERY – RIP RAP, SURGE AND GABION STONE, #1 STONE, CRUSHER RUN, MANUFACTURED SAND, CLAY GRAVEL, FILL SAND, RED DIRT - 12 MONTH SUPPLY

This bid is submitted to: City of Tupelo, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, MS 38804
(Owner)

The undersigned, in compliance with the request for bids hereby proposes to furnish **MATERIALS AND DELIVERY – RIP RAP, SURGE AND GABION STONE, #1 STONE, CRUSHER RUN, MANUFACTURED SAND, CLAY GRAVEL, FILL SAND, RED DIRT - 12 MONTH SUPPLY** for the City of Tupelo in accordance with the specifications provided for the following **UNIT PRICE** amount:

Item Description	Qty.	Unit	Unit Price	Extension
Item 1: 300 LBS RIP RAP	5000	TONS		
Item 2: 100 LBS RIP RAP	5000	TONS		
Item 3: SURGE 8 inch	2500	TONS		
Item 4: GABION 6 inch	2500	TONS		
Item 5: #1 STONE 3 inch ROCK	2500	TONS	\$27.50	68,750.00
Item 6: CRUSHER RUN	15000	TONS	\$25.00	375,000.00
Item 7: MANUFACTURED SAN	1500	TONS	\$29.00	43,500.00
Item 8: CLAY GRAVEL	5000	TONS	\$15.00	75,000.00
Item 9: FILL SAND	2500	TONS	\$8.00	20,000.00
Item 10: RED DIRT	2500	YARDS	\$8.00	20,000.00

#57 Stone

\$22.50

Bidder acknowledges that estimated quantities are not guaranteed and are solely for the purpose of comparison of Bids, and final payment for all Unit Price Bid items will be based on actual quantities, determined as provided in the Contract Documents.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES receipt of the following **ADDENDA**:

NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____
 NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____
 NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____

BIDDER INFORMATION

Company Name: May Farms LLC

Company Representative: Cassie Owen

Title: Office Manager

Business Address:

Street: 544 Birmingham Ridge Rd

City: Saltville State: MS Zip: 38866

Phone: 662-869-2151 Email: office92056@aol.com

Signature of Bidder: 

Date: 8/26/22

Century

BID FORM

This Bid is submitted for: MATERIALS AND DELIVERY - RIP RAP, SURGE AND GABION STONE, #1 STONE, CRUSHER RUN, MANUFACTURED SAND, CLAY GRAVEL, FILL SAND, RED DIRT - 12 MONTH SUPPLY

This bid is submitted to: City of Tupelo, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, MS 38804
(Owner)

The undersigned, in compliance with the request for bids hereby proposes to furnish **MATERIALS AND DELIVERY - RIP RAP, SURGE AND GABION STONE, #1 STONE, CRUSHER RUN, MANUFACTURED SAND, CLAY GRAVEL, FILL SAND, RED DIRT - 12 MONTH SUPPLY** for the City of Tupelo in accordance with the specifications provided for the following **UNIT PRICE** amount:

Item Description	Qty.	Unit	Unit Price	Extension
Item 1: 300 LBS RIP RAP	5000	TONS	\$ 32.60	
Item 2: 100 LBS RIP RAP	5000	TONS	\$ 32.60	
Item 3: SURGE 8 inch	2500	TONS	\$ 31.45	
Item 4: GABION 6 inch	2500	TONS	\$ 32.60	
Item 5: #1 STONE 3 inch ROCK	2500	TONS	\$ 31.45	
Item 6: CRUSHER RUN	15000	TONS	\$ 29.70	
Item 7: MANUFACTURED SAN	1500	TONS	\$ 31.15	
Item 8: CLAY GRAVEL	5000	TONS	no bid	
Item 9: FILL SAND	2500	TONS	no bid	
Item 10: RED DIRT	2500	YARDS	no bid	

Bidder acknowledges that estimated quantities are not guaranteed and are solely for the purpose of comparison of Bids, and final payment for all Unit Price Bid items will be based on actual quantities, determined as provided in the Contract Documents.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES receipt of the following **ADDENDA**:

NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____
NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____
NUMBER: _____ DATE: _____

BIDDER INFORMATION

Company Name: Century

Company Representative: Adam Fowler

Title: Sales Manager

Business Address:

Street: 705 Robert E. Lee Dr.

City: Tupelo State: MS Zip: 38801

Phone: (662) 844-3331 ext. 255 Email: afowler@centurycg.com

Signature of Bidder: Adam Fowler

Date: 8/29/2022

Handwritten text, possibly bleed-through from the reverse side of the page. The text is extremely faint and illegible.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer any rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER Ross & Yerger Insurance, Inc. P.O. Box 1139 Jackson, MS 39215 601 948-2900	CONTACT NAME: Marty Hall
	PHONE (A/C, No, Ext): 601 948 2900 FAX (A/C, No): 601 355 3227 E-MAIL ADDRESS: mhall@rossandyerger.com
INSURED Century Construction Group, Inc. Century Construction & Realty, Inc. P.O. Box 1366 Tupelo, MS 38802	INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
	INSURER A : National Union Fire Insurance Company 19445
	INSURER B : Travelers Property & Casualty Co. of Am. 25674
	INSURER C : New Hampshire Ins. Co. 23841
	INSURER D : Transguard Insurance Company of America 28886
	INSURER E : INSURER F :

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

INSR LTR	TYPE OF INSURANCE	ADDL SUBR INSR (WVD)	POLICY NUMBER	POLICY EFF (MM/DD/YYYY)	POLICY EXP (MM/DD/YYYY)	LIMITS
A	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY <input type="checkbox"/> CLAIMS-MADE <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> OCCUR GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: <input type="checkbox"/> POLICY <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> PROJECT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> LOC OTHER:	X X	GL5268332	04/01/2022	04/01/2023	EACH OCCURRENCE \$1,000,000 DAMAGE TO RENTED PREMISES (Ea occurrence) \$500,000 MED EXP (Any one person) \$25,000 PERSONAL & ADV INJURY \$1,000,000 GENERAL AGGREGATE \$10,000,000 PRODUCTS - COM/OP AGG \$2,000,000 \$
A	AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> ANY AUTO OWNED AUTOS ONLY <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> HIRED AUTOS ONLY <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> SCHEDULED AUTOS NON-OWNED AUTOS ONLY	X X	CA4489814	04/01/2022	04/01/2023	COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT (Ea accident) \$2,000,000 BODILY INJURY (Per person) \$ BODILY INJURY (Per accident) \$ PROPERTY DAMAGE (Per accident) \$ \$
B	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> UMBRELLA LIAB <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> OCCUR <input type="checkbox"/> EXCESS LIAB <input type="checkbox"/> CLAIMS-MADE DED RETENTION \$		CUP9R4930692	04/01/2022	04/01/2023	EACH OCCURRENCE \$9,000,000 AGGREGATE \$9,000,000 \$
C	WORKERS COMPENSATION AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? (Mandatory in NH) If yes, describe under DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below	X	WC022298243	04/01/2022	04/01/2023	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> PER STATUTE <input type="checkbox"/> OTH-ER E.L. EACH ACCIDENT \$1,000,000 E.L. DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE \$1,000,000 E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT \$1,000,000
D	Inland Marine		IMP100072500	04/01/2022	04/01/2023	See Additional Remarks

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)
 * General Liability and Automobile Liability policies include blanket additional insured on a primary and non-contributory basis as required by written contract. General Liability, Automobile Liability and Workers' Compensation policies include blanket waiver of subrogation as required by written contract. Umbrella is follow form. To the extent required by written contract, applicable policies provide 30 days notice of cancellation to the certificate holder.
 (See Attached Descriptions)

CERTIFICATE HOLDER For Information Purposes Only P.O. Box 1366 Tupelo, MS 38802	CANCELLATION SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS. AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE <i>Dudley A. Woodley</i>
---	--

DESCRIPTIONS (Continued from Page 1)

Inland Marine Policy # IMP100072500

Effective: 04-01-2022

Expiration: 04-01-2023

Transguard Insurance Company of America

Builders' Risk Coverage \$15,000,000

Deductible \$ 2,500

Equipment Rented, Leased or Borrowed From Others: \$800,000 Any One Item

Deductible: \$ 2,500

Motor Truck Cargo Legal Liability: \$500,000 Any Land Vehicle or Container

Deductible: \$ 2,500

Trailer Interchange: \$40,000 Any One Trailer Limit

Deductible \$ 2,500



CENTURY
construction

August 29, 2022

City of Tupelo
71 East Troy St.
Tupelo, MS 38804
RE: Aggregate Bid (Limestone)

To Whom It May Concern,

Century Construction, established in 1997, is located in Tupelo, MS. Our company has grown exponentially in different areas of construction, but at this time, we would like to take the opportunity to introduce our trucking division. Century's Trucking division has established a strong sense of community and customer base by providing flexible and dependable service.

We have a very versatile fleet of trucks and trailers allowing us to haul many different types of aggregate materials, I'm sure you've seen some of them blocking intersections at events downtown. We are growing daily, adding new trucks and trailers plus updating our current fleet to be the most efficient in our area.

Here are examples of our current fleet:

1. **Thirty-Five Lightweight Trucks**
 - a. 30 of these being 2018 or newer
 - b. Currently have 10 more light weight Mack trucks ordered
2. **Fifteen Rip-Rap Trailers**
 - a. Eight of which are Class 5 rip-**rap** trailers that can haul an average of 25.5 tons
 - b. Currently have 2 more ordered
3. **Twenty-two Travis Trailers**
 - a. Lightweight aluminum trailers that can haul an average of 28 tons
 - b. Currently have 5 more Travis trailers ordered

We also have a good, core group of drivers and staff that have played a huge part in our success.

I've enclosed a copy of our certificate of liability, as you can see, we exceed your requirements.

We would appreciate your sincere consideration.

Thank you,
Adam Fowler
Sales Manager
662-687-2091
afowler@centurycg.com

Tupelo

705 Robert E. Lee Drive
P.O. Box 1366
Tupelo, MS 38802

205 East Troy Street
Suite 301
Tupelo, MS 38802

Phone: 662-844-3331
Fax: 662-842-7052

Ridgeland

400 West Parkway Place,
Suite 200
Ridgeland, MS 39157

Phone: 769-300-2266
Fax: 769-300-2267