2023-2024 Chemical Bid Overview

Chemical Description Company Quantity Price of Each Shipping Fees Total Cost
Awarded Breakdown Associated with
Bid Purchase

Muriatic Acid No Bid No Bid Needed | No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed

Accu-Tabs Memphis 60lb bucket $199.99 (3.33/Ib) | Shipping included in | $4779.76
Pools the bucket price

Shock: Granular No Bid No Bid Needed | No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed

Chlorine Needed

Perlite Filter Media Memphis 25Ib bag/ 39 $43.95 Shipping Included $1714.05
Pools per pallet

Calcium Chloride ACE 50lb bag/ 55 $25.60 $598.00 $2006.00

per pallet
Sodium Bicarb Janco 360 50Ib bag/ 49 $34.29 $80.00 $1760.21
per pallet

Acid-Rite Tablets No Bid No Bid Needed | No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed

CO2 AirGas Bulk Tank Fill No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed

Enzymes No Bid No Bid Needed | No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed

No Bid Needed = < $5,000 per Budget Year




Memphis Pools

Chemical Quantity Price of Each Shipping Fees Total Cost Bid Awarded to
Description Breakdown Associated with
Purchase
Muriatic Acid No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed
Accu-Tabs 60Ib bucket $199.99 Shipping $4779.76 Memphis Pools
(3.33/1b) included in the
bucket price
Shock: Granular No Bid No Bid Needed | No Bid Needed No Bid Needed | No Bid Needed
Chlorine Needed
Perlite Filter 25lb bag /39 | $43.95 Shipping $1714.05 Memphis Pools
Media per pallet Included
Calcium Chloride | 50lb bag/55 | $48.69 Shipping $2677.95 ACE
per pallet Included
Sodium Bicarb 50lb bag / 49 $54.19 Shipping $2655.31 Janco 360
per pallet Included
Acid-Rite Tablets No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed
Enzymes No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed

Aguatic Consulting & Equipment, Inc. (ACE)

Needed

Chemical Quantity Price of Each Shipping Fees Total Cost Bid Awarded to |
Description Breakdown Associated with
Purchase
Muriatic Acid No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed
Accu-Tabs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Memphis Pools
Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted
Shock: Granular No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Chlorine Needed
Perlite Filter 25lbbag /39 | $29.00 $598.00 $1729 Memphis Pools
Media per pallet
Calcium Chloride | 50Ib bag /55 $25.60 $598.00 $2006.00 ACE
per pallet
Sodium Bicarb 50lb bag / 56 $30.50 $598.00 $2306.00 Janco 360
per pallet
Acid-Rite Tablets No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed




Enzymes No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed

Needed
Janco 360
Chemical Quantity Price of Each Shipping Fees Total Cost Bid Awarded to
Description Breakdown Associated with
Purchase

Muriatic Acid No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed

Accu-Tabs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Memphis Pools
Submitted Submitted Submitted Submitted

Shock: Granular No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed

Chlorine Needed

Perlite Filter 25lb bag / 39 $72.03 $80.00 $2889.17 Memphis Pools

Media per pallet

Calcium Chloride | 50lb bag /55 $38.54 $80.00 $2199.70 ACE
per pallet

Sodium Bicarb 50Ib bag / 49 $34.29 $80.00 $1760.21 Janco 360
per pallet

Acid-Rite Tablets | No Bid No Bid Needed | No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed

Enzymes No Bid No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed No Bid Needed
Needed

No Bid Needed = < $5,000 per Budget Year




2702 Getwell RD - Memphis, TN 34118

ph 20 S48 1z SUT 355 408% ¢~

To: Ship to:
CITY OF TUPELO TUPELO AQUATICS CENTER
DEPT. OF PARK AND REC. 692 NORTH VETERANS BLVD
TUPELO, MS 98803 TUPELO, MS 38804
Salesperson  Phone Shipping Method Shipping Terms
RS 901-383-6080 LIL PPA
Qty ltem # Description
24.00 1080 60 LB. BUCKET ACCU-TABS SHIPPING INCLUDED
39.00 80001133 25 LB. BAG PERLITE SHIPPING INCLUDED

50 LB. BAG CALCIUM CHLORIDE SHIPPING
55.00 e INCLUDED
49.00 1241 50 LB. BAG SODIUM BICARB SHIPPING INCLUDED

Roke

FREIGHT BASED ON CURRENT ESTIMATES, FREIGHT SUBJECT TO CHANGE

Date 9/29/2023
Customer # 644002
Customer PO
I \"III¢III
Delivery Date Terms Quote good thru
net 30 SEPT. 2024
Unit Price Discount Line Total
S 199.99 S 4,799.76
S 43.95 $ 1,714.05
48.69 S 2,677.95
54.19 S 2,655.31
Total Discount
Subtotal $ 11,847.07
Sales Tax
Shipping
Total $ 11,847.07

Thank you for your business!

Memphis Pool Commercial Division

2762 Getwell Road Memphis, TN 38118 (888) 274-2892

£. ;\
A it f



| AQUATIC CONSULTING & EQUIPMENT, INC.

TO: Houston Yarborough- Tupelo Aquatic Center
Houston.Yarborough(@tupleoms.gov
662-397-7244

FROM: Brad Bachman- Aquatic Consulting and Equipment
DATE: October 9, 2023
RE: Chemicals

Per your request, I would like to quote the following:
1. Defender Filter media, Aqua Perl, 25Ib bags, PALLET 39 Bags- $29 each
2. Calcium Chloride 501b bags, PALLET 55 Bags-25.60 each
3. Sodium Bicarbonate 501b bags, PALLET 56 Bags- $30.50 each

4. Shipping for one pallet each via SAIA Trucking: $598

Brod Bachman

Aquatic Consulting and Equipment, Inc
905 Nightingale Walk
Suite B
Alpharetta, GA 30022



JANCO360,..

COMPLETE AQUATIC SOLUTIONS

Houston Yarbrough, Facility Operator
Tupelo Aquatic Center

692 S Veterans Memorial Blvd
Tupelo MS 38804

RE: Chemical Bid: Oct 1, 2023 — Sept 30, 2024

Pricing valid: Oct 1, 2023 - Sept 30, 2024

Perlite, 251b bag, 39 per pallet, sold by full pallet only $72.03ea
o 39 per pallet, pallet price $2,809.17

Calcium Chloride - 50Ib bag, 55 per pallet, sold by full pallet only - $38.54ea
o 55 per pallet, pallet price $2,119.70

Sodium Bicarbonate - 50lb bag, 49 per pallet, sold by full pallet only -
$34.29ea. Full Pallet Price, 49 bags $1,680.21

$80 PER DELIVERY

Thank you for your consideration, please call/email with questions.
Steven Janorschke, President

Janco360 Inc

&ﬁymgvmd&

STEVEN JANORS&HIKE | sTEVEN@IANCO360.cOM | 205-908-7415
COMMERCIAL AQUATIC SALES SERVICE AND INSTALLATIONS




