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2023-025WL LED LUMINAIRES 

6 MONTH SUPPLY BID 



TUPELO WATER & LIGHT DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION - LED LUMINAIRES
BID NO. 2023-025WL  
JUNE 9, 2023

Vendors

Stuart C. Nesco Daybreak Solarmax
Irby LED, LLC LED, Inc.

Item Product

LED Luminaires (6 Month Supply Bid)

1 8000 Lumens Multi-Volt 120/277 Type 5 $115.42 $125.00 $83.41 No Bid
Distribution 10kV/5kA Surge Protection 

Tool-Less Entry  

2 230 Watts 35150 Lumens Multi-Volt 120/277 Type 3 No Bid $352.28 $381.82 $272.00
Distribution 4000K 10kV Surge Protection

Color: Gray

3 270 Watts 31000 Lumens Multi-Volt 120/277 No Bid $585.23 $252.96 $353.00
4000K Yoke Mount 20kV/20kA Surge Protection

with Photo Control Receptacle and Adjustable
Output Unit, Color:  Bronze

4 270 Watts 31000 Lumens Multi-Vlt 120/277 No Bid $585.23 $252.96 $353.00
4000K Yoke Mount 20kV/20kA Surge Protection

with Photo Control Receptacle and Adjustable
Output Unit, Color:  Gray
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ADVERTISEMENT FOR PROPOSALS   
 

NOTICE is hereby given that the City of Tupelo, Mississippi will receive bids for: 
 

LED LUMINAIRES 
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID 

Bid # 2023-025WL 
 

Until 10:00 o’clock A.M. local time on June 9, 2023  
 
 
Bids can be submitted via sealed bid at the Purchasing Office, City Hall 1st Floor, 71 East Troy 
Street, Tupelo, Mississippi, 38804 or electronically at www.tupelomsbids.com.  Bid Documents 
and Specifications can be viewed and obtained online at www.tupelomsbids.com. 
 
Any questions regarding electronic bidding or access to bid documents should be directed to PH 
Bidding Group at 662-407-0193.   
 
Award will be made to the lowest and best bidder.  The Mayor and City Council reserve the right 
to reject any and all bids and to waive any and all informalities. 
 
BY ORDER OF THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TUPELO, 
MISSISSIPPI. 
  
        Jennifer Shempert 
        Purchasing Clerk 
 
 
Publishing Dates: May 11, 2023  
 May 18, 2023 

http://www.tupelomsbids.com/
http://www.tupelomsbids.com/
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LED Luminaires 
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID

Bid # 2023-025WL

I. GENERAL

The City of Tupelo will accept competitive sealed proposals until 10:00 AM, June 9, 2023, 
at City Hall, 71 East Troy Street, Tupelo, Mississippi 38804.  All proposals must be equal 
in performance and quality to the specifications. 

If City Hall is closed for business at the time of the deadline, proposals will be accepted and 
opened on the next business day of the City, at the originally scheduled hour. 

II. TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS & BID FORM

The City of Tupelo will be accepting proposals for LED Luminaires. This is a six (6) month 
supply bid. 

Specifications Unit Price 
Item 1:  8000Lumens Multi-Volt 120/277 Type 5 Distribution 10kV/5kA 
Surge Protection Tool-Less Entry 
(Equal or equivalent to American Electric WL1-D-PRM-D5-MP-TL) 

Item 2:  230 Watts 35150 Lumens Multi-Volt 120/277 Type 3 Distribution 
4000K 10kV Surge Protection, Color: Gray 
(Equal or equivalent to Howard Lighting LRL1SMV34KGY1P7N) 

Item 3:  270 Watts 31000 Lumens Multi-Volt 120/277 4000K Yoke Mount 
20kV/20kA Surge Protection with Photo Control Receptacle and 
Adjustable Output Unit, Color: Bronze 
(Equal or equivalent to Howard Lighting UFAMD74YB2R7NA) 

Item 4:  270 Watts 31000 Lumens Multi-Volt 120/277 4000K Yoke Mount 
20kV/20kA Surge Protection with Photo Control Receptacle and 
Adjustable Output Unit, Color: Gray 
(Equal or equivalent to Howard Lighting UFAMD74YG2R7NA) 

Daybreak LED Modern Series Model: BRNDB-XSY65W-40K
$83.41

Daybreak LED LuXx Series Model: STDB-VAL230W-T3-40K-GR-PC7

Daybreak LED ProFlood Series Model: FLDB-PRO-HZ-240W-40K-BR-PC7 

Daybreak LED ProFlood Series Model: FLDB-PRO-HZ-240W-40K-GY-PC7

$381.82

$252.96

$252.96

Daybreak LED
Highlight

Daybreak LED
Highlight

Daybreak LED
Highlight

Daybreak LED
Highlight



 

4 
 

General Bidders Requirements/Information 

1. The City of Tupelo reserves the right to reject any and all bids, to waive any informalities 
in the bid, or award the bid to whomsoever they may choose.  
 

2. The specifications, as stated, are minimum requirements and may be exceeded by the 
bidder.  However, no additional consideration shall be given for exceeding the minimum 
requirements and all bids will be evaluated against the specifications set forth in this bid 
package. 

 
3. Manufacturer’s part or item numbers are shown only to describe the item and to determine 

the level of acceptable quality.  Other manufacturer’s “equal” items may be bid.  The 
acceptance of “equal” items lies with the City of Tupelo whose decision shall be final.  All 
items shall be delivered FOB to Tupelo Water & Light Department, 320 North Front Street, 
Tupelo, Mississippi  38804. 
 

4. All bid prices shall be net, FOB destination, with transportation charges prepaid by 
vendor. 

 
5. The bid solicitation is for a supply contract of six (6) months with the City to have the 

option, at the end of the initial six (6) month period, to renew the contract for an additional 
six (6) months with no price increase if agreeable with vendor. 

 
6. All items will be ordered on an as needed basis during the life of the contract(s) resulting 

from this bid process.  Minimum order quantities shall be for truckload quantities. 
 
7. No bidder is required to bid on all items.  However, the successful bidder(s) shall be 

determined by item compliance to minimum specifications requirements. 
 
8. Delivery will be a consideration in the awarding of this bid. 
 
9. The burden of proof of specifications is the responsibility of the bidder. 
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III. QUESTIONS 
 
 Failure to examine any specifications and instructions will be at bidder's risk.  All procedural 

and technical questions, or if the attached specifications are incomplete, not clear, or not 
standardized, shall be made in writing and addressed to the following. 
 
General questions regarding this request should be directed to Jennifer Shempert, 
Purchasing Agent, at the City of Tupelo Purchasing Department, 71 East Troy Street, 
Tupelo, MS 38804.  The phone number is 662-841-6456.   Email:  
jennifer.shempert@tupeloms.gov  

 
 For questions concerning the technical specifications, prospective bidders may contact 

Drew Kyle Tupelo Water & Light Department.  The phone number is 662-841-6460.  Email: 
drew.kyle@tupeloms.gov 

 
Questions regarding the website or electronic bidding should be directed to Plan House at 
662-407-0193 or tupelo@planhouseprinting.com.  
 
No oral explanations by any member of the City staff will be binding.  Receipt of addenda 
must be acknowledged in writing.  Submitting vendors shall be responsible for ensuring 
that they have received any and all addenda. 

 
IV. OPENING: 
 

Proposal openings, whether electronic or traditional paper method, shall be conducted 
any time after they are received and shall be conducted by at least two procurement 
officials.  From that point forward, proposals will be considered under advisement. City of 
Tupelo may conduct written or oral discussions with potential bidders.  

 
The City of Tupelo reserves the right to determine responsive offers or proposals, waive 
minor informalities in the process, to reject any and all offers or proposals, and to invite 
priced bids from those companies believed most advantageous to the City. 

 

mailto:jennifer.shempert@tupeloms.gov
mailto:drew.kyle@tupeloms.gov
mailto:tupelo@planhouseprinting.com
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BIDDER INFORMATION FORM 

LED Luminaires 
6-MONTH SUPPLY BID

BID # 2023-025WL

The undersigned proposes to provide water materials which meet the specifications provided.  
The undersigned certifies that the minimum specifications, terms and conditions contained in 
this BID have been considered and understood.  By submitting a proposal, I/We do certify that 
the commodities offered do meet the specifications contained in this Invitation to Bid. 

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES receipt of the following ADDENDA: 

NUMBER: _________________________ DATE: _____________________________ 
NUMBER: _________________________ DATE: _____________________________ 
NUMBER: _________________________ DATE: _____________________________ 

BIDDER INFORMATION: 

Company Name: _____________________________________________________________ 

Company Representative: ______________________________________________________ 

Title: _______________________________________________________________________ 

Business Address: 

Street: _____________________________________________________________________ 

City: __________________________ State: ___________ Zip: ________________________ 

Signature of Bidder: __________________________________________________________ 

Date: ______________________________________________________________________ 

Daybreak LED LLC

John McCarthy

President

12980 IH 35 S.

Von Ormy TX 78073.

6/8/2023
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