


Vendors
Consolidated Southern 

ITEM Product Pipe Pipe
1 ¾ x 3 Repair Clamp       $7.18 $8.06
2 ¾ x 6 Repair Clamp       $13.40 $15.03
3 1 x 3 Repair Clamp          $7.84 $8.76
4 1 x 6 Repair Clamp $14.27 $16.01
5 1½ x 3 Repair Clamp $8.66 $9.71
6 1½ x 6 Repair Clamp $16.32 $18.31
7 1¼ x 3 Repair Clamp $8.07 $9.08
8 1¼ x 6 Repair Clamp $15.04 $16.86
9 2 x 3 Repair Clamp $9.47 $10.61
10 2 x 6 Repair Clamp $17.16 $19.21
11 2 x 12 Repair Clamp $34.88 $39.03
12 3 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $135.00 No Bid
13 4 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $145.00 No Bid
14 6 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $177.00 No Bid
15 6 x 18 Emergency Clamp   $226.00 No Bid
16 8 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $207.00 No Bid
17 8 x 18 Emergency Clamp   $281.00 No Bid
18 10 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $264.00 No Bid
19 10 x 18 Emergency Clamp   $369.00 No Bid
20 12 x 12 Emergency Clamp   $320.00 No Bid
21 12 x 18 Emergency Clamp   $433.00 No Bid
22 4" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $898.00 No Bid
23 6" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $1,271.00 No Bid
24 8" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $1,886.00 No Bid
25 10" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $2,846.00 No Bid
26 12" Tapping Valve - Less Acc $4,300.00 No Bid
27 6 x 4 Tapping Tee $487.00 $432.61
28 6 x 6 Tapping Tee $558.00 $454.24
29 8 x 4 Tapping Tee $536.00 $474.60
30 8 x 6 Tapping Tee $562.00 $519.20
31 8 x 8 Tapping Tee $709.00 $684.48
32 10 x 4 Tapping Tee $564.00 $588.63
33 10 x 6 Tapping Tee $589.00 $618.90
34 10 x 8 Tapping Tee $716.00 $768.36
35 10 x 10 Tapping Tee $1,215.00 $919.02
36 12 x 4 Tapping Tee $605.00 $598.03
37 12 x 6 Tapping Tee $649.00 $627.41
38 12 x 8 Tapping Tee $773.00 $816.48
39 12 x 10 Tapping Tee $1,268.00 $843.83
40 12 x 12 Tapping Tee $1,380.00 $1,259.22
41 2" Coupling $130.00 $134.41
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42 3" Coupling $171.00 $177.31
43 4" Coupling $220.00 $227.21
44 6" Coupling $290.00 $300.91
45 8" Coupling $329.00 $339.73
46 10" Coupling $424.00 $462.10
47 12" Coupling $559.00 $617.15
48 3" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $629.00 No Bid
49 4" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $713.00 No Bid
50 6" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $909.00 No Bid
51 8" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $1,449.00 No Bid
52 10" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $2,260.00 No Bid
53 12" MJ x MJ Gate Valve - Less Acc $2,861.00 No Bid
54 5.25 x 3' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,059.00 No Bid
55 5.25 x 3.5' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,133.00 No Bid
56 5.25 x 4' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,209.00 No Bid
57 5.25 x 4.5' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,283.00 No Bid
58 5.25 x 5' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,357.00 No Bid
59 5.25 x 5.5' Bury Fire Hydrant $3,432.00 No Bid
60 5¼" Fire Hydrant 1' Extension Kit $1,064.00 No Bid
61 5¼" Fire Hydrant 1'-6" Extension Kit $1,205.00 No Bid
62 5¼" Fire Hydrant 2'-6" Extension Kit $1,357.00 No Bid
63 5¼" Fire Hydrant 3'-6" Extension Kit $1,930.00 No Bid
64 5¼" Fire Hydrant 4' Extension Kit $2,128.00 No Bid
65 5¼" Fire Hydrant Flange Repair Kit $275.00 No Bid
66 5¼" Fire Hydrant Main Valve Repair Kit $787.00 No Bid
67 5¼" Fire Hydrant Bonnet Repair Kit $125.00 No Bid
68 ¾" Corp Stop $40.00 $38.25
69 ¾" Curb Stop $49.00 $46.71
70 ¾" Meter Connector $11.39 $11.40
71 ¾" Copper Union $22.27 $21.25
72 ¾" Male Coupling $18.08 $17.54
73 ¾" Female Coupling $19.05 $18.45
74 ¾" Quarter Bend Union $28.50 $27.61
75 1" Corp Stop $61.63 $57.89
76 1" Curb Stop $89.54 $83.26
77 1" Meter Connector $17.74 $17.54
78 1" Copper Union $25.54 $24.44
79 1" Male Coupling $21.58 $20.78
80 1" Female Coupling $26.84 $25.04
81 1" Quarter Bend Union $37.32 $35.46
82 1½" Curb Valve $210.47 $194.15



Vendors
Consolidated Southern 

ITEM Product Pipe Pipe

TUPELO WATER & LIGHT DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION - WATER MATERIALS (6 MONTH SUPPLY BID) 
BID NUMBER 2024-034WL
JUNE 19, 2024

83 1½" Male Coupling $60.88 $56.92
84 1½" Female Coupling $77.85 $72.81
85 1½" Copper Union $87.46 $81.80
86 1½" Quarter Bend Union $121.86 $113.91
87 2" Curb Valve $306.45 $282.81
88 2" Male Coupling $88.71 $82.94
89 2" Female Coupling $92.78 $86.69
90 2" Copper Union $118.12 $110.42
91 2" Quarter Bend Union $249.00 $230.46
92 1½" x ¾" IPS Service Saddle $22.41 $29.10
93 1½" x 1" IPS Service Saddle $22.41 $29.10
94 2" x ¾" IPS Service Saddle $22.50 $29.10
95 2" x ¾" PVC Service Saddle $22.50 $56.97
96 2" x 1" IPS Service Saddle $22.50 $29.10
97 2" x 1" PVC Service Saddle $22.50 $56.97
98 4" x ¾" PVC Service Saddle $29.28 $63.47
99 4" x 1" PVC Service Saddle $29.28 $63.47
100 4" x 1½" PVC Service Saddle $36.99 $70.15
101 4" x 2" PVC Service Saddle $38.89 $70.15
102 6" x ¾" DIPS Service Saddle $38.90 $44.57
103 6" x 1" DIPS Service Saddle $38.90 $44.57
104 6" x 1½" DIPS Service Saddle $47.98 $52.61
105 6" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $47.98 $52.61
106 8" x ¾" DIPS Service Saddle $42.48 $48.79
107 8" x 1" DIPS Service Saddle $42.48 $48.79
108 8" x 1½" DIPS Service Saddle $52.99 $62.76
109 8" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $52.99 $62.76
110 10" x 1½" DIPS Service Saddle $69.90 $60.01
111 10" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $69.90 $60.01
112 12" x 1½" DIPS Service Saddle $82.16 $74.90
113 12" x 2" DIPS Service Saddle $82.16 $74.90
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