ORDINANCE NO. 2024-41

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF TOMBALL, TEXAS AMENDING ITS
CODE OF ORDINANCES BY AMENDING CHAPTER 10- BUILDINGS
AND BUILDING REGULATIONS, BY REPEALING ARTICLE I. - IN
GENERAL, ARTICLE 1II. — BUILDING CODE, ARTICLE IIl. -
RESIDENTIAL CODE, ARTICLE IV. — AIR CONDITIONING AND
MECHANICAL WORK, ARTICLE V. - ELECTRICITY; AND ARTICLE
VI. - PLUMBING AND GAS AND REPLACING WITH A NEW ARTICLE
1 - IN GENERAL; PROVIDING FOR A PENALTY OF AN AMOUNT
NOT TO EXCEED $2,000 FOR EACH DAY OF VIOLATION OF ANY
PROVISION HEREOF; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY, MAKING
FINDINGS OF FACT; AND PROVIDING FOR OTHER RELATED
MATTERS.

* * * * * * * * * *

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Tomball, Texas, finds that it is in the best
interest of the health, safety and welfare of the citizens to update regulations pertaining to building
codes as set forth herein; now therefore,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TOMBALL,
TEXAS:

Section 1. The facts and matters contained in the preamble to this ordinance are hereby
found to be true and correct.

Section 2. Chapter 10 — Buildings and Building Regulations of the Code of Ordinances
is amended by adding a new Article I. — In General, to read as follows:

“Sec. 10-1. International codes adopted.

The following International Code Council Editions including listed appendix chapters ("'the

building codes") are hereby adopted by reference as though they were copied herein fully:

€)) 2021 International Residential Code® (for one and two-family dwellings

only)




(b)

2021 International Building Code® (for all other residential and

commercial construction)

(1) Appendix C, Group U—Aagricultural Buildings

(2) Appendix F, Rodent proofing

(3) Appendix G, Flood-Resistant Construction

(4) Appendix J, Grading

(©) 2021 International Mechanical Code®

(d) 2021 International Plumbing Code®
(@) Appendix B, Rates of Rainfall for Various Cities
(2 Appendix C, Structural Safety
3) Appendix D, Degree Day and Design Temperature
4 Appendix E, Sizing of Water Piping System

(e) 2021 International Fuel Gas Code®

(f 2021 International Energy Conservation Code®

() 2021 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code®

(h) 2021 International Property Maintenance Code®

(1) 2021 International Existing Building Code®

() 2021 International Performance Code®

(1) A: Risk Factors of Use and Occupancy Classifications

(2) B: Worksheet for Assigning Specific Structures

(3) C: Individually Substantiated Design Method

(4) D: Qualification of Characteristics for Design and Review

(5) E: Use of Computer Models




(K) 2021 International Solar Energy Provisions Code®

() 2023 National Electric Code® published by the National Fire Protection

Association

Sec. 10-2. Amendments to the International Residential Code.

(@)

(b)

Section R103 of said code adopted in section 10-1 is hereby amended to provide

as follows:

R103 Department of Building Safety. The enforcement of this code shall be under

the administrative and operational control of the Building Official. The Building

Official shall have such duties and shall be selected and serve in the position at the

pleasure of the City Manager and may be removed without cause by the City

Manager. The Building Official may appoint deputies to assist him/her. Said

deputies shall serve at the pleasure of the Building Official and may be removed

without cause by Building Official.

Section R105 of said code is hereby amended by adding a new section R105.10 to

provide as follows:

R105.10 Liability Insurance. The person or entity that will actually perform the

work or services covered by a permit shall provide to the City evidence of

comprehensive general liability insurance, issued by a company licensed to do

business in Texas, for the duration of the permit, and shall furnish certificates of

insurance to the City as evidence thereof. The certificates shall provide that the

insurance shall not be canceled, reduced, or changed without 30 days advance

notice to the City.




Comprehensive general liability insurance covering all risks associated with the

work, with a minimum limit as currently established or as hereafter adopted by

resolution of the City Council from time to time, or a property damage limit equal

to or exceeding the amount of the contract amount, whichever is greater.

(c) Section R108.2 of said code is amended to provide as follows:
R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. Fees shall be charged in accordance with the City's
master fee schedule, as it may be amended from time to time.
(d) Section R108.6 of said code is hereby amended to provide as follows:
R108.6 Work commencing before permit issuance. The fee for work commenced
without a permit shall be double the fee set forth in the master fee schedule adopted
by the City.
() Table R301.2(1) of said code is completed to provide as follows:
Ground Wind Seismic Subject to Damage From Winter Ice Shield
Snow Speed Design Weathering | Frost Line | Termite Decay Design Underlay
Load (mph) Category Depth Temp Required
0 110borc | A Negligible 6" Very Slight to 32 No
heawy moderate
Flood Hazards Air Freezing Index Mean Annual Temp
FIRM and FBFM as adopted by City Code Section 10-395 Firm | 9 69.9
and FBFM
(m)  Section R313.2 has been deleted in its entirety.
(o) Section P2603.5.1 of said code is hereby amended to provide as follows:

P2603.5.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal

systems shall be not less than six inches (6') below finished grade at the point of

septic tank connection. Building sewers shall not be less than eighteen inches (18")

below grade.




Sec. 10-3. Amendments to the International Building Code.

(a) Section 101 of the building code adopted in section 10-1 is hereby amended

by adding a new Section 101.4.7 and amending Section 101.4.1 to read as follows:

101.4.7 Existing buildings. This code shall apply to alterations, repairs, renovations

and additions to existing buildings as follows:

(1) If, within any 12-month period, alterations, additions, renovations,

repairs, or any combination thereof, costing in excess of 50 percent of the

then physical value of the building, or involving 50 percent or more of the

square footage of the building, are made to an existing building in the

floodplain, such building and associated mechanical, electrical, plumbing

and fuel gas equipment, fixtures and appurtenances shall be made to

conform to the requirements of this code applicable to new buildings in

regards to the Design Flood Elevation.

(2) If an existing building is damaged by fire or otherwise in excess of

50 percent of its then before such damage is repaired, it shall be made to

conform to the requirements of this code applicable to new buildings, except

in regard to slab height where the structure is located outside the floodplain,

the footprint is not modified, and the slab is intact.

(3) For the purpose of this section the physical value of the building

shall be its appraised value as shown on the county's latest tax roll.

Alternatively, upon filing an appeal to the Floodplain Manager, a

professional market appraisal for the pre-event evaluation, assessed post-

event, may be submitted for review.




(b)

Section 103 of said code is hereby amended to provide as follows:

()

103. Department of Building Safety. The enforcement of this code shall be

under the administrative and operational control of the Building Official.

The Building Official shall have such duties and shall be selected and serve

in the position at the pleasure of the City Manager and may be removed

without cause by the City Manager. The Building Official may appoint

deputies to assist him/her. Said deputies shall serve at the pleasure of the

Building Official and may be removed without cause by the Building

Official.

Section 104 of said code is hereby amended to provide as follows:

104. Duties and Power of Building Official.

104.1 General. The Building Official is hereby authorized and

directed to enforce all of the provisions of this code. The Building

Official shall have the power to render interpretations of this code

and to adopt and enforce written rules and supplemental requlations

in order to clarify the application of its provisions. Such

interpretations, rules and requlations shall be in conformance with

the intent and purpose of this code. Any reference in this code to the

code official shall mean the Building Official or the Building

Official's designee.

104.3 Notices and orders. Whenever any work is being done

contrary to the provisions of this code, the Building Official may

order the work stopped by notice in writing served on any persons




(d)

engaged in the doing or causing such work to be done, and any such

persons shall stop work until authorized in writing by the Building

Official to proceed with the work.

Section 105 of said code is hereby amended by adding a new section 105.8

(e)

to provide as follows:

105.8 Liability Insurance. The person or entity that will actually perform

the work or services covered by a permit shall provide to the City evidence

of comprehensive general liability insurance, issued by a company licensed

to do business in Texas, for the duration of the permit, and shall furnish

certificates of insurance to the City as evidence thereof. The certificates

shall provide that the insurance shall not be canceled, reduced, or changed

without 30 days advance notice to the City.

Comprehensive general liability insurance covering all risks associated with

the work, with a minimum limit as currently established or as hereafter

adopted by resolution of the City Council from time to time, or a property

damage limit equal to or exceeding the amount of the contract amount,

whichever is greater.

Section 109.4 of said code is hereby amended to provide as follows:

(f)

109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. The fee for work

commenced without a permit shall be double the fee set forth in the master

fee schedule adopted by the City.

Section 111.1 of said code is hereby amended to provide as follows:




()

111.1 Use and Occupancy. No building or structure shall be used or

occupied, and no change in the existing occupancy classification of a

building or structure or portion thereof shall be made, until the Building

Official has issued a certificate of occupancy therefor as provided herein.

Issuance of a certificate of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval

of a violation of the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the

City. Certificates presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the

provisions of this code, or other ordinances of the City shall not be valid.

Section 113.1 of the code is hereby amended to provide as follows:

(h)

113.1 General. Appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the

City's Building Official in interpreting or applying this code shall be to the

City Council. The City Council may obtain the assistance of persons who

are qualified by experience and training on a particular subject under

consideration.

Appendix J of said code is hereby adopted and the following sections are

amended as follows:

J106.1 Maximum Slope. The slope of cut surfaces shall be no steeper than

is safe for the intended use and shall be no steeper than 3 horizontal to 1

vertical (33 percent) unless the applicant furnishes a soils report justifying

a steeper slope.

Exceptions:

A cut surface may be at a slope of 2 horizontal to 1 vertical (50 percent)

provided that all the following are met:




1.1. It is not intended to support structures or surcharges.

1.2. It is adequately protected against erosion.

1.3. It is no more than 8 feet (2438 mm) in height.

1.4. It is approved by the Building Official.

A cut surface in bedrock shall be permitted to be at a slope of 1

horizontal to 1 vertical (100 percent).

J107.6 Maximum Slope. The slope of fill surfaces shall be no steeper than

is safe for the intended use. Fill slopes steeper than 3 horizontal to 1 vertical

(33 percent) shall be justified by soils reports or engineering data.

Sec. 10-4. Payroll records.

For purposes of enforcing this article, the inspector, or his designated representative, may

examine the payroll records for the preceding 12 months of the master, during normal

business hours. Should the master fail or refuse to make a full, true and accurate disclosure

of his payroll records, the inspector may, after written notification by certified mail,

withhold the issuance of permits to that master until such time as there has been a full, true

and accurate disclosure of the payroll records. Violation of this section will be subject to

the penalty as provided in section 1-14 of this Code.

Sec. 10-5. Suspension, withholding or revocation.

(a) When given a ten-day notice by reqistered or certified mail, and after a hearing

before a board appointed by the City Council, where the person notified may be represented

by an attorney at law of his choice, the holder of a license or certificate issued under the

provisions of this article may have his license or certificate revoked or suspended by the

City for any of the following reasons:




(1)

Habitual drunkenness or the use of narcotics.

(2)

Conviction of a crime involving moral turpitude.

(3)

Adjudication of insanity.

(4)

Fraud or misrepresentation in obtaining a registration or permit.

(5)

Violating on more than one occasion, either willfully or maliciously, or by

(6)

reason of incompetence, any provision of this article or the International

Standard Mechanical Code or amendments thereto.

Conviction of defrauding any person from whom he has rendered or

(7)

contracted to render service.

Securing permit for mechanical work not actually performed by the master

(8)

or by licensed employees under his control, supervision and direction. This

is intended to prevent a master from securing a permit for the purpose of

evading the spirit and intent of this article by entering into any simulated

scheme, transaction or device, whereby mechanical work will be done by

persons who are not employees of the master, or employees of his employer.

Securing a permit under any pretext for any installation concerning which

applicant has no valid contract. This is intended to prevent a master from

securing a permit for the purpose of evading the spirit and intent of this

article by simulated scheme, transaction or device, or performing

mechanical work without a valid permit.

(b) The City may withhold the issuing or renewal of a license or registration certificate

to an applicant by the same process used for revocation or suspension as described

in subsections (a)(1) through (8) of this section.




Sec. 10-6. Appeals.

Appeals of orders, decisions, or determinations made by the City's Building Official in

interpreting or applying building requlations shall be to the City Council. The City Council

may obtain the assistance of persons who are qualified by experience and training on a

particular subject under consideration.

Section 3. Chapter 10 — Buildings and Building Regulations of the Code of Ordinances
is amended by repealing Article I. - In General, Article 1l. — Building Code, Article Ill. —

Residential Code, Article IV. — Air Conditioning and Mechanical Work, Article V. — Electricity;

and Article VI. — Plumbing and Gas, as follows:




























Page 20 of 38















Page 25 of 38



Page 26 of 38






Page 28 of 38



Page 29 of 38



Page 30 of 38



Page 31 of 38



Page 32 of 38



Page 33 of 38



Page 34 of 38









Section 4. Any person who shall intentionally, knowingly, recklessly or with criminal
negligence violate any provision of this Ordinance shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and
upon conviction, shall be fined in an amount not to exceed $2,000. Each day of violation shall
constitute a separate offense.

Section 5. In the event any section, paragraph, subdivision, clause, phrase, provision,
sentence, or part of this Ordinance or the application of the same to any person or circumstance
shall for any reason be adjudged invalid or held unconstitutional by a court of competent
jurisdiction, it shall not affect, impair, or invalidate this Ordinance as a whole or any part or
provision hereof other any part or provision hereof other than the part declared to be invalid or
unconstitutional; and the City Council of Tomball, Texas, declares that it would have passed each
and every part of the same notwithstanding the omission of any and every part of the same
notwithstanding the omission of any such part thus declared to be invalid or unconstitutional, or
whether there be one or more parts.

Section 6. This Ordinance shall take effect immediately from and after its passage and
the publication of the caption hereof, as provided by law and the City’s Home Rule Charter.
FIRST READING:

READ, PASSED AND APPROVED AS SET OUT BELOW AT THE MEETING OF THE CITY
COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TOMBALL HELD ON THE DAY OF 2024.

COUNCILMAN FORD
COUNCILMAN GARCIA
COUNCILMAN DUNAGIN
COUNCILMAN COVINGTON
COUNCILMAN PARR



SECOND READING:

READ, PASSED, AND ORDAINED AS SET OUT BELOW AT A REGULAR MEETING OF
THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF TOMBALL, HELD ON THE DAY OF
2024.

COUNCILMAN FORD
COUNCILMAN GARCIA
COUNCILMAN DUNAGIN
COUNCILMAN COVINGTON
COUNCILMAN PARR

LORI KLEIN QUINN, Mayor
City of Tomball

ATTEST:

Tracy Garcia, City Secretary
City of Tomball



