
Mayor's "Know Local- Go Local" Initiative 

Thunderbolt Businesses 

Spotlight Recognition 

For July 2025 

WHEREAS, The Mayor's "Know Local-Go Local" Business Spotlight Program” was created 
in order to recognize and showcase local area businesses that are vital to the Town's identity. 
One of small-Town charm with local business that serve and support families in our community. 

This recognition program is exclusive to none, for we all stand to benefit as a community via 
prosperity of our Town's businesses. Through this program, members of the community are 
exposed to a variety of businesses that have displayed their desire to be excellent stewards. Not 
only their business, but of the community, ensured to support diversity in their workplace, and a 
desire to continue to do the excellent work, service, or craft they perform. 

It is with the forementioned values at the ready, I Mayor Dana Williams & Council proudly 
recognize and encourage all our citizens and visitors to visit these establishments, learn about 
them, view their websites, social media, and ultimately support these and all local businesses. 

Hereby the following is recognized as the Thunderbolt Business Spotlight of the week... 
 
 

The week of July 6th, 2025- "Know Local- Go Local" Spotlight is... 
 
Lammons Construction Company -Construction Company  

 
 

The week of July 13th, 2025- "Know Local- Go Local" Spotlight is... 
 

Mason Inc- Office Supply Store  
 
 

The week of July 20 th, 2025- "Know Local-Go Local" Spotlight is... 
 

Continental Self Storage- Self Storage  
 
 

The week of July 27th , 2025 - "Know Local - Go Local" Spotlight is... 
 

United Community Bank- Local Community Bank 
 
 

 We look forward to spotlighting all the businesses within the Town of Thunderbolt, as we 
continue to grow and develop as a Town and Community to support one another. 



 
 
Mayor's "Know Local- Go Local" Initiative 

Thunderbolt Businesses 

Spotlight Recognition 

For July 2025 

 

WHEREAS, The Mayor's "Know Local-Go Local" Business Spotlight Program was created in 
order to recognize and showcase local area businesses that are vital to the Town's identity. One 
of small-Town charm, with local  business that serve and support families in our community. 

This recognition program is exclusive to none, for we all stand to benefit as a community via 
prosperity of our Town's businesses. Through this program, members of the community are 
exposed to a variety of businesses that have displayed their desire to be excellent stewards of not 
only their business, but of the community as a whole, ensured to support diversity in their 
workplace, and a desire to continue to do the excellent work, service, or craft they perform. 

It is with the forementioned values at the ready, I Mayor Dana Williams and Council proudly 
recognize and encourage all our citizens and visitors to visit these establishments, learn about 
them, view their websites, social media, and ultimately support these and all local businesses. 

Hereby the following is recognized as the Thunderbolt Business Spotlight of the week... 
 
 

The week of July 27th, 2025- "Know Local - Go Local" Spotlight is... 
 

Lammons Construction Company 
 
 

Local Construction Company 
 
 
 
 

I and We look forward to spotlighting all the businesses within the Town of Thunderbolt, as we 
continue to grow and develop as a Town and Community to support one another. 

 

 

 
__________________________ 

Dana Williams, Mayor 
 
 



 
 
Mayor's "Know Local- Go Local" Initiative 

Thunderbolt Businesses 

Spotlight Recognition 

For July 2025 

 

WHEREAS, The Mayor's "Know Local-Go Local" Business Spotlight Program was created in 
order to recognize and showcase local area businesses that are vital to the Town's identity. One 
of small-Town charm, with local  business that serve and support families in our community. 

This recognition program is exclusive to none, for we all stand to benefit as a community via 
prosperity of our Town's businesses. Through this program, members of the community are 
exposed to a variety of businesses that have displayed their desire to be excellent stewards of not 
only their business, but of the community as a whole, ensured to support diversity in their 
workplace, and a desire to continue to do the excellent work, service, or craft they perform. 

It is with the forementioned values at the ready, I Mayor Dana Williams and Council proudly 
recognize and encourage all our citizens and visitors to visit these establishments, learn about 
them, view their websites, social media, and ultimately support these and all local businesses. 

Hereby the following is recognized as the Thunderbolt Business Spotlight of the week... 
 
 

The week of July 13th, 2025- "Know Local - Go Local" Spotlight is... 
 

Mason Inc 
 
 

Office Furniture & Design Company  
 
 
 
 

I and We look forward to spotlighting all the businesses within the Town of Thunderbolt, as we 
continue to grow and develop as a Town and Community to support one another. 

 

 

 
__________________________ 

Dana Williams, Mayor 
 
 



 
 
Mayor's "Know Local- Go Local" Initiative 

Thunderbolt Businesses 

Spotlight Recognition 

For July 2025 

 

WHEREAS, The Mayor's "Know Local-Go Local" Business Spotlight Program was created in 
order to recognize and showcase local area businesses that are vital to the Town's identity. One 
of small-Town charm, with local  business that serve and support families in our community. 

This recognition program is exclusive to none, for we all stand to benefit as a community via 
prosperity of our Town's businesses. Through this program, members of the community are 
exposed to a variety of businesses that have displayed their desire to be excellent stewards of not 
only their business, but of the community as a whole, ensured to support diversity in their 
workplace, and a desire to continue to do the excellent work, service, or craft they perform. 

It is with the forementioned values at the ready, I Mayor Dana Williams and Council proudly 
recognize and encourage all our citizens and visitors to visit these establishments, learn about 
them, view their websites, social media, and ultimately support these and all local businesses. 

Hereby the following is recognized as the Thunderbolt Business Spotlight of the week... 
 
 

The week of July 20th, 2025- "Know Local - Go Local" Spotlight is... 
 

Continental Self Storage 
 
 

Self Storage Company 
 
 
 
 

I and We look forward to spotlighting all the businesses within the Town of Thunderbolt, as we 
continue to grow and develop as a Town and Community to support one another. 

 

 

 
__________________________ 

Dana Williams, Mayor 
 
 



 
 
Mayor's "Know Local- Go Local" Initiative 

Thunderbolt Businesses 

Spotlight Recognition 

For July 2025 

 

WHEREAS, The Mayor's "Know Local-Go Local" Business Spotlight Program was created in 
order to recognize and showcase local area businesses that are vital to the Town's identity. One 
of small-Town charm, with local  business that serve and support families in our community. 

This recognition program is exclusive to none, for we all stand to benefit as a community via 
prosperity of our Town's businesses. Through this program, members of the community are 
exposed to a variety of businesses that have displayed their desire to be excellent stewards of not 
only their business, but of the community as a whole, ensured to support diversity in their 
workplace, and a desire to continue to do the excellent work, service, or craft they perform. 

It is with the forementioned values at the ready, I Mayor Dana Williams and Council proudly 
recognize and encourage all our citizens and visitors to visit these establishments, learn about 
them, view their websites, social media, and ultimately support these and all local businesses. 

Hereby the following is recognized as the Thunderbolt Business Spotlight of the week... 
 
 

The week of July 27th, 2025- "Know Local - Go Local" Spotlight is... 
 

United Community Bank 
 
 

Local Community Bank 
 
 
 
 

I and We look forward to spotlighting all the businesses within the Town of Thunderbolt, as we 
continue to grow and develop as a Town and Community to support one another. 

 

 

 
__________________________ 

Dana Williams, Mayor 
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