On-Call Public Works Construction Items
Bid Tabulation

. . Cruz Westhill Sullivan
Bid Opening: November 12, 2024, 2:00 p.m. (ITB #3334) Hernandez Construction | Contracting
g Sy Item Description and Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
No. Range
1 Demolition and removal of existing asphalt, excavation of
street section and disposal of all material.
0-500 CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $112.25
501 - 1,000 CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $110.92
1,001 - over CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $110.21
2 Unclassified excavation. Includes demolition, removal, and
haul. Refer to TxDOT Item 110.
0-50CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $112.32
51-100 CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $112.32
101 - over CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $112.32
3 Pulverizing existing asphalt and base material; 6" deep only
(no compaction).
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $18.95
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $18.95
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $17.06
Recycling or pulverizing existing asphalt and base material a
4 minimum of 6" deep; scarify subgrade 6" deep; compact and
finish subgrade and pulverize material complete in place
(95% subgrade and base compaction required).
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 20.85
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 20.85
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 17.06
Recycling or pulverizing existing asphalt and base material a
5 minimum of 6" deep; scarify subgrade 6" deep; compact and
finish subgrade and pulverize material complete in place (3%
Portland cement treated base and compaction required).
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $28.43
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $27.17
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $25.27
Milling existing asphaltic pavement 2" deep with haul-off of
6 . . )
materials and with traffic control.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $8.42
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $8.42
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid b7.72
7 Removal of existing asphalt, excavation of street section and
disposal of all material.
0-250 TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $322.92
251 -500 TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $280.80
501 - over TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $210.60
Place Type A Grade 2 base, compacted to 6" thickness,
8 complete in place (95% subgrade and base compaction
required).
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $29.69
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $28.43
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $25.27
Place Type A Grade 2 base, compacted to 8" thickness,
9 complete in place (95% subgrade and base compaction
required).
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $30.96
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $29.69
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $26.54
10 2" Type D, Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete overlay, complete in
place.
0-500 TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $273.78
501 - 1,000 TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $245.70
1,001 - over TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $210.60
11 3" Type D, Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete overlay, complete in
place.
0-500 TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $273.78
501 - 1,000 TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $245.70
1,001 - over TON per Ton No Bid No Bid $210.60
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12 Prime coat, A-EP at 0.25 gal/SY, complete in place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $3.79
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $3.79
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 53.16
13 Tack Coat, SS-1 at 0.15 gal/SY, complete in place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 2.53
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 2.53
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 1.90
14 Single Course Treatment, Grade 4 coverstone, CRS-2 @
0.40 gal/SY, complete and in place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 17.06
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 17.06
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 14.04
15 Single Course Treatment, Grade 4 coverstone, CHFRS-2 @
0.40 gal/SY, complete and in place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 19.31
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 19.31
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 18.25
16 Single Course Treatment, Grade 4 coverstone, CRS-2TR @
0.40 gal/SY, complete in place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 19.66
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 19.66
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 18.95
17 Fog Seal Treatment, TRMSS @ 0.20 gal/SY, complete in
place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 6.32
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 6.32
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 6.18
18 Fog Seal Treatment, TRFpg @ 0.20 gal/SY, complete in
place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 7.02
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 7.02
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 7.02
19 Fog Seal Treatment, CSS-1h @ 0.20 gal/SY, complete in
place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 3.16
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 3.09
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid 2.81
20 Rejuvenation Treatment, Reclamite @ 0.10 gal/SY, complete
in place.
0-1,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid No Bid
1,001 - 5,000 SY per square yard No Bid No Bid No Bid
5,001 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 Crack Sealing (Crafco Polyflex Type 3).
0-500LF per linear feet No Bid No Bid 53.16
501 - 1,000 LF per linear feet No Bid No Bid 53.16
1,001 - over LF per linear feet No Bid No Bid 53.16
22 Removal of curb without gutter.
0-500LF per linear feet 3.00 No Bid 42.12
501 - 1,000 LF per linear feet 3.00 No Bid 35.10
1,001 - over LF per linear feet 3.00 $2.00 35.10
23 Removal of curb and gutter.
0-500LF per linear feet 53.00 52.00 $56.16
501 - 1,000 LF per linear feet 53.00 52.00 $52.65
1,001 - over LF per linear feet 53.00 52.00 $49.14
24 Removal of reinforced concrete.
0-50 CY per cubic yard 26.00 200.00 182.52
51 - over CY per cubic yard 26.00 200.00 161.46
Valley Gutter, standard 7" depth, 3000 psi concrete, #4 bars
25 at 18" on center both ways. To include expansion joints,
setting forms, compacted subgrade (6" flex base).
0-50 CY per cubic yard 350.00 972.00 702.00
51 - over CY per cubic yard 350.00 972.00 631.80
Curb and Gutter, standard 24" section, 3000 psi concrete,
26 complete in place (Inclusive of 3-No. 3 bars). To include
setting forms and backfill behind curb.
0-50LF per linear feet 30.00 70.00 70.20
51-100 LF per linear feet 30.00 70.00 70.20
101 - over LF per linear feet 30.00 70.00 63.18
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Curb and Gutter, standard 30" section, 3000 psi concrete,
27 complete in place (Inclusive of 3-No. 3 bars). To include
setting forms complete and in place and backfill behind curb.
0-50LF per linear feet $31.00 $72.00 $77.22
51-100 LF per linear feet $31.00 $72.00 $77.22
101 - over LF per linear feet $31.00 $72.00 $70.20
Standup Curb, TxDOT Type I, 3000 psi concrete, complete
28 in place (Inclusive of 2-No. 3 bars). To include setting forms
complete and in place and backfill behind curb.
0-50LF per linear feet 30.00 50.00 70.20
51-100 LF per linear feet 30.00 50.00 63.18
101 - over LF per linear feet 30.00 50.00 56.16
Ribbon Curb, standard 6" x 12" section, 3000 psi concrete,
29 complete in place (Inclusive of 2-No. 3 bars). To include
setting forms complete and in place and backfill behind curb.
0-50LF per linear feet $30.00 $50.00 $84.24
51-100 LF per linear feet $30.00 $50.00 $70.20
101 - over LF per linear feet $30.00 $50.00 $56.16
30 Concrete Sidewalk, 4" thick, 3000 psi concrete with
reinforcement, including forms, complete in place.
0-1,000 SF per square foot 56.50 $14.00 $10.53
1,001 - 5,000 SF per square foot 56.50 $14.00 $9.83
31 Concrete Sidewalk, 6" thick, 3000 psi concrete with
reinforcement, including forms, complete in place.
0- 1,000 SF per square foot 58.00 $16.00 $11.93
1,001 - 5,000 SF per square foot 58.00 $16.00 $11.58
Concrete Pavement, 6" thick, 3000 psi concrete with
32 reinforcement, including forms, per city standard detail,
complete in place.
0-50SY per square yard 58.00 5180.00 $25.27
51 - over SY per square yard 58.00 5180.00 $21.06
Concrete Pavement, 10" thick, 3000 psi concrete with
33 reinforcement, including forms, per city standard detail,
complete in place.
0-50SY per square yard $9.50 5198.00 5189.54
51 - over SY per square yard $9.50 5198.00 $168.48
Structual Reinforced Concrete complete and in place (culvert
34 -
headwalls, retaining walls, box culverts).
0-50CY per cubic yard $350.00 No Bid $842.40
51 - over CY per cubic yard $350.00 No Bid 5702.00
Structual Reinforced Concrete slope paving complete and in
35
place (slope and flat work).
4" per square foot 57.50 No Bid $14.04
6" per square foot 57.50 No Bid $16.85
8" per square foot 57.50 No Bid $21.06
36 Rock riprap (grouted) and placement.
3"-5" per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 315.90
10" - 12" per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 280.80
37 Rock riprap (ungrouted) and placement.
3"-5" per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 5245.70
10" - 12" per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 5245.70
38 Typical Sidewalk Ramp Type 1 (TxDOT Standard).
0-5EA each $1,200.00 | $4,000.00 | $4,914.00
39 Typical Sidewalk Ramp Type 2 (TxDOT Standard).
0-5EA each $1,200.00 | $4,750.00 | $5,335.20
40 Typical Sidewalk Ramp Type 5 (TxDOT Standard).
0-5EA each $1,500.00 | $4,750.00 | $3,510.00
41 Typical Sidewalk Ramp Type 7 and 10 (TxDOT Standard).
0-5EA each $1,600.00 | $4,750.00 | $5,335.20
42 Typical Sidewalk Ramp Type 20 (TxDOT Standard).
0-5EA each $1,400.00 | $4,000.00 | $5,475.60
43 Adjust standard water valve boxes and install concrete collar.
0-5EA each No Bid| $1,000.00 | $7,020.00
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44 Adjust standard storm water and sewer manhole ring and
install concrete collar.
0-5EA each No Bid| $1,500.00 | $1,404.00
45 Unclassified Excavation: Includes haul off and disposal of
excess materials.
0-100 CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 421.20
101 - over CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 421.20
46 Structural Excavation: Includes backfill, haul off, and disposal
of excess materials.
0-100 CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 421.20
101 - over CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 421.20
47 Channel Excavation and haul off of materials.
0-500 CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 51,755.00
501 - 1,000 CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 51,404.00
1,001 - over CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid 51,263.60
Brick Street Repair: Removal and disposal of any excess
base; compaction of base to minimum 6" depth; setting of
48 City supplied replacement bricks to match existing brick bond
pattern; and brooming of joints with cement stabilized brick
sand.
0-50SY per square yard 350.00 180.00 No Bid
51-100 SY per square yard 350.00 180.00 No Bid
101 - over SY per square yard 350.00 180.00 No Bid
Pressure grouting: Grouting and leveling of concrete
49 pavement and sidewalks. Refer to TxDOT Special
Specification 3051.
0-50CF per cubic foot No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 - over CF per cubic foot No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pressure grouting: Grouting and leveling of concrete
50 equipment slabs. Refer to TXDOT Special Specification
3051.
0-50CF per cubic foot No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 - over CF per cubic foot No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 Saw Cut: Saw cut 6" deep joints with power-driven concrete
saws. Refer to TXDOT Specification Item 360.
0-50LF per linear foot 1.25 No Bid 13.34
51 - over LF per linear foot 1.25 No Bid 13.34
52 Saw Cut: Saw cut 8" deep joints with power-driven concrete
saws. Refer to TxDOT Specification Item 360.
0-50LF per linear foot 1.25 No Bid 14.04
51 - over LF per linear foot 1.25 No Bid 14.04
53 Curb Inlet: Install up to 5-foot wide curb inlet at depth of 8-
feet. Refer to TxDOT Specificaiton 465.
0-5EA each $1,300.00 | No Bid| $10,530.00
54 Curb Inlet: Install up to 10-foot wide curb inlet at depth of 8-
feet. Refer to TxDOT Specificaiton 465.
0-5EA each $1,300.00 | No Bid| $14,040.00
55 Clearing and Grubbing: demolition, removal, and rough
grading of surface. Refer to TXDOT Specification Item 100.
0-50SY per square yard No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sodding: plant and water block sod. Refer to TxDOT
56 o
Specification ltem 162.
0-50SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $12.64
51 - over SY per square yard No Bid No Bid $9.48
Lime Treatment (Road-Mixed): depth 6". Refer to TxXDOT
57 e
Specification ltem 260.
0-25TON per Ton No Bid No Bid 1,404.00
26 - over TON per Ton No Bid No Bid 1,263.60
Cement Treatment (Road-Mixed): depth 6". Refer to TxDOT
58 e
Specification ltem 275.
0-25TON per Ton No Bid No Bid 1,404.00
26 - over TON per Ton No Bid No Bid 1,263.60
59 Flowable Backfill: furnish, haul, and place material. Refer to
TxDOT Specification ltem 401.
0-10CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $702.00
11 - over CY per cubic yard No Bid No Bid $702.00
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