CHEMICAL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR 2024 - SUBMITTAL DEADLINE 11/13/2023

Brenntag Great Lakes, LLC

ALUMINUM SULFATE | ALUMINUM SULFATE SODIUM ..
CHEMICAL BIDDER (Iron-Free Grade) (FCC, Food Grade) FLUORIDE HYPOCHLORITE g s
ChemTrade $413.00 per dry ton $423.00 per dry ton
US Alco $664.95 per dry ton No Bid
5,078.26 per dry ton 1.98 per gallon 10.89 per gallon
Hawkins Inc $ perdry $1.98 per g $ per g
Rowell Chemical $1.96 per gallon
No Bid No Bid
Affinitiy Chemical
15.255 per gallon
Carus Corporation $ per g
. No Bid
Mosaic Co
No Bid
Solvay
No Bid

Hydrite Chemicals Co.

Jun-Dec 2023 Chemical Suppliers & Pricing

ChemTrade (rcc, Food Grade)
$413.00 per dry ton

Hawkins
$4,771.00 per dry ton

$1.88 per gallon

Rowell Chemical
$2.03 per gallon

Hawkins
$12.14 per gallon

Recommendation:
Chemical Low Bidder Price Quantity Total % change
Alum (FCC Food Grade) ChemTrade $423.00 per dry ton 400 Dry Tons $169,200.00 2.42%
Fluoride Hawkins Inc $5,078.26 per dry ton 12 Tons $60,939.12 6.44%
Hypo Hydrite $1.88 per gallon 80,000 Gallons $150,400.00 -7.38%
Phosphate Hawkins Inc $10.89 per gallon 16,000 Gallons $174,240.00 -10.30%




