
CHEMICAL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR 2025 - SUBMITTAL DEADLINE 11/11/2024
* Fluoride Submittal date 11/18/2024

CHEMICAL BIDDER

ALUMINUM SULFATE 

(Iron-Free Grade)

ALUMINUM SULFATE 

(FCC, Food Grade)
FLUORIDE*

SODIUM 

HYPOCHLORITE
Liquid Phosphate

ChemTrade

US Alco

Hawkins Inc

Rowell Chemical

Affinitiy Chemical

Carus Corporation

Mosaic Co

Solvay

Hydrite Chemicals Co.

Hawkins Hydrite Hawkins

$5078.26 per dry ton $1.88 per gallon $10.89 per gallon

Chemical Low Bidder Price Quantity Total % change

Alum (FCC Food Grade) ChemTrade $441.00 per dry ton 300 Dry Tons $123,300.00 4.25%

Fluoride Hawkins Inc $5,238.65 per dry ton 10 Tons $52,386.50 3.15%

Hypo Rowell $1.81 per gallon 80,000 Gallons $144,800.00 -3.72%

Phosphate Carus Corp $10.396 per gallon 18,000 Gallons $187,128.00 -4.53%

Recommendation:

Brenntag Great Lakes, LLC

ChemTrade (FCC, Food Grade)

$2.24 per gallon $11.04 per gallon$5,238.65 per dry ton

$1.83 per gallon

$1.81 per gallon

$10.396 per gallon

No Bid

No Bid

$423.00 per dry ton
2024 Chemical Suppliers & Pricing

No Bid

$431.00 per dry ton

$700.4426 per dry ton

No Bid

$441.00 per dry ton

No Bid

No Bid


