CITY OF ROLLINGWOOD

PAYMENT AUTHORIZATION

Date: 2/8/2023

Vendor: ATS Engineers/Inspectors/Surveyors
4910 West Hwy 290
Austin, TX 78735

Vendor ID: ATS

Nature of expense/expenditure:

Budget Code: See below

Invoice #: See below

Invoice Date: See below

Account No. Rollingwood

i

Justification of expense/expenditure:

Description INCODE [ Quanity Extended Cost|
Inv #412663 Building Plan Reviews 1/4/2023 100-5-15-5251 1 $1,198.75| $1,198.75
Inv #1-1154044 inspections 12/31/2022 100-5-15-5200 1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
0
TOTAL COST| $1,198.75
Approved by:
Department Supervisor: . Date:
Finance Dept: A Date: 02/08/23
/ N\
City Secretary: / Date:
City Administrator: G \J Date: 2 / ( O / 25




Engineers | inspectors | Surveyors

City of Rollingwood
Attn: City Administrator
403 Nixon Drive
Rollingwood, TX 78746

Residential Plan Review - 2022-149
Centre One - Remodel

\3]83 Bee Caves Suite 202

'1.25hrs (@ $95/hr

ﬁi/4/23» B

New Residence
200 Vale Street
l/4f_’ 3

i

Residential Plan R -2022-145
Remodel
5014 Rollingwood Drive

1/16/23

DATE INVOICE
1/4/2023 412663

P.O. #: . DUE DATE

2/28/2023

118.75

100.00

100.00

Payments/Credits

Balance Due |

4910 West Hwy 280, Austin Texas 78735

§12-328-6995
Page 1



i S DATE | INVOICE

Engineers | Inspectors | Surveyors 1/4/20273 412663

City of Rollingwood

Attn: City Administrator . ) _— )
403 Nixon Drive P.0. DUE DATE
Rollingwood, TX 78746

2/28/2023

Residential Plan Review - 2022-74 106.00
‘New Residence - Plan Change
14707 Timberline Drive

823

Commercial Plan Review - 2022-108
Live Oak Office Tenant Improvement
2725 Bee Caves Road

4hrs @ $95/hr

.....

1/30/23

i’aymr.axsts./{‘,redits $0.00

We accept cash, checks, Visa, Master Card, American Express, and Discover. Youmay call 512.328.6993 to charge by phone. A late fee will
be added to the invoice total for $15.00 or 10% of the invoice balance, whichever the greater, if payment is not received immediately.

Balance Due £1.198.75

4910 West Hwy 2980, Austin Texas 787358
£12-328-6995
Page 2



A,bel.‘Cameos

From: Nikki Dykes

Sent: Monday, February 6, 2023 11:21 AM

To: Abel Campos

Subject: FW: ATS Plan Review Monthly Invoice January 2023
Attachments: Rollingwood_412663.pdf

Abel,

Please find the ATS review invoice for January 2023 attached.
Thank you! Sincerely,

Nikki Stauvtzenberger

Development Services Manager

Qualified Conshruction Stormwater Inspector #6628
City of Rollingwood

512.327.1838

www.rollingwoodtx.gov

RELLINGWOOD

From: Kathryn Cano <kathryn_cano@ats-engineers.com>
Sent: Monday, February 6, 2023 11:16 AM

To: Nikki Dykes <ndykes@rollingwoodtx.gov>; Development Services <developmentservices@rollingwoodtx.gov>
Subject: ATS Plan Review Monthly Invoice January 2023

Nikki,
Hello! Please find the attached monthly invoice for January. Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you!

I{a.thh.y.n. Cano-
Building Plan Review Department Coordinator

ATS Engineers, Inspectors & Surveyors
4910 West Hwy. 290

Austin, TX 78735

512.636.4670 work cell

512.328.6995 ext. 160

512.328.6996 fax

TBPE Firm Reg. #2487 TBPLS Firm Reg. #10126000
www.ats-engineers.com



