CITY OF ROLLINGWOOD \'\_ \\
PAYMENT AUTHORIZATION / \\
Date: 4/6/2021 Budget Code: See below
Vendor: ATS Engineers/Inspectors/Surveyors Invoice #: See below
4910 West Hwy 290 Invoice Date: See below
Austin, TX 78735 Account No. Rollingwood
Vendor ID: ATS
Nature of expense/expenditure:
Justification of expense/expenditure:
Description Quanity Extended Cost|
Inv #373841  100/5200/15 Building Plan Reviews 3/31/2021 1 $490.00 $490.00
Inv #1-932914 100/5251/15 Inspections 1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
0
TOTAL COST $490.00
Approved by:
Department Supervisor: / Date:
Finance Dept: p Date: 04/06/21
@
City Secretary: : —/Pf\/\/ Date: DL;'/ “—l’ / 2!
-
City Administrator: M Date: L. o ?/(




Al S DATE | INVOICE

Engineers | Inspectors | Surveyors 3/31/2021 373841

City of Rollingwood

Attn: City Administrator . :
403 Nixon Drive P.0. % DUE DATE
Rollingwood, TX 78746

4/30/2021

Residential Plan Review 100.00
Pool

14912 Rollingwood Drive

3/17/21

@a s

1 (.n. 5 6 SR S 5 & & = - R £ ?i‘
gResxdentlai Plan Review 100.00
i New Residence
1205 Ashworth Drive

132621

Sales Tax 0.00
Payments/Credits $0.00
We accept cash, checks, Visa, Master Card, American Express, and Discover, You may call 512.328.6995 to charge by phone. A late fee will
be added to the invoice total for $15.00 or 10% of the invoice balance, whichever the greater, if payment is not received by
Balance Due $490.00

4910 West Hwy 280, Austin Texas 78738
512-328-6995



Abel Campos

From: Carrie Caylor

Sent: Tuesday, April 6, 2021 9:45 AM
To: Abel Campos

Subject: FW: Plan Review Invoice
Attachments: 373841 - RW.pdf

Hey Abel,

Here is the invoice for ATS plan reviews.

Thanks!

Carrie Caylor
Director of Development
City of Rollingwood
512.327.1838

www.rollingwoodix.gov

From: Jaime Lanka <Jaime_Lanka@ats-engineers.com>

Sent: Tuesday, April 6, 2021 9:11 AM

To: Carrie Caylor <ccaylor@rollingwoodtx.gov>

Cc: Christina Buckner <christina_buckner@ats-engineers.com>
Subject: Plan Review Invoice

Hi Carrie, hope you're well! Please see attached for March.

Thanks,

Jaime Lanka
City Services Coordinator

Certified Residential Plans Examiner
ATS Engineers, Inspectors and Surveyors
4910 West Hwy. 290

Austin, TX 78735

737.346.8246 mobile

512.328.6995 ext. 160

512.328.6996 fax

TBPE Firm Reg. #2487

TBPLS Firm Reg. #10126000

www.ats-engineers.com
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