CITY OF ROLLINGWOOD
PAYMENT AUTHORIZATION

Date: 3/14/2023 Budget Code: See below

Vendor: ATS Engineers/Inspectors/Surveyors Invoice #: See below
4910 West Hwy 290 Invoice Date: See below
Austin, TX 78735 Account No. Rollingwood

Vendor ID: ATS

Nature of expense/expenditure:

Justification of expense/expenditure:

Description INCODE Extended Cost
Inv #412663 Building Plan Reviews 1/4/2023 104-5-15-5251 $0.00 $0.00
Inv #1-1163080 Inspections 1/31/2023 140-5-15-8200 $3,135.00{ $3,135.00
inv #414255 Inspections 1/31/2023 100-5-15-5200 1 $65.00 $65.00
Inv #1-1173419 Inspections 2/28/2023 130-5-15-5200 1 $2,540.00] $2,540.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00
1 $0.00 $0.00

0
TOTAL COST|  $5,740.00

Approved by:

Department Supervisor: ]

Finance Dept:

N
-

City Secretary:

{
City Administrator: g k \ /\}

Date:

Date:

03/14/23

Date:

Date
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Engineers I lnspectors ] Surveyors

3
phSt o

City of Rollingwood
Attn; City Administrator
403 Nixon Drive
Rollingwood, TX 78746

, Eec g
Rolhnfm ood

Frame-Mechanical-Flectrical
102 Riley Road, Rolimgwaod ‘

Plumbing Ti@um nspection (F assed - 1/11/202:
Rnlhngwe@d

DATE INVOICE
1/31/2023 I-1163080
P.O.# DUE DATE
3/2/2023

-Plumbing Reinspection (Passed - 1/23/2023) at

Balance Due

4810 West Hwy 290, Austin Texas 78735

§12-328-6995
Page 1



o DATE = INVOICE
1312023 11163080

Engineers | Inspectors | Surveyors

City of Rollingwood

Atin: City Administrator % . P i
‘ : 2.0, #: : E DATE
403 Nixon Drive 5.0 DUE :

E
Rollingwood, TX 78746

3/2/2023

1 )mm
lingwood

Frame Enspect;s_u{(‘?asset'i’ - 13‘/;9‘//1120233 at 3101 Bee C
(Commercial)

Frame-Mechanical-Electrical-Plumbing Inspection (Failed - 1/6/2023) at 3101 0.00
ste 200 Bee Caves Rd, Rollingwood (Commercial)

echanical Inspection (Passed - 1/

Rollingwood (Commercial)

Frame-Mechanical-Electrical Inspection (Passed - 1/25/2023) at 3103 ste 204 75.00
Bee Caves Rd, Rollingwood (Commercial) |

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

4910 West Hwy 290, Austin Texas 787358
812-328-6995
Page 2



DATE  INVOICE
1/31/2023 11163080

Engineers | Inspectors | Surveyors

City of Rollingwood

Attn: City Administrator : ~ |
¢ >0, #: DUE DATE
403 Nixon Drive P.0.# :
Rollingwood, TX 78746
ollingwoo 32/2003

PQG% %
Rolim wad

Femporary Power Inspection (Passed - 1/4/2023) at 4 Michelle Circle, | 65.00

| Final E Ieatmmﬂ?lumbmﬂ Inspection (Passed - 1/12/2023) at 401 Vak St

Rollingwood

ctio A : o
Mechanical, Electrical and/or Plumbing Inspection (Passed - 1/26/2023) at 402

Inwood, Rollin ‘m*oqgi

rame-Mechanical-Electrical-Plumbing Inspection (Reinspect required - ! 65.00
1/6/2023) at 4814 Rollingwood Dr., Rollingwood

Frame iﬁspectmn (Correct and Proceed - 1/18/2023) at 4906 Timberline Drive, 65.00
Rollingwood :

Foundation Pre-pour Inspeuzon AD (Passed -1/ 16/7073) (11; ‘?(}14 POOL | 6:'5 00 o

Timberline, Rollingwood Payments/Credits

Balance Due

4910 West Hwy 290, Austin Texas 78735
812-328-6985
Page 3



City of Rollingwood
Attn: City Administrator
403 Nixon Drive
Rollingwood, TX 78746

DATE = INVOICE
1312023 11163080
P.O. #: DUE DATE
3/2/2023

Payments/Credits

$0.00

We accept cash, checks, Visa, Master Card, American Express, and Discover. You may call 512.328.6995 to charge by phone. A late fee will
be added to the invoice total for $15.00 or 10% of'the invoice balance, whichever the greater, if payment is not received immediately.

Balance Due

$3.135.00

4910 West Hwy 290, Austin Texas 78735

§12-328-6995
Page 4



Abel Campos

From: Development Services

Sent: Tuesday, March 14, 2023 1:44 PM

To: Abel Campos

Subject: FW: Reminder - Past Due Invoice: Invoice 1-1163080 from ATS Engineers, Inspectors, &
Surveyors

Attachments: Inv_I1163080_from_ATS_Engineers_Inspectors__Surveyors_13069350_27656.pdf

Thank you! Sincerely,

Nikki Staulzenberger
Development Services Manager
Qualified Construction Stormwater Inspector #6628
City of Rollingwood

512.327.1838

www rollingwoodtx.gov

RELLINGWOOD

TERHS e

From: Meredith Widlaski <meredith_widlaski@ats-engineers.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 14, 2023 1:05 PM

To: Development Services <developmentservices@rollingwoodtx.gov>
Cc: Desiree Adair <dadair@rollingwoodtx.gov>; Abel Campos <acampos@rollingwoodtx.gov>
Subject: Reminder - Past Due Invoice: Invoice I-1163080 from ATS Engineers, Inspectors, & Surveyors

Dear Customer,

Just a reminder that we haven't received a payment for your past due invoice-l-
1163080 for 3,135.00. If you have not already done so, please remit payment at
your earliest convenience.

If you have questions, please contact us at 512.328.6995 ext. 0, or via email to
Lucy_Zamora@ats-engineers.com.

Thank you for your business, we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,
ATS Engineers, Inspectors, & Surveyors

: 1



. 512-328-6995
~ ATS:Engineers.com




DATE | INVOICE |
1/31/2023 414255

Engineers | Inspectors | Surveyors

City of Rollingwood , :
Attn: City Administrator } . . J—
403 Nixon Drive ; P.0. # DUE DATE

|
Rollingwood, TX 78746 f

37272023

Building - Mechanical - Electrical - Plumbing Final Inspection at 5012 65.00
Timberline Dr., Rollingwood, TX, 78746
Inspection Results:

Building Final - (Passed)

Mechanical Final - (Passed)

Electrical Final - (Passed)
Plumbing Final - (Passed)
Completed on 01/09/2023

Payments/Credits $0.00

We accept cash, checks, Visa, Master Card, American Express, and Discover. You may call 512.328.6995 to charge by phone. A late fee will

be added to the mvoice total for $15.00 or 10% ofthe invoice balance, whichever the greater, if payment is not received immediately.

Balance Due $65.00

4810 West Hwy 290, Austin Texas 78735
512-328-6985



Abel Campos

A B
From: Development Services
Sent: Tuesday, March 14, 2023 1:44 PM
To: Abel Campos
Subject: FW: Reminder - Past Due Invoice: Invoice 414255 from ATS Engineers, Inspectors, &
Surveyors
Attachments: Inv_414255_from_ATS_Engineers_Inspectors__Surveyors_13075547_27656.pdf

Thank you! Sincerely,

Nikki Stavizenberger
Development Services Manager
Quadlified Construction Stormwater Inspecior #6628
City of Rollingwood

512.327.1838

www.rollingwoodtx.gov

RELLINGWOOD |

TELNE e

From: Meredith Widlaski <meredith_widlaski@ats-engineers.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 14, 2023 1:04 PM

To: Development Services <developmentservices@rollingwoodtx.gov>
Cc: Desiree Adair <dadair@rollingwoodtx.gov>; Abel Campos <acampos@rollingwoodtx.gov>
Subject: Reminder - Past Due Invoice: Invoice 414255 from ATS Engineers, Inspectors, & Surveyors

Dear Customer,

Just a reminder that we haven't received a payment for your past due invoice-
414255 for 65.00. If you have not already done so, please remit payment at your
earliest convenience.

If you have questions, please contact us at 512.328.6995 ext. 0, or via email to
Lucy Zamora@ats-engineers.com.

Thank you for your business, we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,
_ATS Engineers, Inspectors, & Surveyors




. 512-328-6995
_ ATS-Engineers.com




Engineers | Inspectors | Surveyors 2/28/2023

11173419

City of Rollingwood
Attn: City Administrafor

403 Nixon Drive P.O. #: DUE DATE
Rollingwood, TX 78746

3/36/2023

Final Mechanical Inspection (Passed - 2/6/2023) at 2900 Bee Cave Rd, 75.00
Rollingwood (Commercial)

}?"00% Deck bteei Bozadmff ln::vpé:ctzonj(Paxsed 2/14/2023) at 304 Almarion 65.00
Drive, Rollingwooc

Wallboard Ir Inspnc‘{mﬂ (Pﬂssé& ’2/2{3/2132?) a

Rollingwood (Commercial)

Payments/Credits

Balance Due

4810 West Hwy 290, Austin Texas 787358
512-328-6995
Page 1



Y Y K DATE  INVOICE |
Engmeers i inspectors l Surveyors 2/18/2023 11173419

Attn: City Administrator

403 Nixon Drive Fo. # | DUEDATE
Rollingwood, TX 78746 |

ri”aa% Baﬁaimg Lmiergmund lectrical insp{:gé;(Sn (?assﬁd FVZ 23/ 2023) at 402 “ - ' f}‘?'{)ﬂ
Pool Inwood Rollingwood f

Iralm Runspee‘nen (Passed ~ 2 9/20/.%} at 4814 R@Iimg.m ood Dr.,
Rollingwood

}’aymems/ Credits

Balance Dueé

4910 West Hwy 290, Austin Texas 78735
512-328-6%95
Page 2



DATE  INVOICE |

Engineers | Inspectors | Surveyors 2/28/2023 I-1 ;,734195

City of Rollingwood .
Attn: City Administrator ‘ 4 ) . e
403 Nixon Drive P.O. #: DUE DATE
Rollingwood, TX 78746 f _ ,

; 3/30/2023

Rollingw
Water Line Inspection (Passed - 2/15/2023) at 4826 Rollingwood Dr.,
Rol

M, g
Electrical Meter Ins
Rollingwood
3

pection (Passed - 2/16/2023

d 1

“lectrical Rough Inspection (Passed - 2
Rollingwood

Payments/Credits $0.00

We accept cash, checks, Visa, Master Card, Anierican Express, and Discover. You may call §12.328.6993 to charge by phone. A late fee will
be added to the invoice total for $15.00 or 10% of the inveice balance, whichever the greater, if payment is not received immediately.

Balance Due £2.540.00

A910 West Hwy 290, Austin Texas 78735
512-328-6995
Page 3



Abel Campos

From: Development Services

Sent: Monday, March 6, 2023 1:54 PM

To: ~ Abel Campos

Subject: FW: Invoice I1-1173419 from ATS Engineers, Inspectors, & Surveyors
Attachments: Inv_11173419_from_ATS_Engineers_Inspectors__Surveyors_4876.pdf

Thank you! Sincerely,

Nikki Stautzenberger
Development Services Manager
Quualified Consfruction Stormwater Inspector #6628
City of Rollingwood

512.327.1838

www rollingwoodix.caov

ROLLINGWOOD |

TEXAS.

From: Lupita Garcia <Lupita_Garcia@ats-engineers.com>

Sent: Friday, March 3, 2023 11:27 AM

To: Development Services <developmentservices@rollingwoodtx.gov>

Cc: Desiree Adair <dadair@rollingwoodtx.gov>; Abel Campos <acampos@rollingwoodtx.gov>
Subject: Invoice -1173419 from ATS Engineers, Inspectors, & Surveyors

Dear Customer:

Your invoice-1-1173419 for 2,540.00 is attached. Please remit payment at your
earliest convenience.

Thank you for your business - we appreciate it very much.

Sincerely,
ATS Engineers, Inspectors, & Surveyors

512-328-6995
ATS-Engineers.com







