
Hailey Roessler <clerk@ridgewaywi.gov>

Fwd: Collins St. Lift Station
Dale Peterson <publicworks@ridgewaywi.gov> Wed, Feb 15, 2023 at 12:06 PM
To: Hailey Roessler <clerk@ridgewaywi.gov>

Well that was way over what we talked about on Monday, I asked if this was for both LS or just Collins St and he replied
just Collins St.  I will contact B&M Technical Services to see if they are interested in providing a quote.

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Dan Westover <dwestover@lwallen.com>
Date: Wed, Feb 15, 2023 at 10:38 AM
Subject: Collins St. Lift Station
To: publicworks@ridgewaywi.gov <publicworks@ridgewaywi.gov>

Hey Dale, for us to come and install new stainless guide rails, stainless top brackets and stainless float hanger bracket
would come to $4744.60. This price includes mileage, labor and all hardware necessary.

Let me know how you would like to proceed.

 

Thanks

Dan Westover
Field Service Coordinator

Email: dwestover@lwallen.com
Phone: 16082101469;ext=1469
Cell: (608) 516-4096
Address: 4633 Tompkins Dr, Madison, WI 53716

www.lwallen.com 

Disclaimer - Notice: Nothing contained in this e-mail shall be considered an acceptance or binding agreement. For SJE policy on
binding agreements please go to our website www.sjeinc.com/terms-and-conditions
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