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City of Republic - Invitation for Bid

City Gateway Sign (Westbound Hwy 60)

SEALED BIDS MUST BE PHYSICALLY RECEIVED AT REPUBLIC CITY HALL PRIOR TO 9:00 a.m. on Thursday,
January 14, 2021.

City of Republic

C/0 City Clerk, Laura
Burbridge 213 N. Main
Republic MO 65738

Bids will be opened by the buyer at REPUBLIC CITY HALL AT 9:00 a.m. on Thursday, January 14", 2021.

e Bids shall be submitted on the forms provided and must be manually signed by the individual authorized
to legally bind the company.

e Bids shall be submitted with the Invitation for Bid (IFB) project name or item clearly indicated on
the outside of the mailing envelope.

e Bids received after the opening date and time will be rejected.

e The attached Terms and Conditions shall become part of any purchase order resulting from this bid.

e FAXED/EMAILED BIDS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.

e You are invited to submit your bid to furnish the materials and/or services described herein.  Please
submit your prices/fees net of all discounts.

e Bids will be taken to City Council for approval on either Tuesday, January 19%, 2021 or Tuesday, February
2", 2021. Notice to proceed shall follow immediately after council approval.

DESCRIPTION

City Gateway Sign (Westbound Hwy 60)
Construction and installation of the City of Republic’s main gateway sign to be located along the westbound lanes
of US Hwy 60.

Inquiries - All inquiries for information should be directed to:
Jared Keeling (417) 732-3500

It is the intent of the City that this Invitation for Bid promotes competitive bidding. It shall be the Vendor’s
responsibility to advise the City if any language, requirements, etc. any combination thereof, inadvertently
restricts or limits the requirements stated in this Invitation for Bid to a single source. Such notification must be
submitted in writing and must be received by the City contact listed above not later than three (3) days prior to
the bid opening date.



INSTRUCTION TO BIDDERS

01. Opening Location: The Bid will be opened at the Republic City Hall 213 N. Main at 9:00 a.m. on
Thursday, January 14, 2021. All bidders or their representatives are invited to attend the
opening of the IFB.

02. IFB Delivery Requirements: Any Bids received after the above stated time and date will not be considered.
It shall be the sole responsibility of the bidder to have their Bid delivered to Republic City Hall for receipt
on or before the due date and time indicated.

a. IfaBidis sent by U.S. Mail, the bidder shall be responsible for its timely delivery to Republic City
Hall.

Bids delayed by mail shall not be considered, shall not be opened, and shall berejected.
Arrangements may be made for their return at the bidder’s request and expense.

Bids may be mailed to Republic City Hall and accepted if the signed bid form and required
information was mailed and received prior to the due date and time.

e. Bids sent by email will not be accepted.

Sealed and Marked: If sent by mail, one original signed Bid shall be submitted in one sealed package,

clearly marked on the outside of the package with the IFB project name.

clearly indicated on the outside of the mailing envelope and addressed to.
City of Republic
C/0 City Clerk, Laura Burbridge
213 N. Main
Republic MO 65738

. Legal Name and Signature: Bids shall clearly indicate the legal name, address, and telephone number of
the bidder (company, firm, corporation, partnership, or individual).

a. Bids shall be manually signed above the printed name and title of signer on the Affidavit of
Compliance page.

The signer shall have the authority to bind the company to the submitted Bid.
Failure to properly sign the Bid form shall invalidate same, and it shall not be considered for
award.

. Corrections: No erasures are permitted.

a. Ifacorrection is necessary, draw a single line through the entered figure and enter the corrected
figure above it.

b. Corrections must be initialed by the person signing the Bid.

. Clarification and Addenda: Each bidder shall examine all Invitation for Bid documents and shall judge all
matters relating to the adequacy and accuracy of such documents.

a. Anyinquiries or suggestions, concerning interpretation, clarification, or additional information
pertaining to the Invitation for Bid shall be made through the listed City contact in writing or
through email.

The City of Republic shall not be responsible for oral interpretations given by any City employee,
representative, or others.
The issuance of written addenda is the official method whereby interpretation, clarification, or
additional information can be given.
It shall be the responsibility of each bidder, prior to submitting their Bid, to contact listed City
contact with questions or inquiries.
. IFB Expenses: There is no expressed or implied obligation for the City of Republic to reimburse responding
firms and the City will not reimburse for any expenses incurred in preparing responses to this request.
. Irrevocable Offer: Any Bid may be withdrawn up until the due date and time set for opening of the IFB.
Any Bid not so withdrawn shall, upon opening, constitute an irrevocable offer for a minimum period of 90




days to sell to the City the goods or services set forth in the IFB, until one or more of the Bids havebeen

duly accepted by the City.

. Responsive and Responsible Bidder: To be responsive, a bidder shall submit a Bid which conforms in all

material respects to the requirements set forth in the Invitation for Bid. To be a responsible bidder, the

bidder shall have the capability in all respects to perform fully the contract requirements, and the tenacity,
perseverance, experience, integrity, reliability, capacity, facilities, equipment and credit which will ensure
good faith performance. The lowest responsible bidder shall mean the bidder who makes the lowest Bid to
sell goods or services of a quality which conforms closest to the quality of goods or services set forth in the
specifications or otherwise required by the City and who is known to be fit and capable to perform the Bid
as made.

. Reserved Rights: The City reserves the right to make such investigations as it deems necessary to make

the determination of the bidder’s responsiveness and responsibility.

a. Such information may include, but shall not be limited to: current financial statement, verification
of availability of equipment and personnel, and past performance records.

. The Right to Audit: The bidder agrees to furnish supporting detail as may be required by the City to

support charges or invoices, to make available for audit purposes all records covering charges pertinent to

the purchase, and to make appropriate adjustments in the event discrepancies are found.

a. The cost of any audit will be paid by the City.

b. The City shall have the right to audit the bidder’s records pertaining to the work/product fora
period of three (3) years after final payment.

. Applicable Law: All applicable laws and regulations of the State of Missouri and the City including the City

Procurement Regulations and Procedures will apply to any resulting agreement, contract, or purchase

order.

a. Anyinvolvement with the City Procurement shall be in accordance with the Procurement
Regulations and Procedures.

. Right to Protest: Appeals and remedies are provided for in the City Procurement Regulations.

a. Protestors shall seek resolution of their complaints initially with the City Purchasing Agent.

b. Any protest shall state the basis upon which the solicitation or award is contested and shall be
submitted within ten (10) calendar days after such aggrieved person knew or could have
reasonably been expected to know of the facts giving rise thereto.

. Ethical Standards: With respect to this IFB, if any bidder violates or is a party to a violation of the general

ethical standards of the City Procurement Code or the State of Missouri Statues, such bidder may be

disqualified from furnishing the goods or services for which the Bid is submitted and shall be further
disqualified from submitting any future Bids.

. Collusion: By offering a submission to this Invitation for Bid, the bidder certifies the bidder has not

divulged, discussed, or compared the Bid with other bidders and has not colluded with any other bidder or

parties to this IFB whatsoever. Also, the bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint Bid, each party thereto
certifies as to their own organization, that in connection with this IFB:

a. Any prices and/or cost data submitted have been arrived at independently, without consultation,
communication, or agreement for the purpose of restricting competition, as to any matter relating
to such prices and/or cost data, with any other bidder or with any competitor.

Any prices and/or cost data for this Bid have not knowingly been disclosed by the bidder and will
not knowingly be disclosed by the bidder prior to the scheduled opening directly or indirectly to
any other bidder or to any competitor.

No attempt has been made or will be made by the bidder to induce any other person or firmto
submit or not to submit a Bid for the purpose of restricting competition.

The only person or persons interested in this Bid, principal or principals are named therein and
that no person other than therein mentioned has any interest in this Bid or in the contract to be
entered into.

No person or agency has been employed or retained to solicit or secure this contract upon an
agreement or understanding for a commission, percentage, brokerage, or contingent fee




exempting bona fide employees or established commercial agencies maintained by the Purchaser
for the purpose of doing business.
15. Contract Forms: Any agreement, contract, or purchase order resulting from the acceptance of a Bid shall
be on forms either supplied by or approved by the City.
16. Liability and Indemnity:

a. Inno event shall the City be liable to the Contractor for special, indirect, liquidated, incidental, or
consequential damages, except those caused by the City’s gross negligence or willful or wanton
misconduct arising out of or in any way connected with a breach of this contract. The maximum
liability of the City shall be limited to the amount of money to be paid or received by the City
under this contract.

The Contractor shall defend, indemnify and save harmless the City, its elected or appointed
officials, agents and employees from and against any and all liability, suits, damages, costs
(including attorney fees), losses, outlays and expenses from claims in any manner caused by, or
allegedly caused by, or arising out of, or connected with, this contract, or the work or any
subcontract thereunder (the Contractor hereby assuming full responsibility for relations with
subcontractors), including, but not limited to, claims for personal injuries, death, property
damage, or for damages from the award of this contract to Contractor.

The Contractor shall indemnify and hold the City harmless from all wages or overtime
compensation due any employees in rendering services pursuant to this agreement or any
subcontract, including payment of reasonable attorneys’ fees and costs in the defense of any claim
made under the Fair Labor Standards Act, the Missouri Prevailing Wage Law or any other federal
or state law.

. IFB Forms, Variances, and Alternates: Bids must be submitted on attached City IFB forms, although
additional information may be attached.

a. Bidders must indicate any variances from the City requested specifications and/or terms and
conditions, on the IFB Affidavit of Compliance.

Otherwise, bidders must fully comply with the City requested specifications and terms and
conditions. Alternate Bids may or may not be considered at the sole discretion of the City
Purchasing Agent.

. Bid Form: All blank spaces must be completed with the appropriate response.

a. The bidder must state the price, written in ink, for what is proposed to complete each item of the
project.

b. Bidders shall insert the words “no bid” in the space provided for an item for which no Bid is made.

c. The bidder shall submit an executed Bid form, affidavit of compliance with other requested
documents.

. Modifications or Withdrawal of Bid: A modification for a Bid already received will be considered only if
the modification is received prior to the time announced for opening of Bids.

a. All modifications shall be made in writing, executed, and submitted on the same form and manner
as the original Bid.

b. Modifications submitted by telephone, fax, or email will not be considered.

. No Bid: If not submitting a Bid, respond by returning the “Statement of No Bid” no later than the stated
Bid opening time and date, and explain the reason in the space provided.

. Errors in Bids: Bidders or their authorized representatives are expected to fully inform themselves as to
the conditions, requirements, and specifications before submitting Bids; failure to do so will be at the
bidder’s own risk. Neither law nor regulations make allowance for errors either of omission or
commission on the part of bidders. In case of error of extension of prices in the Bid, the unit price shall
govern.

. Prices: Bid give both unit price and extended total.

a. Price must be stated in units of quantity specified in the bidding specifications. In case of
discrepancy in computing the amount of the Bid, the unit price of the Bid will govern.




All prices shall be F.0.B. destination, freight prepaid (unless otherwise stated in special
conditions). FOB, as used in this IFB, shall mean that Seller, at their own expense, shall transport
the equipment and/or materials and bear the risk of loss from Sellers location to a specified
location in the City of Republic, MO 65738. Buyer shall not take title to the materials or
equipment until it is delivered and accepted by Buyer at the address specified within the City of
Republic.

Each item must be bid separately and no attempt is to be made to tie any item or items in with
any other item or items.

If a bidder offers a discount on payment terms, the discount time will be computed from the date
of satisfactory delivery at place of acceptance and receipt of correct invoice at the office specified.

e. Payment terms shall be Net 30 if not otherwise specified.

f. Pre-payment terms are not acceptable.

23. Discounts: Any and all discounts except cash discounts for prompt payments must be incorporated as a
reduction in the Bid price and not shown separately.

a. The price as shown on the Bid shall be the price used in determining award(s).

. Descriptive Information: All equipment, materials, and articles incorporated in the product/work covered
by this IFB are to be new and of suitable grade for the purpose intended.

a. Brand or trade names referenced in specifications are for comparison purposes only.

b. Bidders may submit Bids on items manufactured by other than the manufacturer specified when
an “or equal” is stated.

. Deviations to Specifications and Requirements: When bidding on an “or equal,” Bids must be
accompanied with all descriptive information necessary for an evaluation of the proposed material or
equipment such as the detailed drawings and specifications, certified operation and test data, and
experience records.

a. Failure of any bidder to furnish the data necessary to determine whether the product is
equivalent, may be cause for rejection of the specific item(s) to which it pertains.

All deviations from the specifications must be noted in detail by the bidder on the Affidavit of
Compliance form, at the time of submittal of Bid.

The absence of listed deviations at the time of submittal of the Bid will hold the bidder strictly
accountable to the specifications as written.

Any deviation from the specifications as written and accepted by the City may be grounds for
rejection of the material and/or equipment when delivered.

. Samples (if required): (NOT APPLICABLE)

. Quality Guaranty: If any product delivered does not meet applicable specifications or if the product will
not produce the effect that the bidder represents to the City, the bidder shall pick up the product fromthe
City at no expense. Also, the bidder shall refund to the City any money which has been paid forsame.

a. The bidder will be responsible for attorney fees in the event the bidder defaults and court action is
required.

. Quality Terms: The City reserves the right to reject any or all materials if, in its judgment, the item reflects
unsatisfactory workmanship, manufacturing, or shipping damages.

. Tax-Exempt: The City is exempt from sales taxes and Federal Excise Taxes: Missouri Tax ID Number
12492990.

. Awards:

a. Unless otherwise stated in the Invitation for Bid, cash discounts for prompt payment of invoices
will not be considered in the evaluation of prices. However, such discounts are encouraged to
motivate prompt payment.

As the best interest of the City may require, the right is reserved to make awards by item, group of
items, all or none or a combination thereof; to reject any and all Bids or waive any minor
irregularity or technicality in Bids received.




c. Awards will be made to the Bidder whose Bid (1) meets the specifications and all other
requirements of the Invitation for Bid and (2) is the lowest and best Bid, considering price,
delivery, responsibility of the bidder, and all other relevant factors.

31. Authorized Product Representation: The successful bidder(s) by virtue of submitting the name and
specifications of a manufacturer’s product will be required to furnish the named manufacturer’s product.

a. By virtue of submission of the stated documents, it will be presumed by the City that the bidder(s)
is legally authorized to submit and the successful bidder(s) will be legally bound to perform
according to the documents.

. Regulations: It shall be the responsibility of each bidder to assure compliance with OSHA, EPA, Federal,
State of Missouri, and City rules, regulations, or other requirements, as each may apply.

a. E-VERIFY COMPLIANCE REQUIREMENTS: All Contractors/Contractors for contracts exceeding five
thousand dollars shall by sworn affidavit and provision of documentation, affirm its enrollment and
participation in a federal work authorization program with respect to the employees working in
connection with the contracted services. Every such business entity shall also sign an affidavit affirming
that it does not knowingly employ any person who is an unauthorized alien in connection with the
contracted services.

b. Proposers are informed the Project is subject to the requirements of Section 292.675, RSMo., which
requires all contractors or subcontractors doing work on the Project to provide and require its on-site
employees to complete a ten (10)hour course in construction safety and health approved by the
Occupational Safety and Health Administration (“OSHA”) or a similar program approved by the Missouri
Department of Labor and Industrial Relations which is at least as stringent as an approved OSHA program.
The training must be completed within sixty (60) days of the date work on the Project commences. On-site
employees found on the worksite without documentation of the required training shall have twenty (20)
days to produce such documentation.

c. Pursuant to Section 292.675 RSMo. The Contractor shall forfeit to the City as a penalty two thousand
five hundred dollars ($2,500.00), plus one hundred dollars ($100.00) for each on-site employee employed
by the Contractor or its Subcontractor, for each calendar day, or portion thereof, Such on-site employee is
employed without the construction safety training required in the above paragraph.

d. Section 208.009 RSMo. shall apply to any contracts awarded under this bid.

. Termination of Award: Any failure of the bidder to satisfy the requirements of the City shall be reason for
termination of the award.

a. Any Bid may be rejected in whole or in part for any reason by the City.

. Royalties and Patents: The successful bidder(s) shall pay all royalties and license fees for equipment or
processes in conjunction with the equipment being furnished.

a. Bidder shall defend all suits or claims for infringement of any patent right and shall hold the City
harmless from loss on account or cost and attorney’s fees incurred.

. Equal Employment Opportunity Clause: The City of Republic, in accordance with the provision of Title VI
of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 (78 Stat. 252) and the Regulations of the Department of Commerce (15 CFR,
Part 8) issued pursuant to such Act, hereby notifies all bidders that affirmatively ensure that in any
contract entered into pursuant to this advertisement that minority businesses will be afforded full
opportunity to submit Bids in response to this advertisement and will not be discriminated against on the
grounds of race, color, or national origin in consideration for award.

. Prevailing Wages: If the public works construction project is valued at more than $75,000, the successful

bidder shall comply with applicable State provisions concerning the payment of prevailing wages on public
works projects. Accordingly, all workers performing work under the City Contractor Agreement shall be paid
not less than the prevailing hourly rate of wages as determined by the Department of Labor and Industrial
Relations of the State of Missouri (or “MoDOLIR”).

. Insurance Requirements: Without limiting any of the other obligations or liabilities of the Contractor, the
Contractor shall secure and maintain at its own cost and expense, throughout the duration of this Contract
and until the work is completed and accepted by the City, insurance of such types and in such amounts as
may be necessary to protect it and the interests of the City against all hazards or risks of loss as hereunder




specified or which may arise out of the performance of the Contract Documents. The form and limits of such
insurance, together with the underwriter thereof in each case, are subject to approval by the City. At a
minimum, proof of Workers Compensation, Liability, and Automobile Liability insurance shall be presented.
Regardless of such approval, it shall be the responsibility of the contractor to maintain adequate insurance
coverage at all times during the term of the Contract. Failure of the Contractor to maintain coverage shall
not relieve it of any contractual responsibility or obligation or liability under the Contract Documents. The
limits of liability insurance shall be as established annually and published by the Secretary of State in the
Missouri Registry. For this project, the required insurance amounts shall be: Workers” Compensation -
Statutory coverage per RSMo. 287.010 et seq; Employer’s Liability - $1,000,000.00; Commercial General
Liability Insurance - $2,940,868 for all claims arising out of a single accident or occurrence and $441,130 for
any one person in a single accident or occurrence; Automobile Liability Insurance - covering bodily injury
and property damage for owned, non-owned and hired vehicles, with limits of $2,940,868 for all claims
arising out of a single accident or occurrence and $441,130 for any one person in a single accident or
occurrence.
. Performance Bond and Labor & Materials Payment Bond: Pursuant to RSMo. 107.170, if the project is
estimated to exceed $50,000.00, the Contractor shall execute a Performance and Maintenance Bond and a
Labor and Materials Payment Bond with surety approved by the City and on the forms approved by the City,
each bond shall be in the amount of the total project cost, conditioned upon the full and faithful
performance of all major terms and conditions of the Agreement and payment of all labor and material
supplies.
. Nonresident/Foreign Contractors: The Contractor shall procure and maintain during the life of this contract:
a. If the Contractor is a foreign corporation, a certificate of authority to transact business in the State of
Missouri from the Secretary of State, unless exempt pursuant to the provisions of Section 351.570 RSMo.
b. A certificate from the Missouri Director of Revenue evidencing compliance with the transient employer
financial assurance law, unless exempt pursuant to the provisions of Section 285.230 RSMo.
. Bid Tabulation: Bidders may request a copy of the bid tabulation of the Invitation for Bid.
. Budgetary Constraints: The City reserves the right to reduce or increase the quantity, retract any item
from the Bid, or upon notification, terminate entire agreement without any obligations or penalty based
upon availability of funds.
. Additional Purchases by Other Public Agencies: The bidder by submitting a Bid authorizes other public
agencies to “Piggy-Back” or purchase equipment and services being proposed in this Invitation for Bid
unless otherwise noted on the Affidavit of Compliance Form.
. Order of Precedence: Any and all Special/General Conditions and Specifications attached hereto, which
varies from the instruction to bidders, shall take precedence.
. Affidavit for Service Contracts: The Bidder represents, in accordance with RSMO 285.530.2 that they have
not employed, or subcontracted with, unauthorized aliens in connection with the scope of work to be
done under the IFB and agrees to provide an affidavit to the City of Republic affirming that they have not,
and will not in connection with the IFB, knowingly employ, or subcontract with, any person who is an
unauthorized alien.
. Business License - It will be the requirement of the contractor to acquire a City of Republic business
license before they may begin work on the project.
. Inspection and Acceptance: No item(s) received by the City pursuant to this contract shall be deemed
accepted until the City has had reasonable opportunity to inspect the item(s).
a. Anyitem(s) which are discovered to be defective or which do not conform to any warranty ofthe
Seller upon inspection may be returned at the seller’s expense for full credit or replacement.
If at a later time, the defects were not ascertainable upon the initial inspection may also be
returned at the Seller's expense for full credit or replacement.
The City's return of defective items shall not exclude any other legal, equitable or contractual
remedies the City may have.
. Davis-Bacon Act: If the Instructions to Bidders have indicated that the Project is financed in whole or in
part from Federal funds, then this contract shall be subject to all applicable federal statutes, rulesand




regulations, including provisions of the Davis-Bacon Act, 40 U.S.C. §3141 et seq., and the “Federal Labor
Standards Provisions,” incorporated into this Contract. Where the Missouri Prevailing Wage Law and the
Davis-Bacon Act require payment of different wages for work performed under this Contract, the
Contractor and all Subcontractors shall pay the greater of the wages required under either law.

. Jurisdiction and Venue: This IFB and any Agreement required under it, shall be taken and deemed to have
been fully executed and made by the parties herein and governed by the laws of the State of Missouri for
all purposes and intents. Venue under this Agreement or any disputes that come from it shall be in the
Circuit Court of Greene County, Missouri. THE PARTIES HEREBY WAIVE THEIR RIGHT TO A JURY TRIAL
UNDER ANY APPLICABLE STATUTE, COMMON LAW OR FEDERAL OR STATE CONSTITUTION.

. Conflict of Interest: In participating in this IFB and accepting an Agreement, Contractor certifies that no
salaried officer or employee of the City, and no member of the City Council or Mayor, has a financial
interest, direct or indirect, in this Agreement. Any federal regulations and applicable provisions in
Section 105.450 et seq., RSMo. shall not be violated.

. Sovereign Immunity: In no event shall any language or requirement in this IFB or any Agreement that
comes from this IFB be construed as or constitute a waiver or limitation of City’s defenses with regard to
sovereign immunity, governmental immunity, or official immunity under federal or state constitutions,
states, and/or laws.

. Terms: The City of Republic reserves the right to reject any and all proposals received fromthis bid. It
further has the right to negotiate with any qualified source, or to cancel in part or in its entirety this bid.
The City also reserves the right to modify, suspend, or terminate at its sole discretion any and all aspects
of this bud process, to obtain further information from any and all respondents, and to waive any defects
as to form or content of the bid or any submissions by any firm. This bud does not commit the City to
award a contract, to defray any costs incurred in the preparation of a response to this request, or to
procure or contract for services. All submissions become the property of the City as public record. All
submissions may be subject to public review upon request




SPECIFICATIONS & SCOPE OF WORK

The scope of work to be performed by the contractor in this project includes the construction and installation of the City of
Republic’s custom fabricated main gateway sign to be located at 6571 US-60, Brookline, MO.

General Specifications (Refer to drawings for additional information.)
Approximately 32’ wide by 27’ high.
Concrete pad as per artwork.

Vertical steel support structure as per artwork.

Aluminum sheeting and construction (sign cabinet, framing, etc.).

Illuminated with all LED lighting (AGILIGHT) of components.

Masonry work to be a stone veneer that is applied to a Durock frame that is built on the sign structure.
Akzo Noble paint finishes. Sign to be painted with automotive quality paints.

Up and down lighting around sign structure per artwork.

Top reveal portion to have lighting reveal to cast light up and down on structure.

R cabinet and Republic to be flush mount channel letters with lower MISSOURI copy to be a routed acrylic push thru
letter.

Growing Together since 1871 to be non-lit FCO lettering that is illuminated with up lighting per artwork.
Upper reveal to have a stucco/EFIS finish.

Main field of sign where channel letters are mounted to have same effect/finish.

Contractor to connect to primary power at time of installation. Primary electric run to sign by owner.
Tiger provided by owner. Contractor to assist owner in placement of tiger as needed.


https://www.google.com/maps/place/6571+US-60,+Brookline,+MO+65619/@37.1503752,-93.4227108,18z/data=!3m1!4b1!4m5!3m4!1s0x87cf5df79f4c0709:0x1cce6fb95187135e!8m2!3d37.1503734!4d-93.4217799

PROPOSED SIGNAGE - DAY VIEW STOBR3-SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT

REPUBLIC

SINCE 1871




PROPOSED SIGNAGE - NIGHT VIEW

STO3R3-SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT
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PROPOSED SIGNAGE - DAY VIEW

HALO LIGHTING ON TOPPER
WITH WALL WASH EFFECT ON
TEXTURED WALL/REVEAL

INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED

SINGLE FACE LIT CHANNEL

FLUSH MOUNTED TO TEXTURED
CABINET REVEAL WITH
PERFORATED VINYL, VINYL
GRAPHICS, BLACK TRIM AND

5" BLACK RETURNS

IMAGE TRACED - VECTOR LOGO REQUIRED

INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED —
SINGLE FACE LIT CABINET
“RING” WITH ACRYLIC BACKER, VINYL
GRAPHICS, 2" BLACK TRIM ON INSIDE
OF RING AND OUTSIDE OF RING AND
MOUNTED TO POLE*
*POLE DIA TBD BY ENGINEERING
VINYL COLOR TBD
PMS COLOR TBD

BACK OF INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED
SINGLE FACE LIT CABINET RING
PAINTED LIGHT TAN/LIGHT CREME
TEXTURED REVEAL IN CENTER AND
MOUNTED TO POLE

SUPPORT PIPE/POLE PAINTED

CHARCOAL GRAY - PMS TBD

ROCK STONE TOPPER* ————————————————
*SIZE/THICKNESS MAY VARY

NATURAL STONE FACADE

CUSTOM STONE ARCH REVEAL

STO3R3-SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT

FRONT VIEW

8" CAP TRIM
PAINTED BLACK

—=——— TEXTURED WALL REVEAL PAINTED
LIGHT TAN/LIGHT CREME
PMS COLOR TBD
4" CAP TRIM
PAINTED BLACK

OPEN FACE CABINET WITH BLACK

4" TRIM, BLACK RETURNS, TEXTURED WALL
PAINTED LIGHT TAN/LIGHT CREME

PMS COLOR TBD

—— PERFORATED LIT CHANNELS*
FLUSH MOUNTED TO TEXTURED
WALL, BLACK TRIM AND BLACK
RETURNS
*IMAGE TRACED - VECTOR LOGO REQUIRED

S 5 O b R

PUSH THRU ACRYLIC WITH
SECOND SURFACE TRANSLUCENT
GREEN* VINYL

*VINYL COLOR TBD

THICKNESS TBD - 1" THICK SHOWN

IMAGE TRACED - VECTOR LOGO REQUIRED

@
1/4” ALUM. FCO PAINTED
LIGHT TAN/LIGHT CREME AND
PIN MOUNTED
PMS COLOR TBD

~— ALUMINUM FACADE PAINTED
TO RESEMBLE RUSTED EXTERIOR

— 1/4” ALUM. FCO PAINTED
LIGHT TAN/LIGHT CREME AND
v PIN MOUNTED
[ PMS COLOR TBD

== T = LEDHIDDEN FLOOD LIGHTING =
e UNDER ARCH TO CASCADE DOWN ON TIGER
AND LANDSCAPE

SINCE 1871

ROCK STONE TOPPER*
“SIZE/THICKNESS MAY VARY

PRE-PURCHASED TIGER

ILLUSTRATION ONLY
LANDSCAPING DONE BY OTHERS

—IN-GROUND/HIDDEN LED FLOOD LIGHTING

ROCK STONE TOPPER*
*SIZE/THICKNESS MAY VARY

_— LED FLOOD LIGHTING
X SHINING UP ON FCO

_— LANDSCAPING FOR
ILLUSTRATION ONLY
LANDSCAPING DONE
BY OTHERS

5

e
AU

GRADE
ELEVATION

SLOPED/
SLANTED

SITE PLAN/
SITE SURVEY
REQUIRED

IN-GROUND/HIDDEN LED FLOOD LIGHTING IN-GROUND/HIDDEN LED FLOOD LIGHTING




SPRINGFIELDSIGN.com REPUBLIC

PROPOSED SIGNAGE - DAY VIEW STO3R3-SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT

CLIENT
City of Republic

SALES
Dave Schridde 800.845.9927

SCALE AO#
174" =1 17717

ARTIST
RE/BD/B BLAUVELT

REVISION HISTORY

4/29/20-NEW MONUMENT DESIGN
5/13/20-REV1-SALES REV-MERGE BB AND CW
DESIGNS INTO ONE WITH CUSTOMER CHANGES
5/22/20-REV2-SALES REV-MON UPDATE, ADD CALL OUTS,
SHOW TOP AND BOTH SIDE VIEWS
6/15/20-REV3-CUSTOMER REV-OPT. 3 TOPPER
CHOSEN/UPDATE

BACK VIEW

BLACK 4" TRIM

—BACK OF CIRCULAR CABINET
PAINTED BLACK

T:\Cyrious\o17717-City of Republic_MO
(2053)\Art\Working Files

rendition and final co ary from that
dep herein.

'APPROVED BY

DATE

_~—STONE/MASONRY IS
MIRRORED FROM FRONT
SAME DIMENSIONS AND
CALLOUTS

EXISTING

Republic, MO
Proposed Main Gateway
Sign Location

- Westbound HWY 60

E 5 0s

IN-GROUND HIDDEN LED LIGHTING FOR
FACE OF SIGN ONLY
LANDSCAPING DONE BY. BACK OF SIGN IS NON-LIT
OTHERS - LANDSCAPING
DOES NOT WRAP AROUND TO
BACK OF SIGN - SEE TOP AND
SIDE VIEWS FOR REFERENCING

DESIGNER SUGGESTED COLORS

3630-84 PMS 446 C

L o)

\ bel .7 EASTRAC sy
AkzoNobel [ASTRAC [DURABILT] () [y b e PAGE 5 OF 11
COR-M-Z()API’ZO-R:; © 2020 Springfield Sign, All Rights Reserved




PROPOSED SIGNAGE - DAY VIEW STO3R3-SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT

FRONT VIEW

26’-8 3/4”
26’-4 3/4”

ATTENTION ENGINEERING —_ 3-10 1/4 18-10 1/2
HALO LIGHTING ON TOPPER
WITH WALL WASH EFFECT ON [ 157 1/4"
TEXTURED WALL/REVEAL y + -

ATTENTION ENGINEERING ; : ~— ATTENTION ENGINEERING
LIT CABINET “RING” AND LETTER N\ OPEN FACE CABINET WITH LIT CHANNELS AND 4" TRIM ARE FACE FLUSH WITH
CHAQI;INEL FACES ARE FACE FLUSH \ - ” CIRCULAR “R" CABINET

LCULATE THICKNESS OF MATERIALS 3 . CALCULATE THICKNESS OF MATERIALS (LETTER BACK, ACRYLIC FACE, TRIM, ETC.)
(LETTER BACK, ACRYLIC FACE, TRIM, ETC.) & TO ENSURE CRITERIA IS MET
TO ENSURE CRITERIA IS MET A\ /

ATTENTION ENGINEERING
1) ACRYLIC PUSH THRU LETTERS ARE APPROXIMATELY 12" H
2) 1" THICK ACRYLIC SHOWN

Y W— ) FONT IS 17 +/- THICK
\ Z 4) SECOND PASS/CORNER CLEANUP REQUIRED FOR ROUT
/ DUE TO THICKNESS OF MATERIAL

ATTENTION ENGINEERING
LIT “RING” FACE VO IS 91.723" DIA
AT MAXIMUM - NOT INCLUDING
ACRYLIC HIDDEN UNDER 2" TRIM
- SUGGESTED 0.50" SHIP LAP
AREA SHOWN AT HALFWAY MARK

—11'-6 3/4”

ATTENTION ENGINEERING
TEXTURED CREME COLORED WALL
IS RECESSED - APPROXIMATELY 5"+/-
(STANDARD RETURN HEIGHT/DEPTH)
FROM LIT CHANNEL FACES

L~ ATTENTION ENGINEERING
PAINTED 1/4” ALUMINUM FCO WITH
STANDOFFS MOUNTED TO WALL

STANDOFF HEIGHT TBD

— 235 1/4” TO GRADE

15'-5 1/4" TO GRADE

21’-2 3/4” TO GRADE

17°-7 1/2” TO GRADE

ATTENTION ENGINEERING

1) ALL WALL STONE FACADE AND CAP STONE
i e Aoy W - ATIENTION ENGINEERING
SUBJECT TO CHANGE BASED ON STONE : LED FLOOD LIGHT SPACING TBD
FORMATION/CONTOURS AND UNKNOWNS
IN ELEVATION

2) STONE FACADE ARTWORK IS FOR
ILLUSTRATION ONLY

[11-1" APPROXIMATE |

11-10 1/2”

0-4"L
11-3 1/4” 11’-4 3/4”




PROPOSED SIGNAGE - DAY VIEW

SOUTH ELEVATION- LEFT SIDE

WITH CIRCULAR CABINET
4-0" OAW
3-10°

ol

34" ——{ ‘
RN

B S s
]

ALUMINUM FACADE PAINTED TO
RESEMBLE RUSTED EXTERIOR

PIPE/POLE SUPPORT

LIT CIRCULAR CABINET “RING”
CABINET

PAINTED 1/4” ALUMINUM
FCO WITH STANDOFFS

~~—NATURAL STONE
" FACADE

ROCK STONE TOPPER*
*SIZE/THICKNESS MAY VARY

e
/CONCRETE BASE ,—FLOOD LIGHTING

SOUTH ELEVATION - LEFT SIDE
WITHOUT CIRCULAR CABINET

r—a'-m" -

’_g

0= }ﬁA_l
>—HALO LIGHTING ON TOPPER

/;7/ WITH WALL WASH EFFECT ON
P TEXTURED WALL/REVEAL

—LIT CIRCULAR CABINET “RING”
|

CABINET

4" BLACK TRIM
~—OPEN FACE CABINET
_—LIT“R” CHANNEL

0-4"F

~—LIT “REPUBLIC” CHANNELS

_~—PAINTED LIGHT TAN/CREME COLORED

ALUMINUM WITH TEXTURE

1" ACRYLIC PUSH THRU

~—LIT “R” CHANNEL

NORTH ELEVATION - RIGHT SIDE

40" OAW
310"

=t

DR
I

ALUMINUM FACADE PAINTED TO
RESEMBLE RUSTED EXTERIOR

CIRCULAR CABINET “RING”

OPEN FACE CABINET WITH BLACK TRIM—

PAINTED 1/4” ALUMINUM FCO—
WITH STANDOFFS

STO3R3-SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT



PROPOSED SIGNAGE - DAY VIEW STO3R3-SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT

SOUTH ELEVATION - LEFT SIDE NORTH ELEVATION - RIGHT SIDE
WITH CIRCULAR CABINET

— IN-GROUND HIDDEN LED IN-GROUND HIDDEN LED —
LIGHTING LIGHTING




RIGHT SIDE

SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT
NORTH ELEVATION

Wl 0-€2

By % T‘,_:F FN\A
WFTT L2 LOT .02 l)v W2\ €2 4 TFOT .02 IA

— . — i€ 82—
f

STO3R3

_— ATTENTION ENGINEERING
DIA/LOCATION OF SECOND POLE TBD.
ENGINEERING REVIEW REQUIRED
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DAY VIEW
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LEFT SIDE
4-0" OAW
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SOUTH ELEVATION

PROPOSED SIGNAGE




PROPOSED SIGNAGE - DAY VIEW STO3R3-SF ILLUMINATED MONUMENT

TOP VIEW

31’-8”

— EXTERIOR WALL/ CONCRETE BASE
PAINTED CLADDING

OPEN FACE CABINET
WITH BLACK TRIM
N\

S OPEN FACE CABINET
WITH BLACK TRIM

STONE FACADE — —CAPSTONE —CIRCULAR —CENTER — LIT “R” CHANNEL CAP STONE — BLACK CAP TRIM CENTER ’7 CAP STONE

CABINET PIPE/POLE PIPE/POLE
DIATBD DIATBD \

— FLOOD LIGHTING LANDSCAPING
DONE BY OTHERS

PRE-PURCHASED /\7 FLOOD LIGHTING — LANDSCAPING FLOOD LIGHTING N LANDSCAPING

TIGER DONE BY OTHERS DONE BY OTHERS




ATTACHMENT A - BID SUBMISSION FORM

BIDDERS MUST PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION:

Item Description of Work Price
Construction and installation of main gateway sign as
per the scope of services and specifications.
Base Bid

In compliance with this Invitation for Bid and to all terms, conditions, and specifications imposed therein and hereby incorporated by
reference, the undersigned offers and agrees to furnish the goods and/or services described herein.

City of Republic — City Gateway Sign (Westbound Hwy 60)

213 N Main St., Republic, MO 65738

Company Legal Name:

Address:
Telephone:

Signed
Facsimile: Dated
E-mail:

Printed
Cellular: Title

Bidders Federal ID Number:




To be submitted with Vendor’s Bid
______We DO NOT take exception to the IFB Documents/Requirements.
____ We TAKE exception to the IFB Documents/Requirements as follows:
CITY OF REPUBLIC STATEMENT OF “NO BID” * ADDENDA

Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following addendum:

RETURN THIS PAGE ONLY IF YOUR COMPANY PROVIDES THE PRODUCTS/SERVICES BEING BID AND DECLINES TO DO
SO.

Addendum No.

Addendum No.

WE, THE UNDERSIGNED, HAVE DECLINED TO BID ON YOUR IFB * FOR DESCRIPTION FOR THE FOLLOWING
REASON(S):
Addendum No.

SPECIFICATIONS ARE TOO “TIGHT,” I.E. GEARED TOWARD ONE BRAND OR MANUFACTURER ONLY
(PLEASE EXPLAIN BELOW).
Addendum No.
Addendum No.

INSUFFICIENT TIME TO RESPOND TO INVITATION FOR BID.

OUR PRODUCT SCHEDULE WOULD NOT PERMIT US TO PREFORM.

Print Email

Print Federal Tax ID No.




CITY OF REPUBLIC STATEMENT OF “NO BID”
RETURN THIS PAGE ONLY IF YOUR COMPANY PROVIDES THE PRODUCTS/SERVICES BEING BID AND DECLINES TO DO

SO.
WE, THE UNDERSIGNED, HAVE DECLINED TO BID ON YOUR IFB FOR THE FOLLOWING REASON(S):

SPECIFICATIONS ARE TOO “TIGHT,” I.E. GEARED TOWARD ONE BRAND OR MANUFACTURER ONLY
(PLEASE EXPLAIN BELOW).

INSUFFICIENT TIME TO RESPOND TO INVITATION FOR BID.

OUR PRODUCT SCHEDULE WOULD NOT PERMIT US TO PERFORM.

UNABLE TO MEET SPECIFICATIONS.

UNABLE TO MEET INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS.

SPECIFICATIONS UNCLEAR (PLEASE EXPLAIN BELOW).

OTHER (PLEASE SPECIFY BELOW).

REMARKS:

COMPANY NAME:
ADDRESS:
SIGNATURE AND TITLE:
TELEPHONE NUMBER:
DATE:




State of Miszonuri

EXEMPTION FROM MISSOURI SALES AND USE TAX ON PURCHASES

Missouri Tax ID
Number: 12492990

E1Lv OF REPUBLIC Effective Date:

213 N MAIN
REPUBLIC MD 65738 07/11/2002

Issued to:

Your application for sales/use tax exempt status has been approved
persuant to section 146.,030.1, RSMo. This letter is issued as
documentation of your exempt status.

Purchases by your Agency are not subject to sales or use tax

if within the conduct of your Agency's exempt functions

and activities. When purchasing with this exemptiaon, furnish
all sellers or vendors a copy of this letter. This exemption
may not be used by individuals making personal purchases.,

A contractor may purchase and pay for construction materials exempt
from sales tax when fulfilling a contract with vour Agency only

if your Agency issues a project exemption certificate and the
contractor makes purchases in compliance with the provisions

of section 144.062, RSMo.

Sales by vour Agency are subject to all applicable state and
local sales taxes, If you engage in the business of selling
tangible personal property or taxable services at retail, vou
must obtain 2 Missouri Retail Sales Tax License and collect and
remit sales tax. y

This is a continuing exemption subject to legislative changes
and review by the Director of Revenue. If yvour Agency ceases
to qualify es an exempt entity, this exemption will cease to be
valid. This exemption is net assignable or transferable. It
is an exemption from sales and use taxes only and is not an
exemption from real or personal property tax,

Any alteration to this exemption letter renders it invalid.
If vou have any guestions regarding the use of this letter, please

contact the Division of Taxation and Collection, P.D. Box 3300,
Jefferson City, MD £5105-3300, phone 573-751-2836.



MISSOURI PROJECT EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE

Authorization for Purchasing Construction Materials for Tax Exempt Project
(The Form and Content of this Exemption Certificate have been approved by the Missouri Department of Revenue)

EXEMPT ENTITY | ING CERTIFICATE
Name: City of Republic, Missouri

Address: 213 N. Main Avenue

City/State/Zip: Republic, Missouri 65738

MO Tax Exempt I.D. #: 12492990 Letter Effective Date:
Contract Date: Certificate Expiration Date:
Contract #: Revised Expiration Date:

Project Description: City Gateway Sign (Westbound Hwy 60)
Project Location: 6571 US-60, Brookline, MO

Project Completion Date: August 2021
Auth. Signature: .Mayor Date:

The Missouri exempt entity named above hereby authorizes the purchase, without sales tax, of tangible personal property
to be incorporated or consumed in the construction of the project identified herein and no other, pursuant to Section
144.62 RSMo.

PURCHASING CONTRACTOR OR SUBCONTRACTOR

Name:
Address:
City/State/Zip:

INSTRUCTIONS
EXEMPT ENTITY - A signed copy of this certificate, along with your MO Tax Exemption Letter, must be furnished to
each contractor and/or subcontractor who will be purchasing tangible personal property for use in the project. It is the
exempt entity’s responsibility to ensure the validity of the certificate. You must issue a certificate with a Revised
Expiration Date if purchases will be required to complete the project beyond the original Project Exemption Date.

CONTRACTOR OR SUBCONTRACTOR - The contractor shall furnish a completed copy of this exemption
certificate, along with a copy of the exempt entity’s MO Tax Exemption Letter, to all subcontractors, and any contractor
or subcontractor purchasing materials shall present copies of such documents to all material suppliers as authorization to
purchase, on behalf of the exempt entity, all tangible personal property and materials to be incorporated or consumed in
the construction of that project and no other on a tax-exempt basis. A copy of each certificate must be retained by the
purchaser for a period of five years.

MATERIAL SUPPLIER - A completed copy of this exemption certificate, along with the MO Tax Exemption Letter of
the exempt entity contracting for the project, must be obtained from the contractor or subcontractor making purchases of
tangible personal property for use in the project, and retained for audit purposes.  Invoices issued for such purchases
must reflect the name of the exempt entity and the project number assigned by the exempt entity shown above.



NOTICE AND INSTRUCTIONS TO CONTRACTORS/SUBCONTRACTORS
REGARDING SECTIONS 285.525 THROUGH 285.550 RSMO, EFFECTIVE JANUARY 1, 2009

Effective January 1, 2009, and pursuant to the State of Missouri’'s RSMO 285.530(1), No business entity or employer shall
knowingly employ, hire for employment, or continue to employ an unauthorized alien to perform work within the State of
Missouri.

As a condition for the award of any contract or grant in excess of five thousand dollars by the state or by any political
subdivision of the state (e.g., City of Republic, MO) to a business entity, the business entity (Company) shall, by sworn
affidavit and provision of documentation, affirm its enrollment and participation in a federal work authorization program
with respect to the employees working in connection with the contracted services. Every such business entity shall sign
an affidavit affirming that it does not knowingly employ any person who is an unauthorized alien in connection with the
contracted services. [RSMO 285-530(2)]

The City of Republic, Missouri, in order to comply with sections 285.525 through 285.550 RSMO, requires the following
Bid and contract documents:

Required Affidavit for Contracts Over $5,000.00 (US) — Effective 1-1-2009, Company shall comply
with the provisions of Section 285.525 through 285.550 R.S.Mo. Contract award is contingent on
Company providing an acceptable notarized affidavit stating:

1. that Company is enrolled in and participates in a federal work authorization program with respect to
the
employees working in connection with the contracted services; and

2. that Company does not knowingly employ any person who is an unauthorized alien in connection
with
the contracted services.

Copies of affidavit can be found and downloaded on the City of Republic Missouri Public Works
website;

The City of Republic encourages companies that are not enrolled and participating in a federal work authorization program
to do so. E-Verify is an example of this type of program. Information regarding E-Verify is available at
http://www.dhs.gov/xprevprot/programs/gc 1185221678150.shtm or by calling 888-464-4218.



http://www.dhs.gov/xprevprot/programs/gc%201185221678150.shtm

AFFIDAVIT OF COMPLIANCE WITH SECTION 285.500 R.S.MO., ET SEQ.
FOR ALL AGREEMENTS IN EXCESS OF $5,000.00

EFFECTIVE 1/1/2009

STATE OF )

) ss.
COUNTY OF )
Before me, the undersigned Notary Public, in and for the County of ,
State of , personally appeared (Name)
who is (Title) of

(Name of company), (corporation), (partnership), (sole proprietorship), (limited liability company), and after being duly
sworn did depose and say:

(1) that said company is enrolled in and participates in a federal work authorization program
with respect to the employees working in connection with the contracted services; and

(2) that said company does not knowingly employ any person who is an unauthorized alien
in connection with the contracted services.

The terms used in this affidavit shall have the meaning set forth in Section 285.500 R.S. Mo., et seq.

Documentation of participation in a federal work authorization program is attached to this affidavit.

Signature

Printed Name

Subscribed and sworn to before me this day of ,

Notary Public

My commission expires:




Company ID Number: XXXXXX

The foregoing constitutes the full agreement on this subject between the SSA, DHS (Department of Homeland Security),
and the Employer.

The individuals whose signatures appear below represent that they are authorized to enter into this MOU on behalf of the
Employer and DHS respectively.

To be accepted as a participant in E-Verify, you should only sign the Employer’s Section of the signature page. If you
have any questions, contact E-Verify Operations at 888-464-4218.

Emplover, Your Company Name ) j)x a4

r) - S
John Doe XS

Name (Please type or prlnt) A 'i \J Title
W&w—‘/‘é 3% )
Signature J Date

A
Verification | - S) S)S

Name (Please type or print)

Electronically Signed ' ) S)S g r
VIVE AR

i 'y
Signature | ')“\ ¢

- ) S ' ‘3
\)gl‘x)f 5 539”
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