Agency Name City of Republic
Bid Number IFB-006-0-2023/GB
Bid Name Hines and Lynn, School Queuing, and Overlays for 2023

Bid Due Date April 6, 2023 3:00 p.m.
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2023 Overlays- | 2023 Overlays- | 2023 Overlays-

Company Hines and Lynn Roundabout | School Storage Lane Asphalt Milling Total
Blevins Asphalt $535,000.00 $262,000.00 $77.80 $2.40 $827,445.00
Capital Paving No Bid $265,000.00 $89.00 $3.85 $804,382.00
APAC $550,099.50 $238,808.00 $80.45 $2.75 $803,900.00
Emery Sapp and Sons, Inc. $585,958.43 $253,097.23|2" 87.25/5" 83.75 $2.70 $935,639.25
JD Wallace Contracting $525,551.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid







