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Rublic Works + Community Development

City of Republic - Invitation for Bid
BUILDS — Bulk Gravel Materials 2021 - 2022

SEALED BIDS MUST BE PHYSICALLY RECEIVED AT REPUBLIC CITY HALL PRIOR TO 1:00
P.M., local time, on Friday March 19, 2021.

City of Republic

C/0 City Clerk

ATTN: Bid Enclosed BUILDS — Bulk Gravel Materials 2021- 2022
213 N. Main St.

Republic MO 65738

e Bids will be opened by the buver at the location listed above.

Bids shall be submitted on the forms provided and must be manually signed by the individual

authorized to legally bind the company.

e Bids shall be submitied with the Invitation for Bid (IFB) project name or item clearly indicated
on the outside of the mailing envelope.

e Bids received after the opening date and time will be rejected.

e The attached Terms and Conditions shall become part ol any purchase order resulting from this bid.

o FAXED/EMAILED BIDS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.

e You arc invited to submit your bid to furnish the materials and/or services described herein. Please

submit your prices/fees net of all discounts.

DESCRIPTION

BUILLDS - Bulk Gravel Materials 2021 - 2022
See attached General Conditions. Specifications. and or Bid Form tor detailed imformation.

DELIVERY: F.O.B. DESTINATION - The articles to be furnished hercunder shall be delivered all
transportation charges paid by the bidder to destination. In addition, all materiais must be delivered

and/or accessible to bidder within two davs of being requested.

Inquiries - All inquirics for information should be directed to:

Jason Davis Phone: (417) 732-3401 F.mail: jasondavis(@ republicmo.com

It is the intent of the City that this Invitation for Bid promotes competitive bidding. Tt shall be the
Vendor's responsibility to advise the City it any language, requirements, ete. or any combination
thereof, inadvertently restricts or linits the requirements stated in this Invitation for Bid to « single
source. Such notification must be submitted in writing and must be received by the Public Works
Department not later than three (3) davs prior to the bid opening, date.



INSTRUCTION TO BIDDERS

. Opening Location: The Bid will be opened at the Republic City Hall 213 N. Main St. at 1:00

P.M., local time, ON FRIDAY MARCH 19,2021,
a.  All bidders or their representatives are invited to attend the opening of the 1B
 Identification: “1FB” shall refer to this Invitation for Bid.  City” shall reter to the City of Republic. |
Missouri. Bidder/ Vendor/Contractor shall refer to the company. firm, corporation, partnership, or §
individual who submits this IIFB.

. 1FB Delivery Requirements: Any Bids received after the above stated time and date will not be
considered. It shall be the sole responsibility of the bidder to have their Bid delivered to Republic
City Hall for receipt on or before the due date and time ndicated.

a. IfaBidissentby U.S. Mail. the bidder shall be responsible for its timely delivery o RLputh
City Hall.
Bids delayed by mail shall not be considered, shall not be openced, and shall be rejected.
Arrangements may be made for their return at the bidder’s request and expense. However,
a copy of all bids shall be maintained and available for public inspection. i
Bids may be mailed to Republic City Hall and accepted if the signed bid form and 1&quncd
information was mailed and received prior to the due date and time. :

¢.  Bids sent by email will not be aceepted.

f Scaled and Marked: If sent by mail. one original signed Bid shall be submitted in one scaled package, §
§ clcarly marked on the outside of the package with the TFB project name: BUILDS - Bulk
§ Gravel Materials 20212022 clearly indicated on the outside of the mailing envelope and §
| addressed to. City of Republic

C/0 City Clerk

ATTN: Bid Enclosed BUILDS - Bulk Gravel Materials 2021-
2022 213 N Main St.

Republie, MO 65738

4. Legal Name and Signature: Bids shall clearly indicate the fegal name, address, and phonc
number of the bidder (company, firm, corporation. partnership. or individual).
a.  Bids shall be manually signed above the printed name and title of signer on the Affidavit of §
Compliance page.
b. The signer shall have the authority to bind the company to the submitted Bid.

¢. Failure to properly sign the Bid form shall invalidate same. and it shall not be considered for §

award.
5. Corrections: No crasures are permitied.
a. I a correction is necessary. draw a single line through the entered figure and enter
corrected figure above it
b. Corrections must be initialed by the person signing the Bid. ;
_Clarification and Addenda: Fach bidder shall examine all Invitation for Bid documents and sh \H
judge all matters relating to the adequacy and accuracy of such documents. ;
a. Any inquirics or suggestions, concerning interpretation,  clartfication, oradditonal 3
information pertaining to the Invitation for Bid shall be made through the individual listed §
as in the “Inquires™ scetion, in writing or through cmail.
The City of Republic shall not be responsible for oral interpretations given by any (nly
employcee, representative, or others. .;1
The issuance of written addenda is the official method whereby interpretation, clarification. “

or additional information can be wiven.

L
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07.

08.

09.

- Right to Protest: Appcals and remedies are provided for in the City Procurement Regulations.

- Ethical Standards: With respect to this IFBL i any bidder violates or is a party to a violation of the §

- Collusion: By offering a submission to this Invitation for Bid. the bidder certifies the bidder has not

d. It shall be the responsibility of cach bidder. prior to submitting their Bid. to contact the
individual listed in the “Inquires™ section with questions or inquiries.

IFB Expenses: There is no expressed or naplied obligation for the City of Republic to reimburse
responding firms and the City will not reimburse for any expenses incurred in preparing responses
to this request.
Irrevocable Offer: Any Bid may be withdrawn up until the due date and time sct for opening of the
IFB.  Any Bid not so withdrawn shall. upon opening, constitute an irrevocable offer for a minimum |
period of 180 days to scll to the City the goods or services set forth in the IFB. until one or more of
the Bids have been duly accepted by the City.
Responsive and Responsible Bidder: To be responsive. a bidder shall submita Bid which conforms
in all material respects to the requirements set forth in the Invitation for Bid. To be a responsible §
bidder, the bidder shall have the capability i all respects to perform fully the contract requirements, §
and the tenacity, perseverance, experience. integrity. reliability, capacity, facilitics, cquipment and §
credit which will ensure good faith performance. The lowest responsible bidder shall mean the bidder §
who makes the lowest Bid to sell goods or services ot a quality which conforms closest to the quality |
of goods or services sct forth in the specifications or otherwise required by the City and who is §
known to be fit and capable to perform the Bid as made. |

. Reserved Rights: The City reserves the right to make such investigations as 1t deems necessary 1o §

make the determination of the bidder’s responsiveness and responsibility.,
a. Such mformation may mclude. but shall not be hmited to: current financial statement.

verification of availability of equipment and personnel. and past performance records.

. The Right to Audit: The bidder agrees to furnish supporting detail as may be required by the City §

to support charges or invoices. to make avatlable for audit purposes all records covering charges §
pertinent to the purchase. and to make appropriate adjustments in the event discrepancics are tound. §

a. The cost of any audit will be paid by the City.
b. The City shall have the right to audit the bidder’s records pertaining to the work ‘product for
a period of three (3) years after final payment. i

- Applicable Law: All applicable laws and regulations ot the State of Missourt and the City including §

the City Procurement Regulations and Procedures will apply to any resulting agreement. contract, §
or purchasec order. :
a.  Any involvement with the City Procurement shall be in accordance with the Procurement §
Regulations and Procedures.

a. Protestors shall seek resolution ot therr complaints initially with the City Purchasing Agent. |
b.  Any protest shall state the basis upon which the solicitation or award is contested and shall §

be submitted within ten (10) calendar days after such aggrieved person knew or could have §

reasonably been expected to know of the facts giving rise thereto.

general cthical standards ol the City Procurement Code or the State of Missouri Statucs, such bidder
may be disqualified from furnishing the goods or services for which the Bid is submitted and shall
be further disqualified tfrom submitting any tuture Bids.

divulged, discussed. or compared the Bid with other bidders and has not colluded with any other
bidder or parties to this IFB whatsocver.  Also, the bidder certifies, and in the case of a joint Bid, §

cach party thereto certifies as to therr own organization, that in connection with this [FB:
a. Any prices and/or cost data submitted have been arrived at independently, without :
consultation. communication, or agreement for the purpose of restricting competition. as to §

any matter relating to such prices and/or cost data, with any other bidder or with any §
_competitor :

R st i e S e
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d.

Any prices and/or cost dula for this Bid have not knowingly bccn disclosed by the bidder and
will not knowingly be disclosed by the bidder prior to the scheduled opening directly or
indirectly to any other bidder or to any competitor.

No attempt has been made or will be made by the bidder to induce any other person or firm
to submit or not to submit a Bid for the purpose of restricting competition.

The only person or persons mterested in this Bid. principal or principals are named therein
and that no person other than therein mentioned has any interest in this Bid or in the contract
to be entered into.

No person or agency has been employed or retained to solicit or secure this contract upon an |
agreement or understanding for a commission, pereentage, brokerage. or contingent fee §
exempting bona f(ide cmployees or established commercial agencies maintained by the

Purchascer for the purposc of doing business.

16. Contract Forms: Any agreement. contract. or purchase order resulting from the aceeptance ofa Bid §
shall be on forms cither supplied by or approved by the City. '
17. Liability and Indemnity:

19.

d.

b.

In no event shall the City be liable to the Contractor for special. indirect, or consequential

damages, cxcept those caused by the City’s gross negligence or willful or wanton misconduct §
arising out ol or in any way connected with a breach of this contract. The maximum liability §
of the City shall be limited to the amount of moncy to be paid or received by the City under §
this contract.
The Contractor shall defend, indemnify and save harmless the City, its clected or appointed §
officials. agents and employees from and against any and all Tiability, suits. damages. costs §
(including attorney tees). losses, outlays and expenses from claims in any manncer caused by. &
or allegedly caused by, or arising out of. or connected with, this contract, or the work or any §
subcontract thereunder (the Contractor hereby assuming full responsibility for relations with §
subcontractors), including, but not limited to, claims for personal injuries, death, property &
damage, or for damages from the award of this contract to Contractor.
The Contractor shall indemnity and hold the City harmless from all wages or overtime §
compensation duc any cmployees in rendering services pursuant to this agreement or any §
subcontract, including payment of rcasonable attorneys” fees and costs in the defense ot any

claim madc under the Fair Labor Standards Act, the Missourt Prevailing Wage Law or any :
other tederal or state law.

.IFB Forms, Variances, and Alternates: Bids must be submitted on attached City 1FB forms. §
although additional information may be attached. i
a.

Bidders must indicate any variances from the City requested specitications and/or terms and §
conditions, on the [FB Affidavit of Compliance.
Otherwise. bidders must fully comply with the City requested specifications and terms and
conditions.  Alternate Bids may or may not be considered at the sole discretion of the € iy §
Purchasing Agent.

u,
i

Bid Form: All blank spaccs must be completed with the appropriate response.

d.

d.

The bidder must state the price, written in ink, for what is proposed to complete cach item of §
the project. ,‘
Bidders shall insert the words “no bid™ in the space provided for an item tor which no Bid is §
made.

The bidder shall submit an excecuted Bid torm and Aftidavit ot Compliance with other

R R

requested documents.
The type and amount of any supplemental information is left o the Bidders discretion,
however, all submitted data may be used to determine the best and lowest bid.
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20.

NS
o

27,

. No Bid: [f not submitting a Bid. respond-by returning the “Statement of No Bid™ no later than the §

. Errors in Bids: Bidders or their authorized representatives are expected to fully inform themscelves §

. Prices: Bid give both unit price and extended total.

- Discounts: Any and all discounts exeept cash discounts for prompt payments must be incorporated

. Descriptive Information: All cquipment, materials. and articles incorporated in the product/work

. Deviations to Specifications and Requirements: When bidding on an “or cqual.” Bids must be §

Modifications or Withdrawal of Bid: A modilicauon for a Bid already recerved will be considered §
only if the modification is received prior to the tme announced for opening ol Bids. '
a.  All modifications shall be made in writing, executed. and submitted on the same form and
manner as the original Bid.
b. Modifications submitted by telephone. fax. or email will not be considered.

stated Bid opening time and date, and explain the reason in the space provided.

as to the conditions, requirements. and specifications before submitting Bids: fatlure to do so will be §
at the bidder’s own risk.  Neither law nor regulations make allowance for errors cither of omission §
or commission on the part of bidders. In case of error of extension of prices in the Bid, the unit §
price shall govern.

a. Price must be stated in units. In case of discrepancy in computing the amount of the Bid. the §
unit price of the Bid will govern. A (2) two year price guarantee will be accepted.
b. All prices shall be F.O.B. destination. freight prepaid (unless otherwise stated in special
conditions).
c¢. Each item must be bid separately and no attempt is to be made to tic any item or items in §
with any other item or items. :
d. [Ifabidder offers a discount on payment terms. the discount time will be computed from the
date of satisfactory delivery at place of acceptance and receipt of correct invoice at the office §
specified. |
¢.  Payment terms shall be Net 30 i not otherwise specitied.
. Pre-payment terms are not acceptable.

as a reduction in the Bid price and not shown sceparately.
a. The price as shown on the Bid shall be the price used in determining award(s).

covered by this 1I'B are to be new and of suitable grade for the purpose intended.
a. Brand or trade names referenced in specitications are for comparison purposces only.
b. Bidders may submit Bids on items manufactured by other than the manufacturer speciticd g

when an “or cqual™ is stated.

accompanied with all descriptive information necessary for an evaluation of the proposed material §
or equipment such as the detailed drawings and specitications, certified operation and test data, and §
experience records,
a. Failure of any bidder to furnish the data necessary to determine whether the product is |
cquivalent. may be cause tor rejection of the specific item(s) to which it pertains. ;
b. All deviations trom the specifications must be noted in detail by the bidder on the Affidavit

of' Comphiance form, at the time of submittal of Bid.
¢. Theabsence of listed deviations at the time ot submittal ot the Bid will hold the bidder strictly
accountable to the spectfications as written. :
d. Any deviation from the specilications as written and accepted by the City may be grounds §
tor rejection of the material and/or equipment when delivered. 5
Quality Guaranty: If any product delivered does not mect applicable specifications or il the product
will not produce the ettect that the bidder represents to the City, the bidder shall pick up the product

from the City at no expense. Also. the bidder shall refund to the City any moncey which has been

SR SR R N

haid for same.
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28.

32.

(S
s

(2
)

Awards:

. Equal Employment Opportunity Clause: The City of Republics i accordance with the provision §

CInsurance Requirements: Without limiung any ol the other obligations or liabilities of” the §

a. The bidder will be responsible for attorney fees in the event the bidder defaults and court §
action is required. 3
Quality Terms: The City reserves the right to reject any or all materials il in s judgment. the tiem
reflects unsatisfactory workmanship. manutacturing. or shipping damages. '

. Tax-Exempt: The City is exempt from sales taxes and Federal Excise Taxes: Missouri Tax 1D §

Number 12492990,

a. Unless otherwise stated in the Invitation for Bid, cash discounts for prompt payment of §
invoices will not be considered in the evaluation of prices. However. such discounts arc §
cncouraged to motivate prompt payment. .

b. As the best interest of the City may require. the right is reserved to make awards by item. §
group of items. all or nonc or a combination thereof? to reject any and all Bids or waive any §
minor irrcgularity or technicality in Bids received. §

¢. Awards will be made 1o the Bidder whose Bid (1) meets the specifications and all other §
requirements ol the Invitation for Bid and (2) 1s the lowest and best Bid. considering price,
delivery. responsibility of the bidder. and all other relevant factors,

. Authorized Product Representation: The successlul bidder(s) by virtue of submitting the name §

and specifications of a manufacturer’s product will be required to furnish the named manufacturer’s
product. :
a. By virtue of submission of the stated documents. it will be presumed by the City that the
bidder(s) is legally authorized to submit and the successtul bidder(s) will be legally bound to
perform according to the documents.
Regulations: It shall be the responsibility of cach bidder to assure compliance with OSHAL EPA

Federal, State of Missouri. and City rules. regulations, or other requirements. as cach may apply. i
a. Proof of Lawful Residence Required: Sccuon 208.009 RSMo. shall apply to any contracts §
awarded undcr this bid. g
. Termination of Award: Any failurc of the bidder to satisty the requirements of the City shall be H
reason for termination of the award. ‘4

a. Any Bid may be rejected in whole or i part for any reason by the City.

s

. Royalties and Patents: The successful bidder(s) shall pay all royalties and license fees for §

cquipment or processes in conjunction with the equipment being turnished. :
a.  Bidder shall defend all suits or claims for infringement of any patent right and shall hold the §

City harmless from loss on account or cost and attorney’s fees incurred.

of Title VI of the Civil Rights Act ot 1964 (78 Stat. 252) and the Regulations of the Departiment of §
Commerce (15 CFR, Part 8) issucd pursuant to such Act. hereby notifies all bidders that affirmatively §
ensure that in any contract entered into pursuant to this advertisement that minority businesses will §
be afforded full opportunity to submit Bids in response to this advertisement and will not bc
discriminated against on the grounds of race. color, or national origin in consideration for award.

Contractor. the Contractor shall sccure and maintain at its own cost and expense. throughout the §
duration ot this Contract and unul the work is completed and accepted by the City, nsurance of such §

types and in such amounts as may be necessary 1o protect itand the interests of the City against all §

5 5 5 . . s . &
hazards or risks of loss as hercunder specified or which may arise out ol the performance ol the §

Contract Documents.  The torm and himits ot such insurance, together with the underwriter thercot’!
in cach casc, arc subject to approval by the City. - At a mmimum, proof of Workers Compensation,
Liability, and Automobile Liability insurance shall be presented. Regardless of such approval, it
shall be the responsibility of the contractor to maintain adequate insurance coverage at all tmes

. ~ x ~ o~ % - 1&
during the term of the Contract. Failure of the Contractor to mamtaim coverave shall notrelieve it
iy B i AR g e ol i i Gl bR ot EGRHROE 8 il i it i gt it i g b A il it TR T T tatatiiia by et SN Ll 2 i Lo i i » p
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40.

41.

T, ) e T G e e IR e

of any contractual responsibility or obligation or hability under the Contract Documents. The limits §

of liability insurance shall be as established annually and published by the Seeretary of State in the
Missouri Registry.  For this project, the required insurance amounts shall be: Workers’

Compensation - Statutory coverage per RSMo. 287.010 ¢t seq: Employer’s  Liability -}

$1.000.000.00: Commercial General Liability Insurance - $2.804.046 for all claims arising out of a §
single accident or occurrence and $420.606 for any onc person ina single accident or occurrence:
Automobile Liability Insurance - covering bodily injury and property damage for owned. non- owned §
and hired vehicles, with limits of $2.804.046 for all claims arising out of a single accident or
occurrence and $420.606 for any onc person in a single accident or occurrence.
Nonresident/Foreign Contractors: The Contractor shall procure and maintain during the life oi
this contract:

a. If the Contractor is a forcign corporation. a certificate ol authority to transact business in the State §

ol Missouri from the Sceretary of State, unless exempt pursuant to the provisions of Section 351.570
RSMo.

b. A certificate from the Missouri Director of Revenue evidencing compliance with the transient §

employer financial assurance law. unless exempt pursuant to the provisions ol Section 285.230 §

RSMo.

. Bid Tabulation: Bidders may request a copy of the bid tabulation of the Invitation for Bid.
. Budgetary Constraints: The City reserves the right to reduce or increase the quantity. retract any §

item from the Bid. or upon notification. tcrminate entire agreement without any obligations or
penalty based upon availability of funds.

Additional Purchases by Other Public Agencies: The bidder by submitting a Bid authorizes other §
public agencies to “Piggy-Back™ or purchase cquipment and services being proposed in this §

Invitation for Bid unless otherwise noted on the Affidavit of Compliance Form.

Order of Precedence: Any and all Special/General Conditions and Specifications attached hereto. &

which varies from the instruction to bidders. shall take precedence.

2. Affidavit for Service Contracts: The Bidder represents. in accordance with RSMO 285.530.2 that §

they have not employed. or subcontracted with. unauthorized aliens in connection with the scope of §

work 1o be done under the 1FB and agrees to provide an affidavit to the City of Republic affirming §

that they have not. and will not in connection with the IFB. knowingly employ. or subcontract with,
any person who is an unauthorized alien.

deemed accepted until the City has had reasonable opportunity It mspect the item(s).
a. Any item(s) which are discovered to be defective or which do not conform to any warranty
of the Seller upon inspection may be returned at the seller’s expense for full credit or
replacement.

b. If at a later time. the delects were not ascertainable upon the mitial inspection may also be §

returned at the Scller's expense for full credit or replacement.

(@]

remedics the City may have

_Terms: The City of Republic reserves the right to reject any and all proposals received from this

bid. It further has the right 1o negotiate with any qualified source, or to cancel in part or in its

entirety this bid.  The City also reserves the right to modify. suspend. or terminate at its solc §

The City's return of defective items shall not exclude any other legal. equitable or contractual

e s

Inspection and Acceptance: No item(s) received by the City pursuant to this contract shall be

RN

e

discretion any and all aspects of this bid process. 1o obtain further information from any and all g

respondents. and 1o waive any defeets as o form or content of the bid or any submissions by Anv
firm. This bid does not commit the City to award a contract, to defray any costs incurred in the

preparation of a responsc (o this request. or to procure or contracl t for services. All suhnn\\mn\

become the property ol the City as public luu)ld All submissions may be subject to public review §
upon request.
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45. Frrors and Omissions: [rrors or omissions contamed within these specifications should be
reported immediately to the individual listed i the “Inquiries™ Section. I necessary, a written bid
addendum will be issued to correct discerepancics.

46. Additional Terms:

a. All materials in this TFB must be delivered to bidder within two weeks of being requested
by bidder.
b. Payment for all products will be at the unit price as bid and the City expressly reserves the
right to incrcasc or decercase the number of units purchased as need dictates
c. ltisinthe City's best interest to purchasc all materials trom the low bidder for cach
seetion: however, in the event that supply or delivery of the desired product is not available §
within a necessary time frame, the City reserves the right to purchase products outside of
the bidaward
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BID SPECIFICATIONS

This Invitation for Bid (1FB) is for the proposced gravel material purchases for 2021- 2022 to include the

following:

e Materials listed in Attachment A~ Bid Submission form

e Onc or more ltems on Attachment A can be bid on

e The City reserves the right to select one or more vendors 1f bid on separate items providing cach
vendor meets requirement of terms in [FB

¢ All bids to include:

o Freight/Hauling Costs

e All materials in this [FB must be delivered/accessible to bidder within two days of being requested
by bidder, or the City rescrves the right to purchase from the next lowest bidder who can fill the
delivery request.

e All terms, conditions, and specifications of the IFB imposced therein and hereby incorporated by
reference.

Please note any of the following:
e Any labor personnel requests of the City of Republic

¢ Any other requests or responsibilities of the City of Republic

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK]
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ALTTALMIVIENT A~ BID SUDBIVIIDSIUIN ruUrKivi

BIDDERS MUST PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION:
| |

Item | Description and Manufacturer [Unit $ !Picked ‘
1 , up | Delivered |

Unit $ . Unit$

Gravel - Q\\Q"l"l | ' Shot Rock - ‘ H130 | lo,307
Gravel= (33155 _ 3/8" Stone | ‘3,85[%. e
Gravel ~ Q) 900 | 5;8“ Stone 1 12,513, %i
' Gravel — O 3 3/4" to 1" Clean Stone _ ' | 'Q“qo lfl |
Gravel - %a‘ﬁ 2"to4” Cleanstone = DY (5" Clean | 1290 1 7.96
Gravel — 033&)56 1 SUEG Base Rock Type1 | | 9_,0()7\4‘007
Gravel — o 1” State Base Rock Type 5 i g
Gravel 0330 5 3/16chip (mlxmp wynfh alt) ' ?\(% l@éo
_S?ndr , Contr?ctor - A:_w “ [ iNBl NB i
~Sand ‘ ‘ Landscaplng 77 NR NB




Please note that the delivered price reflects a haul rate of $5.00 per ton, which is based on a maximum
of $3.00 per gallon fuel.

Due to the unstable fuel prices the following additional charges will apply.
Fuel $3.25- Haul $5.25
Fuel $3.50- Haul $5.50
Fuel $3.75- Haul $5.75

Fuel $4.00- Haul $6.00 ETC.

Thank you,
Keith Stevens

Sales Manager



In compliance with this Invitation for Bid and to all terms, conditions, and specifications imposed therein and hereby incorporated by
reference, the undersigned offers and agrees to furnish the goods and/or services described herein.

City of Republic — Bulk Gravel Materials 2021 - 2022, \ .
OCA (.,omm\\es

|
\ ¥
Company Ni“"“&g&@ﬁ&hn@*ﬂ&&ﬁ@iﬁwpgﬁwm

Addrcss:4 | 06
ragphone 41 - (094 - R34

caar: 417-2337-4 62\

Facsimilc: 4 |71- Laqél' Lo \ G\Z

RS ~
Signature: /WW

printed Tite: Saled ManaaSe

Date: (\3"0 - &0&\

Bidders Federal 1D Number: 5\?’ IAO |4 ({)q

IREMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK|
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State of Flissouri

Limited Exemption

from Missouri State Sales and Use Tax on Purchases
(Political Subdivision)

Issued To: MISSOURI ID: 12492990

CITY OF REPUBLIC
5213 N MAIN AVE Effective Date: 07/11/2002
IREPUBLIC, MO 65738-1472

Your application for sales and use tax exempt status has been approved under Section 144 030.1,
' RSMo. This letter is issued as documentation of your agency's exemplt status. Your agency must
adhere to all requirements of your exempt status h

This is a continuing exemption subject to legislative changes and review by the Director of Revenue
Outlined below are specific requirements regarding this exemption  This summary is not intended as a

complete restatement of the law. You should review the law to ensure your understanding and
compliance.

« This exemption is not assignable or transferable. It is an exemption from sales and use taxes
only and is not an exemption from real or personal property tax

« Purchases by your agency are not subject to sales or use tax if conducted within your agency's
exempt functions and activities. When purchasing with this exemption, furnish all sellers or
vendors a copy of this letter.

« Individuals making personal purchases may not use this exemption

¢ A contractor may purchase and pay for construction materials exempt from sales tax when
fulfilling a contract with your agency only if your agency issues a project exemption certificate and
the contractor makes purchases in compliance with the provisions of Section 144.062 RSMo

« Sales by your agency are subject to all applicable state and local sales taxes

« If your agency engages in the business of selling tangible personal property or taxable services at
retail, you must obtain a Missouri Retail Sales Tax License and collect and remit state and local
sales taxes.

¢ Any alteration to this exemption letter renders it invalid

If you have any questions regarding the use of this letter, contact the Taxation Division, Post Office Box
358, Jefferson City, MO 65105-0358, salestaxexemptions@dor. mo.gov, or call 573-751-2836.

Notice Number 2017597353
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MISSOURI PROJECT EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE

Authorization for Purchasing Construction Materials for Tax Exempt Project
(The Form and Content of this Exemption Certificate have been approved by the Missourt Department of Revenue)

EXEMPT ENTITY ISSUING CERTIFICATE
Name: City of Republic. Missourt

Address: 213 N. Main Avenue

City/State/Zip: Republic, Missourt 65738

MO Tax Lxempt 1D, #: 12492990 Letter Effective Date:
Contract Date: B Certificate Eixpiration Date:
Contract #: Revised Expiration Date:

Project Description:

Project Location.

Estimated Project Completion Date:

Auth. Signature: Date:

The Missourt exempt entity named above hereby authorizes the purchase, without sales tax. of tangible personal property
to be incorporated or consumed in the construction of the project identified herein and no other, pursuant to Section
144.062 RSMo.

PURCHASING CONTRACTOR OR SUBCONTRACTOR
Name:

Address:

City/State/Zip:

INSTRUCTIONS
EXEMPT ENTITY - A signed copy of this certificate, along with vour MO Tax I-xemption Letter, must be turnished o
cach contractor and/or subcontractor who will be purchasing tangible personal property tor use in the project. Itis the
exempt entity's responsibility to ensure the validity ol the certificate. You must issue a certificate with a Revised
ixpiration Date if purchases will be required to complete the project beyond the original Project Exemption Date.

CONTRACTOR OR SUBCONTRACTOR - The contractor shall furnish a completed copy of this exemption
certiticate, along with a copy of the exempt entity’s MO Tax Lixemption Letter, to all subcontractors. and any contractor
or subcontractor purchasing materials shall present copies of such documents o all material suppliers as authorization to
purchase, on behalt of the exempt entity. all tangible personal property and materials to be incorporated or consumed in
the construction of that project and no other on a tax-exempt basis. A copy of cach certificate must be retained by the
purchaser for a period of five years.

MATERIAL SUPPLIER - A completed copy of this exemption certificate, along with the MO Tax Fxemption Letier of
the exempt entity contracting tor the project, must be obtained from the contractor or subcontractor making purchases ol
tangible personal  property for use in the project, and retamed for audit purposes.  Invoices issued for such purchases

must reflect the name of the exempt entity and the project number assigned by the exempt entity shown above.
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