



City Of Republic Administration-

This bid packet states that we should advise of any special requirements or restrictions on any item. There were a couple of duplicate items on this bid and a few NO BID items that we weren't able to bid. The only pricing restrictions on here that will not only fluctuate but will change consistently is the PVC Pipe. Price increases do happen on other materiel but we have a solid relationship with our manufactures and they are always willing to accommodate the best they can for us so we can for you. We are local and can guarantee most of the items on this bid within the two week obligation. Meters are a 4-6 week lead time. Meters take a while to build for custom cities and are built to order. That's the only items on here that will take a longer lead time. I have also attached a separate sheet with a quote of ADS Storm Pipe. It is an honor for us to turn in this bid with you all again. We appreciate the relationship we have with this city and we will always take care of you to the best of our abilities. Thank you for business!

BRADLEY COVER - MANAGER

Springfield Winwater

1151 S. Scenic Ave

Springfield, MO 65802

(417) 865-9000 | spfldwinwater3@yahoo.com

(417) 429-6737 Cell

ATTACHMENT A – BID SUBMISSION FORM

BIDDERS MUST PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION:

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
Hersey Water Meter 5/8"x1/2"	Model 420	142.86	117.65	304
Hersey Water Meter 1"	Model 452	293.85	238.75	4
Hersey Water Meter 1-1/2"	Model MVR 100	666.25	592.22	2
Hersey Water Meter 2"	Model MVR 160	796.47	752.22	2
Meter Setter 5/8"x 1/2"	12" tall, Ball Valve Locking Tap, Duel Purpose Nut 3/4" FNPT	133.20	117.53	6
Meter Setter 1"	12" tall, Ball Valve Locking Tap, Duel Purpose Nut 3/4" FNPT	260.91	230.21	3
Meter Setter 1-1/2"	15" tall, Duel Ball Valve, Low Bypass Locking Tap, 1-1/2" FNPT	998.90	943.40	2
Meter Setter 2"	15" tall, Duel Ball Valve, Low Bypass Locking Tap, 2" FNPT	1124.07	1061.62	2
Meter Re-Setter 5/8"x1/2"	Low Rise Horizontal Ball Valve Locking Tap	123.52	108.99	6
Corp Stop	3/4" AWWA x 3/4" CTS Compression	38.81	34.25	25
Corp Stop	1" AWWA x 1" CTS Compression	58.71	51.80	15
Corp Stop	2" MNPT x 2" FNPT	244.74	231.15	2
Fitting	3/4" x 3/4" CTS Compression	21.67	19.12	25
Fitting	3/4" x 1" CTS Compression	25.17	21.40	25
Fitting	3/4" MNPT x 1" CTS Compression	19.69	17.38	25
Fitting	3/4" MNPT X 3/4" CTS Compression	17.80	15.71	50
Fitting	3/4" MNPT x 3/4" PVC Compression	23.59	20.81	25
Fitting	3/4" MNPT x 1" PVC Compression	35.17	31.04	15
Fitting	1" MNPT x 1" PVC Compression	36.76	32.44	15
Fitting	3/4" CTS x 1" PVC Compression	40.99	36.17	15
Fitting	1" x 1" CTS Compression	24.79	21.87	25
Fitting	1" x 1" PVC Compression	53.72	47.40	10
Fitting	3/4" x 3/4" PVC Compression	31.63	27.91	25
Fitting	3/4" CTS x 1" PVC Compression Duplicate No Bid			
Fitting	5/8" x 1/2" Straight Meter Ball Valve with locking Tap x 3/4" FNPT	44.01	38.84	20
Fitting	5/8" x 1/2" 90 Degree Meter Ball Valve with Locking Tap x 3/4" FNPT	42.75	37.72	20
Fitting	1" CTS 90 Degree Compression	36.00	31.77	15
Fitting	3/4" CTS 90 Degree Compression	27.97	24.68	25
Fitting	3/4" FNPT x FNPT 90	5.25	4.64	10
Fitting	1" FNPT x FNPT 90	8.07	7.12	10
Fitting	1-1/2" FNPT x FNPT 90	16.07	14.18	5
Fitting	2" FNPT x FNPT 90	26.12	23.04	5
Fitting	3/4" Street 90	6.88	6.07	10
Fitting	1" Street 90	11.27	9.94	10

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
Fitting	1-1/2" Street 90	22.52	19.87	5
Fitting	2" Street 90	38.21	33.72	5
Fitting	3/4" FNPT x FNPT 45	5.25	4.64	10
Fitting	1" FNPT x FNPT 45	8.89	7.85	10
Fitting	1-1/2" FNPT x FNPT 45	17.72	15.64	5
Fitting	2" FNPT x FNPT 45	28.77	25.39	5
Fitting	3/4 FNPT x FNPT Coupling	4.20	3.71	10
Fitting	1" FNPT x FNPT Coupling	6.37	5.62	10
Fitting	1-1/2" FNPT x FNPT Coupling	13.60	12.00	5
Fitting	2" FNPT x FNPT Coupling	22.37	19.74	5
Fitting	3/4" Nipple 2" Long	2.87	2.53	25
Fitting	3/4" Nipple 4" Long	4.95	4.37	25
Fitting	1" Nipple 2" Long	4.12	3.64	25
Fitting	1" Nipple 4" Long	7.17	6.33	25
Fitting	1-1/2" Nipple 2" Long	7.00	6.18	5
Fitting	1-1/2" Nipple 4" Long	12.57	11.10	5
Fitting	2" Nipple 2" Long	9.95	8.78	5
Fitting	2" Nipple 4" Long	16.16	14.26	5
Fitting	1-1/2" x 2" Bushing	13.75	12.13	5
Fitting	1" x 2" Bushing	16.55	14.60	5
Fitting	3/4" x 1" Bushing	4.24	3.74	10
Fitting	1/2" 3/4" Coupling	5.07	4.47	10
Fitting	3/4" x 1" Coupling	8.41	7.42	10
Fitting	1-1/2" x 1-1/2" CTS Compression	82.92	73.17	10
Fitting	2" x 2" CTS Compression	111.96	98.79	5
Fitting	2" CTS x 2" PVC Compression	133.19	117.52	4
Fitting	2" MIP x 2" CTS Compression	84.09	74.20	10
Fitting	2" MIP x 2" PVC Compression	105.04	92.68	6
Fitting	1-1/2" x 1-1/2" CTS Compression Duplicate note			
Fitting	1-1/2" x 1-1/2" PVC Compression	104.83	92.50	5
Fitting	2" FIP Tee	36.23	31.91	5
Fitting	2" Street 45	28.77	25.39	5
Fitting	1-1/2" Street 45	23.15	20.42	5
Fitting	2" MIP Plug	12.07	10.65	5
Fitting	2" FIP Cap	18.52	16.34	5
Fitting	1-1/2" MNPT Plug	7.67	6.77	5
Fitting	1-1/2" FNPT Cap	10.95	9.66	5
Fitting	1" MIP Plug	4.03	3.55	10
Fitting	1" FIP Cap	5.33	4.71	10
Fitting	3/4" MIP Plug	3.09	2.73	10
Fitting	3/4" FIP Cap	3.43	3.02	10
Fitting	1/2" MIP Plug	2.73	2.41	10
Fitting	1/2" FIP Cap	2.61	2.31	10
Fitting	3/4" x 3/4" FNPT strait ball valve	61.07	53.88	10

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
Fittings	22.5 SCH 40 4" Glue on	10.26	9.06	22
Fittings	45 SCH 40 4" Glue on	6.57	5.74	16
Fittings	90 SCH 40 4" Glue on	8.12	7.17	12
Fittings	Sanitary Y SCH 40 4" Glue on	14.45	12.75	7
Fittings	Sanitary T SCH 40 4" Glue on	12.65	11.17	6
Fittings	Threaded cleanout coupling W/ cap SCH 40 4" Glue on	10.43	9.20	36
Fittings	Sch 35 to Sch 40 adaptor	9.93	8.77	24
Fittings	Sch 40 service Tee's 8" X 4" Glue on	73.79	65.12	8
Fittings	Sch 40 service Tee's 8" X 6" Glue on	81.85	72.22	6
Fittings	Sch 40 service Tee's 10" X 4" Glue on	128.92	113.75	2
Fittings	Sch 40 service Tee's 10" X 6" Glue on	158.64	139.98	2
Fittings	Sch 40 service Tee's 12" X 4" Glue on	174.31	153.81	2
Fittings	Sch 40 service Tee's 12" X 6" Glue on	199.04	175.62	2
Fittings	Shear Guard Coupling 4"	27.85	24.58	18
Fittings	Shear Guard Coupling 6"	83.91	74.04	4
Fittings	Back Flow Preventer 4"	42.24	37.27	6
Glue	PVC Glue Rain and Shine	16.25	14.34	12
Primer	PVC Primer (Purple)	10.29	9.04	12

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
Fitting	1" x 1" FNPT strait ball valve	94.89	83.73	10
Fitting	2" x 2" FNPT strait ball valve	250.79	236.86	3
Saddles	2" IPS x 3/4" AWWA Hinged	23.51	20.74	20
Saddles	2" IPS x 1" AWWA Hinged	23.51	20.74	20
Saddles	4" IPS x 3/4" AWWA Hinged	36.57	32.27	10
Saddles	4" IPS x 1" AWWA Hinged	36.57	32.27	10
Saddles	6" IPS x 3/4" AWWA Hinged	54.53	48.12	10
Saddles	6" IPS x 1" AWWA Hinged	54.53	48.12	10
Saddles	8" IPS x 3/4" AWWA Hinged	74.93	66.12	5
Saddles	8" IPS x 1" AWWA Hinged	74.93	66.12	5
Saddles	10" IPS x 3/4" AWWA Hinged	144.57	127.57	3
Saddles	10" IPS x 1" AWWA Hinged	144.57	127.57	3
Saddles	12" IPS x 3/4" AWWA Hinged	192.36	169.73	3
Saddles	12" IPS x 1" AWWA Hinged	192.36	169.73	3
Saddles	2" DIPS x 3/4" AWWA Double Strap	20.49	18.68	6
Saddles	2" DIPS x 1" AWWA Double Strap	20.49	18.68	6
Saddles	4" DIPS x 3/4" AWWA Double Strap	26.26	22.98	6
Saddles	4" DIPS x 1" AWWA Double Strap	26.26	22.98	6
Saddles	6" DIPS x 3/4" AWWA Double Strap	28.62	25.04	4
Saddles	6" DIPS x 1" AWWA Double Strap	28.62	25.04	4
Saddles	8" DIPS x 3/4" AWWA Double Strap	34.77	30.43	4
Saddles	8" DIPS x 1" AWWA Double Strap	34.77	30.43	4
Saddles	10" DIPS x 3/4" AWWA Double Strap	47.44	41.51	4
Saddles	10" DIPS x 1" AWWA Double Strap	47.44	41.51	4
Saddles	12" DIPS x 3/4" AWWA Double Strap	56.90	49.77	4
Saddles	12" DIPS x 1" AWWA Double Strap	56.90	49.77	4
Saddles	2" DIPS x 2" FNPT Double Strap No B.I.			
Saddles	4" DIPS x 2" FNPT Double Strap	34.26	29.98	6
Saddles	6" DIPS x 2" FNPT Double Strap	41.44	36.26	4
Saddles	8" DIPS x 2" FNPT Double Strap	45.79	40.06	4
Saddles	10" DIPS x 2" FNPT Double Strap	60.39	52.84	4
Saddles	12" DIPS x 2" FNPT Double Strap	72.40	63.35	4
Saddles	2" IPS x 2" FNPT Hinged No B.I.			
Saddles	4" IPS x 2" FNPT Hinged	78.71	69.45	10
Saddles	6" IPS x 2" FNPT Hinged	102.81	90.72	10
Saddles	8" IPS x 2" FNPT Hinged	106.12	93.64	5
Saddles	10" IPS x 2" FNPT Hinged	206.27	182.00	3
Saddles	12" IPS x 2" FNPT Hinged	222.20	190.06	3
Clamps	3/4" IPS x 3" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	29.97	26.23	12
Clamps	3/4" IPS x 6" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	53.99	47.24	8
Clamps	3/4" CTS x 3" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	29.97	26.23	16

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
Clamps	3/4" CTS x 6" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	51.93	45.44	10
Clamps	1" IPS x 3" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	31.52	27.58	12
Clamps	1" IPS x 6" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	54.49	47.68	8
Clamps	1" CTS x 3" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	31.14	27.25	12
Clamps	1" CTS x 6" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	54.16	47.39	8
Clamps	1-1/2" IPS x 3" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	32.70	28.61	12
Clamps	1-1/2" IPS 6" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	55.97	48.80	6
Clamps	1-1/2" CTS 3" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	31.93	27.94	12
Clamps	1-1/2" CTS 6" Long Full Circle Stainless Bolt Smith-Blair	55.02	48.14	6
Clamps	1-1/2" DIPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	No Bid Available		0
Clamps	2" DIPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long	60.77	53.18	4
Clamps	4" DIPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long	76.69	67.10	2
Clamps	6" DIPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long	89.34	78.18	2
Clamps	8" DIPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long	104.24	91.21	2
Clamps	10" DIPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long	120.39	105.34	2
Clamps	12" DIPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long	135.59	118.64	2
Clamps	1-1/2" DIPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	No Bid Available		0
Clamps	2" DIPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long	97.20	85.05	4
Clamps	4" DIPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long	123.96	108.46	2
Clamps	6" DIPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long	143.70	125.74	2
Clamps	8" DIPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long	167.52	146.58	2
Clamps	10" DIPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long	191.97	167.98	2
Clamps	12" DIPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long	220.17	192.65	2
Clamps	1-1/2" PVC IPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	No Bid Available		0
Clamps	2" PVC IPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	57.03	49.90	4
Clamps	4" PVC IPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	71.73	62.76	2
Clamps	6" PVC IPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	87.39	76.46	2
Clamps	8" PVC IPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	101.90	89.16	2

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
Clamps	10" PVC IPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	114.97	100.60	2
Clamps	12" PVC IPS 226 Style 7 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	133.42	116.74	2
Clamps	1-1/2" PVC IPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	111.54	97.60	2
Clamps	2" PVC IPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	93.12	81.48	4
Clamps	4" PVC IPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	113.52	99.33	2
Clamps	6" PVC IPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	141.86	124.13	2
Clamps	8" PVC IPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	163.99	143.49	2
Clamps	10" PVC IPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	188.72	165.13	2
Clamps	12" PVC IPS 226 Style 12 1/2" Long Smith-Blair	213.66	186.95	2
Clamps	2" PVC IPS Collar	76.70	67.11	4
Clamps	4" PVC IPS Collar	96.72	84.63	2
Clamps	6" PVC IPS Collar	98.96	86.59	2
Clamps	8" PVC IPS Collar	120.93	105.81	2
Clamps	10" PVC IPS Collar	99.80	87.33	2
Clamps	12" PVC IPS Collar	129.29	113.13	2
Clamps	4" DIPS Bell Joint	219.72	192.25	2
Clamps	6" DIPS bell Joint	236.16	206.64	2
Clamps	8" DIPS Bell Joint	335.56	293.61	2
Clamps	10" DIPS Bell Joint	373.35	329.42	2
Clamps	12" DIPS Bell Joint	365.99	344.46	2
Tap saddle	4" x 4" PVC IPS	354.49	332.34	2 any size
Tap saddle	6" x 6" PVC IPS	380.39	356.61	2 any size
Tap saddle	8" x 8" PVC IPS	453.78	427.08	2 any size
Tap saddle	10" x 10" PVC IPS	702.52	662.38	2 any size
Tap saddle	12" x 12" PVC IPS	871.93	823.49	2 any size
Tap saddle	4" x 4" DIPS Cast/Ductile	354.49	332.34	2 any size
Tap saddle	6" x 6" DIPS Cast/Ductile	380.39	356.61	2 any size
Tap saddle	8" x 8" DIPS Cast/Ductile	453.77	427.08	2 any size
Tap saddle	10" x 10" DIPS Cast/Ductile	664.31	627.40	2 any size
Tap Saddle	12" x 12" DIP112" X 12" Cast/Ductile	896.20	846.22	2 any size
Valve	4" MJ x MJ	442.50	420.92	4
Valve	6" MJ x MJ	564.67	537.12	4
Valve	8" MJ x MJ	899.37	855.50	4
Valve	10" MJ x MJ	1402.39	1333.98	2

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
Valve	12" MJ x MJ	1779.54	1687.98	2
Valve	4" MJ x Flange	422.46	401.85	4
Valve	6" MJ x Flange	561.67	537.12	4
Valve	8" MJ x Flange	882.36	839.32	4
Valve	10" MJ x Flange	1402.39	1333.98	2
Valve	12" MJ x Flange	1693.23	1610.64	2
Valve	2" MJ x MJ	279.50	265.89	4
Valve	2" Thread x thread	270.04	256.87	4
Screw Type Valve Box		72.06	67.82	25
Foster Adaptor	4" MJ	92.44	87.00	12 any size
Foster Adaptor	6" MJ	114.94	108.18	1
Foster Adaptor	8" MJ	162.44	152.88	
Foster Adaptor	10" MJ	233.69	219.94	
Foster Adaptor	12" MJ	254.94	239.94	
Midco	2" MJ	37.40	35.20	10
MJ Restraint	4" PVC	22.93	21.58	5
MJ Restraint	6" PVC	27.86	26.22	5
MJ Restraint	8" PVC	41.19	38.77	5
MJ Restraint	10" PVC	77.85	73.27	4
MJ Restraint	12" PVC	81.98	77.15	4
MJ Restraint	4" IRON	18.93	17.81	5
MJ Restraint	6" IRON	22.26	20.95	5
MJ Restraint	8" IRON	33.45	31.48	5
MJ Restraint	10" IRON	49.59	46.67	4
MJ Restraint	12" IRON	72.25	68.00	4
Hymax Grip	2"	175.71	165.38	4
Hymax Grip	4"	230.41	216.86	2
Hymax Grip	6"	317.35	298.68	2
Hymax Grip	8"	409.88	385.77	2
Hymax Grip	10"	520.28	489.67	2
Hymax Grip	12"	612.53	576.50	2
Fire Hydrant	Safety Yellow, 5-1/4", 4' Bury	1911.76	1800.00	2
MJ Fitting	4" TEE	59.73	52.71	6
MJ Fitting	4" Sleeve	40.53	35.77	6
MJ Fitting	4" Anchor 12" Long	69.12	60.99	6
MJ Fitting	4" 11-1/4"	34.56	30.50	6
MJ Fitting	4" 22-1/2"	35.84	31.62	6
MJ Fitting	4" 90	45.65	40.28	6
MJ Fitting	4" MJ x Flange	43.52	38.40	6
MJ Fitting	4" Plain x MJ	No Bid		
MJ Fitting	4" 45	37.97	33.51	6
MJ Fitting	6" Tee	107.52	94.87	4
MJ Fitting	6" Sleeve	67.84	59.86	4
MJ Fitting	6" Anchor 18" Long	134.40	118.59	4

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
MJ Fitting	6" Anchor 12" Long	122.93	107.67	4
MJ Fitting	6" 11-1/4"	57.60	50.82	4
MJ Fitting	6" 22-1/2	55.04	48.57	4
MJ Fitting	6" 45	60.59	53.46	4
MJ Fitting	6" 90	74.67	65.88	4
MJ Fitting	6" Flange x MJ	59.73	52.71	4
MJ Fitting	6" Plain End x MJ <i>No B'd</i>			
MJ Fitting	8" TEE	160.85	141.93	4
MJ Fitting	8" Sleeve	109.23	96.38	4
MJ Fitting	8" Anchor 12" long	156.16	137.79	4
MJ Fitting	8" 11-1/4	78.08	68.90	4
MJ Fitting	8" 22-1/2	86.19	76.05	4
MJ Fitting	8" 45	88.32	77.93	4
MJ Fitting	8" 90	107.95	95.25	4
MJ Fitting	8" Flange x MJ	90.03	79.44	4
MJ Fitting	8" Plain End x MJ <i>No B'd</i>			
MJ Fitting	10" TEE	229.55	202.54	2
MJ Fitting	10" Sleeve	130.56	115.20	2
MJ Fitting	10" Anchor 12" Long	277.76	245.08	2
MJ Fitting	10" 11-1/4	126.29	111.44	2
MJ Fitting	10" 22-1/2	127.15	112.19	2
MJ Fitting	10" 45	127.57	112.57	2
MJ Fitting	10" 90	171.09	150.97	2
MJ Fitting	10" Flange x MJ	156.16	137.79	2
MJ Fitting	10" Plain end x MJ <i>No B'd</i>			
MJ Fitting	12" TEE	320.43	282.73	2
MJ Fitting	12" Sleeve	175.79	155.11	2
MJ Fitting	12" Anchor 12" Long	411.73	363.30	2
MJ Fitting	12" 11-1/4	156.16	137.79	2
MJ Fitting	12" 22-1/2	166.83	147.20	2
MJ fitting	12" 45	190.72	168.28	2
MJ Fitting	12" 90	230.40	203.30	2
MJ Fitting	12" Flange x MJ	200.11	176.57	2
MJ Fitting	12" Plain end X MJ <i>No B'd</i>			
Pipe	3/4" CTS C-901 ADS PolyFlex 100' Roll	27.00	24.00	500'
Pipe	1" CTS C-901 ADS PolyFlex 100' Roll	43.00	40.00	300'
Stiffeners	3/4" CTS C-901 ADS PolyFlex	1.81	1.69	50
Stiffeners	1" CTS C-901 ADS PolyFlex	1.93	1.80	50
Pipe	1/2" SCH 40 20' sticks	6.50	6.00	500'
Pipe	3/4" SCH 40 20' sticks	7.60	7.20	500'
Pipe	3/4" SCH 80 20' sticks	7.60	7.20	500'
Pipe	1" SCH 40 20' sticks	11.80	11.20	500'
Pipe	1" SCH 80 20' sticks	11.80	11.20	500'
Pipe	2" SCH 40 20' sticks	23.20	22.80	500'

Item	Description and Manufacturer	Unit \$	Bulk Unit \$	Required # to Purchase for Bulk Discount
Pipe	2" SCH 80	41.80	41.00	500'
Pipe	3" SCH 40	47.00	46.40	500'
Pipe	3" SCH 80	82.80	82.00	500'
Pipe	4" SCH 40	63.80	63.00	500'
Pipe	4" SDR 21 Class 200	44.80	44.00	500'
Pipe	6" SDR 21 Class 200	94.20	93.60	500'
Pipe	8" SDR SOR 21 Class 200	160.00	158.20	500'
Pipe	10" SDR 21 Class 200	246.00	245.60	200'
Pipe	12" SDR 21 Class 200	346.20	345.80	200'
Meter Pit	18" X 30"	47.64	44.69	10
Meter Pit	24" X 30"	86.44	81.04	5
Meter Pit	30" X 30"	139.03	130.34	3
Meter Pit	36" X 30"	205.60	192.75	3
Meter Pit lid	18" Raised Two Piece	32.00	30.00	20
Meter Ring	24" X 18"	33.33	31.25	5
Meter Ring	30" X 18"	69.33	65.00	3
Meter Ring	36" X 18"	104.00	97.50	3
Tracer Wire	12 Gauge 500' Roll	82.00	74.00	2,000
Wire Nuts	Sealed Bury 10 Pack	14.20	12.00	10
Gasket	2" MJ	3.66	3.41	10
Gasket	2" Trans	3.20	2.99	10
Gasket	4" MJ	4.12	3.84	10
Gasket	4" Trans	4.57	4.27	10
Gasket	6" MJ	4.12	3.84	10
Gasket	6" Trans	5.03	4.69	10
Gasket	8" MJ	4.57	4.27	10
Gasket	8" Trans	7.32	6.83	10
Gasket	10" MJ	6.40	5.97	10
Gasket	10" Trans	8.23	7.68	10
Gasket	12" MJ	7.32	6.83	10
Gasket	12" Trans	9.14	8.53	10
Bolts	Tee Bolt MJ fittings	1.60	1.49	90

BRASS ITEMS MUST BE:
AY McDonald, Ford, Muller, or Equivalent
MJ FITTINGS MUST BE:
Taylor-Sigma or equivalent
GATE VALVES MUST BE:
Clow, Muller
HYDRANTS MUST BE:
Clow, Muller
MJ RESTRAINTS MUST BE:
Mege Lug or equivalent



1151 SOUTH SCENIC
SPRINGFIELD, MO 65802

PHONE (417) 865-9000
FAX (417) 865-9667

Quoted To Customer

CITY OF REPUBLIC
ATTN ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
213 N MAIN AVE
REPUBLIC, MO 65738-1472

Phone (417) 732-3400
Fax (417) 732-3499

Job Name

ADS Pipe Quote

Quote No.	Date	Page
0011037	3/16/21	1
Expiration Date		2/01/22
Revised Date		3/16/21
Bid Due Date		3/15/21

Quoted By


BRAD COVER
Bacover@winwaterworks.com
(417) 865-9000

Customer	Payment Terms	Quoted To	Salesperson	FOB
000825	NET 30	Brad	TIMOTHY SIKES	S

Line	Qty.	Description	Unit Price	UOM	Extended Price
1.0	20	4X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	.8600	FT	17.20
2.0	20	6X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	1.9000	FT	38.00
3.0	20	8X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	3.4300	FT	68.60
4.0	20	10X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	5.4000	FT	108.00
5.0	20	12X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	5.9600	FT	119.20
6.0	20	15X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	8.3600	EA	167.20
7.0	20	18X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	11.7200	FT	234.40
8.0	20	24X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	18.0700	FT	361.40
9.0	20	30X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	25.0800	FT	501.60
10.0	20	36"X20' SOLID N-12 ST/IB ULTRA	32.7900	EA	655.80

Tax Area Id	Net Sales
260771210	2,271.40
	Freight .00
	Tax .00
	Quotation Total 2,271.40

In compliance with this Invitation for Bid and to all terms, conditions, and specifications imposed therein and hereby incorporated by reference, the undersigned offers and agrees to furnish the goods and/or services described herein.

City of Republic – Waterline Materials 2021 - 2022
Company Name: Springfield Winwater
Address: 1151 S. Scenic Ave Springfield, MO 65802
Telephone: (417) 865-9000
Cellular: (417) 429-6737
Facsimile: (417) 865-9667
E-mail: Bacover@winwaterworks.com or Spfldwinwater3@yahoo.com
Signature:  Brad Cover
Printed Title: Manager
Date: 3-18-2021
Bidders Federal ID Number: 431566884

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK]

To be submitted with Vendor's Bid

☐ We DO NOT take exception to the IFB Documents/Requirements.

☒ We TAKE exception to the IFB Documents/Requirements as follows:

CITY OF REPUBLIC STATEMENT OF "NO BID" * ADDENDA

A Few Duplicates and NO Bid items.

Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following addendum:

RETURN THIS PAGE ONLY IF YOUR COMPANY PROVIDES THE PRODUCTS/SERVICES BEING BID AND DECLINES TO DO SO.

Addendum No. ____

Addendum No. ____

WE, THE UNDERSIGNED, HAVE DECLINED TO BID ON YOUR IFB BULK WATERLINE MATERIALS 2021- 2022 FOR THE FOLLOWING REASON(S):

☐ SPECIFICATIONS ARE TOO "TIGHT," I.E. GEARED TOWARD ONE BRAND OR MANUFACTURER ONLY (PLEASE EXPLAIN BELOW).

Addendum No. ____

Addendum No. ____

☐ INSUFFICIENT TIME TO RESPOND TO INVITATION FOR BID.

☐ OUR PRODUCT SCHEDULE WOULD NOT PERMIT US TO PREFORM.

Print Email Bacover@winwater.com or SyflDwinwater3@yahoo.com

Print Federal Tax ID No. 431566884

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK]

State of Missouri
Limited Exemption
from Missouri State Sales and Use Tax on Purchases
(Political Subdivision)

Issued To:

MISSOURI ID: 12492990

CITY OF REPUBLIC
213 N MAIN AVE
REPUBLIC, MO 65738-1472

Effective Date: 07/11/2002

Your application for sales and use tax exempt status has been approved under Section 144.030.1, RSMo. This letter is issued as documentation of your agency's exempt status. Your agency must adhere to all requirements of your exempt status.

This is a continuing exemption subject to legislative changes and review by the Director of Revenue. Outlined below are specific requirements regarding this exemption. This summary is not intended as a complete restatement of the law. You should review the law to ensure your understanding and compliance.

- This exemption is not assignable or transferable. It is an exemption from sales and use taxes only and is not an exemption from real or personal property tax.
- Purchases by your agency are not subject to sales or use tax if conducted within your agency's exempt functions and activities. When purchasing with this exemption, furnish all sellers or vendors a copy of this letter.
- Individuals making personal purchases may not use this exemption.
- A contractor may purchase and pay for construction materials exempt from sales tax when fulfilling a contract with your agency only if your agency issues a project exemption certificate and the contractor makes purchases in compliance with the provisions of Section 144.062 RSMo.
- Sales by your agency are subject to all applicable state and local sales taxes.
- If your agency engages in the business of selling tangible personal property or taxable services at retail, you must obtain a Missouri Retail Sales Tax License and collect and remit state and local sales taxes.
- Any alteration to this exemption letter renders it invalid.

If you have any questions regarding the use of this letter, contact the Taxation Division, Post Office Box 358, Jefferson City, MO 65105-0358, salestaxexemptions@dor.mo.gov, or call 573-751-2836.

Notice Number: 2017597353

MISSOURI PROJECT EXEMPTION CERTIFICATE

Authorization for Purchasing Construction Materials for Tax Exempt Project
(The Form and Content of this Exemption Certificate have been approved by the Missouri Department of Revenue)

EXEMPT ENTITY ISSUING CERTIFICATE

Name: City of Republic, Missouri
Address: 213 N. Main Avenue
City/State/Zip: Republic, Missouri 65738

MO Tax Exempt I.D. #: 12492990

Letter Effective Date: _____

Contract Date: _____

Certificate Expiration Date: _____

Contract #: _____

Revised Expiration Date: _____

Project Description: _____

Project Location: _____

Estimated Project Completion Date: _____

Auth. Signature: _____ Date: _____

The Missouri exempt entity named above hereby authorizes the purchase, without sales tax, of tangible personal property to be incorporated or consumed in the construction of the project identified herein and no other, pursuant to Section 144.062 RSMo.

PURCHASING CONTRACTOR OR SUBCONTRACTOR

Name:
Address:
City/State/Zip:

INSTRUCTIONS

EXEMPT ENTITY - A signed copy of this certificate, along with your MO Tax Exemption Letter, must be furnished to each contractor and/or subcontractor who will be purchasing tangible personal property for use in the project. It is the exempt entity's responsibility to ensure the validity of the certificate. You must issue a certificate with a Revised Expiration Date if purchases will be required to complete the project beyond the original Project Exemption Date.

CONTRACTOR OR SUBCONTRACTOR - The contractor shall furnish a completed copy of this exemption certificate, along with a copy of the exempt entity's MO Tax Exemption Letter, to all subcontractors, and any contractor or subcontractor purchasing materials shall present copies of such documents to all material suppliers as authorization to purchase, on behalf of the exempt entity, all tangible personal property and materials to be incorporated or consumed in the construction of that project and no other on a tax-exempt basis. A copy of each certificate must be retained by the purchaser for a period of five years.

MATERIAL SUPPLIER - A completed copy of this exemption certificate, along with the MO Tax Exemption Letter of the exempt entity contracting for the project, must be obtained from the contractor or subcontractor making purchases of tangible personal property for use in the project, and retained for audit purposes. Invoices issued for such purchases must reflect the name of the exempt entity and the project number assigned by the exempt entity shown above.

[REMAINDER OF PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK]