

Asphalt Bids

Commercial Surface Mix (MODOT BP-2)

Description	Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc.	Blevins Asphalt Construction Co., Inc.	APAC-Central Inc.	Capital Materials LLC
Unit Bid (No Delivery)	\$63.00	\$63.00	\$70.60	\$70.00
Unit Bid with Bulk Discount	\$62.00	\$0	\$70.60	N/A
Quantity Required for Discount (tons)	100	N/A	N/A	N/A
Delivered Unit Bid or additional cost per mile	N/A	\$5.95	N/A	N/A
Units	per ton	per ton	per ton	per ton

Bituminous Base

Description	Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc.	Blevins Asphalt Construction Co., Inc.	APAC-Central Inc.	Capital Materials LLC
Unit Bid (No Delivery)	\$61.00	\$62.50	\$66.80	\$68.00
Unit Bid with Bulk Discount	\$60.00	\$0	\$66.80	N/A
Quantity Required for Discount (tons)	100	N/A	N/A	N/A
Delivered Unit Bid or additional cost per mile	N/A	\$5.95	N/A	N/A
Units	per ton	per ton	per ton	per ton

MODOT BP-1

Description	Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc.	Blevins Asphalt Construction Co., Inc.	APAC-Central Inc.	Capital Materials LLC
Unit Bid (No Delivery)	\$62.00	\$63.00	\$70.60	\$70.00
Unit Bid with Bulk Discount	\$61.00	\$0	\$70.60	N/A
Quantity Required for Discount (tons)	100	N/A	N/A	N/A
Delivered Unit Bid or additional cost per mile	N/A	\$5.95	N/A	N/A
Units	per ton	per ton	per ton	per ton

Cold Mix

Description	Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc.	Blevins Asphalt Construction Co., Inc.	APAC-Central Inc.	Capital Materials LLC
Unit Bid (No Delivery)	\$77.00	\$95.00	No Bid	\$130.00
Unit Bid with Bulk Discount	\$76.00	\$0	No Bid	N/A
Quantity Required for Discount (tons)	100	N/A	No Bid	N/A
Delivered Unit Bid or additional cost per mile	N/A	\$5.95	No Bid	N/A
Units	per ton	per ton	per ton	per ton