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 CIRCADIA CORE CREATIVE GROOMS INDOFF MOSELEYS POE
August 21, 2025 @ 10:00am NO BID 120 Days to Complete 10 Working Days 14 Working Days 45-60 Days to Complete NO BID
Deposit Requirements  NA 50%/100% 50%/Net 30 50%/Net 10  
Addendums Received 1,2,3 1,2,3 1,2,3 1,2,3
Group A-INDIANA DESK Qty  Kimball/Indiana Indiana Indiana Indiana
Item A1-Curved Desk-Right Ped 10 $0.00 $15,118.00 $13,688.20 $12,904.00 $13,750.00 $0.00
Item A2-Curved Desk-Left Ped 13 $0.00 $19,653.40 $17,794.66 $16,775.20 $17,875.00 $0.00
Item A3-Single Pedestal Desk 2 $0.00 $2,390.10 $2,127.50 $2,005.60 $2,138.00 $0.00
Item A4-Bridge 16 $0.00 $4,164.00 $5,261.44 $4,960.00 $5,296.00 $0.00
Item A5-Return Shell 3 $0.00 $1,241.76 $1,320.03 $1,244.40 $1,326.00 $0.00
Item A6-Return Shell 4 $0.00 $1,655.68 $1,760.04 $1,659.20 $1,768.00 $0.00
Item A7-Return w/Right Ped 2 $0.00 $1,381.48 $1,342.52 $1,265.60 $1,350.00 $0.00
Item A8-Height Adjustable Desk 2 $0.00 $5,839.12 $6,363.80 $5,999.20 $6,394.00 $0.00
Item A9-Height Adjustable Return 2 $0.00 $2,988.64 $3,136.48 $2,956.80 $3,152.00 $0.00
Item A10-Multi-File Credenza 1 $0.00 $1,342.69 $1,405.31 $1,325.00 $1,412.00 $0.00
Item A11-Multi-File Credenza 1 $0.00 $1,141.05 $1,149.88 $1,084.00 $1,155.00 $0.00
Item A12-Multi-File Credenza 9 $0.00 $12,340.62 $10,486.35 $9,885.60 $10,539.00 $0.00
Item A13-Multi-File Credenza 7 $0.00 $9,786.35 $8,156.05 $7,688.80 $8,197.00 $0.00
Item A14-Storage Credenza 6 $0.00 $9,314.82 $7,963.44 $7,507.20 $7,998.00 $0.00
Item A15-Custom Multi-File Credenza 1 $0.00 $1,308.41 $1,293.72 $1,219.60 $1,300.00 $0.00
Item A16-Wardrobe 4 $0.00 $3,616.80 $3,878.20 $3,656.00 $3,896.00 $0.00
Item A17-Two Shelf Bookcase 24 $0.00 $7,882.80 $11,558.16 $7,946.40 $11,616.00 $0.00
Item A18-Three Shelf Bookcase 3 $0.00 $1,629.15 $1,908.12 $1,648.95 $1,917.00 $0.00
Item A19-Five Shelf Bookcase 2 $0.00 $1,067.38 $1,853.40 $1,601.60 $1,862.00 $0.00
Item A20-Floating Shelf 8 $0.00 $1,801.20 $1,731.20 $1,632.00 $1,744.00 $0.00
Item A21-Glass Markerboard-48" 1 $0.00 $537.45 $1,802.04 $1,698.80 $1,810.00 $0.00
Item A22-Glass Markerboard-30" 3 $0.00 $1,937.94 $3,372.00 $3,178.80 $3,387.00 $0.00
Item A23-Glass Markerboard-36" 3 $0.00 $3,789.48 $3,980.46 $3,752.40 $3,999.00 $0.00
Item A24-Conference Table-42" 2 $0.00 $3,457.48 $2,992.22 $2,820.80 $3,006.00 $0.00
Item A25-Conference Table-48" 2 $0.00 $6,388.38 $3,078.78 $2,902.40 $3,094.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $121,774.18 $119,404.00 $109,318.35 $119,981.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $12,673.00 $10,515.00 $7,210.00 $12,673.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $3,361.18 $0.00 $1,255.00 $4,289.17 $0.00

    
Total Group A $0.00 $137,808.36 $129,919.00 $117,783.35 $136,943.17 $0.00
Lead Time  10-12 weeks 5-7 weeks 6-8 weeks 5-7 Weeks  

FURNISHINGS BID TABULATION
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 CIRCADIA CORE CREATIVE GROOMS INDOFF MOSELEYS POE
 

Group B-LACASSE  NO BID NO BID
Item B1-Collaborative Table 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,144.00 $1,208.00 $0.00
Item B2-Bookcase Credenza 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,580.00 $5,895.00 $0.00
Item B3-Refrigerator Credenza 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,517.00 $1,602.00 $0.00
Item B4-Conference Table 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,806.00 $1,907.00 $0.00
Item B5-Round Conference Table 2 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,330.00 $2,462.00 $0.00
Item B6-Small Bookcase Credenza 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $632.00 $667.00 $0.00
Item B7-Lectern 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $591.00 $625.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $13,600.00 $14,366.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $850.00 $2,379.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $156.00 $539.41 $0.00

    
Total Group B $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $14,606.00 $17,284.41 $0.00
Lead Time    6-8 weeks 5-6-Weeks  

 

Group C-VERSTEEL  NO BID
Item C1-Training Table 6 $0.00 $0.00 $6,325.44 $7,188.00 $7,182.00 $0.00
Item C2-Training Table w/Power 6 $0.00 $0.00 $7,785.36 $8,850.00 $8,838.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $14,110.80 $16,038.00 $16,020.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $962.10 $1,069.00 $480.60 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $1,150.00 $667.00 $1,980.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $192.00 $595.75 $0.00

    
Total Group C $0.00 $0.00 $16,222.90 $17,966.00 $19,076.35 $0.00
Lead Time   5-6 weeks 4-6 weeks 4-5 Weeks  

Group D-HON  NO BID
Item D1-3 Drawer Lateral File-36" 3 $0.00 $0.00 $2,364.51 $2,412.00 $2,796.00 $0.00
Item D2-3 Drawer Lateral File-42" 2 $0.00 $0.00 $1,817.68 $1,828.00 $3,872.80 $0.00
Item D3-5 Drawer Lateral File-36" 2 $0.00 $0.00 $2,525.42 $2,540.00 $3,028.00 $0.00
Item D4-5 Drawer Lateral File-42" 2 $0.00 $0.00 $2,907.52 $2,870.00 $3,374.00 $0.00
Item D5-Storage Island 1 $0.00 $0.00 $3,158.90 $3,068.00 $3,607.00 $0.00
Item D6-Mobile Pedestal 4 $0.00 $0.00 $1,232.16 $1,096.00 $1,516.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $14,006.19 $13,814.00 $18,193.80 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $420.19 $415.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $835.00 $817.00 $1,684.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $165.00 $587.15 $0.00

    
Total Group D $0.00 $0.00 $15,261.38 $15,211.00 $20,464.95 $0.00
Lead Time 3-4 weeks 4-6 weeks 3-4 Weeks
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 CIRCADIA CORE CREATIVE GROOMS INDOFF MOSELEYS POE

Group E-SPECIAL-T  NO BID
Item E1-Task Table 1 $0.00 $0.00 $823.87 $828.00 $869.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $823.87 $828.00 $869.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $316.33 $321.00 $249.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $70.00 $67.00 $113.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $13.00 $39.81 $0.00

    
Total Group E $0.00 $0.00 $1,210.20 $1,229.00 $1,270.81 $0.00
Lead Time 3-4 weeks 6-8 weeks 4-6 Weeks

100%

Group F-LESRO  NO BID
Item F1-Lounge Chair 4 $0.00 $0.00 $4,561.32 $4,588.00 $4,720.00 $0.00
Item F2-Bench 1 $0.00 $0.00 $1,104.53 $1,111.00 $1,143.00 $0.00
Item F3-Table 1 $0.00 $0.00 $241.33 $243.00 $250.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $5,907.18 $5,942.00 $6,113.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $177.22 $195.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $215.00 $245.00 $277.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $70.00 $207.47 $0.00

    
Total Group F $0.00 $0.00 $6,299.40 $6,452.00 $6,597.47 $0.00
Lead Time 3-4 weeks 4-5 weeks 3 Weeks

Group G-SIT ON IT  
Item G1-Executive Task Chair-High 15 $0.00 $9,854.40 $8,904.90 $10,080.00 $11,610.00 $0.00
Item G2-Executive Task Chair-Mid 26 $0.00 $17,239.04 $15,581.54 $17,628.00 $20,306.00 $0.00
Item G3-Conference Chair 16 $0.00 $9,718.24 $8,764.96 $9,920.00 $11,440.00 $0.00
Item G4-Office Task Chair 23 $0.00 $10,999.98 $9,926.11 $11,247.00 $12,949.00 $0.00
Item G5-Task Stool 2 $0.00 $935.66 $932.34 $956.00 $1,102.00 $0.00
Item G6-Guest Chair 24 $0.00 $8,285.28 $6,998.88 $8,244.00 $11,640.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $57,032.60 $51,108.73 $58,075.00 $69,047.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,607.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $2,170.00 $2,035.00 $1,690.00 $2,170.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $1,480.07 $0.00 $662.90 $2,547.60 $0.00

    
Total Group G $0.00 $60,682.67 $53,143.73 $62,034.90 $73,764.60 $0.00
Lead Time 8-10 weeks 4-6 weeks 6-8 weeks 6 Weeks
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 CIRCADIA CORE CREATIVE GROOMS INDOFF MOSELEYS POE
Group H-ALLSEATING  
Item H1-Stack Chair w/Arms 100 $0.00 $28,261.00 $28,729.00 $28,900.00 $28,900.00 $0.00
Item H2-Armless Stack Chair 25 $0.00 $6,500.00 $6,607.75 $6,650.00 $6,650.00 $0.00
Item H3-Armless Stack Chair 6 $0.00 $1,560.00 $1,585.86 $1,596.00 $1,596.00 $0.00
Item H4-Stack Chair w/Arms 42 $0.00 $11,869.62 $12,066.18 $12,138.00 $12,138.00 $0.00
Item H5-Chair Dolly 4 $0.00 $692.16 $703.64 $708.00 $708.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $48,882.78 $49,692.43 $49,992.00 $49,992.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $1,638.00 $2,855.00 $1,585.00 $1,638.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $1,263.02 $0.00 $560.00 $1,677.88 $0.00

    
Total Group H $0.00 $51,783.80 $52,547.43 $52,137.00 $53,307.88 $0.00
Lead Time 8-10 weeks 3-4 weeks 6-8 weeks 5-7 Weeks

Group I-CLARIDGE  NO BID
Item I1-48" Markerboard 2 $0.00 $0.00 $940.68 $1,072.00 $1,072.00 $0.00
Item I2-60" Markerboard 3 $0.00 $0.00 $1,726.92 $1,968.00 $1,968.00 $0.00
Item I3-96" Markerboard 1 $0.00 $0.00 $770.64 $878.00 $878.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $3,438.24 $3,918.00 $3,918.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $530.00 $690.00 $618.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $50.00 $146.19 $0.00

    
Total Group I $0.00 $0.00 $3,968.24 $4,658.00 $4,682.19 $0.00
Lead Time 6-8 weeks 6-8 weeks 6 Weeks

100%

Group J-TREETOP PRODUCTS  NO BID
Item J1-Trash Receptable 2 $0.00 $0.00 $3,381.24 $3,456.00 $3,456.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $3,381.24 $3,456.00 $3,456.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $624.60 $430.00 $563.05 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $280.00 $215.00 $226.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $45.00 $137.72 $0.00

    
Total Group I $0.00 $0.00 $4,285.84 $4,146.00 $4,382.77 $0.00
Lead Time 2-3 weeks 1-3 weeks 1-2 Weeks

100%
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 CIRCADIA CORE CREATIVE GROOMS INDOFF MOSELEYS POE
Group K-SAFCO  NO BID
Item K1-Wall Rack 25 $0.00 $0.00 $652.00 $675.00 $675.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $652.00 $675.00 $675.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $162.98 $165.00 $59.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $435.00 $550.00 $398.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $35.85 $0.00

    
Total Group K $0.00 $0.00 $1,249.98 $1,405.00 $1,167.85 $0.00
Lead Time 1-2 weeks 3-4 weeks 2 Weeks

100%

Group L-BOBRICK  NO BID
Item L1-Coat Hook 25 $0.00 $0.00 $1,549.25 $1,125.00 $1,300.00 $0.00
Subtotal $0.00 $0.00 $1,549.25 $1,125.00 $1,300.00 $0.00
Freight, if applicable $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $201.00 $45.00 $0.00
Sales Tax $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Installation $0.00 $0.00 $435.00 $425.00 $398.00 $0.00
Performance Bond $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $15.00 $55.76 $0.00

    
Total Group L $0.00 $0.00 $1,984.25 $1,766.00 $1,798.76 $0.00
Lead Time 2-3 weeks 2 weeks 2 Weeks

100%

$287,308.47  

$422,562.00

$135,253.53

$303,558.47

SAVINGS FROM ORIGINAL BUDGET:

GRAND TOTAL

TOTAL LOW BIDS FOR SPECIFIED PRODUCT:

Estimate Cost for Name Plates at each Office Door: $1,250.00
Artwork, Plants, Accessories Allowance: $15,000.00

ORIGINAL BUDGET WITHOUT CONTINGENCY: 

BID SUMMARY:

ITEMS NOT INCLUDED IN BIDS:


	HOURS

