

CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL

Bid due 3/24/23 2:00 p.m.

Item	Description	Impressive Promotional	Destination Athlete of Macomb	Express Press	Hilton Screeners	Inkpressions
SETUP/ARTWORK						
1	Logo Setup/Artwork Dept/City	5.00	118.50	0.00	0.00	40.00
2	Logo Setup/Artwork Sponsor	5.00	118.50	0.00	0.00	40.00
PRINTING COSTS (per shirt)						
3	1 color logo/1 location	1.00	6.75	1.00	3.00	3.26
4	2 color logo/1 location	1.50	7.75	1.75	4.00	3.70
5	1 color logo/2 location	2.00	10.75	2.00	5.00	6.52
6	2 color logo/2 location	3.00	13.00	3.50	6.90	7.40
7	"Coach", "Supervisor", "Staff"	1.00	10.00	1.00	3.00	8.00
EMBROIDERY COSTS (per logo)						
8	Embroidered logo - 1 color	5.00	16.25	5.00	8.00	3.80
9	Embroidered logo - 2 color	5.00	20.25	5.00	8.00	3.80
10	Embroidered logo - 1 color, on customer supplied item	7.50	18.25	6.00	8.00	4.75
11	Embroidered logo - 2 color, on customer supplied item	7.50	22.00	6.00	8.00	4.75
ADULT SOFTBALL/COACHSTAFF						
12	T-Shirts, SS, 50/50 cotton/poly	Gildan G800/G800b	Port & Co. PC55	Gildan 8000	Gildan 8000	Port & Co. PC55
	Youth Small - Youth XL	4.50	8.90	3.50	3.95	3.79
	Adult Small - Adult XL	4.50	8.90	3.50	3.95	4.35
	Adult 2XL	6.50	10.50	5.50	7.00	6.22
	Adult 3XL	7.50	13.00	6.50	8.50	8.40
	Adult 4XL	7.50	14.00	7.50	8.50	8.40
13	T-shirts, LS, 50/50 cotton/poly	Port & Co PC55LS	Port & Co PC55LS	Gildan 8400	No Brand Name	Port & Co PC55LS
	Adult Small - Adult XL	9.00	14.75	6.71	8.00	7.59
	Adult 2XL	11.00	15.50	8.71	9.75	9.03
	Adult 3XL	12.00	16.25	9.71	10.95	10.19
	Adult 4XL	12.00	17.25	10.71	10.95	10.19
14	T-shirt - SS, 100 % poly, wicking	Augusta 790	Augusta 790	Augusta 790	Augusta 790	Augusta 790
	Adult Small - Adult XL	7.50	13.50	5.56	5.20	6.28
	Adult 2XL	9.50	15.50	7.56	6.75	8.02
	Adult 3XL	10.50	17.00	8.56	9.50	11.12

CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL

Bid due 3/24/23 2:00 p.m.

Item	Description	Impressive Promotional	Destination Athlete of Macomb	Express Press	Hilton Screeners	Inkpressions
15	T-shirt - LS, 100% poly, wicking	Augusta 788	Augusta 788	Augusta 788	Augusta 788	Augusta 788
	Adult Small - Adult XL	10.50	16.50	7.66	7.95	9.43
	Adult 2XL	12.50	18.50	9.66	9.40	10.78
	Adult 3XL	14.50	20.00	10.66	12.25	14.82
16	Nike Style Discontinued Polo, SS	Nike 267020/286772	Under Armour (1370399)	No Brand Name	Nike 373749/354064	Nike 373749/354064
	Adult Small - Adult XL	45.50	42.25	16.14	26.00	24.27
	Adult 2XL	47.50	42.25	18.14	27.50	25.70
	Adult 3XL (no ladies)	48.50	46.25	19.14	30.75	28.56
	Adult 4XL (no ladies)	48.50	n/a	20.14	32.25	28.56
17	Sweatshirt - Crew Neck	Gildan G180	Gildan G180	Gildan G180	Gildan G180	Gildan G180
	Adult Small - Adult XL	14.00	20.50	9.10	10.25	11.26
	Adult 2XL	16.00	22.50	11.10	12.30	13.46
	Adult 3XL	17.00	24.00	12.10	15.75	15.70
	Adult 4XL	17.00	25.00	13.10	15.75	15.70
18	Sweatshirt - Crew Neck	Port & Co PC 90	Port & Co PC 90	Port & Co PC 90	Port & Co PC 90	Port & Co PC 90
	Adult Small - Adult XL	17.50	21.25	12.17	11.00	10.29
	Adult 2XL	19.50	23.00	14.17	13.00	12.15
	Adult 3XL	20.50	25.50	15.17	15.00	14.08
	Adult 4XL	20.50	26.50	16.17	15.00	14.08
19	Sweatshirt - Crew Neck	FOL #82300	FOL #82300	FOL #82300	FOL #82300	FOL #82300
	Adult Small - Adult XL	21.00	n/a	14.92	18.25	15.89
	Adult 2XL	23.00	n/a	16.92	24.50	20.42
	Adult 3XL	24.00	n/a	17.92	27.25	22.85
20	Sweatshirt - Crew Neck	Sport Tek F280	Sport Tek F280	Sport Tek F280	Sport Tek F280	Sport Tek F280
	Adult Small - Adult XL	35.00	36.25	24.12	30.75	28.56
	Adult 2XL	37.00	37.25	26.12	32.25	29.99
	Adult 3XL	38.00	38.25	27.12	35.40	32.85
	Adult 4XL	38.00	40.00	28.12	35.75	34.28

CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL

Bid due 3/24/23 2:00 p.m.

Item	Description	Impressive Promotional	Destination Athlete of Macomb	Express Press	Hilton Screeners	Inkpressions
21	Sweatshirt - Full zip, hood	Port & Co. PC90ZH	Port & Co. PC90ZH	Port & Co. PC90ZH	Port & Co. PC90ZH	Port & Co. PC90ZH
	Adult Small - Adult XL	28.00	31.25	19.31	24.50	22.83
	Adult 2XL	30.00	33.00	21.31	26.50	24.58
	Adult 3XL	31.00	35.75	22.31	32.00	29.86
	Adult 4XL	31.00	36.75	23.31	32.00	29.86
22	Sweatshirt - Full zip, hood	Sport Tek F282	Sport Tek F282	Sport Tek F282	Sport Tek F282	Sport Tek F282
	Adult Small - Adult XL	45.50	46.00	30.41	39.25	36.42
	Adult 2XL	47.50	48.00	32.41	40.75	37.85
	Adult 3XL	48.50	49.50	33.41	43.75	40.70
	Adult 4XL	48.50	51.00	34.41	45.40	42.13
23	Sweatshirt - Full zip, hood	FOL #82230R	FOL #82230R	FOL #82230R	FOL #82230R	FOL #82230R
	Adult Small - Adult XL	33.25	n/a	23.05	30.95	27.13
	Adult 2XL	35.25	n/a	25.05	35.75	30.72
	Adult 3XL	36.25	n/a	26.05	39.75	32.85
24	Fleece Jacket, LS, Mens & Ladies	Core 365 #88190/78190	Core 365 #88190/78190	Core 365 #88190/78190	Core 365 #88190/78190	Core 365 #88190/78190
	Adult Small - Adult XL	31.50	48.00	21.27	27.95	25.00
	Adult 2XL	33.50	51.00	23.27	31.25	27.86
	Adult 3XL	34.50	53.00	24.27	32.75	29.29
	Adult 4XL (Men's only)	34.50	54.00	25.27	34.25	30.72
	Adult 5XL (Men's only)	34.50	55.00	26.27	36.25	32.15
25	T-shirts, LS, 100% cotton	Gildan 5400/5400L	Gildan 5400/5400L	Gildan 5400/5400L	Gildan 5400/5400L	Gildan 5400/5400L
	Adult Small - Adult XL	8.75	14.25	6.08	7.25	7.13
	Adult 2XL	10.75	15.00	8.08	9.15	9.27
	Adult 3XL	11.75	16.00	9.08	11.40	11.42
	Adult 4XL (mens only)	11.75	17.00	10.08	n/a	n/a
26	Wind Shirt, LS, unlined, V-neck	Sport-Tek JST72	Sport-Tek JST62	Agusta 3415	Sport Tek J343	Agusta 3415
	Adult XSmall - Adult XL	22.75	27.25	18.95	16.95	22.10
	Adult 2XL	24.75	29.00	20.95	18.50	23.60
	Adult 3XL	25.75	32.00	21.95	21.50	26.89
	Adult 4XL	25.75	33.00	22.95	23.00	28.24

CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL

Bid due 3/24/23 2:00 p.m.

Item	Description	Impressive Promotional	Destination Athlete of Macomb	Express Press	Hilton Screeners	Inkpressions
27	Polo Shirt - SS, wicking, Mens & Ladies	Harriton M315/M315W	Harriton M315/M315W	Harriton M315/M315W	Harriton M315/M315W	Harriton M315/M315W
	Adult XSmall - Adult XL	22.75	24.00	15.50	20.75	18.58
	Adult 2XL	24.75	27.00	17.50	23.95	21.43
	Adult 3XL	25.75	29.00	18.50	25.55	24.28
	Adult 4XL	25.75	30.00	19.50	27.00	25.71
28	Crew Neck Sweatshirt	Jerzees 4662M	Jerzees 4662M	Jerzees 4662M	Jerzees 4662M	Jerzees 4662M
	Adult XSmall - Adult XL	19.25	22.25	12.61	14.25	14.36
	Adult 2XL	21.25	23.75	14.61	18.75	17.22
	Adult 3XL	22.25	25.00	15.61	21.25	20.08
	Adult 4XL	22.25	26.50	16.61	21.25	n/a
29	Hoodie Pullover Sweatshirt	Hanes F170	Hanes F170	Hanes F170	Hanes F170	Hanes F170
	Adult XSmall - Adult XL	31.50	31.50	21.61	27.35	25.43
	Adult 2XL	33.50	38.50	23.61	32.75	30.50
	Adult 3XL	34.50	42.50	24.61	38.25	35.65
	Delivery after receipt of order	10-15 days	15 business days	23 days	5-7 business days	10-12 business days
	Reprint delivery	5-10 days	15 business days	23 days	5-7 business days	10-12 business days
	How much time to ship Championship items to teams	5-10 days	15 business days	23 days	Approx 15 business days	10-12 business days
Comments		Current global supply chain issues may affect availability of above specified items. Substitute items may be subject to price adjustment. Shipping to Novi Facilities only included in price.		Any style sized XXL or larger will incur an addtl. Cost 2XL +\$2 3XL +\$3 4XL +\$4 Will allow employees to make personal purchases at the contract price	Depending on order size and turn around time. Goods will either be delivered by us or UPS. UPS will incur a freight charge. All small orders will be sent UPS.	

CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL

Bid due 3/24/23 2:00 p.m.

Item	Description	Jonahs Enterprises	Riddell/ All American	Seaside Companies	Sources Inc.
SETUP/ARTWORK					
1	Logo Setup/Artwork Dept/City	1 Color = \$50 2 Color = \$100	22.00	60.00	40.00
2	Logo Setup/Artwork Sponsor	1 Color = \$50 2 Color = \$100	22.00	60.00	40.00
PRINTING COSTS (per shirt)			(12-96 pieces)		
3	1 color logo/1 location	6.00	4.15	1.25	1.60
4	2 color logo/1 location	6.00	4.40	2.19	1.95
5	1 color logo/2 location	12.00	8.30	2.80	3.20
6	2 color logo/2 location	12.00	8.80	4.06	3.90
7	"Coach", "Supervisor", "Staff"	6.00	4.15	1.56	10.00
EMBROIDERY COSTS (per logo)					
8	Embroidered logo - 1 color	12.00	6.00	5.00	4.50
9	Embroidered logo - 2 color	12.00	6.00	5.00	4.50
10	Embroidered logo - 1 color, on customer supplied item	12.00	6.00	5.00	7.00
11	Embroidered logo - 2 color, on customer supplied item	12.00	6.00	5.00	7.00
ADULT SOFTBALL/COACHSTAFF					
12	T-Shirts, SS, 50/50 cotton/poly	Gildan 5000	Gildan G8000/G8000b	Port & Co. PC55	Port & Co.
	Youth Small - Youth XL	7.25	4.68	3.20	4.80
	Adult Small - Adult XL	7.40	5.08	3.25	6.44
	Adult 2XL	9.39	9.39	5.45	6.44
	Adult 3XL	10.74	9.39	7.35	8.35
	Adult 4XL	10.74	9.39	7.35	8.35
13	T-shirts, LS, 50/50 cotton/poly	Delta 12640	Gildan 8400	Port & Co. PC55LS	Port & Co.
	Adult Small - Adult XL	10.12	8.55	6.43	7.64
	Adult 2XL	11.63	10.65	7.90	8.90
	Adult 3XL	14.06	10.65	8.90	9.90
	Adult 4XL	14.06	10.65	8.90	9.90
14	T-shirt - SS, 100 % poly, wicking	Augusta 790	Augusta 790	Augusta 790	Augusta 790
	Adult Small - Adult XL	8.86	5.00	5.70	6.50
	Adult 2XL	10.21	7.00	7.28	8.01
	Adult 3XL	12.91	7.50	10.10	10.73

CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL

Bid due 3/24/23 2:00 p.m.

Item	Description	Jonahs Enterprises	Riddell/ All American	Seaside Companies	Sources Inc.
15	T-shirt - LS, 100% poly, wicking	Augusta 788	Augusta 788	Augusta 788	Augusta 788
	Adult Small - Adult XL	11.43	7.65	8.50	9.25
	Adult 2XL	12.78	9.65	9.70	10.43
	Adult 3XL	15.48	10.65	13.25	13.96
16	Nike Style Discontinued Polo, SS	Nike 373749/354064	Nike 373749/354064	Nike 373749/354064	Nike 373749/354064
	Adult Small - Adult XL	26.94	no bid	19.10	22.24
	Adult 2XL	28.29	no bid	20.20	23.49
	Adult 3XL (no ladies)	30.99	no bid	22.45	25.99
	Adult 4XL (no ladies)	32.34	no bid	23.58	27.24
17	Sweatshirt - Crew Neck	Gildan G180	Gildan G18000	Gildan G180	Gildan G180
	Adult Small - Adult XL	17.34	11.55	8.50	11.73
	Adult 2XL	19.42	14.35	11.78	13.65
	Adult 3XL	21.51	14.35	13.74	15.61
	Adult 4XL	16.04	14.35	13.74	15.61
18	Sweatshirt - Crew Neck	Port & Co PC 90	Port & Co PC 90	Port & Co PC 90	Port & Co PC 90
	Adult Small - Adult XL	16.42	11.00	9.00	10.88
	Adult 2XL	18.18	16.00	10.63	12.50
	Adult 3XL	20.00	16.00	12.31	14.19
	Adult 4XL	20.00	16.00	12.31	14.19
19	Sweatshirt - Crew Neck	FOL #82300	One Stop #FL375	FOL #82300	FOL #82300
	Adult Small - Adult XL	19.58	19.75	14.43	14.90
	Adult 2XL	24.02	24.65	18.54	18.86
	Adult 3XL	26.41	24.65	20.75	20.99
20	Sweatshirt - Crew Neck	Sport Tek F280	Sport Tek F280	Sport Tek F280	Sport Tek F280
	Adult Small - Adult XL	36.39	33.85	24.98	26.86
	Adult 2XL	37.74	38.00	26.24	28.11
	Adult 3XL	40.44	38.00	28.74	30.61
	Adult 4XL	41.79	38.00	29.98	31.86

CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL

Bid due 3/24/23 2:00 p.m.

Item	Description	Jonahs Enterprises	Riddell/ All American	Seaside Companies	Sources Inc.
21	Sweatshirt - Full zip, hood	Port & Co. PC90ZH	Port & Co. PC90ZH	Port & Co. PC90ZH	Port & Co. PC90ZH
	Adult Small - Adult XL	30.97	28.77	19.98	21.85
	Adult 2XL	32.62	29.65	21.50	23.38
	Adult 3XL	37.62	29.65	26.13	28.00
	Adult 4XL	37.62	29.65	26.13	28.00
22	Sweatshirt - Full zip, hood	Sport Tek F282	Sport Tek F282	Sport Tek F282	Sport Tek F282
	Adult Small - Adult XL	43.81	37.70	31.87	33.74
	Adult 2XL	45.16	41.80	33.12	34.99
	Adult 3XL	47.86	41.80	35.61	37.49
	Adult 4XL	49.21	41.80	36.87	38.74
23	Sweatshirt - Full zip, hood	FOL #82230R	FOL #82230R	FOL #82230R	FOL #82230R
	Adult Small - Adult XL	29.73	32.23	24.64	25.61
	Adult 2XL	32.81	37.45	27.90	28.74
	Adult 3XL	35.04	37.45	29.83	30.61
24	Fleece Jacket, LS, Mens & Ladies	Core 365 #88190/78190	Core 365 #88190/78190	Core 365 #88190/78190	Core 365 #88190/78190
	Adult Small - Adult XL	28.53	no bid	22.72	23.75
	Adult 2XL	31.32	no bid	25.30	26.25
	Adult 3XL	32.73	no bid	26.60	27.50
	Adult 4XL (Men's only)	34.13	no bid	27.90	28.75
	Adult 5XL (Men's only)	35.54	no bid	29.20	30.00
25	T-shirts, LS, 100% cotton	Gildan 5400/5400L	Gildan 5400/5400L	Gildan 5400/5400L	Gildan 5400/5400L
	Adult Small - Adult XL	9.27	8.55 / 7.15	6.68	7.68
	Adult 2XL	10.20	10.60 / 10.40	7.92	8.91
	Adult 3XL	12.44	n/a	9.94	10.94
	Adult 4XL (mens only)	13.79	n/a	n/a	11.15
26	Wind Shirt, LS, unlined, V-neck	Sport Tek JST72	Sport Tek JST72	Sport Tek JST72	Sport Tek JST72
	Adult XSmall - Adult XL	24.24	19.98	16.24	17.24
	Adult 2XL	25.59	24.19	17.49	18.49
	Adult 3XL	28.29	24.19	19.98	20.99
	Adult 4XL	29.64	24.19	21.24	22.24

CITY OF NOVI - SPORT CLOTHING APPAREL

Bid due 3/24/23 2:00 p.m.

Item	Description	Jonahs Enterprises	Riddell/ All American	Seaside Companies	Sources Inc.
27	Polo Shirt - SS, wicking, Mens & Ladies	Harriton M315/ M315W	Harriton M315/ M315W	Harriton M315/ M315W	Harriton M315/ M315W
	Adult XSmall - Adult XL	22.21	no bid	16.87	17.25
	Adult 2XL	25.02	no bid	19.46	19.75
	Adult 3XL	26.42	no bid	20.76	21.00
	Adult 4XL	27.83	no bid	22.06	22.25
28	Crew Neck Sweatshirt	Jerzees 4662M	Jerzees 4662M	Jerzees 4662M	Jerzees 4662M
	Adult XSmall - Adult XL	18.08	15.72	13.43	14.44
	Adult 2XL	20.89	18.25	16.05	16.94
	Adult 3XL	23.68	18.63	18.55	19.44
	Adult 4XL	23.83	20.48	n/a	20.57
29	Hoodie Pullover Sweatshirt	Hanes F170	HN345	Hanes F170	Hanes F170
	Adult XSmall - Adult XL	28.03	32.90	22.56	24.13
	Adult 2XL	32.82	37.89	27.09	28.56
	Adult 3XL	37.68	38.89	31.89	33.06
	Delivery after receipt of order	30-60 days	30 days	7-10 days	21 days
	Reprint delivery	30 days	Contact Sales Rep	30-45 days	14 days
	How much time to ship Championship items to teams	30 days	30 days	n/a	21 days
Comments		Once PO is received we will fulfill orders between 30-60 days.		In stock blank items ship within 2-3 days	