
 

ORDINANCE NO. XXXXXX 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORMAN, 

OKLAHOMA, AMENDING ARTICLES I AND IV OF CHAPTER 9 OF THE 

CODE OF THE CITY OF NORMAN SO AS TO ADOPT AND AMEND THE 

2018 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE; SETTING AN EFFECTIVE DATE OF 

MARCH 1, 2023; AND PROVIDING FOR THE SEVERABILITY THEREOF. 

 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF NORMAN, OKLAHOMA: 

 
§ 1.  That Article I (“General Administration”) of Chapter 9 of the Code of  the City of Norman, and its various 

Sections 9-101 through  9-200 shall be amended as follows:

 

 

ARTICLE I. GENERAL ADMINISTRATION 

Sec. 9-101. Duties of the Fire Code Official. 

The Fire Code Official shall enforce the provisions of this chapter and all state laws under his jurisdiction 
pertaining to fire prevention, investigation, suppression or extinguishing of fires. The Fire Code Official shall have 
the powers of a police officer in performing his duties under this chapter.  

(Ord. No. 0-1718-17, § 1) 

Sec. 9-102. Application of the Fire Prevention Code. 

Except as otherwise provided in this chapter, the provisions of Section 9-401 Fire Prevention Code shall serve  

apply  to provide a reasonable level of life safety and property protection from the hazards of fire, explosion or 

dangerous conditions in new and existing buildings, structures and premises, and to provide a reasonable level of 

safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during emergency operations.  conditions hazardous to life or 
property in the occupancy of buildings already having a Certificate of Occupancy and premises within the limits of 
the City of Norman.  

(Ord. No. 0-1718-17, § 1) 

Sec. 9-103.   Reserved. Application of the Fire Code. 

Except as otherwise provided in this chapter, the provisions of Section 9-402 Fire Code shall apply to 
construction of new buildings, remodeling of existing buildings, additions to existing buildings, and change of 
occupancy group of existing buildings, within the limits of the City of Norman.  

Sec. 9-104. Effect of conflicting provisions. 

Whenever the requirements or provisions of this chapter are in conflict with the requirements or provisions 
of any other lawfully adopted ordinance, the Fire Code Official and the Building Official shall prescribe minimum 
requirements necessary to establish a reasonable level of fire and life safety and property protection from the 

https://up.codes/viewer/oklahoma/ifc-2018/chapter/2/definitions#explosion
https://up.codes/viewer/oklahoma/ifc-2018/chapter/2/definitions#existing


 

 

 
    Created: 2022-03-23 10:48:25 [EST] 

(Supp. No. 169) 

 
Page 2 of 10 

hazards created by fire, explosion, and dangerous conditions concerning matters in conflict, and all provisions of 
this chapter not in conflict shall remain in full force and effect.  

(Ord. No. 0-1718-17, § 1) 

Sec. 9-105. Appeals. 

The property owner or his authorized agent shall have the right to appeal a decision or determination made 
by the Fire Code Official relative to the application and interpretation of the appropriate code, as adopted in this 
chapter, to the Board of Appeals established in Section 4-1601 of the Code of the City of Norman whenever:  

(1) The true intent of the adopted codes, or the rules legally adopted thereunder, have been incorrectly or 
improperly interpreted;  

(2) The provisions of those codes do not fully apply; and/or  

(3) An equally good or better form of construction is proposed.  

Sec. 9-106. Penalties. 

(a) Any person, firm, or corporation convicted of violating any provision of this chapter, or of failing to act or 
comply with the rules and regulations enacted pursuant to this chapter; shall be punished by a monetary fine 
of not less than fifty dollars ($50.00) nor more than seven hundred fifty dollars ($750.00), or by 
imprisonment for a period not to exceed sixty (60) days, or by both such fine and imprisonment for each 
such violation or failure to comply.  

(b) Each day that a violation or failure to comply exists shall constitute a separate and distinct offense, and any 
one (1) or more of such offenses may be set out in any complaint or information filed.  

Secs. 9-107—9-200. Reserved. 

§ 2.  That Article IV (“Codes and Standards”) of Chapter 9 of the Code of the City of Norman, and its Sections 9-
401 and  9-402, shall be amended as follows:

ARTICLE IV. CODES AND STANDARDS 

Sec. 9-401. Adoption of the Fire Prevention Code. 

(a) Pursuant to 59 O.S. § 1000.23, the NFPA® 1 Fire Code, 2015 edition, as published by the National Fire 
Protection Association®; and documents listed in Chapter 2 of that code; hereinafter referred to as "NFPA 1" 
is hereby adopted as the Fire Prevention Code of the City of Norman for regulations governing conditions 
hazardous to life and property from fire or explosion; and occupancy of buildings already having a Certificate 
Of Occupancy, with the same force and effect as if fully set out in this section with amendments thereto as 
prescribed in this section.  

(b) The Fire Prevention Code shall not become effective until at least three (3) copies, including modifications 
prescribed in this section, have been filed in the office of the City Clerk.  

(c) The following sections of NFPA 1 are hereby amended, added, deleted, or substituted as noted:  

(1) 1.1.1 [Amended] The scope includes, but is not limited to, the following:  



 

 

 

1. Inspection of existing permanent and temporary buildings, processes, equipment, systems and 
other fire and related life safety situations.  

2. Investigation of fires, explosions, hazardous materials incidents, and other related emergency 
incidents.  

3. Fire and life safety education of fire brigades, employees, responsible parties, and the general 
public.  

4. Existing occupancies and conditions.  

5. Installation, use, storage, and handling of medical gas systems.  

6. Hazards from outside fires in vegetation, trash, building debris, and other materials.  

7. Regulation and control of special events including, but not limited to, assemblage of people, 
exhibits, trade shows, amusement parks, haunted houses, outdoor events, and other similar 
special temporary and permanent occupancies.  

8. Decorations, furnishings, and other combustibles that contribute to fire spread, fire load, and 
smoke production.  

9. Storage, use, processing, handling, and on-site transportation of flammable and combustible 
gases, liquids, and solids.  

10. Storage, use, processing, handling, and on-site transportation of hazardous materials.  

11. Control of emergency operations and scenes.  

12. Conditions affecting fire fighter safety.  

(2) 1.1.2 Title [Amended]. The title of this Code shall be NFPA 1, Fire Prevention Code, of the National Fire 
Protection Association (NFPA).  

(3) 1.3.1 [Amended] This Code shall apply to existing conditions.  

(4) 1.3.6.1 [Amended] Buildings permitted for construction after the adoption of this Code shall comply 
with the provisions in the Building Code as adopted in Section 5-201 of the Code of the City of Norman 
and the Fire Code as adopted in Section 9-402 of the Code of the City of Norman.  

(5) 1.3.6.3 [Amended] Repairs, renovations, alterations, reconstruction, change of occupancy, and 
additions to buildings shall conform to the provisions in the Building Code as adopted in Section 5-201 
of the Code of the City of Norman and the Fire Code as adopted in Section 9-402 of the Code of the City 
of Norman.  

(6) Sections 1.10 through 1.10.6.6 [Deleted] NFPA 1 Sections 1.10 through 1.10.6.6 are hereby deleted in 
favor of the provisions of Section 4-1601 of the Code of the City of Norman.  

(7) 1.12.8 [Amended] The AHJ is authorized to establish permits as required in accordance with Table 
1.12.8(a) through 1.12.8(d). Those cases in which the AHJ does not establish a permit shall not justify a 
violation of any provision of this Code or any other applicable law or regulation.  

(8) 1.16.4.2 [Amended] Violations of the Code shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.  

(9) Chapter 2 Referenced Publications [Amended]. NFPA 1 Chapter 2 is hereby amended to include the 
following substitutions:  

[Substitute] "NFPA 13, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems, 2013 edition" with "NFPA 13, 
Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems, 2016 edition."  

[Substitute] "NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two-Family 
Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2013 edition" with "NFPA 13D, Standard for the Installation of 
Sprinkler Systems in One- and Two-Family Dwellings and Manufactured Homes, 2016 edition."  



 

 

 

[Substitute] "NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-Rise Residential 
Occupancies, 2013 edition" with "NFPA 13R, Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems in Low-
Rise Residential Occupancies, 2016 edition."  

[Substitute] "NFPA 17A, Standard for Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems, 2013 edition" with "NFPA 
17A, Standard for Wet Chemical Extinguishing Systems, 2017 edition."  

[Substitute] "NFPA 20, Standard for the Installation of Stationary Pumps for Fire Protection, 2013 
edition" with "NFPA 20, Standard for the Installation of Stationary Pumps for Fire Protection, 2016 
edition."  

[Substitute] "NFPA 24, Standard for the Installation of Private Fire Service Mains and Their 
Appurtenances, 2013 edition" with "NFPA 24, Standard for the Installation of Private Fire Service Mains 
and Their Appurtenances, 2016 edition."  

[Substitute] "NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance of Water-Based Fire 
Protection Systems, 2014 edition" with "NFPA 25, Standard for the Inspection, Testing, and 
Maintenance of Water-Based Fire Protection Systems, 2017 edition."  

[Substitute] "NFPA 72®, National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2013 edition" with "NFPA 72®, 
National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, 2016 edition."  

[Substitute] "NFPA 2001, Standard on Clean Agent Fire Extinguishing Systems, 2012 edition" with 
"NFPA 2001, Standard on Clean Agent Fire Extinguishing Systems, 2015 edition."  

 (a) Pursuant 59 O.S. § 1000.23, the International Fire Code, 2018 edition, including Appendix B, C,  D, E, F and G 
as published by the International Code Council, Inc., including modifications by the Oklahoma Uniform 
Building Code Commission as set forth in Title 748, of the Oklahoma Administrative Code; hereinafter 
referred to as "IFC," is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the City of Norman for regulating conditions 
hazardous to life and property from fire or explosion; and occupancy of buildings already having a Certificate 
Of Occupancy or Certificate of Completion, construction of new buildings, remodeling of existing buildings, 
additions to existing buildings, and change of occupancy group of existing buildings, with the same force and 
effect as if fully set out in this section with amendments thereto as prescribed in this section.  

(b) The Fire Code shall not become effective until at least three (3) copies, including modifications prescribed in 
this section, have been filed in the office of the City Clerk.  

(c) The following sections of the IFC are hereby amended, added, deleted, or substituted as noted:  

(1) 101.1 Title [Amended]. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Norman, 
hereinafter referred to as "this code."  

(2) 101.2.1 Appendices [Amended]. The provisions in appendices B, C, D, E, F, G are hereby adopted and 
are considered a part of this code. All other appendices are not adopted and shall not apply.  

(3) SECTION 103 FIRE PREVENTION DIVISION [Substitute]  

(4) 103.1 General [Amended]. The Fire Prevention Division of Norman Fire Department is established 
within the jurisdiction under the direction of the fire code official. The function of the division shall be 
the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code. 

 (5) 105.7.25 Temporary membrane structures and tents [Amended]. A construction permit is required to 
erect an air-supported temporary membrane structure, a temporary stage canopy, or an individual tent 
having an area in excess of 120 square feet (11.16 m2 ). Multiple tents placed side by side with a 
clearance of not less than 12 feet (3658 mm) to any other tent shall be considered as an individual 
tent.  

Exceptions:  

1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.  



 

 

 

2. Funeral tents and curtains, or extensions attached thereto, when used for funeral services.  

(6) SECTION 109 BOARD OF APPEALS [Deleted]. IFC Section 109 is hereby deleted in favor of the provisions 
of Section 4-1601 of the Code of the City of Norman.  

(7) 110.4 Violation penalties [Amended]. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters, repairs or does work in 
violation of the approved construction documents, directive of the fire code official or of a permit 
issued under the provisions of this code shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.  

(8) 112.4 Failure to comply [Amended]. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served 
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove the violation 
or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.  

(9) 503.1 Where required [Amended]. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained in 
accordance with Sections 503.1.1 through 503.1.3 or when approved by the fire code official, in 
accordance with Appendix D.  

Exception: Fire apparatus access roads constructed in accordance with Section 20-113 of the Code of 
the City of Norman.  

(10) 503.2.1 Dimensions [Amended]. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not 
less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance 
with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm). 
Fire apparatus access roads shall not be located within 10 feet (3048 mm) of any building.  

(11) 507.3 Fire flow [Amended]. Fire flow requirements for buildings or portions of buildings and facilities 
shall be determined by an approved method or when approved by the fire code official, in accordance 
with Appendix B.  

(12) 507.5 Fire hydrant systems [Amended]. Fire hydrant systems shall comply with Sections 507.5.1 
through 507.5.6 or when approved by the fire code official, in accordance with Appendix C.  

Exception: Fire hydrant systems constructed in accordance with Section 20-113 of the Code of the City 
of Norman.  

(13) 507.5.5 Clear space around hydrants [Amended]. A clear space as described in Section 2002.8 of the 
City of Norman Engineering Design Criteria shall be maintained around fire hydrants.  

(14) 509.2 Equipment Access [Amended].  Unless otherwise approved by the fire code official, exterior 
access shall be provided and maintained for all fire protection equipment to permit immediate safe 
operation and maintenance of such equipment.  Storage, trash and other materials or objects shall not 
be placed or kept in such a manner that would prevent such equipment from being readily accessible. 

(15) 3103.2 Approval required [Amended]. Tents and membrane structures having an area in excess of 120 
square feet (11.16 m2 ) shall not be erected, operated or maintained for any purpose without first 
obtaining a permit and approval from the fire code official. Multiple tents placed side by side with a 
clearance of not less than 12 feet (3658 mm) to any other tent shall be considered as an individual 
tent.  

Exceptions:  

1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.  

2. Funeral tents and curtains, or extensions attached thereto, when used for funeral services.  

(16) 3105.2 Approval [Amended]. Temporary stage canopies in excess of 120 square feet (11.16 m2 ) shall 
not be erected, operated or maintained for any purpose without first obtaining approval and a permit 
from the fire code official. 



 

 

 

(17) 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited [Amended]. Storage of Class I and II 
liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited.  

Exception: Where allowed by the Zoning Ordinance of the City of Norman and when approved by the 
fire code official.  

(18) 5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited [Amended]. Storage of Class I and II 
liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited.  

Exception: Where allowed by the Zoning Ordinance of the City of Norman and when approved by the 
fire code official.  

(39) CHAPTER 80 REFERENCED STANDARDS [Amended]. IFC Chapter 80 is hereby amended to include the 
following substitutions:  

[Substitute] "NFPA 13-13" with "NFPA 13-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 13D-13" with "NFPA 13D-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 13R-13" with "NFPA 13R-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 14-13" with "NFPA 14-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 17A-13" with "NFPA 17A-17"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 20-13" with "NFPA 20-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 24-13" with "NFPA 24-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 25-14" with "NFPA 25-17"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 30-12" with "NFPA 30-15"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 72-13" with "NFPA 72-16"  

 
 

Sec. 9-402. Reserved.  Adoption of the Fire Code. 

(a) Pursuant 59 O.S. § 1000.23, the International Fire Code, 2015 edition, including Appendix B, C and D, as 
published by the International Code Council, Inc., including modifications by the Oklahoma Uniform Building 
Code Commission as set forth in Title 748, Chapter 20, Subchapter 3 of the Oklahoma Administrative Code; 
more specifically Sections 3, 7, 7.1, 8, 11, 12, 13, 13.2, 13.3, 13.4, and 13.5, effective September 15, 2017; 
hereinafter referred to as "IFC," is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the City of Norman for regulating 
construction of new buildings, remodeling of existing buildings, additions to existing buildings, and change of 
occupancy group of existing buildings, with the same force and effect as if fully set out in this section with 
amendments thereto as prescribed in this section.  

(b) The Fire Code shall not become effective until at least three (3) copies, including modifications prescribed in 
this section, have been filed in the office of the City Clerk.  

(c) The following sections of the IFC are hereby amended, added, deleted, or substituted as noted:  

(1) 101.1 Title [Amended]. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Norman, 
hereinafter referred to as "this code."  

(2) 101.2.1 Appendices [Amended]. The provisions in appendices B, C and D are hereby adopted and are 
considered a part of this code. All other appendices are not adopted and shall not apply.  

(3) SECTION 103 FIRE PREVENTION DIVISION [Substitute]  

(4) 103.1 General [Amended]. The Fire Prevention Division of Norman Fire Department is established 
within the jurisdiction under the direction of the fire code official. The function of the division shall be 



 

 

the implementation, administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code and NFPA 1 as 
adopted in Section 9-401 of the Code of the City of Norman.  

(5) 105.1.6 Annual permit [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.1.6 is hereby deleted without substitution.  

(6) 105.1.6.1 Annual permit records [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.1.6.1 is hereby deleted without 
substitution.  

(7) Sections 105.6 through 105.6.48 [Deleted]. IFC Sections 105.6 through 105.6.48 are hereby deleted 
without substitution.  

(8) 105.7 Construction permits [Amended]. The fire code official is authorized to issue construction 
permits in accordance with Sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.18. Those cases in which the fire code 
official does not establish a permit shall not justify a violation of any provision of this Code or any other 
applicable law or regulation.  

(9) 105.7.1 Automatic fire-extinguishing systems [Amended]. The installation of or modification to an 
automatic fire-extinguishing system shall be reviewed and approved by the fire code official. 
Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered to be a modification and does 
not require a permit.  

(10) 105.7.2 Battery systems [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.2 is hereby deleted without substitution.  

(11) 105.7.3 Compressed gases [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.3 is hereby deleted without substitution.  

(12) 105.7.4 Cryogenic fluids [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.4 is hereby deleted without substitution.  

(13) 105.7.5 Emergency responder radio coverage system [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.5 is hereby deleted 
without substitution.  

(14) 105.7.6 Fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment [Amended]. The installation of or 
modification to fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment shall be reviewed and 
approved by the fire code official. Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not 
considered to be a modification and does not require a permit.  

(15) 105.7.7 Fire pumps and related equipment [Amended]. The installation of or modification of fire 
pumps and related fuel tanks, jockey pumps, controllers and generators shall be reviewed and 
approved by the fire code official. Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not 
considered to be a modification and does not require a permit.  

(16) 105.7.8 Flammable and combustible liquids [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.8 is hereby deleted without 
substitution.  

(17) 105.7.9 Gates and barricades across fire apparatus access roads [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.9 is hereby 
deleted without substitution.  

(18) 105.7.10 Hazardous materials [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.10 is hereby deleted without substitution.  

(19) 105.7.11 Industrial ovens [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.11 is hereby deleted without substitution.  

(20) 105.7.12 LP-gas [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.12 is hereby deleted without substitution.  

(21) 105.7.13 Private fire hydrants [Amended]. The installation of or modification to private fire hydrants 
shall be reviewed and approved by the fire code official. Maintenance performed in accordance with 
this code is not considered to be a modification and does not require a permit.  

(22) 105.7.14 Smoke control or smoke exhaust systems [Amended]. The installation of or modification to 
smoke control or smoke exhaust systems shall be reviewed and approved by the fire code official. 
Maintenance performed in accordance with this code is not considered to be a modification and does 
not require a permit.  



 

 

(23) 105.7.15 Solar photovoltaic power systems [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.15 is hereby deleted without 
substitution.  

(24) 105.7.16 Spraying and dipping [Deleted]. IFC Section 105.7.16 is hereby deleted without substitution.  

(25) 105.7.17 Standpipe systems [Amended]. The installation, modification or removal from service of a 
standpipe system shall be reviewed and approved by the fire code official. Maintenance performed in 
accordance with this code is not considered to be a modification and does not require a permit.  

(26) 105.7.18 Temporary membrane structures and tents [Amended]. A construction permit is required to 
erect an air-supported temporary membrane structure, a temporary stage canopy, or an individual tent 
having an area in excess of 120 square feet (11.16 m2 ). Multiple tents placed side by side with a 
clearance of not less than 12 feet (3658 mm) to any other tent shall be considered as an individual 
tent.  

Exceptions:  

1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.  

2. Funeral tents and curtains, or extensions attached thereto, when used for funeral services.  

(27) SECTION 108 BOARD OF APPEALS [Deleted]. IFC Section 108 is hereby deleted in favor of the provisions 
of Section 4-1601 of the Code of the City of Norman.  

(28) 109.4 Violation penalties [Amended]. Any person who violates a provision of this code or fails to 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters, repairs or does work in 
violation of the approved construction documents, directive of the fire code official or of a permit 
issued under the provisions of this code shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.  

(29) 111.4 Failure to comply [Amended]. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served 
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove the violation 
or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.  

(30) 503.1 Where required [Amended]. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained in 
accordance with Sections 503.1.1 through 503.1.3 or when approved by the fire code official, in 
accordance with Appendix D.  

Exception: Fire apparatus access roads constructed in accordance with Section 20-113 of the Code of 
the City of Norman.  

(31) 503.2.1 Dimensions [Amended]. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not 
less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in accordance 
with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm). 
Fire apparatus access roads shall not be located within 10 feet (3048 mm) of any building.  

(32) 507.3 Fire flow [Amended]. Fire flow requirements for buildings or portions of buildings and facilities 
shall be determined by an approved method or when approved by the fire code official, in accordance 
with Appendix B.  

(33) 507.5 Fire hydrant systems [Amended]. Fire hydrant systems shall comply with Sections 507.5.1 
through 507.5.6 or when approved by the fire code official, in accordance with Appendix C.  

Exception: Fire hydrant systems constructed in accordance with Section 20-113 of the Code of the City 
of Norman.  

(34) 507.5.5 Clear space around hydrants [Amended]. A clear space as described in Section 2002.8 of the 
City of Norman Engineering Design Criteria shall be maintained around fire hydrants.  

(35) 3103.2 Approval required [Amended]. Tents and membrane structures having an area in excess of 120 
square feet (11.16 m2 ) shall not be erected, operated or maintained for any purpose without first 
obtaining a permit and approval from the fire code official. Multiple tents placed side by side with a 



 

 

clearance of not less than 12 feet (3658 mm) to any other tent shall be considered as an individual 
tent.  

Exceptions:  

1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.  

2. Funeral tents and curtains, or extensions attached thereto, when used for funeral services.  

(36) 3105.2 Approval [Amended]. Temporary stage canopies in excess of 120 square feet (11.16 m2 ) shall 
not be erected, operated or maintained for any purpose without first obtaining approval and a permit 
from the fire code official and the building official.  

(37) 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited [Amended]. Storage of Class I and II 
liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited.  

Exception: Where allowed by the Zoning Ordinance of the City of Norman and when approved by the 
fire code official.  

(38) 5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited [Amended]. Storage of Class I and II 
liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited.  

Exception: Where allowed by the Zoning Ordinance of the City of Norman and when approved by the 
fire code official.  

(39) CHAPTER 80 REFERENCED STANDARDS [Amended]. IFC Chapter 80 is hereby amended to include the 
following substitutions:  

[Substitute] "NFPA 13-13" with "NFPA 13-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 13D-13" with "NFPA 13D-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 13R-13" with "NFPA 13R-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 14-13" with "NFPA 14-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 17A-13" with "NFPA 17A-17"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 20-13" with "NFPA 20-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 24-13" with "NFPA 24-16"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 25-14" with "NFPA 25-17"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 30-12" with "NFPA 30-15"  

[Substitute] "NFPA 72-13" with "NFPA 72-16"  

 

§ 3. Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase, or portion of this 

ordinance is, for any reason, held invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent 

jurisdiction, such portion shall be deemed a separate, distinct, and independent provision, 

and such holding shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. 

 

ADOPTED this ______________ day of NOT ADOPTED this _________ day of  

___________________________ , 2022. ___________________________ , 2022. 

_________________________________ _________________________________ 



 

 

 (Mayor)  (Mayor) 

 

 

ATTEST: 

_________________________________ 

 (City Clerk) 

 


