SECTION ONE - PAVEMENT MARKINGS BID #2425-41

Action Safety Supply RCC Traffic, LLC (Rudy) pirect Tratfie Control mmﬂwouhuqﬂ“__n sharonp@
Oktahoma City, OK e Olahoma City, OK | Oklahoma City, oK |  £2i2nning.com
. . - - Multi- -
Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic ik Plastic —— Plastic Plastic Blults
Polymer Polymer Polymer Polymer
ESTIMATED
ITEM QUANTITY | PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL NO BID NOBID |NoBID| wNoOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pavement Markings
A, |4° Wide W/ Y Line {LF) 70.000 $1.25]  $87,500.00 51.60{ $70.000.00{ $0.65 $45.500.00] $0.70 $49.000,00]  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
B. |4 Wide Black Line {LF) 10,000 |NA NA $15.00| $150.000.00) NA _ |NA $3.50 $35.000.00|  No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
C. |6” wide W/ Y Line {LF) 40,000 $1.650  $66,000,00 $1.15] $46.000.00( $1.00 $40.000.00] $1.50 $60,000.00]  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D. |67 Wide Black Line {LF) 10,000 [NA NA $2.60| $26.000.00] NA |NA $5.00 $50,000.00] Mo Bid No Bigt No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
E. 16" wade W ! Y Line (LF) 3,000 $2.45]  §7,350.00] $2.40 $7,200.00] $1.25 $3,750.00] $2.00 $6,000.00] Mo Bl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F. |12° wide w /¥ Lina (LF} 500 $2.60)  $1,300.00 $2.60[  $1.300.00] $250 S.nmo.oo_ $3.00 $1,500.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid
(3. |24" Wide Whita Line (LF} 4,000 $13.00) $52,000.00]  $13.00] $52,000.00 $8.00 nn_..So.S_ $6.00 $24.000.00]  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H. JOMLY 8f X 5.9 (EA) 10 $52.00 $520.00 «mn.S_ $520.00] $125.00 u._.u....o.oo_ $125.00 2.»8.8_ Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
|. |Grade Crossing (RXR) 10|  $325.00]  $3.250.00 Snu.S_ $3.250.00] $200.00 uu.ooo.S_ $200.00 mn.So.S_ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
J. JTum Lane-Use Arrow (EA) 60 $71.50]  34.290.00 u:.uo_ 54,290.00] $75.00 $4,500.00] $75.00 ma.wco.oa_ No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid
K. |Through Lane-Uise Arrow (EA) 10 $71.50 $715.00 nq._‘mo_ §715.00] 575.00 §750.00] $75.00 m.._.uo.S_ No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
Tum and Through Lane-Use
L. |arow (EA) 10 $78.001 $780.00)  $76.00 $780.00] $150.00 $1,500.000 $150.00 $1.500.00]  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bi¢ No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
M. |Speed Hump Marking (EA) 180 $162.50] $16.250.00] $162.50) $16.250.00| $65.00 $6.,500.00] 3$55.00 $5,500.000  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
N. |Bicycle Lane Mariing (EA) 60|  $19500] $11.700.00] %$195.00| $11,700.00] $250.00 $15.000.00] $250.00 $15000.00] Mo Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid Nao Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O, |Shared Lane Marking (EA) 40 $195.00]  §7.800.00] $195.000 $7,800.00 $5250.00 $10,000.00) $250.00 $10,000.00{ No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid
Yield Line Marking (EA} 12
P. lin. X 18In. 60 $26.00] $1.560.00] $26.00] $1.560.00| $25.00 $1,500.00] $25.00 $1,500.00] N Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Yield Line Marking (EA) 24
Q. |in. X 36 in. 30 $32.50 $975.00]  $32.50 $875.00) $50.00 $1,500.00] $50.00 $1,500.00] Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
R, |Two Lane SCHOOL Marking 4 $405.00( ﬂ.nao.cm_ $405.00 m..uac.S_ $375.00 $1.500.00] $375.00 $1,500.00] Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
| I
Thermoplastic Remoeval j{Cleanup and proper disposal of debris is the responsibility of the contractor.)
Removal of pavement
markings based on a 4° wide
S, [line per linear foot 75.000 $1.15]  $86.250.00 $1.15| $86.250.00] $0.50 $37.500.00] $0.50 $37,500.00] Mo Ead No Bid Ng Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Remaval of "Arrow” pavemnent
T. |marking symbol 50 $30.00] 3150000  $30.00] $1.500.00| $20.00 $1,000.00] $20.00 $1,000.00] NoBid Mo Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of "Only” pavement
U. |marking legend 20 $30.00 $600.00f  $30.00 $600.00] $20.00 $400.00] $20.00 $400.00] NoBid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
| |oranp TotaL | ] sast.se0.00] [ sa89.930.00] } $199.400.00] {  s209.400.00




SECTION TWO - RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS - CLASS C BID #2425-41

ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY

RCC Traffic, LLC Oktahoma Chy, OK

DIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL,

Roadsafe Traffic Systems, Inc.

OKlahoma City, OK {Rudy Canstruction) e, Oklahama City, OK gheronpbeplannng gom
. . Multi- Multi- . .
Piastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Plastic Plastic Multi-Polymer Flastic Multi-Polymer
Polymer Polymer
ITEM QUANTITY] PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL |[PRICE |TOTAL] PRICE TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID

A.) Insiallation of Ennis-
Flint Model 201 400) $1000¢ | $4¢,000.00 | $100.00 | $40,000 00 54000 | $16.000.00 |[NOBID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NC BID NG BID NO BID
B.) Replacermant of lens
Ennis-Flint Model 201 50| $2000 $1.000 00 $2000 | $1.00000 $20.00 $1.000.00 |NOBID NQ BIC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BIO NO BID
C.) Removal of ruised
pavement marksr casing
and pateh pavement
where marker existed. 100) $100.00 | $10.000.00 | $10000 | $10.00000 $100.00 | $10.000.00 | No BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BIC NO BID NO BID NC BID
GRAND TOTAL $51,000.00 $51,000.00 $0.00 $27,000.00

Supenasar :




