
LINE MAINTENANCE   -   TABULATION OF BIDS 
 Water Line Repair Clamps 

BID 2526-35 April 23,2026 
 

 
 

 
American 
Waterworks 
Supply, Inc. 

 
Ferguson 
Waterworks 

 
Utility 
Technology 
Services 
 

 

 
Core and Main 

 

Oklahoma 
Contractors 
Supply 

Category I 
2” X 6” 

 
$114.31 

 
$57.00 

 
$50.113 

 
$51.17 

 
$53.02 

Category II 
4” X 6” 

 
$152.36 

 
$57.00 

 
$67.052 

 
$68.47 

 
$57.09 

Category III 
4” X 8” 

 
$190.12 

 
$89.00 

 
$68.598 

 
$70.04 

 
$57.09 

Category IV 
4” X 12” 

 
$301.99 

 
$67.00 

 
$92.794 

 
$94.75 

 
$89.28 

Category V 
6” X 8” 

 
$227.51 

 
$106.00 

 
$69.773 

 
$71.25 

 
$66.58 

Category VI 
6” X 12” 

 
$363.27 

 
$120.00 

 
$100.392 

 
$102.51 

 
$94.64 

Category VII 
6” X 15” 

 
$400.65 

 
$182.00 

 
$117.186 

 
$119.66 

 
$134.27 

Category VIII 
6” X 20” 

 
$604.34 

 
$225.86 

 
$176.062 

 
$179.77 

 
$173.37 

Category IX 
6” X 24” 

 
$760.51 

 
$291.16 

 
$216.206 

 
$220.76 

 
$192.29 

Category X 
6” X 30” 

 
$990.14 

 
$78.00 

 
$250.835 

 
$256.12 

 
$242.88 

Category XI 
8” X 8” 

 
$266.59 

 
$123.74 

 
$79.083 

 
$80.75 

 
$77.10 

Category XII 
8” X 12” 

 
$427.83 

 
$142.55 

 
$118.041 

 
$121.19 

 
$110.12 

 

 



LINE MAINTENANCE   -   TABULATION OF BIDS 
 Water Line Repair Clamps 

BID 2526-35 April 23,2026 
 

 
 

 
American 
Waterworks 
Supply, Inc. 

 
Ferguson 
Waterworks 
 

 
Utility 
Technology 
Services 
 

 
Core and Main 

 
Oklahoma 
Contractors 
Supply 

Category XIII 
8” X 15” 

 
$488.89 

 
$204.52 

 
$134.938 

 
$137.38 

 
$142.10 

Category XIV 
8” X 20” 

 
$692.61 

 
$308.29 

 
$190.227 

 
$194.24 

 
$195.90 

Category XV 
8” X 30” 

 
$1,136.90 

 
$215.00 

 
$326.309 

 
$333.18 

 
$275.35 

Category XVI 
12” X 15” 

 
$730.41 

 
$294.34 

 
$193.021 

 
$197.09 

 
$165.84 

Category XVII 
12” X 20” 

 
$1,014.34 

 
$352.66 

 
$333.536 

 
$340.55 

 
$233.96 

Category XVIII 
12” X 24” 

 
$1,204.69 

 
$425.96 

 
$370.083 

 
$377.88 

 
$246.66 

Category XIX 
12” X 30” 

 
$1,719.48 

 
$484.97 

 
$419.845 

 
$428.69 

 
$322.26 

Category XX 
14” x 20” 

 
$1,930.66 

 
$623.29 

 
$399.99 

 
$431.10 

 
$369.84 

Category XXI 
16” X 20” 

 
$2,470.48 

 
$519.42 

 
$445.247 

 
$479.88 

 
$395.13 

Category XXII 
16” X 30” 

 
$3,713.99 

 
$810.75 

 
$710.227 

 
$765.47 

 
$564.42 

Category XXIII 
24” X 24” 

 
$5,257.00 

 
$1,625.65 

 
$1,267.887 

 
$1447.06 

 
$672.05 

Category XXIV 
30” X 36” 

 
$9,763.00 

 
$8,712.93 

 
$2,004.691 

 
$2295.00 

 
$1,008.73 

Category XXV 
36” X 30” 

 
$8,796.00 

 
$3,904.17 

 
$2,170.629 

 
$No bid 

 
$1,118.75 

Category XXVI 
36” X 36” 

 
$11,725.00 

 
$10,387.89 

 
$2,646.175 

 
$No bid 

 
$1,311.99 

 



LINE MAINTENANCE   -   TABULATION OF BIDS 
 Water Line Repair Clamps 

BID 2526-35 April 23,2026 
 
 

 
 

 
American 
Waterworks 
Supply, Inc 
 

 
Ferguson 
Waterworks 

 
Utility 
Technology 
Services 

 
Core and Main 

 
Oklahoma 
Contractors 
Supply 

Section XXVII 
42” X 36” 

 
$15,675.00 

 
$13,799.74 

 
$3,173.588 

 
$No bid 

 
$1,498.19 

Section XXVIII 
42” X 42” 

 
$22,360.00 

 
$19,955.75 

 
$No bid 

 
$No bid 

 
$1,714.75 

Category XXIX 
2”X6” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$192.00 

 
$72.00 

 
$74.031 

 
$84.89 

 
$72.98 

Category XXX 
2”X 12” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$336.00 

 
$99.16 

 
$96.083 

 
$84.89 

 
$95.52 

Category XXXI 
2” X 6” 1” CC Thread 

 
$192.00 

 
$72.00 

 
$74.031 

 
$84.89 

 
$72.98 

Category XXXII 
2” X 12” 1” CC Thread 

 
$336.00 

 
$105.77 

 
$96.083 

 
$109.65 

 
$95.52 

Category XXXIII 
4” X 8” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$269.00 

 
$83.05 

 
$91.753 

 
$134.97 

 
$75.40 

Category XXXIV 
4” X 12” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$381.00 

 
$115.00 

 
$116.722 

 
$134.97 

 
$103.57 

Category XXXV 
4” X 8” 1” CC Thread 

 
$269.00 

 
$86.21 

 
$91.753 

 
$134.97 

 
$75.40 

Category XXXVI 
4” X 12” 1” CC Thread 

 
$381.00 

 
$116.03 

 
$116.722 

 
$134.97 

 
$103.57 

Category XXXVII 
6” X 8” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$307.00 

 
$94.15 

 
$98.639 

 
$120.00 

 
$87.50 

Category XXXVIII 
6” X 15” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$480.00 

 
$155.00 

 
$140.062 

 
$167.95 

 
$141.71 

Category XXXIX 
6” X 8” 1” CC Thread 

 
$307.00 

 
$92.72 

 
$98.639 

 
$120.00 

 
$87.50 

Category XL 
6” X 15” 1” CC Thread 

 
$480.00 

 
$140.00 

 
$140.062 

 
$167.95 

 
$141.71 



LINE MAINTENANCE   -   TABULATION OF BIDS 
 Water Line Repair Clamps 

BID 2526-35 April 23,2026 
 

      

  
American 
Waterworks 
Supply, Inc. 
 

 
Ferguson 
Waterworks 
 

 
Utility 
Technology 
Services 
 

 

Core and Main 
 
Oklahoma 
Contractors 
Supply 

Category XLI 
8” X 8” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$346.00 

 
$104.12 

 
$100.763 

 
$170.00 

 
$91.23 

Category XLII 
8” X 15” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$568.00 

 
$180.00 

 
$157.907 

 
$213.00 

 
$154.44 

Category XLIII 
8” X 8” 1” CC Thread 

 
$346.00 

 
$105.00 

 
$100.763 

 
$170.00 

 
$91.23 

Category XLIV 
8” X 15” 1” CC Thread 

 
$568.00 

 
$175.00 

 
$157.907 

 
$213.00 

 
$154.44 

Category XLV 
12” X 15” ¾” CC Thread 

 
$809.00 

 
$250.00 

 
$219.907 

 
$290.00 

 
$214.03 

Category XLVI 
12” X 15” 1” CC Thread 

 
$809.00 

 
$250.00 

 
$219.907 

 
$290.00 

 
$214.03 

 
 

     

 
 

     

 
 

     

 
 

     

 

 


