LINE MAINTENANCE DIVISION — TABULATION OF BIDS

COPPER METER YOKES FOR METERS, REPAIR CLAMPS/SETTERS, METER BOXES WITHCAST IRON LIDS, HDPE METER BOXES WITHANTIFLOAT LIDS,

HDP| ANTIFLOAT LIDS

BID #2223-45 FEBRUARY 23, 2023

Pioneer Oklahoma Utility Technology Ferguson Core & Main AMERICAN
Supply Contractor’s Services OKC, OK OKC, OK WATERWORKS
Moore, OK Supply LLC OKC, OK SUPPLY, INC.
OKC, OK Norman, OK
SECTION 1: Copper $174.85 $250.00 $185.65 $219.86 $170.72 $£156.90
Meter Yokes
SECTION 1: Repair $53.50 $38.34 $48.00 $94.82 $45.73 $89.00
Clamps, Category 1
Category I $68.55 $62.63 $£58.00 $127.48 $58.63 $125.00
Category 111 $68.55 $62.63 $70.25 $159.07 $58.63 $157.00
Category 1V 510520 $95.59 $95.50 $252.67 $£89.95 $249.00
Category V $79.95 $39.46 $72.00 $190.35 $71.87 $191.00
Category VI $128.10 $85.75 $108.00 $303.94 $108.13 $300.00
Category VII $141.05 $101.48 $127.00 $335.22 $120.62 $331.00
Category VIII $221.55 $£138.70 $185.00 $505.65 $184.64 $495.00
Category IX $277.00 $197.37 $222.00 $636.32 $222.45 $592.00
Category X $316.70 $247.43 $265.00 $828.45 $280.00 $795.00
Category X1 $93.45 $76.76 $84.25 $223.05 $79.93 $220.00
Category XII $149.30 $100.71 $£119.00 $357.97 $115.20 $354.00
Category XIII $171.65 $£118.99 $145.00 $409.06 $145.34 $398.00
Category XIV $£249.00 $169.66 $199.50 $579.51 $199.48 $571.00
Category XV $368.15 $301.46 $330.50 $951.24 $314.78 $906.00
Category XV1 $262.25 $152.54 $197.00 $611.13 $196.48 $695.00




LINE MAINTENANCE DIVISION — TABULATION OF BIDS
COPPER METER YOKES FOR METERS, REPAIR CLAMPS/SETTERS, METER BOXES WITHCAST IRON LIDS, HDPE METER BOXES WITHANTIFLOAT LIDS,
HDPI ANTIFLOAT LIDS
BID #2223-45 FEBRUARY 23, 2023

Pioneer Supply Oklahoma Utility Technology Ferguson Core & Main American Waterwork
Moore, OK Contractor’s Services OKC, OK OKC, 0K Supply Inc.
Supply LL.C OKC, OK Norman, OK
. OKC, OK
Category XVII $358.40 $202.56 $255.00 $848.69 $254.24 $793.00
Category XVIII $429.35 $283.57 $350.00 $1,007.95 $349.79 $997.00
Category XIX $503.40 $369.75 $397.00 $1,438.67 $418.87 $1,395.00
Category XX No Bid $297.61 $378.00 $1,615.38 $454.77 $1,653.00
Category XX1 $906.85 $319.55 $421.00 $2,067.30 $470.59 $2,060.00
Category XXiI $1,712.70 $458.24 $671.50 $3,181.65 $807.49 $3,062.00
Category XXIII No bid $665.59 $1200.00 $4,398.01 $1,339.35 $4,398.00
Category XXIV No bid $1,227.21 $2,256.50 $8,958.86 $2,117.67 $8957.00
Category XXV No bid $1,107.99 $2,052.00 $7,521.96 $2,294.12 $7,521.00
Category XXVI No bid $1,369.41 $2,052.00 $10,029.22 $2,975.00 $10,028.00
Category XXVil No bid $1,483.79 $3.000.00 $14,893.24 $3,875.00 $14,934.00
Category XXVIII No bid $1,698.26 No bid $21,38_}' 17 A No bid $20,256.00
Category XXIX $82.10 $51.83 $67.25 $160.52 $79.89 $158.00
Category XXX $118.35 $79.34 $90.50 $280.76 $107.28 $277.00
Category XXXI $82.10 $51.83 $67.50 $160.52 $79.89 $158.00
Category XXXII $118.35 $79.35 $90.50 $280.76 $107.28 $277.00
Category XXXIII $97.45 $76.13 $87.50 $224.78 $113.16 $222.00




LINE MAINTENANCE DIVISION - TABULATION OF BIDS

COPPER METER YOKES FOR METERS, REPAIR CLAMPS/SETTERS, METER BOXES WITHCAST IRON LIDS, HDPE METER BOXES WITHANTIFLOAT LIDS,

HDPI ANTIFLOAT LIDS

BID #2223-45 FEBRUARY 23, 2023

Oklahoma
Pioneer Supply Contractor’s Utility Technology Ferguson Core & Main American Waterwork
Moore, OK Supply LLC Services OKC, OK OKC, OK Supply Inc.
OKC, OK OKC, OK Norman, OK

Category XXXIV $134.90 $109.00 $114,00 $318.39 $137.97 $296.00
Category XXXV $97.45 $76.13 $87.50 $224.78 $113.16 $222.00
Category XXXVI $134.90 $£109.09 $114.00 $318.39 $137.97 $296.00
Category XXVII $109.15 $72.95 $93.00 $256.07 $110.13 $253.00
Category XX VIII $171.55 $114,97 $141.50 $400.93 $167.95 $396.00
Category XXXIX $109.15 $72.95 $93.00 $256.07 $110.13 $253.00
Category XL $171.55 $114.97 $141.50 $400.93 $167.95 $396.00

Category XLI $122.95 $88.95 $104.00 $288.75 $134.24 -$284.00 ‘
Category XLII1 $202.75 $132.48 $165.50 £474.77 $212.42 $467.00
Category XLIII $122.95 $89.95 $104.00 $288.75 $134.24 $279.00
Category XLIV $202.75 $132.48 $165.50 $288.75 $21242 $467.00
Category XLV $295.35 $166.04 $208.00 $676.83 $246.83 $669.00
Category XLVI $295.35 $166.04 $208.00 $676.83 $246.83 $669.00

Section I:
Meter Boxes w/cast No bid $135.00 £130.00 $128.66 $114.36 $179.00
iron lid
Meter Boxes w/ HDPE No bid $130.00 $90.00 $88.39 $86.43 $160.00
Antifloat lids

HDPE antifloat lids No bid $35.00 $29.00 $29.39 $28.74 $49.00




LINE MAINTENANCE DIVISION — TABULATION OF BIDS

COPPER METER YOKES FOR METERS, REPAIR CLAMPS/SETTERS, METER BOXES WITHCAST IRON LIDS, HDPE METER BOXES WITHANTIFLOAT LIDS,

HDPI ANTIFLOAT LIDS

BID #2223-45 FEBRUARY 23, 2023

Pioneer Supply Oklahoma Utility Technology Ferguson Core & Main American Waterwork
Moore, OK Contractor’s Services OKC, OK OKC, OK Supply Inc.
Supply LLC OKC, OK Norman, OK
OKC, OK
Section I: Cold Water
Meters 5/87x3/4” Cold No bid No bid $111.11 No Bid $77.65 No bid
Water Meters
17 Cold Water Meters No bid No bid $172.22 No bid $212.35 No bid
1 %" Cold Water No bid No bid $400.00 No bid $551.25 No bid
Meters
2” Compound Meters No bid No bid $1,145.00 No bid $1875.00 No bid
2” Cold Water Meters No bid No bid $461.11 No bid $723.75 No bid
2" Turbine Meters No bid No bid $805.00 No bid $843.34 No bid
3” Compound Merters No bid No bid $1,450.00 No bid $2,704.00 No bid
3" Turbine Meters No bid No bid $972.22 No bid $1,513.34 No bid
3” Fire Hydrant No bid No bid $1,480.00 No bid $1502.50 No bid
Meters
4" Compound Meters No bid No bid $2,515.00 No bid $3,375.00 No bid
4” Turbine Meters No bid No bid $1,894.44 No bid $1,733.34 No bid
6” Compound Meters No bid No bid $4,370.00 No bid $6,357.14 No bid
6” Turbine Meters No bid No bid $3,411.11 No bid $3,500.00 No bid




