

SECTION TWO - RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS - CLASS C BID #2425-41

ITEM	QUANTITY	ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY Oklahoma City, OK		RCC Traffic, LLC Oklahoma City, OK (Rudy Construction)		DIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL, INC.		Roadsafe Traffic Systems, Inc. Oklahoma City, OK		sharonp@planning.com		dks@aw-inc.com	
		PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL	PRICE	TOTAL
A.) Installation of Erms-Flint Model 201	400	\$100.00	\$40,000.00	\$100.00	\$40,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
B.) Replacement of lens Erms-Flint Model 201	50	\$20.00	\$1,000.00	\$20.00	\$1,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
C.) Removal of raised pavement marker casting and patch pavement where marker existed.	100	\$100.00	\$10,000.00	\$100.00	\$10,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
GRAND TOTAL			\$51,000.00		\$51,000.00		\$8.00		\$27,000.00				

Supervisor