Date:  March 21, 2023

To: Barbara Andros, Revenue Collection Supervisor
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From: Steve Guizzo, Engineering Assistant

Subject: “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” Resident Contribution

I’ve attached payments for the “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” to be deposited
in revenue account “Citizen Sidewalk Reconstruction” account number 509-364253. The balance will
later be requested, via Mayor and City Council Resolution, to replenish the Citywide Sidewalk
Reconstruction Project account (TC0273).

Payments Received

Name | Property Address | Amount
Patti Lowry |1616 Rolling Stone Dr. $ 569.83¢v
Ross Eaton 11413 Peach Tree Ln. S 46747¢
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Total:|$ 1,037.30

Respectfully,

0

Steve Guizzo

officeimemokandiim



2

(V4
N

officeImemoekandiiim

Date: March 21,2023

To: Barbara Andros, Revenue Collection Supervisor

From: Steve Guizzo, Engineering Assistant

Subject: “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” Resident Contribution

Ive attached payments for the “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” to be deposited
in revenue account “Citizen Sidewalk Reconstruction” account number 509-364253. The balance will
later be requested, via Mayor and City Council Resolution, to replenish the Citywide Sidewalk

Reconstruction Project account (TC0273).

Payments Received
Name | Property Address Amount
Cheryl Hollingsworth 1900 Riviera Dr. $  111.734
Randy Jones 12509 O J Talley Circle $ 29843y
Lori Jervis 1204 S. University Blvd. 8 1,744.75¢
Janell McDonald 913 Chautauqua Ave. $ 1,297.88¢"
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- Total:|$ 3,452.79

Respectfully,

Steve Guizzo



Date:  February 17, 2023

To: Barbara Andros, Revenue Collection Supervisor

S0

From: Steve Guizzo, Engineering Assistant

Subject: “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” Resident Contribution

I’ve attached payments for the “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” to be deposited
in revenue account “Citizen Sidewalk Reconstruction” account number 509-364253. The balance will
later be requested, via Mayor and City Council Resolution, to replenish the Citywide Sidewalk
Reconstruction Project account (TC0273).

Payments Received

Name Property Address Amount
Hagll Park HOA 24" Ave. NE S. of Creighton $ 398632 ¥
Scott Clift 4001 Harrogate 3 23864
Brookhaven Village Plaza 3700 W. Robinson $ 26247
Arbor Lake HOA 48" Ave NW $ 2136l ¢
Shawn McElhiney 1513 Fawn Run Xing $ 13451 ¢

|
- - Total:($ 4,835.55
Respectfully
<

Steve Guizzo
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Date: November 21, 2022

To: Barbara Andros, Revenue Collection Supervisor
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From: Steve Guizzo, Engineering Assistant

Subject: “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” Resident Contribution

I’ve attached payments for the “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” to be deposited
in revenue account “Citizen Sidewalk Reconstruction” account number 509-364253. The balance will
later be requested, via Mayor and City Council Resolution, to replenish the Citywide Sidewalk
Reconstruction Project account (TC0273).

Payments Received
Name Property Address Amount
Carlton Carter 2808 Bishops Ct. $  169.264
Sheryl Wells 1909 Danfield 18 212944
Cynthia Teague 1708 Pembroke Dr. $ 91413
David Ritz 413 Portland St. $ 240194
Kerry McKeown 1229 Burkshire Terrace $ 221351+
Kristy Doyle 1229 Burkshire Terrace $ 1,581.87¢"
Total:|$ 5,331.90
Respectfully,
<~
Steve Guizzo
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Date:  October 31, 2022

To: Barbara Andros, Revenue Collection Supervisor

From: Steve Guizzo, Engineering Assistant

Subject: “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” Resident Contribution

I've attached payments for the “FYE 2023 Citywide Sidewalk Reconstruction Project” to be deposited
in revenue account “Citizen Sidewalk Reconstruction” account number 509-364253. The balance will
later be requested, via Mayor and City Council Resolution, to replenish the Citywide Sidewalk
Reconstruction Project account (TC0273).

Payments Received
Name Property Address Amount
Mr. & Mrs. Newman 1210 Woodstock Ct. $655.08¢"
(HD & SJ Moore _ 6ButingtonPl. | $1,762.404
Marvinlamb _ 816LandsdownDr. | $649.13¢"
Elizabeth or Arthur
Waldenville 1214 Woodstock Ct. $790.51y"
Charlie & Teri Lynn 1317 Brookhaven Blvd. $373.88¢"
Linda Pointer 12 Bingham P1. $691.88}"
Total:| $4,922.88
Respectfully,
Steve Guizzo
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