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ITEM
ESTIMATED 
QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Pavement Markings

A. 4" Wide Line (LF) 70,000          $0.85 $59,500.00 $0.85 $59,500.00 $1.00 $70,000.00 $0.75 $52,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

B. 4" Wide Line BLACK (LF) 10,000          $2.25 $22,500.00 $0.75 $7,500.00

C. 6" Wide Line (LF) 40,000          $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.75 $70,000.00 $1.50 $60,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

D. 6" Wide Line BLACK (LF) 10,000          $5.00 $50,000.00 $1.50 $15,000.00

E. 8" Wide Line (LF) 3,000            $1.25 $3,750.00 $1.25 $3,750.00 $2.00 $6,000.00 $2.00 $6,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F. 12" Wide Line (LF) 500               $1.50 $750.00 $1.50 $750.00 $3.00 $1,500.00 $3.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

G. 24" Wide Line (LF) 4,000            $10.00 $40,000.00 $10.00 $40,000.00 $6.00 $24,000.00 $6.00 $24,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

H. ONLY 8ft X 5.9ft (EA) 10                 $40.00 $400.00 $40.00 $400.00 $125.00 $1,250.00 $125.00 $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

I.
Grade Crossing (RXR) 8ft X 
20ft (EA) 10                 $250.00 $2,500.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $1,250.00 $12,500.00 $1,250.00 $12,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

J. Turn Lane-Use Arrow 8ft (EA) 60                 $125.00 $7,500.00 $125.00 $7,500.00 $75.00 $4,500.00 $75.00 $4,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

K.
Through Lane-Use Arrow 9.5ft 
(EA) 10                 $125.00 $1,250.00 $125.00 $1,250.00 $75.00 $750.00 $75.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

L.
Turn and Through-Lane Use 
Arrow (EA) 10                 $125.00 $1,250.00 $125.00 $1,250.00 $150.00 $1,500.00 $150.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

M. Speed Hump Markings (EA) 100               $220.00 $22,000.00 $220.00 $22,000.00 $125.00 $12,500.00 $75.00 $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

N. Bicycle Lane Markings (EA) 60                 $370.00 $22,200.00 $370.00 $22,200.00 $350.00 $21,000.00 $250.00 $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O. Shared Lane Markings (EA) 40                 $370.00 $14,800.00 $370.00 $14,800.00 $350.00 $14,000.00 $250.00 $10,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P.

Yield Line Marking 12in x 18in 
segment (MUTCD Fig 3B-
16(a))                   60 $20.00 $1,200.00 $20.00 $1,200.00 $25.00 $1,500.00 $25.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Q

Yield Line Marking 24in x 36in 
segment (MUTCD Fig 3B-
16(b)) 30                 $25.00 $750.00 $25.00 $750.00 $50.00 $1,500.00 $50.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

R
Two-Lane SCHOOL Marking 
(MUTCD Fig 7C-1) 4                    $310.00 $1,240.00 $310.00 $1,240.00 $1,250.00 $5,000.00 $1,250.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Thermoplastic Removal (Cleanup and proper disposal of debris is the responsibility of the contractor.)

S.

Removal of pavement markings
based on a 4" wide line per 
linear foot 75,000          $0.45 $33,750.00 $0.45 $33,750.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid       No Bid No Bid       No Bid

T
Removal of "Arrow" pavement 
marking symbol 50                 $20.00 $1,000.00 $20.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 $50.00 $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

U
Removal of "Only" pavement 
marking legend 20                 $10.00 $200.00 $10.00 $200.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

GRAND TOTAL $254,040.00 $326,540.00 $326,000.00 $306,000.00
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