
Kyla Gardner <kyla.cityclerk@newmeadowsidaho.us>

Fwd: Invoice 5141 from Idaho CDL Training LLC
1 message

Ivan McDaniel <ivan.m@newmeadowsidaho.us> Wed, Sep 6, 2023 at 8:12 AM
To: Kyla Gardner <kyla.cityclerk@newmeadowsidaho.us>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Idaho CDL Training LLC <quickbooks@notification.intuit.com>
Date: Mon, Aug 21, 2023, 2:46 PM
Subject: Invoice 5141 from Idaho CDL Training LLC
To: <idaholaunch@wdc.idaho.gov>, <ivan.m@newmeadowsidaho.us>

INVOICE 5141

Idaho CDL Training LLC

DUE 08/21/2023

$3,340.00
Review and pay

Powered by QuickBooks

To:

Idaho Workforce Development Council

Ivan McDaniels

Note that this is a split invoice based on the attached voucher received by Idaho CDL

Training from the Idaho Workforce Development Council.

Idaho Workforce Development Council portion = $2,672.00



Student: (Ivan McDaniels) portion = $668.00

Total = $3,340.00

Course Dates October 6 - 9, 2023

Please remit payment for the portion you are responsible for. For each payment, please

reference invoice number and student name.

Idaho CDL Training LLC

1111 s orchard st #239 boise, ID 83705

208-258-3515 Kim@idahocdltraining.com www.idahocdltraining.com

If you receive an email that seems fraudulent, please check with the business owner before paying.
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