> Lochner

SCHEDULE A: CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 9-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE B: CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 9-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE C: CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 10-UNIT T-HANGAR

BID TABULATION

OMAR N. BRADLEY AIRPORT (MBY)

MOBERLY, MISSOURI
MODOT PROJECT NO. 24-034A-1
LOCHNER NO. 12366

SCHEDULE D: CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 10-UNIT T-HANGAR

BID OPENING: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 at 3:00 P.M. (CDT)

M

't '5585 :

&
ALE\\

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc Seaton Construction Group, LLC ar Holmagxi:c::ianlg?t:sctruction &

Item No. S':):c Description | Qty | Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

SCHEDULE A

CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 9-UNIT T-HANGAR
1 c-105 X;‘:ﬂf‘f)“"“ (NTE 10% of Total Schedule A Bid 1 |Ls|s 51,366.00 | $ 51,366.00| $ 75,000.00 | § 75,000.00 $ 55,598.20 | $ 55,598.20
2 TEMP |Temporary Marking, Lighting, and Barricades 1 LS. | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00] $ 9,500.00 | $ 9,500.00 $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00
3 C-100 |Contractor Quality Control Program (CQCP) 1 Ls. | $ 32,500.00 | $ 32,500.00] $ 40,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 $ 78,000.00 | $ 78,000.00
4 C-102 |Temporary Erosion Control 1 LS. | $ 32,500.00 | $ 32,500.00] $ 34,000.00 | $ 34,000.00 $ 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00]
5 P-152  |Unclassified Excavation 194 | cy.| $ 200.00 | $ 38,800.00] $ 230.00 | $ 44,620.00 $ 40.00 | $ 7,760.00
6 P-152  |Unsuitable Subgrade Removal and Replacement 50 cy.|s 150.00 | $ 7,500.00] $ 187.00 | $ 9,350.00 D $ 50.00 | $ 2,500.00

P-154,
7 g:;gg: Aggregate Subbase Course (12) 1952 | sv. | $ 4500 | $ 87,840.00| $ 4700 $ 91,744.00 M $ 22.00 | $ 42,944.00
or P-219
P-208,
8 ol:;jz_(;si,g Aggregate Base Course (6") 1952 | SY. | $ 28.00 | $ 54,656.00] $ 36.50 | $ 71,248.00) D — $ 11.00 | $ 21,472.00
9 P-501 |P.C.C. Pavement Mix Design 1 Ls. | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00] $ 350.00 | $ 350.00] — — $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
10 P-501 |P.C.C. Pavement (6") 1841 [ SY. | § 105.00 | $ 193,305.00] $ 116.00 | $ 213,556.00 m $ 125.00 | $ 230,125.00
I
1" P-620 |Permanent Reflectorized Pavement Marking (Yellow) 192 SF.|$ 1000 | $ 1,920.00] $ 2200 | $ 4,224.00 $ 4500 | $ 8,640.00|
12 P-620 f;;’gka)“e”‘ Non-Reflectorized Pavement Marking 34 |SF|s 1000 | $ 3,840.00| $ 12,00 | 4,608.00 E $ 2500 | $ 9,600.00
13 D-701 |12" Storm Pipe 159 | LF. | $ 100.00 | $ 15,900.00] $ 105.00 | $ 16,695.00 O $ 4000 | $ 6,360.00
14 D-701 |12" End Section 1 EA. | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00] $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 m $ 1,750.00 | $ 1,750.00
15 D-701 |4'x2' Junction Box 1 EA. | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00] $ 10,700.00 | $ 10,700.00 2 $ 4,800.00 | $ 4,800.00
16 D-705  |Slotted Drain (10") 233 | LF. | $ 375.00 | $ 87,375.00] $ 355.00 | $ 82,715.00 ’ $ 380.00 | $ 88,540.00
17 D-705 |Perforated Underdrain (4") 367 | LF.|$ 50.00 | $ 18,350.00| $ 52.00 | $ 19,084.00 $ 9.00| $ 3,303.00
18 D-705 |Underdrain Cleanout Riser 2 EA. | $ 2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00] $ 1,800.00 | $ 3,600.00] m $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00]
19 T-901 |Temporary Seeding 1 AC. | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00] $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
20 T-901 |Permanent Seeding 1 AC. | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00] $ 4,20000 | $ 4,200.00 $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00]|
21 TREC  |Erosion Control Blanket (Type 2C) 4717 | SY. | $ 4001 $ 18,868.00] $ 450 $ 21,226.50 $ 4001 $ 18,868.00)
22 PTM  |Permanent Transition Mat 16 SF.|$ 80.00 | $ 1,280.00] $ 59.00 | $ 944.00| $ 22000 | $ 3,520.00
SCHEDULE A SUBTOTAL| $ 700,000.00 | $ 761,564.50 $ 611,580.20
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J> Lochner

BID TABULATION

OMAR N. BRADLEY AIRPORT (MBY)
MOBERLY, MISSOURI
MODOT PROJECT NO. 24-034A-1
LOCHNER NO. 12366

SCHEDULE A: CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 9-UNIT T-HANGAR

SCHEDULE B: CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 9-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE C: CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 10-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE D: CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 10-UNIT T-HANGAR

BID OPENING: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 at 3:00 P.M. (CDT)

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc

Seaton Construction Group, LLC

JT Holman General Construction &
Excavating, LLC

Item No.| S::c Description | Qty | Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
SCHEDULE B
CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 9-UNIT T-HANGAR
1 c-105 2";‘(’)':]'2”?)“"" (NTE 10% of Total Schedule B Bid 1 | Ls 80,730.00 | $ 80,730.00) $ 136,990.00 | $ 136,990.00 128,401.00 | $ 128,401.00
2 TEMP [Temporary Marking, Lighting, and Barricades 1 LS. 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 N O B | D $ 2290435 | $ 22,904.35 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
3 --- Construct 9-Unit T-Hangar 1 L.S. 1,008,000.00 | $ 1,008,000.00 $ 1,109,834.57 | $ 1,109,834.57 1,185,000.00 | $ 1,185,000.00
4 ---  |Construct 9-Unit T-Hangar Approach 774 | SY. 105.00 | $ 81,270.00 S U B I\/l I I I E D $ 12942 | $ 100,171.08 115.00 | $ 89,010.00
SCHEDULE B SUBTOTAL 1,175,000.00 $ 1,369,900.00 1,412,411.00
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc Seaton Construction Group, LLC SaEClmaniCenerslic onstictions
Excavating, LLC
Item No.| S::c Description | Qty | Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
SCHEDULE C
CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 10-UNIT T-HANGAR
1 c-105 2";‘(’)':]'2”?)“"" (NTE 10% of Total Schedule C Bid 1| Ls. 56,165.00 | $ 56,165.00| $ 75,000.00 | $ 75,000.00 58,291.30 | $ 58,291.30
2 TEMP | Temporary Marking, Lighting, and Barricades 1 LS. 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00] $ 9,500.00 | $ 9,500.00 D 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00
3 C-100 |Contractor Quality Control Program (CQCP) 1 LS. 32,500.00 | $ 32,500.00] $ 40,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 m 78,000.00 | $ 78,000.00
4 C-102  |Temporary Erosion Control 1 LS. 32,500.00 | $ 32,500.00| $ 34,000.00 | $ 34,000.00 D 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00]
5 P-152 |Unclassified Excavation 200 | Cl. 200.00 | $ 40,000.00] $ 230.00 | $ 46,000.00 I 40.00 | $ 8,000.00]
I
6 P-152 |Unsuitable Subgrade Removal and Replacement 50 c.. 150.00 | $ 7,500.00] $ 187.00 | $ 9,350.00 m P 50.00 | $ 2,500.00
P-154, I
7 ::jgg' Aggregate Subbase Course (12) 2080 | SY. 4500 | $ 93,600.00| $ 4700 $ 97,760.00 2200 | $ 45,760.00
or P-219 O
P-208,
8 P-209, |Aggregate Base Course (6") 2,080 | S.Y. 28.00]| $ 58,240.00] $ 36.50 | $ 75,920.00 Z 11.00 $ 22,880.00
or P-219
9 P-501 |P.C.C. Pavement Mix Design 1 LS. 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00] $ 350.00 | $ 350.00 3 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
10 P-501 |P.C.C. Pavement (6") 1,960 | S.Y. 105.00 | $ 205,800.00] $ 116.00 | $ 227,360.00 m 125.00 | $ 245,000.00
1 P-620 |Permanent Reflectorized Pavement Marking (Yellow) 201 S.F. 1000 $ 2,010.00] $ 2200 $ 4,422.00 4500 | $ 9,045.00|
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J> Lochner

BID TABULATION

OMAR N. BRADLEY AIRPORT (MBY)
MOBERLY, MISSOURI
MODOT PROJECT NO. 24-034A-1
LOCHNER NO. 12366

SCHEDULE A: CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 9-UNIT T-HANGAR

SCHEDULE B: CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 9-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE C: CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 10-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE D: CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 10-UNIT T-HANGAR

BID OPENING: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 at 3:00 P.M. (CDT)

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc

Seaton Construction Group, LLC

JT Holman General Construction &
Excavating, LLC

Item No. Sﬁ:-c Description Qty | Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
12 P-620 (PBSI;’Q;“"‘ Non-Reflectorized Pavement Marking 402 | SF. 1000 | $ 4,020.00] s 12,00 | 4,824.00 2500 | $ 10,050.00)
13 D-701 |12" Storm Pipe 146 | LF. 100.00 | $ 14,600.00] $ 105.00 | $ 15,330.00 D 4000 | $ 5,840.00
14 D-701 [12" End Section 1 EA. 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00] $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 m 1,750.00 | $ 1,750.00|
15 D-701 |4'x2' Junction Box 1 EA. 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00] $ 10,700.00 | $ 10,700.00 D l_ 4,800.00 | $ 4,800.00
16 D-705 |Slotted Drain (10") 251 | LF. 375.00 | $ 94,125.00] $ 355.00 | $ 89,105.00 — |_ 380.00 | $ 95,380.00)
17 D-705 |Perforated Underdrain (4") 392 | LF. 50.00 | $ 19,600.00] $ 52.00 | $ 20,384.00| m — 9.00| $ 3,528.00
18 D-705 |Underdrain Cleanout Riser 2 EA. 2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00| $ 1,800.00 | $ 3,600.00 2 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
19 T-901 |Temporary Seeding 1 AC. 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00] $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 O 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
20 T-901 |Permanent Seeding 1 AC. 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00] $ 4,200.00 | $ 4,200.00 Z m 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00]
21 TREC |Erosion Control Blanket (Type 2C) 4,765 | S.Y. 400 $ 19,060.00] $ 450 | $ 21,442.50] D 400)| $ 19,060.00
22 PTM  |Permanent Transition Mat 16 SF. 80.00| $ 1,280.00] $ 59.00 | $ 944.00| (/) 220.00 | $ 3,520.00

SCHEDULE C SUBTOTAL 735,000.00 | $ 794,391.50 641,204.30
ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc Seaton Construction Group, LLC r H°'ma2x‘i:3::fn';‘l’_'l‘z'“°ﬁ°" @

Item No.| S::'c Description | Qty | Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

SCHEDULE D

CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 10-UNIT T-HANGAR
1 c-105 2";‘(’)':]'2”?)“"" (NTE 10% of Total Schedule D Bid 1| Ls 82,325.00 | $ 82,325.00 $ 149,909.90 | $ 149,909.90 139,602.50 | $ 139,602.50
2 TEMP |Temporary Marking, Lighting, and Barricades 1 LS. 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 N O B I D $ 22,97840 | $ 22,978.40 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
3 ---  |Construct 10-Unit T-Hangar 1 LS. 1,120,000.00 | $ 1,120,000.00 $ 1,218,145.00 | $ 1,218,145.00 1,290,000.00 | $ 1,290,000.00
4 - Construct 10-Unit T-Hangar Approach 835 | S.. 105.00 | $ 87,675.00] S U B M ITT E D $ 12942 | $ 108,065.70 115.00 | $ 96,025.00

SCHEDULE D SUBTOTAL 1,295,000.00 $ 1,499,099.00 1,535,627.50
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J> Lochner

BID TABULATION

OMAR N. BRADLEY AIRPORT (MBY)
MOBERLY, MISSOURI
MODOT PROJECT NO. 24-034A-1
LOCHNER NO. 12366

SCHEDULE A: CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 9-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE B: CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 9-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE C: CONSTRUCT TAXILANE FOR 10-UNIT T-HANGAR
SCHEDULE D: CONSTRUCT APPROACH PAVEMENT AND 10-UNIT T-HANGAR

BID OPENING: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 at 3:00 P.M. (CDT)

JT Holman General Construction &

| ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE | Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc Seaton Construction Group, LLC Excavating, LLC
SCHEDULE A TOTAL: | $ 700,000.00 | $ 761,564.50 | NO BID SUBMITTED 611,580.20
SCHEDULE B TOTAL: | $ 1,175,000.00 | NO BID SUBMITTED $ 1,369,900.00 1,412,411.00
SCHEDULE C TOTAL: | $ 735,000.00 | $ 794,391.50 | NO BID SUBMITTED 641,204.30
SCHEDULE D TOTAL: | $ 1,295,000.00 | NO BID SUBMITTED $ 1,499,099.00 1,535,627.50
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