BID NAME/NUMBER:

OPEN DATE:

Vendor Name:
Street address:
City, State:
Phone:

25-303-02-19 / Sanitary Sewer Trunkline Project from Glasscock Road to Bryan Road

February 24, 2025 2:00 PM CST

Texas Pride Utilities

Gonzalez Engineering &
Management

RDH Site & Concrete, LLC.

GO Underground, LLC.

725 Carby Rd.

P.O. Box 3275

3909 Clavel St., Ste. D.

217 E. Monroe Ave.

Houston, TX 77037

Edinburg, TX 78540

Palmview, TX 78572

Harlingen, TX 78550

(832) 607-0707

(956) 304-0100

(956) 502-5426

(956) 412-6100

Fax:|(281) 715-4680 (956) 513-0884 (956) 475-3917
Contact:|Luis Guerra Hugo P. Gonzalez Teresa Puente George Olivares
Email: |Luisg@TexasPrideUtilities.com JHugo@gemengineers.net teri@rdhcompany.com I_goexcavate@y'hoo.com
|DESCRIPTION: QTY UoM Unit Price Extended Price] Unit Price [ Extended Price| Unit Price Extended Price] Unit Price | Extended Price
Base Bid: Water Improvements

16" PVC C900 DR18 10 LF $100.00 $1,000.00 $65.00 $650.00 $25.00 $250.00 | $254.90 $2,549.00
2[6" Gate valve w/box 1 EA $3,200.00 $3,200.00 | $2,500.00 $2,500.00 | $2,000.00 $2,000.00 | $6,141.00 $6,141.00
3|Fire hydrant w/6" valve 1 EA $7,500.00 $7,500.00 | $8,500.00 $8,500.00 | $8,500.00 $8,500.00 | $15,986.00 $15,986.00
414" Bollards 4 EA $600.00 $2,400.00 | $1,200.00 $4,800.00 | $250.00 $1,000.00 | $6,071.75 $24,287.00
5[2" Dual service connection-adj. 10 EA $2,000.00 $20,000.00 | $4,500.00 $45,000.00 | $1,500.00 $15,000.00 | $942.90 $9,429.00
6[2" Dual service connect.-across 10 EA $2,600.00 $26,000.00 | $5,500.00 $55,000.00 | $2,000.00 $20,000.00 | $1,240.00 $12,400.00
7{1" Single service connection-adj 5 EA $1,600.00 $8,000.00 | $2,500.00 $12,500.00 | $750.00 $3,750.00 | $880.00 $4,400.00
8[1" Single service connect-across 5 EA $2,000.00 $10,000.00 | $3,000.00 $15,000.00 | $1,000.00 $5,000.00 | $1,280.00 $6,400.00

Total Water Improvements | $78,100.00 $143,950.00 | $55,500.00 $81,592.00 |
1]24" PVC SDR26 (18'-20' cut) 1870 LF $380.00 $710,600.00 | $230.00 $430,100.00 | $141.00 $263,670.00 | $361.61 $676,210.70
2{24" PVC SDR26 (16'-18' cut) 1986 LF $370.00 $734,820.00 | $220.00 $436,920.00 | $136.00 $270,096.00 | $361.40 $717,740.40
3[24" PVC SDR26 (14'-16' cut) 951 LF $360.00 $342,360.00 $215.00 $204,465.00 | $131.00 $124,581.00 | $361.41 $343,700.91
4124" PVC SDR26 (12'-14' cut) 794 LF $350.00 $277,900.00 | $205.00 $162,770.00 | $126.00 $100,044.00 | $361.79 $287,261.26
5[24" PVC SDR26 (10'-12' cut) 770 LF $340.00 $261,800.00 | $195.00 $150,150.00 | $121.00 $93,170.00 | $361.31 $278,208.70
6[Manhole (18'-20' cut) 9 EA $26,000.00 $234,000.00 | $30,000.00 $270,000.00 | $27,750.00 $249,750.00 | $40,869.33 $367,823.97
7{Manhole (16'-18' cut) 12 EA $25,000.00 $300,000.00 | $28,000.00 $336,000.00 | $27,250.00 $327,000.00 | $39,673.75 $476,085.00
8[Manhole (14'-16' cut) 2 EA $24,000.00 $48,000.00 | $26,000.00 $52,000.00 | $26,750.00 $53,500.00 | $38,639.37 $77,278.74
9{Manhole (12'-14' cut) 1 EA $22,000.00 $22,000.00 | $25,000.00 $25,000.00 | $26,250.00 $26,250.00 | $38,639.00 $38,639.00

10|{Manhole (10'-12' cut) 4 EA $20,000.00 $80,000.00 | $22,000.00 $88,000.00 | $25,750.00 $103,000.00 | $40,813.25 $163,253.00
Manhole (8'-10' cut) W/Grinder
pump W/Force main full
11]assembly & reconnection 1 EA $60,000.00 $60,000.00 ] $125,000.00 $125,000.00 | $35,000.00 $35,000.00 1$121,503.00 $121,503.00
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BID NAME/NUMBER:

OPEN DATE:

Vendor Name:
Street address:
City, State:

25-303-02-19 / Sanitary Sewer Trunkline Project from Glasscock Road to Bryan Road

February 24, 2025 2:00 PM CST

Texas Pride Utilities

Gonzalez Engineering &
Management

RDH Site & Concrete, LLC.

GO Underground, LLC.

725 Carby Rd.

P.O. Box 3275

3909 Clavel St., Ste. D.

217 E. Monroe Ave.

Houston, TX 77037

Edinburg, TX 78540

Palmview, TX 78572

Harlingen, TX 78550

Phone:

(832) 607-0707

(956) 304-0100

(956) 502-5426

(956) 412-6100

Fax:|(281) 715-4680 (956) 513-0884 (956) 475-3917
Contact:|Luis Guerra Hugo P. Gonzalez Teresa Puente George Olivares
Email:|Luisg@TexasPrideUtilities.com JHugo@gemengineers.net teri@rdhcompany.com goexcavate@yahoo.com
Manhole (6'-8' cut) W/Grinder
pump W/Force main full
12|assembly & reconnection 1 EA $60,000.00 $60,000.00 |$125,000.00 $125,000.00 | $35,000.00 $35,000.00 |$121,503.00 $121,503.00
13[6" San. Sew. Connection & 6" 1 EA $4,000.00 $4,000.00 | $10,000.00 $10,000.00 | $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $800.00 $800.00
14|Trench excavation protection 6371 LF $20.00 $127,420.00 $60.00 $382,260.00 $3.00 $19,113.00 $20.70 $131,879.70
15|Bore 24" (20' depth) 114 LF $800.00 $91,200.00 $650.00 $74,100.00 $500.00 $57,000.00 $500.00 $57,000.00
16|Bore 24" (14' depth) 40 LF $600.00 $24,000.00 $550.00 $22,000.00 $750.00 $30,000.00 $500.00 $20,000.00
17| Temporary Pump By-Pass 1 LS $480,000.00 $480,000.00 |$250,000.00 $250,000.00 | $10,000.00 $10,000.00 | $65,000.00 $65,000.00
Drain ditch realign & regrade E.
18|& W. Side 404 LF $40.00 $16,160.00 $25.00 $10,100.00 $20.00 $8,080.00 $18.00 $7,272.00
19|Erosion Control Plan 1 LS $35,000.00 $35,000.00 | $15,000.00 $15,000.00 | $7,500.00 $7,500.00 | $44,000.00 $44,000.00
20| Traffic Control Plan 1 LS $34,000.00 $34,000.00 | $50,000.00 $50,000.00 | $7,500.00 $7,500.00 | $48,000.00 $48,000.00
21|Sanitary Sewer Allowance 1 LS $100,000.00 $100,000.00 | $100,000.00 $100,000.00 |$100,000.00 $100,000.00 | $100,000.00 $100,000.00
Total Sanitary Sewer
Improvements $4,043,260.00 $3,318,865.00 $1,922,754.00 $4,143,159.38
Total Utility Improvements $4,121,360.00 $3,462,815.00 $1,978,254.00 $4,224,751.38
Base Bid: Pavement Improvements
1|Excavation & grading 3464 SY $20.00 $69,280.00 $5.00 $17,320.00 $7.50 $25,980.00 $2.00 $6,928.00
2|Subgrade Preparation 3464 SY $26.00 $90,064.00 $4.50 $15,588.00 $2.50 $8,660.00 $3.00 $10,392.00
3]|5% Lime 43 TNS $200.00 $8,600.00 $280.00 $12,040.00 $500.00 $21,500.00 $320.00 $13,760.00
10" Compacted crushed caliche
4|base w/prime coat 3464 SY $60.00 $207,840.00 $17.00 $58,888.00 $15.50 $53,692.00 $31.11 $107,765.04
2" Hot mix asphaltic concrete
5|w/tack coat 3358 SY $80.00 $268,640.00 $22.00 $73,876.00 $12.75 $42,814.50 $29.83 $100,169.14
6]18" Curb & gutter 405 LF $80.00 $32,400.00 $20.00 $8,100.00 $45.00 $18,225.00 $32.00 $12,960.00
714"x5' wide concrete sidewalks 190 SF $10.00 $1,900.00 $10.00 $1,900.00 $65.00 $12,350.00 $16.00 $3,040.00
Total Pavement Improvements $678,724.00 $187,712.00 $183,221.50 $255,014.18
Total Imprvoments $4,800,084.00 $3,650,527.00 $2,161,475.50 $4,479,765.56 |
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BID NAME/NUMBER

OPEN DATE

Vendor Name:
Street address:
City, State:
Phone:

Fax:

Contact:
Email:

: 25-303-02-19 / Sanitary Sewer Trunkline Project from Glasscock Road to Bryan Road

: February 24, 2025 2:00 PM CST

Texas Pride Utilities

Gonzalez Engineering &
Management

RDH Site & Concrete, LLC.

GO Underground, LLC.

725 Carby Rd.

P.O. Box 3275

3909 Clavel St., Ste. D.

217 E. Monroe Ave.

Houston, TX 77037

Edinburg, TX 78540

Palmview, TX 78572

Harlingen, TX 78550

(832) 607-0707

(956) 304-0100

(956) 502-5426

(956) 412-6100

(281) 715-4680

(956) 513-0884

(956) 475-3917

Luis Guerra

Hugo P. Gonzalez

Teresa Puente

George Olivares

Luisg@TexasPrideUtilities.com

Hugo@gemengineers.net

teri@rdhcompany.com

Jsoexcavate@yahoo.com

Alternate No. 2 Sanitary Sewer Improvements

-

24" HDPE Sewer Pipe (Bidder
agrees to furish and deliver to
the owner all the necessary
materials, equipment and
supplies, including installation of
all materials, equipment,
supplies, all other labor,
excavation, filling, insurance ,
general administrative and all
other misc costs, overhead and
profit to complete the
construction of the pipe bursting
existing 18 inch sewer line to 24
in as shown on the plans and

6200 LF

$440.00 $2,728,000.00

$290.00 | $1,798,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

Total Imprvoments with Alternate No. 2

$7,528,084.00

$5,448,527.00

$2,161,475.50

$4,479,765.56

Hours/Days to complete work:

200 Calendar Days

548 Calendar Days

548 Calendar Days

548 Calendar Days

Bid Bond

Addendums

Yes (2)

Yes (2)

Yes (2)

Yes (2)

Review Notes: Lowest Responsible and Responsive Bidder for Base Bid is RDH Site and Concrete. (Did not bid Alternat
Lowest Responsible and Responsive Bidder for Base Bid and Alternate is RBM Contractors.

| ** Shaded areas show corrections on price extensions
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BID NAME/NUMBER:

OPEN DATE:

Vendor Name:
Street address:

RBM Contractors, LLC.

Renoworks, LLC.

Mor-Wil, LLC.

Pega JPS Utilites, LLC.

2919 N. Kenyon Rd., Ofc 2

2705 E. Davis Rd.

808 S. Shary Rd., Ste. 5, PMB 21

24105 Brushline Rd.

City, State:|Edinburg, TX 78542 Edinburg, TX 78540 Mission, TX 78572 Edinburg, TX 78542
Phone:|(956) 520-8707 (956) 513-1849 (956) 276-4702 (956) 380-1509
Fax:
Contact:|Braulio Rios Rene Olivarez Albert Garza lll Pedro Saenz
Email:|rbmcontractors@yahoo.com Rene@renoworksfs.com admin@mor-wil.com pedro@pegajps.com
|DESCRIPTION: QTY UoM Unit Price Extended Price] Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price| Extended Price Unit Price| Extended Price
Base Bid: Water Improvements
1]6" PVC C900 DR18 10 LF $109.00 $1,090.00 $260.00 $2,600.00 $175.32 $1,753.20 $50.00 $500.00
2|6" Gate valve w/box 1 EA $2,000.00 $2,000.00 | $3,750.00 $3,750.00 $2,987.26 $2,987.26 $2,400.00 $2,400.00
3|Fire hydrant w/6" valve 1 EA $6,950.00 $6,950.00 | $9,750.00 $9,750.00 $9,706.34 $9,706.34 $8,500.00 $8,500.00
414" Bollards 4 EA $452.47 $1,809.88 | $1,100.00 $4,400.00 $5,846.00 $23,384.00 $550.00 $2,200.00
5[2" Dual service connection-adj. 10 EA $2,100.00 $21,000.00 | $2,100.00 $21,000.00 $4,880.98 $48,809.80 $2,995.00 $29,950.00
62" Dual service connect.-across 10 EA $2,350.00 $23,500.00 | $2,100.00 $21,000.00 $4,974.99 $49,749.90 $3,950.00 $39,500.00
7{1" Single service connection-adj 5 EA $1,900.00 $9,500.00 | $2,250.00 $11,250.00 $3,611.85 $18,059.25 $1,500.00 $7,500.00
8]1" Single service connect-across 5 EA $2,150.00 $10,750.00 | $2,250.00 $11,250.00 $3,699.38 $18,496.90 $1,995.00 $9,975.00
Total Water Improvements $76,599.88 $85,000.00 $172,946.65 $100,525.00
1]24" PVC SDR26 (18'-20' cut) 1870 LF $282.92 $529,060.40 $225.00 $420,750.00 $208.63 $390,138.10 $475.00 $888,250.00
2{24" PVC SDR26 (16'-18' cut) 1986 LF $241.65 $479,916.90 $215.00 $426,990.00 $207.55 $412,194.30 $460.00 $913,560.00
3[24" PVC SDR26 (14'-16' cut) 951 LF $233.40 $221,963.40 $275.00 $261,525.00 $189.18 $179,910.18 $350.00 $332,850.00
4124" PVC SDR26 (12'-14' cut) 794 LF $216.89 $172,210.66 $225.00 $178,650.00 $192.34 $152,717.96 $325.00 $258,050.00
5[24" PVC SDR26 (10'-12' cut) 770 LF $216.89 $167,005.30 $222.00 $170,940.00 $192.10 $147,917.00 $265.00 $204,050.00
6[Manhole (18'-20' cut) 9 EA $17,275.52 $155,479.68 | $6,750.00 $60,750.00 $26,561.56 $239,054.04 $55,000.00 $495,000.00
7|[Manhole (16'-18' cut) 12 EA $15,878.49 $190,541.88 | $14,100.00 $169,200.00 $25,880.40 $310,564.80 $45,000.00 $540,000.00
8[Manhole (14'-16' cut) 2 EA $15,462.94 $30,925.88 | $9,200.00 $18,400.00 $25,564.40 $51,128.80 $40,000.00 $80,000.00
9[Manhole (12'-14' cut) 1 EA $15,462.96 $15,462.96 | $8,050.00 $8,050.00 $25,564.40 $25,564.40 $35,000.00 $35,000.00
10|{Manhole (10'-12' cut) 4 EA $12,448.44 $49,793.76 | $11,000.00 $44,000.00 $25,564.40 $102,257.60 $30,000.00 $120,000.00
Manhole (8'-10' cut) W/Grinder
pump W/Force main full
11|assembly & reconnection 1 EA $42,528.90 $42,528.90 | $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $71,100.00 $71,100.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00
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BID NAME/NUMBER:

OPEN DATE:

Vendor Name:
Street address:

RBM Contractors, LLC.

Renoworks, LLC.

Mor-Wil, LLC.

Pega JPS Utilites, LLC.

2919 N. Kenyon Rd., Ofc 2

2705 E. Davis

Rd.

808 S. Shary Rd., Ste. 5, PMB 21

24105 Brushline Rd.

City, State:|Edinburg, TX 78542 Edinburg, TX 78540 Mission, TX 78572 Edinburg, TX 78542
Phone:|(956) 520-8707 (956) 513-1849 (956) 276-4702 (956) 380-1509
Fax:
Contact:|Braulio Rios Rene Olivarez Albert Garza lll Pedro Saenz
Email:|rbmcontractors@yahoo.com Rene@renoworksfs.com admin@mor-wil.com pedro@pegajps.com
Manhole (6'-8' cut) W/Grinder
pump W/Force main full
12|assembly & reconnection 1 EA $42,528.90 $42,528.90 | $21,750.00 $21,750.00 $71,100.00 $71,100.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
13|6" San. Sew. Connection & 6" 1 EA $4,064.49 $4,064.49 | $4,750.00 $4,750.00 $7,900.00 $7,900.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00
14|Trench excavation protection 6371 LF $5.50 $35,040.50 $11.00 $70,081.00 $11.16 $71,100.36 $20.00 $127,420.00
15|Bore 24" (20' depth) 114 LF $714.57 $81,460.98 | $1,500.00 $171,000.00 $662.93 $75,574.02 $1,500.00 $171,000.00
16|Bore 24" (14' depth) 40 LF $627.34 $25,093.60 | $1,500.00 $60,000.00 $1,047.54 $41,901.60 $950.00 $38,000.00
17| Temporary Pump By-Pass 1 LS $7,243.40 $7,243.40 1$245,000.00 $245,000.00 $23,700.00 $23,700.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00
Drain ditch realign & regrade E.
18|& W. Side 404 LF $40.64 $16,418.56 $40.00 $16,160.00 $39.11 $15,800.44 $55.00 $22,220.00
19|Erosion Control Plan 1 LS $51,535.24 $51,535.24 | $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $31,600.00 $31,600.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
20| Traffic Control Plan 1 LS $17,592.79 $17,592.79 | $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $55,300.00 $55,300.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
21|Sanitary Sewer Allowance 1 LS $100,000.00 $100,000.00 |$100,000.00 $100,000.00 | $100,000.00 $100,000.00 | $100,000.00 $100,000.00
Total Sanitary Sewer
Improvements $2,435,868.18 $2,481,996.00 $2,576,523.60 $4,587,200.00
Total Utility Improvements $2,512,468.06 $2,566,996.00 $2,749,470.25 $4,687,725.00
Base Bid: Pavement Improvements
1|Excavation & grading 3464 SY $4.92 $17,042.88 $11.00 $38,104.00 $4.33 $14,999.12 $22.00 $76,208.00
2|Subgrade Preparation 3464 SY $4.17 $14,444.88 $14.00 $48,496.00 $4.33 $14,999.12 $11.00 $38,104.00
3[5% Lime 43 TNS $494.40 $21,259.20 $7.00 $301.00 $551.16 $23,699.88 $350.00 $15,050.00
10" Compacted crushed caliche
4|base w/prime coat 3464 SY $15.40 $53,345.60 $21.00 $72,744.00 $19.16 $66,370.24 $20.00 $69,280.00
2" Hot mix asphaltic concrete
5|w/tack coat 3358 SY $16.52 $55,474.16 $21.00 $70,518.00 $22.58 $75,823.64 $25.00 $83,950.00
6]18" Curb & gutter 405 LF $14.00 $5,670.00 $22.00 $8,910.00 $27.31 $11,060.55 $50.00 $20,250.00
7[4"x5" wide concrete sidewalks 190 SF $18.50 $3,515.00 $35.00 $6,650.00 $20.79 $3,950.10 $45.00 $8,550.00
Total Pavement Improvements $170,751.72 $245,723.00 $210,902.65 $311,392.00
Total Imprvoments $2,683,219.78 $2,812,719.00 $2,960,372.90 $4,999,117.00
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BID NAME/NUMBER:

OPEN DATE:
Vendor Name:|RBM Contractors, LLC. Renoworks, LLC. Mor-Wil, LLC. Pega JPS Utilites, LLC.
Street address:]2919 N. Kenyon Rd., Ofc 2 2705 E. Davis Rd. 808 S. Shary Rd., Ste. 5, PMB 2124105 Brushline Rd.
City, State:|Edinburg, TX 78542 Edinburg, TX 78540 Mission, TX 78572 Edinburg, TX 78542
Phone:|(956) 520-8707 (956) 513-1849 (956) 276-4702 (956) 380-1509
Fax:
Contact:|Braulio Rios Rene Olivarez Albert Garza lll Pedro Saenz
Email:|rbmcontractors@yahoo.com Rene@renoworksfs.com admin@mor-wil.com pedro@pegajps.com

Alternate No. 2 Sanitary Sewer Improvements

24" HDPE Sewer Pipe (Bidder
agrees to furish and deliver to
the owner all the necessary
materials, equipment and
supplies, including installation of
all materials, equipment,
supplies, all other labor,
excavation, filling, insurance ,
general administrative and all
other misc costs, overhead and
profit to complete the
construction of the pipe bursting
existing 18 inch sewer line to 24
in as shown on the plans and 6200 LF

$242.99 $1,506,538.00 | $399.21 $2,475,102.00 NO BID NO BID

-

Total Imprvoments with Alternate No. 2 $4,189,757.78 $5,287,821.00 $2,960,372.90 $4,999,117.00

Hours/Days to complete work: 548 Calendar Days 200 Calendar Days 548 Calendar Days 550 Calendar Days

Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes

Addendums Yes (2) Yes (1) Yes (2) Yes (2)

Review Notes: €)
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BID NAME/NUMBER:

25-303-02-19 / Sanitary Sewer Trunkline Project from Glasscock Road to Bryan Road

OPEN DATE:

February 24, 2025 2:00 PM

CST

Vendor Name:

Texas Pride Utilities

Gonzalez Engineering &
Management

RDH Site & Concrete,
LLC.

GO Underground, LLC.

Street address:

725 Carby Rd.

P.O. Box 3275

3909 Clavel St., Ste. D.

217 E. Monroe Ave.

City, State:|Houston, TX 77037 Edinburg, TX 78540 Palmview, TX 78572 Harlingen, TX 78550
Phone:|(832) 607-0707 (956) 304-0100 (956) 502-5426 (956) 412-6100
Fax:](281) 715-4680 (956) 513-0884 (956) 475-3917
Contact:|Luis Guerra Hugo P. Gonzalez Teresa Puente George Olivares
Email: |Luisg@TexasPrideUtilities.com|Hugo@gemengineers.net teri@rdhcompany.com [goexcavate@yahoo.com
DESCRIPTION OF FORMS: [ Unit Price  =xtended Pricd Unit Price [Extended Pric{ Unit Price =xtended Pric§ Unit Price [Extended Prict
Solicitation Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes
Terms & Conditions Included Partial Yes Yes Yes
Pricing Schedule Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusive Bidding Certrificate Yes Yes Yes Yes
Schedule of Subcontractor/SubConsultants Yes Yes Yes Yes
Contractor Site Visit Checklist Yes Yes Yes
Addenda(s) Yes (2) Yes (2) Yes (2) Yes (2)
Gen. Business Questionare Yes Yes Yes Yes
References Yes Yes Yes
CIQ
Bid Bond |

Review Notes:
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BID NAME/NUMBER:

OPEN DATE:

Vendor Name:
Street address:

City, State:|Edinburg, TX 78542 Edinburg, TX 78540 Mission, TX 78572
Phone:|(956) 520-8707 (956) 513-1849 (956) 276-4702
Fax:
Contact:|Braulio Rios Rene Olivarez Albert Garza Il
Email:|rbmcontractors@yahoo.com JRene@renoworksfs.com Jadmin@mor-wil.com

RBM Contractors, LLC.

Renoworks, LLC.

Mor-Wil, LLC.

Pega JPS Utilites, LLC.

2919 N. Kenyon Rd., Ofc 2

2705 E. Davis Rd.

808 S. Shary Rd., Ste. 5, P!

24105 Brushline Rd.

Edinburg, TX 78542

(956) 380-1509

Pedro Saenz

[pedro@pegajps.com

Unit Price |Extended Price

DESCRIPTION OF FORMS: [ Unit Price =xtended Pric{ Unit Price Extended Pric{ Unit Price =xtended Pric

Solicitation Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes

Terms & Conditions Included Partial Yes Yes Yes

Pricing Schedule Yes Yes Yes Yes

Non-Collusive Bidding Certrificate Yes Yes Yes

Schedule of Subcontractor/SubConsultants Yes Yes Yes Yes

Contractor Site Visit Checklist Yes Yes Yes
Addenda(s) Yes (2) Yes (1) Yes (2) Yes (2)

Gen. Business Questionare Yes Yes Yes Yes

References Yes Yes Yes Yes

CIQ
Bid Bond Yes Yes

Review Notes:
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