
BID NAME/NUMBER: 23-393-05-18  /  Meter Connect Supplies

OPEN DATE: May 18, 2023  2:00 PM  CST

Vendor Name:
Street address:

City, State:
Phone:

Fax:
Contact:

Email:
DESCRIPTION: UOM Est. Quantity Unit Price Ext.

1 Feet 1,000 $0.98 $980.00 $0.75 $750.00 $0.68 $680.00
2 Feet 1,000 $2.85 $2,850.00 $1.95 $1,950.00 $2.39 $2,390.00
3 Each 10 $22.88 $228.80 $28.00 $280.00 $23.09 $230.90
4 Each 400 $6.62 $2,648.00 $8.25 $3,300.00 $8.43 $3,372.00
5 Each 75 $8.95 $671.25 $11.50 $862.50 $10.27 $770.25
6 Each 50 $34.08 $1,704.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $44.97 $2,248.50
7 Each 100 $59.66 $5,966.00 $150.00 $15,000.00 $59.57 $5,957.00
8 Each 5 $437.88 $2,189.40 $655.00 $3,275.00 $250.28 $1,251.40
9 Each 75 $48.21 $3,615.75 $100.00 $7,500.00 $48.14 $3,610.50

10 Each 10 $34.08 $340.80 $200.00 $2,000.00 $33.33 $333.30
11 Each 50 $260.83 $13,041.50 $655.00 $32,750.00 $264.77 $13,238.50
12 Each 10 $99.04 $990.40 $200.00 $2,000.00 $75.85 $758.50
13 Each 10 $48.43 $484.30 $55.00 $550.00 $47.30 $473.00
14 Each 20 $51.78 $1,035.60 $85.00 $1,700.00 $50.62 $1,012.40
15 Each 20 $21.43 $428.60 $40.00 $800.00 $37.21 $744.20
16 Each 5 $15.44 $77.20 $30.00 $150.00 $21.92 $109.60
17 Each 5 $18.46 $92.30 $33.00 $165.00 $26.72 $133.60
18 Each 30 $11.57 $347.10 $22.00 $660.00 $15.26 $457.80
19 Each 50 $22.33 $1,116.50 $34.00 $1,700.00 $29.46 $1,473.00
20 Each 20 $43.54 $870.80 $75.00 $1,500.00 $69.64 $1,392.80
21 Each 10 $30.86 $308.60 $105.00 $1,050.00 $29.09 $290.90
22 Each 30 $35.95 $1,078.50 $110.00 $3,300.00 $36.02 $1,080.60
23 Each 5 $11.69 $58.45 $22.00 $110.00 $16.55 $82.75
24 Each 100 $16.43 $1,643.00 $25.00 $2,500.00 $16.39 $1,639.00
25 Each 20 $19.46 $389.20 $30.00 $600.00 $19.62 $392.40
26 Each 20 $76.81 $1,536.20 $115.00 $2,300.00 $76.68 $1,533.60
27 Each 5 $17.28 $86.40 $22.00 $110.00 $17.25 $86.25
28 Each 5 $23.43 $117.15 $27.00 $135.00 $23.15 $115.75
29 Each 5 $114.51 $572.55 $200.00 $1,000.00 $113.09 $565.45
30 Each 5 $102.27 $511.35 $150.00 $750.00 $103.17 $515.85
31 Each 30 $34.34 $1,030.20 $60.00 $1,800.00 $40.81 $1,224.30

32
Each 20 $342.76 $6,855.20 No Bid No Bid $464.52 $9,290.40

33 Each 5 $79.86 $399.30 $435.00 $2,175.00 $78.89 $394.45
34 Each 10 $8.39 $83.90 $20.00 $200.00 $12.62 $126.20
35 Each 5 $3.47 $17.35 $7.50 $37.50 $4.32 $21.60
36 Each 5 $13.50 $67.50 $23.00 $115.00 $16.76 $83.80
37 Each 20 $100.94 $2,018.80 $131.00 $2,620.00 $96.30 $1,926.00
38 Each 10 $132.52 $1,325.20 $143.00 $1,430.00 $122.27 $1,222.70
39 Each 20 $118.90 $2,378.00 $152.00 $3,040.00 $113.45 $2,269.00
40 Each 10 $149.36 $1,493.60 $165.00 $1,650.00 $142.50 $1,425.00
41 Each 20 $147.15 $2,943.00 $176.00 $3,520.00 $140.39 $2,807.80
42 Each 10 $168.65 $1,686.50 $188.00 $1,880.00 $160.90 $1,609.00
43 Each 10 $182.31 $1,823.10 $213.00 $2,130.00 $168.61 $1,686.10
44 Each 10 $215.03 $2,150.30 $230.00 $2,300.00 $198.87 $1,988.70
45 Each 10 $213.36 $2,133.60 $247.00 $2,470.00 $203.55 $2,035.50
46 Each 10 $244.98 $2,449.80 $265.00 $2,650.00 $233.72 $2,337.20
47 Each 10 $365.94 $3,659.40 $340.00 $3,400.00 $338.23 $3,382.30
48 Each 10 $365.94 $3,659.40 $363.00 $3,630.00 $338.23 $3,382.30
49 Each 20 $95.93 $1,918.60 $110.00 $2,200.00 $68.75 $1,375.00
50 Each 5 $128.87 $644.35 $140.00 $700.00 $83.63 $418.15
51 Each 10 $130.78 $1,307.80 $145.00 $1,450.00 $72.84 $728.40
52 Each 500 $11.49 $5,745.00 $25.00 $12,500.00 $18.34 $9,170.00
53 Each 750 $8.04 $6,030.00 $10.30 $7,725.00 $9.85 $7,387.50
54 Each 1,000 $0.11 $110.00 $0.25 $250.00 $0.11 $110.00
55 Each 1,000 $0.27 $270.00 $0.30 $300.00 $0.13 $130.00
56 Each 50 $10.88 $544.00 $15.00 $750.00 $12.24 $612.00
57 Each 6 No Bid No Bid $310.00 $1,860.00 $153.18 $919.08
58 Each 6 No Bid No Bid $535.00 $3,210.00 $231.08 $1,386.48
59 Each 50 $23.62 $1,181.00 $36.70 $1,835.00 $30.56 $1,528.00
60 Feet 50 $13.25 $662.50 $15.00 $750.00 $23.42 $1,171.00

61
Each 50

$54.20 $2,710.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $68.11 $3,405.50

Caleb Burson, VP

caleb@accuratemeter.com

Roel Garza, Operations Manager

jennifer.pinales@coreandmain.com

Core & Main , fka HD Supply 
WaterworksAccurate Utility Supply, LLC.

5445 Stockdick School Rd.

Katy, TX  77449

(281) 391-8100

(281) 391-8110(956) 584-7487

Ferguson Waterworks

Corey Ivie

justin.Dickerson@ferguson.com

1900 W. Expressway 83

Mission, TX  78572

(956) 584-8199

3" BRASS FLANGE KITS WITH ACCESSORIE
4" BRASS FLANGE KITS WITH ACCESSORIE
JUMBO METER BOX 
JUMBO METER BOX LID
1” MIPT x COMPRESSION CORPORATION 
STOP (S100-4 OR EQUAL)

PLASTIC METER BOX
PLASTIC METER BOX LID
3/4" RUBBER GASKET
1" RUBBER GASKET
2" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE

16" x 1" D/S SADDLE
16" x 2" D/S SADDLE
2" x 1" PVC QUICK TAP C160
3" x 1" PVC QUICK TAP C160
4" x 1" PVC QUICK TAP C160

8" x 2" D/S SADDLE
10" x 1" D/S SADDLE
10" x 2" D/S SADDLE
12" x 1" D/S SADDLE
12" x 2" D/S SADDLE

4"x 1" D/S SADDLE
4" x 2" D/S SADDLE
6" x 1" D/S SADDLE
6" x 2" D/S SADDLE
8" x 1" D/S SADDLE

2" BRASS GATE VALVE (SQUARE HEAD) 
HEAVY-DUTY
2" x 1" WYE 4 MULTI SERVICE
3/4" GATE VALVE BRASS
3/4" x 1" BRASS HEX NUT REDUCER
1" x 2" BRASS HEX NUT REDUCER

3/4" COMPRESSION FEMALE ADAPTER
1" COMPRESSION FEMALE ADAPTER
2" x 1" COMPRESSION WYE
2" 3-PART UNION
2" BRASS GATE VALVE

2" COMPRESSION ANGLE STOP FOR 
1" COMPRESSION x 3/4" U-BRANCH
3/4” COMPRESSION TEE

3/4" COMPRESSION ANGLE STOP FOR U-
1" COMPRESSION ANGLE STOP
2" COMPRESSION ANGLE STOP FOR PVC 
1" x 3/4" COMPRESSION ANGLE STOP
3/4" ANGLE STOP U-BRANCH

2" x 6" BRASS NIPPLE
2" x 12" BRASS NIPPLE

100 N. 1st St.

McAllen, TX  78501

956-631-3341

956-687-5918

1" LINEAR FEET OF POLYETHYLENE 
2" LINEAR FEET OF POLYETHYLENE 
1" 3-PART UNION
3/4" METER COUPLING
1" METER COUPLING

1" COMPRESSION TEE
2" BRASS 90
2" BRASS CAP
2" BRASS COUPLING
2" x 3" BRASS NIPPLE

2" COMPRESSION MALE ADAPTER

1 1/2" BRASS FLANGE KIT
2" BRASS FLANGE KIT
1" BRASS GATE VALVE
3/4" COMPRESSION MALE ADAPTER
1" COMPRESSION MALE ADAPTER

mailto:justin.Dickerson@ferguson.com
mailto:caleb@accuratemeter.com
mailto:jennifer.pinales@coreandmain.com
mailto:caleb@accuratemeter.com
mailto:jennifer.pinales@coreandmain.com
mailto:justin.Dickerson@ferguson.com


BID NAME/NUMBER: 23-393-05-18  /  Meter Connect Supplies

OPEN DATE: May 18, 2023  2:00 PM  CST

Vendor Name:
Street address:

City, State:
Phone:

Fax:
Contact:

Email:
Caleb Burson, VP

caleb@accuratemeter.com

Roel Garza, Operations Manager

jennifer.pinales@coreandmain.com

Core & Main , fka HD Supply 
WaterworksAccurate Utility Supply, LLC.

5445 Stockdick School Rd.

Katy, TX  77449

(281) 391-8100

(281) 391-8110(956) 584-7487

Ferguson Waterworks

Corey Ivie

justin.Dickerson@ferguson.com

1900 W. Expressway 83

Mission, TX  78572

(956) 584-8199

100 N. 1st St.

McAllen, TX  78501

956-631-3341

956-687-5918

62
Each 500

$20.12 $10,060.00 $25.00 $12,500.00 $48.98 $24,490.00

63
Each 750

$8.63 $6,472.50 $12.50 $9,375.00 $24.49 $18,367.50
$119,809.60 $186,700.00 $155,350.76

** Shaded areas have been corrected on extensions

Please Note:  Lowest Responsive, Responsible Bidder: Core & Main, LP.  Ferguson Waterworks and Accurate Utility did not bid all the items. 

45 Days

None

10.00%

None

5 to 20 weeks

5-15%

NoneAddendums

Total Base AmountMeter Connect Supplies

1st Year Renewal 20.00%

Delivery days after receipt of purchase order TBD ARO

COMPOSITE METER BOX LID WITH 
RECESSED HOLE

COMPOSITE METER BOX WITH RECESSED 
HOLE
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BID NAME/NUMBER: 23-393-05-18  /  Meter Connect Supplies

OPEN DATE: May 18, 2023  2:00 PM  CST

Vendor Name:
Street address:

City, State:
Phone:

Fax:
Contact:

Email:
DESCRIPTION of FORMS:

Ferguson Waterworks
1900 W. Expressway 83
Mission, TX  78572
(956) 584-8199

Accurate Utility Supply, 
LLC.

Core & Main , fka HD 
Supply Waterworks
100 N. 1st St.
McAllen, TX  78501
956-631-3341

5445 Stockdick School Rd
Katy, TX  77449
(281) 391-8100

justin.Dickerson@ferguson.com

(956) 584-7487
Corey Ivie

956-687-5918
Roel Garza, Operations Ma
jennifer.pinales@coreandmain.com

(281) 391-8110
Caleb Burson, VP
caleb@accuratemeter.com

Solicitation Signed Yes
Terms & Conditions Included Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes

Pricing Schedule Yes
Non-Collusive Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes

Addenda(s) None
Gen. Business Questionare Yes

None
Yes

None
Yes

References Yes
CIQ

Yes Yes
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