BID NAME/NUMBER:

OPEN DATE:

Vendor Name:

Street address:

23-562-09-08 / Hot & Cold Mix Asphalt

September 08, 2023 2:00 PM CST

Vulcan Construction

Materials

Terra Firma

CAPA / Upper Valley

Materials

Frontera Materials

10101 Reunion PI, Ste. 500

9312 E. Curve Rd.

3609 W. Palma Vista Dr.

P.O. Box 1449

City, State:|San Antonio, TX 78216 Edinburg, TX 78542 Palmview, TX 78572 Elsa, TX 78543
Phone:|(210) 965-0419 (956) 348-8215 (956) 867-8690 (956) 316-8952
Fax:](210) 524-3555 (956) 380-4085
Contact:|Julia Farrar Nancy Davenport Alberto Martinez Brandon Henry
Email: [farrari@vmcmail.com accounting@terrafirmamaterials.com]albertolab@capatexas.com Brandon.Henry@FMITex.com
DESCRIPTION: | UOM | QTY |Unit Price  |Total Ext. Unit Price | Total Ext. Unit Price | Total Ext. Unit Price  |Total Ext.
BASE TERM (ONE YEAR)
1| [Hot Mix Asphalt Type "D" Ton 3,000 |no bid no bid $90.00 $270,000.00 $83.00| $249,000.00 $79.90| $239,700.00
2| |Cold Mix Asphalt Type "D" Ton 1,000 $136.70 $136,700.00 $109.00 $109,000.00 $119.00] $119,000.00 $97.92 $97,920.00
HOT MIX ALTERNATE BID - Hot Mix without Delivery
3| |Hot Mix Asphalt Type "D" Ton 3,000 |no bid no bid $76.00| $228,000.00 $70.00| $210,000.00 $70.00| $210,000.00
TOTAL BID $136,700.00 $607,000.00 $578,000.00 $547,620.00
ADDENDUMS None None
Hours/Days to pick up product after receipt of
purchase order 5 Days 48 Hours 24 Hours 24 Hours
1st 6-month Renewal 6% 3% 5.0% 5.0%
1st 6-month Renewal for alternate 3% 5.0% 5.0%
2nd 6-month Renewal 6% 3% 5.0% 5.0%
2nd 6-month Renewal for alternate 3% 5.0% 5.0%
Please Note: Vulcan Construction and Waller County Ashpalt did not bid on all items
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BID NAME/NUMBER: 23-562-09-08 / Hot & Cold Mix Asphalt

Vendor Name:
Street address:
City, State:
Phone:

Fax:

Contact:

Email

OPEN DATE: September 08, 2023 2:00 PM CST

Vulcan Construction Materials

Terra Firma

CAPA / Upper Valley Materials

Frontera Materials

10101 Reunion PI, Ste. 500

9312 E. Curve Rd.

3609 W. Palma Vista Dr.

P.O. Box 1449

San Antonio, TX 78216

Edinburg, TX 78542

Palmview, TX 78572

Elsa, TX 78543

(210) 965-0419

(956) 348-8215

(956) 867-8690

(956) 316-8952

(210) 524-3555

(956) 380-4085

Julia Farrar

Nancy Davenport

Alberto Martinez

Brandon Henry

:|farrar@vmcmail.com

accounting@terrafirmamaterials.com

DESCRIPTION of FORMS:

albertolab@capatexas.com

Brandon.Henry@FMITex.com

Solicitation Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes
Terms & Conditions Included Yes Yes Yes Yes
Non-Collusive Yes Yes Yes Yes
Pricing Schedule Yes Yes Yes Yes

Addenda(s) None None None None

Gen. Business Questionare Yes Yes Yes Yes
References Yes Yes No No

CIQ
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