City of Milpitas

Purchasing Division

455 E. Calaveras Blvd.
Milpitas, CA 95035-5411
Telephone: (408) 586-3160
Fax: (408) 586-3170

INVOICE QUESTIONS : (408) 586-3127

SHIP TO: Accounts Payable
City of Milpitas
455 E. Calaveras Blvd.
Milpitas, CA 95035-5411

VENDOR: LC Action Police Supply
1088 N. 1%t St.
San Jose, CA 95112

DESCRIPTION OF ITEM

PURCHASE ORDER

Attachment 2

MAIL INVOICE TO: CITY OF MILPITAS

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
455 E. CALAVERAS BLVD.
MILPITAS, CA 95035-5411
PO NUMBER:
PAGE 1 OF 1
EFFECTIVE DATE: 01/22/20
EXPIRATION DATE: 01/21/21
ANNUAL DOLLAR AMOUNT: $50,000.00

CONTACT:
PHONE#: 408-294-2677
FAX#:

Provide equipment as required by the City of Milpitas in accordance with Invitation for Bids (IFB) F20-25
specifications and vendors responses, which are attached and incorporated herein by this reference.
The City reserves the right to renew the Purchase Order for two (2) additional one (1) year periods.

PURCHASING OFFICER:

CITY MANAGER:

(Required Only On Orders Greater Than $10,000)

[u—

. FURNISH TWO (2) COPIES OF THE INVOICE.

2. INVOICE EACH SHIPMENT SEPARATELY.

3. PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON
ALL INVOICES, CORRESPONDENCE, CONTAINERS
AND PACKING LISTS.

4. ALL MATERIAL IS TO BE DELIVERED AS
SPECIFIED ABOVE.

5. NO EXCEPTIONS UNLESS STATED ABOVE.

6. ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS ARE
STATED ON THE BACK OF THIS FORM.
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10.

11.

12.
13.

14.

15.

THIS ORDER IS SUBJECT TO THE FOLLOWING TERMS AND CONDITIONS

ACCEPTANCE - This Purchase Order becomes a binding contract upon the terms and conditions set forth herein by
acknowledgement or commencement of performance. Additional terms or changes proposed by the Seller do not become
effective until accepted by the Buyer in writing. Oral agreements affecting the provisions of this Purchase Order shall
become binding only after mutual acceptance of a revision in writing to this Purchase Order. If the delivery schedule
shown on this order cannot be met, Seller shall inform the Buyer of the Seller’s best possible delivery for the Buyer’s
consideration.

PRICE — The price for each item covered by this Purchase Order shall be the price shown for such item on the face of this
Purchase Order.

PAYMENT - Invoices will be paid according to discount terms or if no discount is offered, within thirty days after receipt
and acceptance of goods or completion and acceptance of services. Discount periods will be computed from either the date
of delivery of goods ordered or the date of receipt of acceptable invoices, prepared in accordance with the terms of Buyer’s
order, whichever is later.

OVERSHIPMENTS — Overshipments necessary to adjust quantity ordered to nearest standard pack are acceptable
provided such overshipments do not exceed 5% or $25.00, whichever is smaller, of the line item involved.

PACKING, SHIPPING AND INSURANCE — No charges will be allowed for boxing, wrapping or cartage unless so
specified in this Purchase Order. Seller shall pack or otherwise prepare all articles for shipment so as to secure the lowest
transportation rates consistent with timely delivery, meet carrier’s requirements and safeguard against damage from
weather and transportation. Seller shall mark the number of this Purchase Order on each container and enclose a packing
slip with the order number in an envelope on each container.

TITLE AND RISK OF LOSS — Except as otherwise expressly provided herein, title to and risk of loss on all items shipped
by the Seller to the Buyer shall pass to the Buyer at the F.O.B. point designated on the face of this order. Cost of all return
shipments for whatever reason returned, shall be borne by the Seller with title and risk passing at the Buyer’s plant.
DELIVERY - Time is of the essence. Delivery must be effected within the time stated on the Purchase Order and shall not
be made later or substantially earlier than the dates shown. If items are delivered substantially in advance of scheduled
delivery dates, the Buyer may return them at the Seller’s expense. Unless failure to meet delivery schedule is due to causes
beyond the Seller’s control, the Buyer may terminate this Purchase Order without liability and may purchase elsewhere and
charge the Seller with any loss incurred thereby.

WARRANTIES — In addition to any warranty implied by fact or law, the Seller expressly warrants all items covered by
this Purchase Order to be free from defects in workmanship and materials, to conform strictly to applicable specifications,
drawings and approved samples, if any, and to be fit for the purpose for which purchased. Such warranties, together with
all other services warranties of the Seller, shall run in favor of the Buyer. All warranties shall survive inspection,
acceptance and final payment by the Buyer.

ASSIGNMENTS — This Purchase Order shall not be assigned in any manner by the Seller nor shall a subcontract be made
with any other party for the furnishing of any of the completed substantially completed articles, items, spare parts, work or
services covered by this Purchase Order without the Buyer’s prior written consent.

TERMINATION — The performance of work under this Purchase Order may be terminated in whole or from time to time
in part by the Buyer.

TAXES — All Federal, State or local taxes of any nature which are paid by the Seller and billed or passed on to the Buyer
as part of the price for this Purchase Order shall be stated separately and clearly designated as such in the Seller’s invoices.
LIENS — All items to be delivered hereunder shall be free and clear of any and all liens and encumbrances whatsoever.
COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS — The Seller shall in the performance of this Purchase Order comply with all applicable
Federal, State and local laws, government orders and regulations.

WAIVERS — The failure of the Buyer to insist, in any one or more instances, upon the performance of any of the terms,
covenants or conditions of this Purchase Order, or to exercise any right hereunder, shall not be construed as a waiver or
relinquishment of the future performance of any such term, covenant or condition or the future exercise of such right, but
the obligation of the Seller with respect to such future performance shall continue in full force and effect.
INDEMINFICATION AND INSURANCE - If the Seller’s agents, employees or subcontractors enter upon premises
occupied by or under the control of the Buyer or any of its customers of suppliers in the course of the performance of this
Purchase Order. The Seller shall take all necessary precautions to prevent the occurrence of any injury (including death) to
any person or any damage to any property arising out of any acts or omissions of the Seller’s agents, employees, or
subcontractors and except to the extent that any such injury or damage is due solely and directly to the Buyer’s negligence
or other fault. The Seller shall indemnify and hold the Buyer harmless from and against any suits, liabilities, losses,
damages, claims, causes of action and expenses (including attorney fees) arising out of or connected with any act or
omission of the Seller, its agents, employees or subcontractors. The Seller shall maintain public liability, property damage
and worker’s compensation insurance policies. Upon request of the Buyer, the Seller furnish the Buyer, certificates of
insurance showing that the Seller carries adequate insurance for such purposes with insurers and in amounts acceptable to
the Buyer which the certificates of insurance shall also provide that at least ten (10) days’ notice in writing shall be given to
the Buyer at the address indicated on the face of this Purchase Order of cancellation or reduction of coverage before such
coverage is cancelled or reduced.



DESCRIPTION

SPECIFICATIONS

COIMMENTS OR OTHER BRAND OFF

UNIT COST

YEAR ONE

UNIT COST
7ZAR TWO

UNIT COST
YEAR THREE

ASP BATON 26" ASP, 26" - 52611 - No substitutions 92.27 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
ASP BATON HOLDER ASP 52633 Scabbard 35.61 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
BADGE HOLDER Dutyman 5304 8.62 NOT TO EX. 3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
BALLISTICHELMET Protech Protech 3A # 00207010 350 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BALLISTIC HELMET BAG #00020178 39.99 NOT TO EX.. 3% _ [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BALLISTIC HELMET SHIELD #000999863 99.75 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
BALLISTIC VEST Second Chance- SM01-3A00S-SMO01 - No substitutions SM01 DISTCONTINUED REPLACED WITH SM02 755 NOT TO EX. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BALLISTIC VEST COVERS Second Chance - No substitutions E1 COVER 55 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
BATON HOLDER Bianchi 7313 14.01 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BATON RING Bianchi 7904 6.11 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, DUTY BAM 7950, 1137 34.14 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, DUTY Bianchi 7980 34.14 NOT TO EX. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
BELT, DUTY Bianchi Buckleless 7970 41.28 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
BELT, DUTY Bianchi Sam Browne 7960 40.26 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, DUTY Bianchi Nylon, 7200 29.05 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, DUTY Bianchi Accumold, Webgear 7210 214 NOT TO EX. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, DUTY, UNDERBELT Bianchi 7205 16.81 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, PANTS Boston 6582 (buckle), 6530 (no buckle) 28.1 NOT TO EX. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, PANTS Bianchi, Garrison B8V 19.62 NOT TO EX. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
BELT, PANTS 5.11 TDU Belt 59552 (1.75") 12.48 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, PANTS 5.11 TDU Belt 59551 (1.5") 12.48 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |[NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, PANTS Bianchi 7205 velcro 16081 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |[NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, SWAT Bianchi Web Belt 7202, 1.75" 22.68 NOT TOEX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
BLOUSING BANDS Vanguard Coast Guard Boot Bands NO BID NO BID NO BID

BOOTS, MOTOR Dehner or All American 905L NO BID NO BID NO BID

BOOTS, POLICE ACADEMY 5.11 A.T.A.C 8" Storm #12004 (mens) #12217 (women) 98.8 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |[NOT TO EX.. 3%
CAP, BASEBALL, BLUE WITH PATCH (Civilian) Richardson 514 NO BID NO BID NO BID

CAP, DRESS Hankin NO BID NO BID NO BID

CHEST PROTECTOR, MFF Hatch Centurion CDX2500 (chest/shoulder) 95.85 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |[NOT TO EX. 3%
DIGITAL RECORDER POUCH Bianchi 7303 13.5 NOT TO EX. 3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
EARPIEC KIT Braverman Comm. Astra# T20015L 51.6 NOTTOEX. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
ELBOW PADS, MFF Hatch Centurion NE35 NO BID NO BID NO BID

FLASHLIGHT & A/C CHARGER Streamlight Ultrastinger 77551 LED, AC bid spec 4716, 1134 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
FLASHLIGHT, CONE Streamlight yellow cone wand 78904 4.41 NOT TO EX..3%  |[NOT TO EX.. 3%
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER Bianchi 7909 5.35 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER, BIANCHI, #7311 Bianchi 7311 15.29 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |[NOT TO EX.. 3%
FLASHLIGHT, TLR -1 99.23 NOT TO EX..3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
FLEX CUFFS, MFF Plastic Zip-Tie, Safariland 8210, 10pk or individual 11.23 NOT TO EX. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
FOREARM PADS, MFF Hatch Centurion FP100 Forearm 15.74 NOTTOEX. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
GEAR BAG, MFF Hatch M2 50.11 NOTTOEX. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
GLOVES, MFF Hatch Centorian MP100 NO BID NO BID NO BID

GLOVES, WHITE PROCESSIONAL Vanguard white parade gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID

HANDCUFF CASE, DOUBLE Bianchi 7917 22.17 NOT TO EX.,3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
HANDCUFF CASE, DOUBLE, WEBGEAR Bianchi 7317 18.6 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
HANDCUFF CASE, SINGLE Bianchi 7900 18.34 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
HANDCUFF CASE, SINGLE Bianchi 7300 15.8 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
HANDCUFF KEY, HEAVY DUTY Bianchi Accumold 7916 14.27 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
HANDCUFF/MAG COMBO, PADDLEBACK Bianchi 45, Blk Leather -to fit 9mm, .40 & .45 cal Glock 35.93 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
HANDCUFFS, CHAINED Peerless Chrome - No substitutions 2217 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
HANDCUFFS, HINGED Peerless Chrome 31.23 NOT TO EX.. 3% [NOT TOEX. 3%
HASHMARK Embroidered sleeve, various colors as needed NO BID NO BID NO BID

HAT, SWAT (CAMO) Richardson NO BID NO BID NO BID

HAT, CAMPAIGN Stratton S-400B NO BID NO BID NO BID

HAT, DRESS Lancaster NO BID NO BID NO BID

HAT, DRESS, CHIEF ONLY (CUSTOM SCRAMBLE) Lancaster NO BID NO BID NO BID

HELMET COVER, TRUSPEC Tru Spec 5937 13.75 NOT TO EX..3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
HELMET, MOTORCYCLE Shoei RJ-Platinum Air LE 442.74 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
HOLSTER PANCAKE (for Glock 9mm, 40 & 45) Bianchi 60 / 83 35.93 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
HOLSTER, GLOCK 6360 WITH LIGHT 94.47 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
HOLSTER, GLOCK Gen 5§ 6360 WITH LIGHT 94.47 NOT TO EX. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
HOLSTER, SWAT, TACTICAL THIGH Safariland 6004 122.5 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
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HOOD, SWAT, BLK, NOMEX Hatch NH2500 Nomex Hood NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Large LT. Bars Vanguard NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE) Small LT. Bars Vanguard NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, FIRE BUGLES Chiefand Lt. NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, BICYCLE, BLK ( Liner & Custom Print) Mocean 2150 Avalanche wi/reflect tape NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, CNT Chameleon soft shell (black) 48099 UP A 2XL 85.77 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
JACKET, DUTY Blauer 6120 NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, GANG UNIT/RAID Royal Blue poly unlined windbreaker NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, IKE Sinatra NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, INSTRUCTORS 5.11 48001 3-in-1 Parka (range red 477) UP TO 2XL 173.72 NOT TOEX. 3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
JACKET, OFFICE (women) Port Authority Pique Fleece L222 NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, OFFICE (men) Port Authority Pique Fleece F222 NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, PATROL Blauer #9820 w/liner NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, POLICE ACADEMY WINDBREAKER NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, RAID Royal Blue poly unlined windbreaker NO BID NO BID NO BID
KEEPERS, BAM, 4-PACK Bianchi 7906 7.64 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
KEEPERS, BIANCHI NYLON Bianchi 7406 7.39 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
KEY STRAP, BAM, SILENT Bianchi 7916 14.27 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
KEY STRAP, WEBGEAR Bianchi 7316 14.01 NOTTOEX..3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
KNEE PADS, MFF Centurion KP250 knee pads 17.29 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
LANYARD (Whistle) Windsor Whistle NO BID NO BID NO BID
MAG POUCH, DOUBLE Bianchi 7302 19.62 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
MAG POUCH, DOUBLE Bianchi Threat Ill, 7922 19.36 NOT TO EX.. 3% NOT TO EX. 3%
MAG POUCH, DOUBLE Bianchi 7902, 1138 24.2 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
MAG POUCH, SINGLE (open top) 19.36 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
MAG POUCH, SINGLE closed top} 23.95 NOT TO EX.. 3% NOT TO EX. 3%
NAMETAG METAL (LIST SIL/BLK, SIL/BLU, OR GLD/BLU) Classic BLACKINTON J1 NAME METAL NAME BAR 5.45 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
NAMETAPE, CLOTH Eddie NO BID NO BID NO BID
NUMBERTAPE, CLOTH, BLK/SIL Eddie NO BID NO BID NO BID
O.C. HOLDER Bianchi 7907 17.83 NOT TO EX. 3%  |[NOT TO EX. 3%
O.C. HOLDER, BAM, OPEN TOP Bianchi 7908 14.52 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
O.C. HOLDER, NYLON - OPEN Bianchi 7308 10.95 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
0O.C. HOLDER, WEBGEAR - CLOSED/NYLON Bianchi Accumold 7310 11.46 NOT TO EX..3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
O.C. SPRAY, MK4 & MK4C Defence Technologies MKIV DEFTEC # 5049 10.16 NOTTO EX..3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
O.C. SPRAY, SMALL MK3 Defence Technologies MKIII DEFTEC # 5039 9.01 NOTTO EX. 3%  [NOT TOEX.. 3%
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, CAPT HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, GOLD HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, LT HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, PSO HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, SUBDUED HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, SWAT SUBDUED HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH, FIRE NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH, SHIELD HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, FLAG Schweizer Emblems NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, MOTOR W HEEL, SET Schweizer Emblems NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCHES, CLOTH 'POLICE' STAR Schweizer Emblems NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCHES, DPS PATROL HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCHES, EXPLORER HD Graphics NO BID NO BID NO BID
RADIO HOLDER Bianchi 7923 25.48 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
RADIO HOLDER Bianchi Universal 7914S 30.83 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |[NOT TO EX.. 3%
RADIO HOLDER Bianchi 7324 19.36 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
RAIL MOUNTED LIGHT POUCH Bianchi 7327 43.12 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
RAINGEAR, ANIMAL CONTROL Blauer 9691 (No "Police" on back) NO BID NO BID NO BID
RAINGEAR, JACKET Blauer 9691 NO BID NO BID NO BID
RAINGEAR, BLAUER, JACKET, CSO BLAUER 233R with hood NO BID NO BID NO BID
RAINGEAR, PANTS 5.11 48057 UP TO 2XL 71.66 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
RAINGEAR, HOOD Blauer (w/Jacket) NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIN GUARDS, MFF Hatch Centurion TS70 55.2 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL, S/S TAN W/W SHIRT Flying Cross 69R6604 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL, L/S TAN W/W SHIRT Flying Cross 19W6604 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL POLO Port Authority L455 (women) NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL POLO Port Authority K455 (men) NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, ANIMAL CONTROL POLO L/S Port Authority K455LS (men) NO BID NO BID NO BID
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SHIRTS, BIKE, POLO, S/S BLK W/ NAME EMBROIDERY 5.11 Performance Polo 71049 UP TO 2XL 29.31 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRTS, BIKE, POLO, L/S BLK W/ NAME EMBROIDERY 5.11 Performance Polo 72049 UP TO 2XL 31.48 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRTS, CADET, L-SLEEVE, TAN, CLOTH Dickies Poly Cotton RN20967 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, CADET, S-SLEEVE, TAN, CLOTH Dickies Poly cotton NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, CPAJAN.CONTROL, L-SLEEVE, TAN, POLY Flying Cross 19W6604 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, CPAJANM.CONTROL, S-SLEEVE, TAN, POLY Flying Cross 69R6604 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, CSI/K-9, L-SLEEVE, BLU, BDU Blauer 8703 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, CSI/K-9, S-SLEEVE, BLU, BDU Blauer 8713 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, EXPLORER, L-SLEEVE, LITE BLUE Blauer 8431 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, EXPLORER, S-SLEEVE, LITE BLUE Blauer 8421 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, FIRE COMMAND, W HITE, UUS Flying Cross 45W6600 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, FIRE COMMAND, W HITE, SIS Flying Cross 95R6600 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, FIRE NOMEX S/S Nomex 705MN NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, FIRE NOMEX US Nomex 700MN NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, FIRE PREVENTION, NOMEX LS Nomex 700MN NO BID NO BID NO BID
|SHIRTS, FIRE PREVENTION, NOMEX S/S Nomex 705MN NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, INCLEMENT WEATHER Blauer 8703 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, MANAGER,RECORDS & DISPATCH, US Elbeco Paragon Plus 811, 867 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, MANAGER,RECORDS & DISPATCH, SIS Elbeco Paragon Plus 801, 877 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, MFF, US, BLK Propper 2412 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, NVI/PEO, US, LIGHT BLUE Flying Cross 45W6625 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, NVI/PEO, S/S, LIGHT BLUE Flying Cross 95R6625 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, PATROL, L-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Flying Cross 20W9586 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, PATROL, L-SLEEVE, POLYESTER, Flying Cross 48W6686 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, PATROL, S-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Flying Cross 70R9586 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, PATROL, S-SLEEVE, POLYESTER, Flying Cross 98R6686 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, POLICE ACADEMY (Light Blue) Horace Small (Red Cap) Model SPS6mB7 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRT, POLO 5.11 Performance Polo 71049 UP TO 2XL 29.31 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRT, POLO 5.11 Performance Polo 61165 UP TO 2XL 29.31 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
SHIRT, POLO 5.11 Performance Polo 72049 UP TO 2XL 31.48 NOT TO EX. 3%  |[NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRT, POLO Port Authority LS00, Womens (S/S) NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRT, POLO Port Authority LS00LS, Womens (L/S) NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRT, POLO Port Auhtority KSOOLS Men (L/S) NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRT, POLO Port Authority L420 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRT, POLO Port Auhtority K420 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRT, POLO Port Auhotiry L568 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRT, POLO, DISPATCH/ PROPERTY(women) 5.11 Helios 61305 women UP TO 2XL 32.57 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
SHIRT, POLO, DISPATCH/ PROPERTY(men) 5.11 Helios 41192 men UP TO 2XL 32,57 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRTS, POLO PROESSIONAL 5.11 Professional Polo 41060 S/S UP TO 2XL 29.31 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRTS, POLO PROESSIONAL 5.11 Professional Polo 42056 L/S UP TO 2XL 33.65 NOT TO EX., 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRTS, RECORDS, L-SLEEVE, WHITE Elbeco 801/877 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, RECORDS, S-SLEEVE, WHITE Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, SWAT, COMBAT Tru-Spec Combat Shirt 2650 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, SWAT, STRYKE TDU LS RAPID 72071, Stryke TDU LS Rapid shirt (color: black or green) 60.8 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
SHIRTS, SWAT, RIPSTOP TDU LS 72002, Ripstop TDU US Shirt, (Color: black or green) 35.83 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
SHIRTS, TAC, L-SLEEVE, BLK, BDU, W/NUMBERTAPE Proper Ripstop NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, UAS, TDU, DRK NAVY 5.11 Llong sleeve TDU #72002, dark navy 35.83 NOT TOEX..3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
SHOES, BIKE Magnum or Rocky, Quarter Length NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHORTS, BIKE, BLK, BDU Mocean, TR601 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHOULDER PADS, MFF/CHEST PROTECTOR Hatch, Centurion 95.85 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SL 20X BATTERY Streamlight - for SL-20X 29.01 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SL 20X W/AC CHARGER Streamlight - for SL-20X STREAMLIGHT 20701 103.22 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SWAT, BALACLAVA Blackhawk, Nomex #HDC19575 BLACKHAWK # 333005 13.85 NOT TO EX. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
SWAT, COVERED COMP LIGHT HOLDER Bianchi 9711 SHOULD BE PART NUMBER # 7911 17.83 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
SWAT, FIELD JACKET Propper, No Patches NO BID NO BID NO BID
SWAT, FLASHLIGHT Streamlight 75013 84 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
SWAT, GLOVES Hatch KSG500, Kevlar Shooting N, NOT TO EX. 3% NOT TO EX. 3%
SWAT, JACKET Gortex Hatch MT2000 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SWAT, MAGAZINE POUCH Bianchi Accumold, Close Top 7302 19.62 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
SWAT, MAGAZINE POUCH Bianchi Accumold, Open Top 7320 17.58 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |[NOT TO EX. 3%
TIE CLIP Gold or Silver, Vanguard NO BID NO BID NO BID
TIE CLIP, SUNNYVALE Hook fast NO BID NO BID NO BID
TIE, BLACK S. Broome Clip-on NO BID NO BID NO BID
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TIE, BOWTIE, BLUE, SOUTHER STYLE, RECORDS S. Broome Snap-on NO BID NO BID NO BID
TIE, NAVY, PATROL S. Broome Clip-on NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, ANIM. CTRL, BLACK Blauer 8810 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, BICYCLE, BLK Mocean, Blk 2050 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, CADET, TAN, CLOTH Dickies 640 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, CPA, TAN, POLYESTER Fechheimer 46351 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, CSIK-9, BLU BDU'S Blauer 8810 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRPUSERS, FIRE NOMEX Nomex 402MN (men) 401MN (women) NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, FIRE PREVENTION, NOMEX Nomex 402MN (men) 401MN (women) NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, MANAGER, RECORDS & DISPATCH Flying Cross SUMTRS01 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, MOTOR BRITCHES Sinatra NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, PATROL, 100% WOOL Fechheimer 32289 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, PATROL, POLYESTER Fechheimer 38289 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, PROPERTY, 5.11 TATICAL PRO 5.11 Stryke Pant 64386 (women), 74369 (men) 53.74 NOT TO EX. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
TROUSERS, POLICE ACADMEY TDU 5.11 TDU black NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, POLICE ACADMEY NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, RECORDS, BLU, POLY/WOOL Edwards 8783-07 or Flying Cross 39400W or 39400 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, SWAT TAC, BLK, BDU'S, SIZE-SPECIFIC 74068 XPRT Tactical Pant (color: black or green) 141.15 NOT TO EX..3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
TROUSERS, UAS, TDU, DARK NAVY 5.11 TDU Pant #74003, dark navy 36.37 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |[NOT TO EX. 3%
WHISTLE, BLACK Acme, Blk Plastic 4.4 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX. 3%
WHISTLE, CHROME Acme, Chrome 4.4 NOT TO EX. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
WINDBREAKER, CHAPLAIN, W/PATCHES Blue Polyester windbreaker, no lining NO BID NO BID NO BID
MILPITAS-ONLY ITEMS NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
ASP BATON HOLDER, SWAT Safariland Black Plastic 19.81 NOT TO EX.. 3% _ |NOT TO EX.. 3%
BELT, SWAT Trouser Bianchi 16.81 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX., 3%
BELT, SWAT Utility Belt Bianchi NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOOTS, MOTOR SIDI Canyon Gortex NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOOTS, SWAT Under Armor, Valsetz 81.47 NOT TO EX. 3%  |NOT TO EX. 3%
CAP, SWAT Utility Cap Condor NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLASHLIGHT, SWAT Streamlight 74114 STREAMLIGHT # 74414 88 NOT TO EX.. 3% NOT TO EX.. 3%
FLASHBANG HOLDER, SWAT Safariland/5.11 12.95 NOT TO EX.. 3% NOT TO EX., 3%
GLOVES, SWAT Mecanix/P.I.G. NO BID NO BID NO BID
HANDCUFF HOLDER, SWAT Safariland/5.11 12.95 NOT TO EX. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
HANDCUFF/MAG COM BO, PADDLEBACK Bianchi 45, Blk Leather -to fit S&W M&P .40 25.73 NOT TO EX..3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
HAT, SWAT Proper Boonie Hat Multicam NO BID NO BID NO BID
HOLSTER PANCAKE (for S&W M&P .40) 29.56 NOT TO EX.. 3% INOT TO EX.. 3%
HOLSTER, S&W M&P .40 37.2 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
HOLSTER, SWAT, TACTICAL THIGH Safariland Thigh-rig 125.58 NOT TO EX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE]} Large SGT. Chevrons NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE]} Small SGT. Chevrons NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE] Large Captain Bars NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE} Small Captain Bars NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE} Large Asst. Chief Stars NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC (DESCRIBE} Small Asst. Chief Stars NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC [DESCRIBE} Large Chief Stars NO BID NO BID NO BID
INSIGNIA PINS, ETC {DESCRIBE} Small Chief Stars NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, SWAT MGS Field Jacket w/liner NO BID NO BID NO BID
JACKET, MOTOR TourMaster Flex LE Safety Jacket NO BID NO BID NO BID
MAG POUCH, SWAT Pro-Tech, Safariland, 5.11 13.88 NOT TO EX.. 3%  [NOT TO EX.. 3%
O.C. HOLDER, SWAT Safariland Tall OC holder 13.88 NOT TO EX. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
PATCH,CLOTHSTAR, CHIEF NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, ASST CHIEF NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, SGT NO BID NO BID NO BID
PATCH, CLOTH STAR, POLICE OFFICER NO BID NO BID NO BID
RADIO HOLDER, SWAT Protech 19.44 NOT TOEX.. 3%  |NOT TO EX.. 3%
RAINGEAR, SWAT Poncho NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, CITIZEN VOLUNTEER, L-SLEEVE, WHITE, CLOTH Elbeco 801/877 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, CITIZEN VOLUNTEER, S-SLEEVE, WHITE, CLOTH Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, PATROL, L-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, PATROL, S-SLEEVE, 100% WOOL Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, SWAT, COMBAT Proper Multicam NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, MOTOR BRITCHES Flying Cross NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, PATROL, 100% WOOL Elbeco NO BID NO BID NO BID
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TROUSERS, SWAT TAC, BLK, BDU'S, SIZE-SPECIFIC

Proper Multicam

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

UTILITY BAG, SWAT

5.11

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

BADGE HOLDER, BFP AND ADMIN

Black leather, designed for use with a shield-type badge, with
attached belt clip

12.5

125

BADGE MORNING BAND

shoulder to navel

BELT, BDU FIRE

All black, with no contrasting colors or trim. Black or gunmetal-
colored hardware

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

CAP, DRESS MILPITAS FIRE

Traditional Bell Crown-style fire cap with appropriate fire cap
piece

M Approved Manufacturers: Bayly, Midway, Marlow White
)

N Fire Chief

M White vinyl top, white band with gold metallic strap, 5-
crossed-bugle gold strap pins

and gold bullion decorated on a black high gloss visor.

M Deputy Chief

M White vinyl top, black band with gold metallic strap 3-
crossed-bugle gold strap pins

and gold bullion decorated on a high gloss black visor.

M Battalion Chief

M White vinyl top, black band with gold metallic strap, 2-
crossed-bugle gold strap pins

and high gloss black visor.

M Captain

M White vinyl top, black band with silver metallic strap, 2-
parallel-bugle silver strap

pins and high gloss black visor

M Engineer, Firefighter and Administration

M Navy blue wool top and band with black patent leather strap,
silver FD strap pins

and high gloss visor

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

COLLAR INSIGNIA CLASS "A" SHIRT

N Chief Officers

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

COLLAR INSIGNIA COAT

M 1" collar insignia to be worn %" from front and bottom of the

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

DRESS JACKET OTHER PERSONNEL FIRE

Flying Cross Model # X917889-04, 100% Wool, style # 13754.
U.S. Navy

Officer-style double-breasted with (6) silver buttons designating
appropriate

rank

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

DRESS JACKET CHIEF OFFICERS FIRE

Flying cross Model # X917B889-04, 100% Wool, style # 13754.
U.S. Navy Officer-style double-breasted with (6) gold buttons
designating appropriate rank

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

DRESS SLACKS

Flying Cross Model #SFFDTRSO2 100% Navy Blue Wool,
standard belt loops and pockets

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

HAT, BASEBALL

Department logo

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MHAT, COLD WEATHER CAP

Plain, navy, knit or fleece, cuffed or uncuffed, with approved
Milpitas Fire Department
logo embroidery to be forward facing

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

HAT, TILLEY

Navy Tilley Endurable Hat Style #T-3 with approved Milpitas
Fire Department logo
embroidery

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

JACKET, BDU FIRE

Matching set to BDU pants. Milpitas Fire Department patch on
both shoulders 1" down from shoulder
seam. Name tape over left pocket.

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

JACKET, FLEECE FIRE

Navy Blue. Fleece Jacket 5.11

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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JACKET, STATION WORK JACKET FIRE Lion™ # 3134 or uniform committee approved equivalent,
midnight blue, liner optional,
all-weather, short-waist jacket, uniform patch shall be sewn 1"
down from shoulder
seam. NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, DRESS MILPITAS FIRE Flying Cross Style #35W54 0 Standard long-sleeve poly-
cotton white dress shirt, plain collar, barrel cuff, military
creases, pleated pocket and epaulets
0 No button down or tab-type collars
O Patches on dress shirt
NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, FIRE Wool: Flying Cross, dark blue, long or short sleeve NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHIRTS, JOB-SHIRT MILPITAS FIRE 5.11 Tactical style # 72321 or Game Job Shirt
style # 811
O Navy, 11.6 oz. poly-cotton fleece, % zip, side pockets, right
chest radio pocket with
Velcro, radio microphone pockets at both shoulders and pen
pocket on left sleeve.
MFD text logo embroidered on left chest. Last name in all
capital letters embroidered on
right chest with Helvetica 7/8™ font.
NO BID NO BID NO BID
SLEEVE BRAID MILPITAS FIRE Gold, white or black Rices nylon braid article 7100 Stripes for
respective ranks as follows:
O Chief Five %" Gold Braid Stripes (1%%")
O Deputy Chief  Three %" Gold Braid Stripes (1%%")
O Battalion Chief Two %" Gold Braid Stripes (1%")
0 Captain  Two %" White Braid Stripes (1%%")
0 Engineer  Single Black Braid
O Firefighter  Single Black Braid
0 Administrative No Braid NO BID NO BID NO BID
TIE CLASPS, MILPITAS FIRE Tie clasps must be appropriate for public display on dress
uniform (Gold for chief
officers; silver for all other personnel) NO BID NO BID NO BID
TIE, BLACK MILPITAS FIRE Black wool, cotton or Dacron, (1%4") minimum, (2%")
maximum width. Clip-on type if
assigned to immediate response, conventional type acceptable
f ot NO BID NO BID NO BID
TROUSERS, BDU FIRE 5.11 Tactical Taclite Pro Pants or 5.11 Company Cargo Pants,
Navy Blue NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERATIONS/REPAIRS N/A N/A N/A
Cut tails N/A N/A N/A
Dart back N/A N/A N/A
Hash marks N/A N/A N/A
Re-hem pants N/A N/A N/A
Remove hash marks N/A N/A N/A
Remove patches N/A N/A N/A
Sew patches - jacket N/A N/A N/A
Sew patches - shirt N/A N/A N/A
Shorten crotch N/A N/A N/A
Shorten sleeves N/A N/A N/A
Take in sides N/A N/A N/A
Take in sides & sleeves N/A N/A N/A
Take in waist/let out waist N/A N/A N/A
Zippers in customer's garments N/A N/A N/A
Customn Alterations Per 1/2 hour N/A N/A N/A
Per hour N/A N/A N/A
* No charge for patches or star N/A N/A N/A
* All uniforms must have employee 1D#
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