
Bid Table - WELL 17 TREATMENT FACILITY (BT-05GM)

Legend

The green cells with bolded numbers indicate that this bid was the lowest price.

The orange cells indicate that this item from that vendor was selected.

The green cells with orange outline indicate that this item from that vendor was selected, and 

has the lowest price.
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Total Cost

Alt 1

Alt 2

Base Bid ($)

# Locked Items Quantity Unit Use
Tax
on
City
EquipmentUnit
Price

1

#1-1 Mobilization (5%) 1 LS $80,769.00

#1-2 Construction Traffic Control 1 LS $10,900.00

#1-3 Site Identification Sign 1 LS $1,090.00

#1-4

Storm Water and Erosion 

Control 1 LS $13,080.00

#1-5

Use Tax on City Provided 

Equipment (Pump) (0.06) 1 LS $28,269.24 $28,269.24

2

#2-1

Clearing and 

Grubbing/Demolition 1 LS $27,250.00

#2-2 Demolition of Existing Wellhouse 1 LS $13,080.00

#2-3 Asphalt Paving 625 SY $54.50

#2-4 Gravel Surface 75 SY $47.96

#2-5

Landscaping (Tree planting, re-

sod, sprinkler repair/relocation, 

pavers) 1 LS $54,500.00

#2-6

Engineered Stormwater 

Infiltration System 1 LS $38,150.00

#2-7

Concrete Flatwork (Sidewalk, 

Steps, Pads) 56 SY $136.25

#2-8 8' Wrought Iron Fence 65 LF $96.60

#2-9 6’ Chain-link Fence 110 LF $30.52

#2-10 8’Vinyl Fence 200 LF $88.84

#2-11 20' Swing Gate 1 EA $14,011.95

#2-12 4’ Swing Gate 1 EA $2,802.39

#2-13

12" Water Main (Pipe, Valves, 

Fittings) 1 LS $9,810.00

#2-14

10” Water Main (Pipe, Valves, 

Fittings) 1 LS $39,240.00

#2-15 12" Sanitary Sewer 110 LF $708.50

#2-16 Sand and Grease Trap 1 EA $13,080.00

#2-17 Catch Basin 2 EA $6,540.00

#2-18 4' Dia. Manhole, > 10 feet deep 2 EA $9,810.00

#2-19 Air Gap Discharge Structure 1 EA $3,815.00

MOBILIZATION & GENERAL CONDITIONS (5)

SITE IMPROVEMENTS & UTILITIES (24)

$1,704,860.88

0

$1,738,650.88

Cascade Enterprises Inc.



#2-20

1 1/2" Water Service Connection 

(Pipe, Fittings, Valves, Meter) 1 LS $13,080.00

#2-21

6" Water Service Connection 

(Pipe, Fittings, Valve) 1 LS $22,890.00

#2-22 Misc. Yard Piping 1 LS $19,620.00

#2-23 Curb & Gutter 310 LF $39.24

#2-24 Valley Gutter 230 LF $39.24

3

#3-1

Building & Tank Foundations and 

Floor Slab 1 LS $270,320.00

#3-2

Building (incl. Roof, Gutters, 

Building Coatings, Bollards, 

Stairs, Doors, Handrails, etc.) 1 LS $129,710.00

#3-3 Catwalk Framing and Grating 1 LS $22,890.00

#3-4

Electrical (Site, Building & 

Equipment) 1 LS $172,220.00

#3-5 Instrumentation and Control 1 LS $76,300.00

#3-6 HVAC Equipment 1 LS $37,060.00

#3-7 Plumbing 1 LS $42,510.00

#3-8 Fire System 1 LS $62,130.00

#3-9

Process Piping and Equipment 

(Pipes, Valves, Fittings, Coating, 

Supports, etc.) 1 LS $38,150.00

#3-10 Workbench 1 EA $2,725.00

#3-11 Wall Cabinet and Sink 1 EA $2,725.00

#3-12 Chlorine Analyzer 2 EA $10,900.00

#3-13

Sodium Hypochlorite Metering 

Pump 1 EA $5,450.00

#3-14

Sodium Hypochlorite Storage 

Tank and Fill Connection 1 EA $5,450.00

#3-15

Emergency Eyewash and Shower 

Unit 1 EA $2,725.00

#3-16

Install Filter Equipment (Filter, 

Instrumentation, Electrical, 

Blower, etc.) 1 LS $47,960.00

#3-17

Install Filter Equipment (Filter, 

Instrumentation, Electrical, 

Blower, etc.) 1 LS $34,880.00

#3-18

Discharge Header (Pipe, Fittings, 

Valves, Static Mixer, and 

Appurtenances) 1 LS $19,620.00

#3-19

Well Pump and Motor 

Installation 1 LS $74,120.00

BUILDING (20)



#3-20 Startup and Commissioning 1 LS $26,160.00

Base Bid Total

4

#4-1

316 Stainless Steel Pump 

Column 1 LS $22,890.00

5

#5-1 Stainless Steel Pump Bowls 1 LS $ 10,900.0

BID ALTERNATE 2 (1)

BID ALTERNATE 1 (1)



Total Unit
Price Total Unit
Price Total Unit
Price

$80,769.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $14,548.00 $14,548.00 $50,000.00

$10,900.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $1,606.00 $1,606.00 $6,270.00

$1,090.00 $350 $350 $1,285.00 $1,285.00 $2,500.00

$13,080.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $1,720.00 $1,720.00 $5,000.00

$28,269.24 $28,269.24 $28,269.24 $28,269.24 $28,269.24 $28,269.24

$27,250.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $13,919.00 $13,919.00 $19,000.00

$13,080.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $13,116.00 $13,116.00 $32,000.00

$34,062.50 $65 $40,625.00 $56 $35,000.00 $30

$3,597.00 $17 $1,275.00 $27 $2,025.00 $84

$54,500.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $13,852.00 $13,852.00 $19,000.00

$38,150.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $33,268.00 $33,268.00 $30,000.00

$7,630.00 $136 $7,616.00 $88 $4,928.00 $550

$6,279.00 $70 $4,550.00 $90 $5,850.00 $330

$3,357.20 $35 $3,850.00 $30 $3,300.00 $110

$17,768.00 $90 $18,000.00 $87 $17,400.00 $180

$14,011.95 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $13,764.00 $13,764.00 $25,000.00

$2,802.39 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,753.00 $2,753.00 $8,800.00

$9,810.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,756.00 $3,756.00 $19,000.00

$39,240.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $19,338.00 $19,338.00 $19,000.00

$77,935.00 $80 $8,800.00 $71 $7,810.00 $280

$13,080.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,240.00 $5,240.00 $5,000.00

$13,080.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,903.00 $5,806.00 $1,250.00

$19,620.00 $6,500.00 $13,000.00 $8,821.00 $17,642.00 $1,900.00

$3,815.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,843.00 $16,843.00 $3,800.00

MOBILIZATION & GENERAL CONDITIONS (5)

SITE IMPROVEMENTS & UTILITIES (24)

$1,704,860.88 $1,977,036.24 $ 1,498,477.24 $1,639,699.24

0 0 49 0

$1,738,650.88 $ 2,017,036.24 $ 1,532,332.24 $ 1,684,699.24

Cascade Enterprises Inc. IMCO General Construction Irminger Construction Inc. JC Constructors, Inc.



$13,080.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,445.00 $6,445.00 $2,500.00

$22,890.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $9,819.00 $9,819.00 $6,300.00

$19,620.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,962.00 $2,962.00 $6,300.00

$12,164.40 $30 $9,300.00 $43 $13,330.00 $20

$9,025.20 $30 $6,900.00 $80 $18,400.00 $42

$270,320.00 $230,000.00 $230,000.00 $120,099.00 $120,099.00 $42,000.00

$129,710.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $378,979.00 $378,979.00 $330,000.00

$22,890.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $34,581.00 $34,581.00 $28,000.00

$172,220.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $210,929.00 $210,929.00 $238,000.00

$76,300.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $27,945.00 $27,945.00 $37,600.00

$37,060.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $73,379.00 $73,379.00 $86,000.00

$42,510.00 $68,000.00 $68,000.00 $48,591.00 $48,591.00 $75,000.00

$62,130.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $43,460.00 $43,460.00 $50,000.00

$38,150.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00 $53,450.00 $53,450.00 $75,000.00

$2,725.00 $500 $500 $1,770.00 $1,770.00 $1,900.00

$2,725.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,030.00 $3,030.00 $700

$21,800.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $8,512.00 $17,024.00 $9,500.00

$5,450.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $9,052.00 $9,052.00 $3,800.00

$5,450.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $9,239.00 $9,239.00 $6,300.00

$2,725.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,547.00 $1,547.00 $6,300.00

$47,960.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $33,460.00 $33,460.00 $12,000.00

$34,880.00 $1 $1 $0 $0 $25,000.00

$19,620.00 $500 $500 $17,815.00 $17,815.00 $35,000.00

$74,120.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $65,678.00 $65,678.00 $90,000.00

BUILDING (20)



$26,160.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $14,455.00 $14,455.00 $12,000.00

$1,704,860.88 $1,977,036.24 $1,498,477.24

$22,890.00 $ 28,000.0 $28,000.00 $ 10,101.0 $10,101.00 $ 30,000.0

$10,900.00 $ 12,000.0 $12,000.00 $ 23,754.0 $23,754.00 $ 15,000.0

BID ALTERNATE 2 (1)

BID ALTERNATE 1 (1)



Total Unit
Price Total Unit
Price Total

$50,000.00 $70,200.00 $70,200.00 No Bid No Bid 50000

$6,270.00 $4,095.00 $4,095.00 No Bid No Bid 6270

$2,500.00 $1,755.00 $1,755.00 No Bid No Bid 2500

$5,000.00 $6,435.00 $6,435.00 No Bid No Bid 5000

$28,269.24 $28,269.24 $28,269.24 No Bid No Bid 28269.24

$19,000.00 $87,750.00 $87,750.00 No Bid No Bid 19000

$32,000.00 $17,550.00 $17,550.00 No Bid No Bid 32000

$18,750.00 $61.78 $38,612.50 No Bid No Bid 18750

$6,300.00 $234 $17,550.00 No Bid No Bid 6300

$19,000.00 $20,483.19 $20,483.19 No Bid No Bid 19000

$30,000.00 $10,998.00 $10,998.00 No Bid No Bid 30000

$30,800.00 $75.97 $4,254.32 No Bid No Bid 30800

$21,450.00 $118.80 $7,722.00 No Bid No Bid 21450

$12,100.00 $34.04 $3,744.40 No Bid No Bid 12100

$36,000.00 $90.68 $18,136.00 No Bid No Bid 36000

$25,000.00 $15,093.00 $15,093.00 No Bid No Bid 25000

$8,800.00 $3,042.00 $3,042.00 No Bid No Bid 8800

$19,000.00 $12,870.00 $12,870.00 No Bid No Bid 19000

$19,000.00 $30,888.00 $30,888.00 No Bid No Bid 19000

$30,800.00 $82.96 $9,125.60 No Bid No Bid 30800

$5,000.00 $6,669.00 $6,669.00 No Bid No Bid 5000

$2,500.00 $643.50 $1,287.00 No Bid No Bid 2500

$3,800.00 $4,972.50 $9,945.00 No Bid No Bid 3800

$3,800.00 $6,435.00 $6,435.00 No Bid No Bid 3800

MOBILIZATION & GENERAL CONDITIONS (5)

SITE IMPROVEMENTS & UTILITIES (24)

0

$1,639,699.24 $1,775,759.00 $ 0

0 0

Tribal Fire Systems LLC

$ 1,684,699.24 $1,829,258.42 $ 31,420.0

JC Constructors, Inc. The Ewing Company



$2,500.00 $14,040.00 $14,040.00 No Bid No Bid 2500

$6,300.00 $9,945.00 $9,945.00 No Bid No Bid 6300

$6,300.00 $13,455.00 $13,455.00 No Bid No Bid 6300

$6,200.00 $15.76 $4,885.60 No Bid No Bid 6200

$9,660.00 $14.01 $3,222.30 No Bid No Bid 9660

$42,000.00 $112,580.03 $112,580.03 No Bid No Bid 42000

$330,000.00 $385,522.02 $385,522.02 No Bid No Bid 330000

$28,000.00 $73,125.00 $73,125.00 No Bid No Bid 28000

$238,000.00 $236,340.00 $236,340.00 No Bid No Bid 238000

$37,600.00 $30,537.00 $30,537.00 No Bid No Bid 37600

$86,000.00 $38,887.00 $38,887.00 No Bid No Bid 86000

$75,000.00 $64,367.55 $64,367.55 No Bid No Bid 75000

$50,000.00 $57,973.50 $57,973.50 $31,420.00 ######## 50000

$75,000.00 $119,808.00 $119,808.00 No Bid No Bid 75000

$1,900.00 $1,755.00 $1,755.00 No Bid No Bid 1900

$700 $2,925.00 $2,925.00 No Bid No Bid 700

$19,000.00 $7,692.75 $15,385.50 No Bid No Bid 19000

$3,800.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid 3800

$6,300.00 $8,658.00 $8,658.00 No Bid No Bid 6300

$6,300.00 $2,667.60 $2,667.60 No Bid No Bid 6300

$12,000.00 $22,932.00 $22,932.00 No Bid No Bid 12000

$25,000.00 $21,955.92 $21,955.92 No Bid No Bid 25000

$35,000.00 $21,996.00 $21,996.00 No Bid No Bid 35000

$90,000.00 $67,706.73 $67,706.73 No Bid No Bid 90000

BUILDING (20)



$12,000.00 $4,680.00 $4,680.00 No Bid No Bid 12000

1639699

$1,639,699.24 $1,775,759.00

$30,000.00 $ 38,294.1 $38,294.10 No Bid No Bid

$15,000.00 $ 15,205.32 $15,205.32 No Bid No Bid

BID ALTERNATE 2 (1)

BID ALTERNATE 1 (1)


