2025 DPS Material Hauling & Disposal
BID TABULATION

GFL Environmental

Roseville Crushed, LLC.

BID QUANTITIES

Item # Item Description Est. Qty.  UNIT | Est. Qty. Bid Est. Total | Est. Qty. Bid Est. Total

1 Class IT Fill Sand 7,000 CYD 7,000 $ 13.75 $ 96,250.00 7,000 $ 1590 $111,300.00

2 21 AA Limestone 200 CYD 200 $ 25.00 $ 5,000.00 200 $ 29.65 $ 5,930.00

3 Course Aggregate, MDOT 6AA 200 CYD 200 $ 35.00 $ 7,000.00 200 $ 3465 $ 6,930.00

4 Pea-Gravel 100 CYD 100 $ 34.00 $ 3,400.00 100 $ 29.80 $ 2,980.00

5 Ballfield Slag 100 CYD 100 $ 55.00 $ 5,500.00 100 NO BID n/a

6 Athletic Meal 100 CYD 100 $ 45.00 $ 4,500.00 100 NO BID n/a
Baseball/Softball Infield

7 Material 250 CYD 250 $§ 45.00 $ 11,250.00 250 NO BID n/a

8 Volleyball Sand 250 CYD 250 $ 20.00 $ 5,000.00 250 NO BID n/a

9 Mason Sand, 2NS 100 CYD 100 $ 23.00 $ 2,300.00 100 $ 1695 $ 1,695.00

10 Screened Topsoil 100 CYD 100 $§ 25.00 $ 2,500.00 100 $ 20.00 $ 2,000.00
Double-Processed Hardwood

11 Mulch 200 CYD 200 $ 35.00 $ 7,000.00 200 NO BID n/a
Engineered Wood Fiber Mulch

12 (Playground Mulch) 250 CYD 250 $ 45.00 $ 11,250.00 250 NO BID n/a

Material Out GFL Environmental Roseville Crushed, LLC.
BID QUANTITIES
Item # Item Description Est. Qty.  UNIT | Est. Qty. Bid Est. Total | Est. Qty. Bid Est. Total

1 Excavated Spoils 7,000 CYD 7,000 $ 10.00 $ 70,000.00 7,000 $ 12.00 $ 84,000.00

2 Leaves 5,000 CYD 5,000 $ 12.00 $ 60,000.00 5,000 NO BID n/a

3 Sweeper & Vactor Debris 400 CYD 400 $ 20.00 $ 8,000.00 400 NO BID n/a

4 Wood Chips 1,000 CYD 1,000 $ 12.00 $ 12,000.00 1,000 NO BID n/a

5 Broken Asphalt 250 CYD 250 $§ 10.00 $ 2,500.00 250 $ 10.00 $ 2,500.00
Stumps & Logs (40-yard roll

6 off) 400 CYD 400 $ 30.00 $ 12,000.00 400 NO BID n/a

7 Broken Concrete 500 CYD 500 $ 10.00 $ 5,000.00 500 $ 10.00 $ 5,000.00
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