TABULATION OF BIDS

2025 WATER MAIN PROJECTS - PIPE & PARTS

City of Madison Heights - Department of Public Services

CITY OF MADISON HEIGHTS
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SERVICES Ferguson Waterworks Core & Main Etna Supply
24425 Schoenherr Road 6575 23 Mile Road 4901 Clay Avenue
Warren, MI, 48089 Shelby Twp., MI, 48316 Grand Rapids, MI, 49548
ITEM UNIT UNIT UNIT
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT PRICE AMOUNT
T 12" C900 DR14 PVC 200 FT $ 4950 $ 9,900.00 $ 4858 $ 9,716.00 $ 51.55 $ 10,310.00
2 8" C900 DR14 PVC 4,400 FT $ 2250 $ 99.000.00 $ 2255 $ 99.220.00 $ 23.90 $ 105.160.00
3 6" C900 DR14 PVC 240 FT $ 13.00 $ 3,120.00 $ 13.09 $ 3,141.60 $ 1390 $ 3,336.00
4 5 Gallon Pipe Lube 1 EA $ 55.00 $ 55.00 $ 7635 $ 76.35 $ 98.00 $ 98.00
5 12" Valve 8RW12 MJ VLV OR 2 EA $ 2,465.00 $ 4,930.00 $ 245021 $ 4,900.42 $ 2,543.00 $ 5,086.00
6 8" Valve 8RW12 MJ VLV OR 13 EA $ 1.250.00 $ 16.250.00 $ 124181 $ 16,14353 $ 1.288.00 $ 16,744.00 *
7 6" Valve BRW12 MJ VLV OR 12 EA $ 776.00 $ 9,312.00 $ 77124 $ 9,254.88 $ 800.00 $ 9,600.00
8 1040Z Frame 7" 15 EA $ 31350 $  4.702.50 $ 31161 $ 4.674.15 $ 32300 $  4.845.00
9 1040A Cover w/MH Water Logo 15 EA $ 22450 $ 3,367.50 $ 22314 $ 3,347.10 $ 231.00 $ 3,465.00 *
10 60" Dia. x 8" Concrete Gate Well Base 15 EA $ 2760.00 $ 41,400.00 $ 35438 $ 5.315.70 No Bid
48" Dia. x 3' Gate Well Bottom Section with
11 (2) Doahouse Openinas 15 EA $ = $ 64557 $  9,683.55 No Bid
12 48" Dia. x 2' Eccentric Gate Well Cone 15 EA $ = $ 32288 $  4,843.20 No Bid
13 48" Dia. x 1' Grooved Gate Well Flatton 15 EA $ o $ 40294 $  6.044.10 No Bid
No Bid

14 96 Brick MHC State of MI Spec Manhole 4 PALLET | $ 288.00 $ 1,728.00 $ 446.40 $  1.785.60 No Bid
15 96 Block 246 Manhole 24"x6" 4 PALLET | $ 20160 $ 806.40 $ 321.60 $ 1,286.40 No Bid &
16 94 pound Baa of Cement 2 PALLET | $ 19.00 $  1.330.00 $ 654.80 $  1.309.60 No Bid
17 Bag of Mortar 2 PALLET | $ 7.00 $ 588.00 $ 465.75 $ 931.50 No Bid
18  EJ Fire Hvdrant - 5BR250 (4.5' DOB) 12 EA $ 3150.00 $ 37.800.00 $ 3130.76 $ 37.569.12 $ 3.249.00 $ 38,988.00
19 EJ Fire Hydrant - 5BR250 (5' DOB) 1l7) EA $ 3,212.00 $ 38,544.00 $ 3,191.25 $ 38,295.00 $ 331200 $ 39,744.00
20  EJFire Hvdrant - 5BR250 (5.5' DOB) 12 EA $ 327200 $ 39.264.00 $ 325174 $ 39.020.88 $ 337400 $ 40.488.00
21 D-Box Assembly (without lid) 1l7) EA $ 268.00 $ 3,216.00 $ 24107 $ 2,892.84 $ 27335 $ 3,280.20
22  D-Box Lid * w/MH Water Loao 12 EA $ 36.00 $ 432.00 $ 3590 $ 430.80 $ 31040 $  3.724.80
23 24" D-Box Extension 2 EA $ 8550 $ 171.00 $ 8530 $ 170.60 $ 88.00 $ 176.00 *
24 12"MJ Cap DI 2 EA $ 179.00 $ 358.00 $ 180.57 $ 361.14 $ 18435 $ 368.70
25 8" MJ Cap DI 16 EA $ 12300 $ 1,968.00 $ 12385 $ 1,981.60 $ 12645 $ 2,023.20
26 6"MJCap DI 2 EA $ 80.00 $ 160.00 $ 79.90 $ 159.80 $ 8155 $ 163.10
27 12" MJ Plug DI 6 EA $ 27400 $ 1,644.00 $ 27645 $ 1,658.70 $ 28225 $ 1,693.50
28  8"MJPlua DI 12 EA $ 13200 $  1.584.00 $ 13263 $  1,591.56 $ 13550 $  1.626.00
29 6" MJ Plug DI 2 EA $ 93.00 $ 186.00 $ 9349 $ 186.98 $ 9545 $ 190.90
30  12"MJ 45 Bend DI 2 EA $ 447.00 $ 894.00 $ 45143 $ 902.86 $ 460.90 $ 921.80
31 8" MJ 45 Bend DI 1l7) EA $ 179.00 $ 2,148.00 $ 18057 $ 2,166.84 $ 18435 $ 2,212.20
32  12"MJ22.5Bend DI 2 EA $ 380.00 $ 760.00 $ 38351 $ 767.02 $ 39150 $ 783.00
33 8" MJ 22.5 Bend DI 8 EA $ 176.00 $ 1,408.00 $ 17738 $ 1,419.04 $ 18110 $ 1,448.80
34 12"MJ11.25 Bend DI 2 EA $ 360.00 $ 720.00 $ 36354 $ 727.08 $ 37115 $ 742.30
35 8" MJ 11.25 Bend DI 4 EA $ 160.00 $ 640.00 $ 161.40 $ 645.60 $ 16470 $ 658.80
36  12"x12" MJ Tee DI 4 EA $ 723.00 $  2.892.00 $ 73026 $  2.921.04 $ 74560 $  2982.40
37 12"x8" MJ Tee DI 2 EA $ 549.00 $ 1,098.00 $ 554.49 $ 1,108.98 $ 566.15 $ 1,132.30
38  12"x6"MJ Tee DI 1 EA $ 520.00 $ 520.00 $ 52493 $ 524.93 $ 53595 $ 535.95
39  8'x8"MJ Tee DI 15 EA $ 32800 $  4,920.00 $ 33158 $  4,973.70 $ 33855 $ 507825
40 8 MJ Tee DI 12 EA $ 277.00 $  3,324.00 $ 27964 $  3,355.68 $ 28550 $  3,426.00
41 6"x6" MJ Tee DI i EA $ 222.00 $ 222.00 $ 22372 $ 223.72 $ 22840 $ 228.40
42 12"x12"x8"x 8" DI Cross 1 EA $ 645.00 $ 645.00 $ 651.96 $ 651.96 $ 665.65 $ 665.65
43 6" MJ Medalua for PVC Pipe 50 EA $ 3800 $  1,900.00 $ 3853 $  1,926.50 $ 3870 $  1,935.00
44 8"MJ Megalug for PVC Pipe 150 EA $ 56.00 $  8,400.00 $ 57.00 $ 855150 *|$ 5730 $  8,595.00
45 12" MJ Meqalug for PVC Pipe 12 EA $ 110,00 $  1,320.00 $ 11328 $  1,359.36 $ 11385 $  1,366.20
46 6" MJ Gasket 50 EA $ 750 $ 375.00 $ 500 $ 250.00 $ 630 $ 315.00
47 8"MJ Gasket 150 EA $ 800 $  1,200.00 $ 6.39 $ 958.50 $ 675 $ 101250
48 12" MJ Gasket 12 EA $ 1300 $ 156.00 $ 1028 $ 123.36 $ 1015 $ 121.80
49 3/4"x3.5" T-Head Bolt n Nut Coated 8 EA $ 475.00 $  3,800.00 $ 456.25 $  3,650.00 $ 43750 $  3500.00
50  3/4"x4" T-Head Bolt n Nut Coated 1 EA $ 425.00 $ 425.00 $ 500.00 $ 500.00 $ 625.00 $ 625.00
51 56" Curb Box 164 EA $ 4250 $  6,970.00 $ 4237 $ 6,948.68 $ 4840 $  7,937.60
52 3/4" Curb Stop CFxCF 122 EA $ 20.00 $  2,440.00 $ 77.90 $  9,503.80 $ 79.45 $  9,692.90
53  3/4" Corp Stop CCxCR (150 PSI) 131 EA $ 3800 $ 4,978.00 $ 3758 $  4,922.98 $ 36.00 $ 4,716.00
54 3/4" 3pc Coupling CFXCF 125 EA $ 21.00 $ 2,625.00 $ 2058 $ 257250 $ 1995 $ 249375
55  8'x3/4"CC DBL Saddle 131 EA $ 164.00 $ 21,484.00 $ 163.66 $ 21,439.46 $ 18295 $ 23,966.45 *
56  8"x1" CC DBL Saddle 1 EA $ 164.00 $ 164.00 $ 16366 $ 163.66 $ 18295 $ 182.95
57  8'x1.5"CC DBL Saddle it EA $ 268.00 $ 268.00 $ 17226 $ 172.26 $ 19255 $ 192.55
58  8"'x2"CC DBL Saddle 1 EA $ 273.00 $ 273.00 $ 187.76 $ 187.76 $ 19995 $ 199.95
59  12"x3/4" CC DBL Saddle it EA $ 238.00 $ 238.00 $ 237.33 $ 237.33 $ 25200 $ 252.00
60  12"x1" CC DBL Saddle 1 EA $ 238.00 $ 238.00 $ 23733 $ 237.33 $ 22460 $ 224.60
61  12"'x1.5" CC DBL Saddle it EA $ 268.00 $ 268.00 $ 267.69 $ 267.69 $ 253.30 $ 253.30
62  12"x2" CC DBL Saddle 1 EA $ 27300 $ 273.00 $ 27257 $ 272.57 $ 268.65 $ 268.65
63  3/4" K Copper 60' Roll 15 EA $ 36540 $  5481.00 $ 366.60 $  5,499.00 $ 37620 $ 5,643.00
64 3/4" K Copper 100’ Roll 2 EA $ 609.00 $  1,218.00 $ 611.00 $  1,222.00 $ 627.00 $  1,254.00
65 1" K Copper 60' Roll 1 EA $ 485.00 $ 485.00 $ 487.20 $ 487.20 $ 499.80 $ 499.80
66 1" K Copper 100’ Roll 1 EA $ 809.00 $ 809.00 $ 812.00 $ 812.00 $ 833.00 $ 833.00
67 2" K Copper 60" Roll 1 EA $ 118620 $ 1.186.20 $ 118980 $  1.189.80 $ 122200 $ 1,222.00
68 8"X12" Solid Sleeve 6 EA $ 176.00 $ 1,056.00 $ 17738 $ 1,064.28 $ 18110 $ 1,086.60
69  5BR250 Hydrant Extension 6" 6 EA $ 329.00 $  1,974.00 $ 327.42 $  1.964.52 $ 339.00 $  2,034.00
70 5BR250 Hydrant Extension 12" 6 EA $ 379.00 $ 2,274.00 $ 37691 $ 2,261.46 $ 390.00 $ 2,340.00
71 6" Lockina 90 Hvdrant Elbow 8 EA $ 296.00 _$  2.368.00 $ 28532 $ 2.282.56 $ 305.00 _$ _ 2.440.00

Total Bid: $ $

Incomplete]

* Indicates that bid amount was corrected by the City

2/14/2025



