
  BID TABULATION   

City of Mangum
 Water Meter System Replacement Project

 June 1, 2023 @ 2:00 p.m.
MECE 223100

A1 1565 EA 5/8"  MACH 10 R900 METER $310.00 $485,150.00

A2 2 EA 3"  MACH 10 R900 METER $2,750.00 $5,500.00

A3 2 EA 6" Mach 10 R900 Meter $5,350.00 $10,700.00

A4 1 LS Drive By System $21,100.00 $21,100.00

TOTAL BID SECTION A NO BID $522,450.00

A5 1565 EA 5/8"  Meter Installation $68.00 $106,420.00

2 EA 3"  Meter Installation $750.00 $1,500.00

2 EA 6" Meter Installation $1,300.00 $2,600.00

TOTAL BID SECTION A INSTALLATION NO BID $110,520.00

B1 1565 EA 5/8"  x 3/8" iPerl

B2 2 EA 3" iPerl Meter

B3 2 EA 6" iPerl Meter

B4 1569 EA Smart Points-520M- Single Port

Force Jam-JV Core & Main

A6

DESCRIPTIONITEM QUANTITY

Sec B Sensus Meters

UNIT

A7

Sec A Neptune Meters

Sec A Installation



B5 1 LS Drive By System

TOTAL BID SECTION B NO BID NO BID

B6 1565 EA 5/8"  Meter Installation

B7 2 EA 3"  Meter Installation

B8 88 EA 6" Meter Installation

TOTAL BID SECTION B INSTALLATION NO BID NO BID
 

C1 1565 EA 5/8" Sonata Ultrasonic Meter $362.74 $567,688.10

C2 2 LF 3"  Octave Ultrasonic Meter $2,804.58 $5,609.16

C3 2 EA 6" Octave Ultrasonic Meter $7,073.05 $14,146.10

C4 1 LS Drive By System $26,576.56 $26,576.56

TOTAL BID SECTION C $614,019.92 NO BID
Sec C Installation

C5 1565 EA 5/8" Meter Installation $62.50 $97,812.50

C6 2 EA 3" Meter Installation $1,500.00 $3,000.00

C7 2 EA 6" Meter Installation $2,250.00 $4,500.00

TOTAL BID SECTION C INSTALLATION $105,312.50 NO BID

Sec C Master Meter

Sec B Installation


