CITY OF LYNDEN
BID TABULATION

November 9, 2023, 2:00 p.m.

2024-02 CHEMICALS (1) Lime, (2) Alum, (3) Salt, (4) Fluorosilicic Acid

Cascade Columbia

Kemira Water

PRODUCT & QUANTITY | Chemtrade Chemicals Distribution TR International Solutions
. : $0.378/Ib ,
(1) Hydrated Lime No Bid $491.40/bag $0.325/Ib No Bid
175,000 Ibs $66,150.00 $56,875
@2 | Aluminum Sulfate $682.00/dry fon No Bid No Bid $786.00/dry ton
$68,200.00 - $78,600.00 -
100 to 350 dry tons $238.700.00 $.00 $275 100.00
, $.30/Ib : :
(3) | Solar Extra-Coarse Salt No Bid $15.00/bag No Bid No Bid
20,000 Ibs. $6,000.00
I . , $800/wet ton , :
(4) Fluorosilicic Acid No Bid ($.3775/Ib) No Bid No Bid
20 tons $16,000.00
(5) Sodium Hypochlorite No Bid $3.32/gal No Bid No Bid
4,000 gallons $13,280.00




