
Bidder Lakeside 
(Burlington Plant) Cowden Stremler Granite 

Asphalt Class B $73.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 

5/8” Minus Solo No Bid $17.25 $17.45 No Bid
5/8” Minus Trailer No Bid $16.50 $14.10 No Bid
5/8” Minus City Haul No Bid $12.00 $11.25 $15.00 
3/4" Drain Solo No Bid $17.25 $16.50 No Bid
3/4" Drain Trailer No Bid $16.25 $13.25 No Bid
3/4” Drain City Haul No Bid $12.00 $9.50 $15.00 
1” Drain Solo No Bid $17.25 $16.50 No Bid
1” Drain Trailer No Bid $16.50 $13.25 No Bid
1” Drain City Haul No Bid $12.00 $9.50 $15.00 
1 1/2" Drain Solo No Bid $18.50 $18.50 No Bid
1 1/2" Drain Trailer No Bid $17.25 $15.00 No Bid
1 1/2" Drain City Haul No Bid $13.00 $10.00 $15.00 
Pea Gravel Solo No Bid $17.00 $18.50 No Bid
Pea Gravel Trailer No Bid $16.25 $15.00 No Bid
Pea Gravel City Haul No Bid $12.00 $10.00 $15.00 
4-8” Spalls Solo No Bid $24.75 No Bid No Bid
4-8” Spalls Trailer No Bid $21.50 No Bid No Bid
4-8” Spalls City Haul No Bid $14.25 No Bid No Bid
Pit Run Solo No Bid $12.75 $10.25 No Bid
Pit Run Trailer No Bid $9.75 $8.25 No Bid
Pit Run City Haul No Bid $9.00 $5.00 $6.00 
Topsoil Solo No Bid $27.00 $22.25 No Bid
Topsoil Trailer No Bid $24.00 $19.50 No Bid
Topsoil City Haul No Bid $18.00 No Bid No Bid
Sand Solo Truck No Bid $13.50 $13.45 No Bid
Sand Trailer No Bid $12.00 $10.15 No Bid
Sand City Haul No Bid $10.00 $7.00 $8.00 
¼” Fract Sand Solo No Bid $23.75 $20.95 No Bid
1/4” Fract Sand Trailer No Bid $20.50 $17.60 No Bid
¼” Fract Sand City No Bid $17.00 No Bid $15.00 
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All pricing is "per ton" except Screened Topsoil 
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