BID TABULATION
Annual Sod Contract - ITB #202312

Awardee

SOD: Various Types - ALL CERTIFIED

Odums Sod, Inc.

**Mola Delivery &

Nursery Inc.
Item No. Item Description uom Picked-Up Price Picked-Up Price
11315 Floratam — St. Augustine (See Per Sq. Ft. A
Specs) 0.34
Palmetto - St. A ti S
11316 | o et ugustine (See | persq e, 0.46
Specs) 0.34
Citra Blue - St. A ti S
11620 |-'TeEMVeE ugustine (See Per Sq. Ft. 0.54
Specs) 0.40
Bitter Blue - St. Al ti S
11623 |- erEe ugustine (See | persq. . No Bid No Bid
Specs)
11317 |Bahia (See Specs) Per Sq. Ft. 0.36
0.27
11608 |UltimateFlora - Zoysia Per Sq. Ft. No Bid
0.60
11611 |SeaDwarf - Seashore Paspalum Per Sq. Ft. No Bid
1.20
11320 Bermuda Per Sq. Ft. 0.60
0.60
11321 |Celebration Per Sq. Ft. 0.60
0.60
11322  |Tiftway 419 Bermuda (See Specs) Per Sq. Ft. 0.62
0.60
Item No. Item Description uom Delivered Price Delivered Price
FI —St. Al ti
11329 oratam — St. Augustine (See Per Sq. Ft. 0.46
Specs) 0.34
Palmetto - St. A ti S
11330 | o meRo ugustine (5ee | persq. Ft. 0.48
Specs) 0.34
Citra Blue - St. A ti S
11621 |- o SUe ugustine (See Per Sq. Ft. 0.55
Specs) 0.40
Bitter Blue - St. A ti S
11624 |0 T PMe ugustine (See Per Sq. Ft. No Bid No Bid
Specs)
11331  [Bahia (See Specs) Per Sq. Ft. 0.38
0.27
11609 UltimateFlora - Zoysia Per Sq. Ft. No Bid
0.60
11612 SeaDwarf - Seashore Paspalum Per Sq. Ft. No Bid
1.20
11334 Bermuda Per Sq. Ft. 0.63
0.60
11335 |Celebration Per Sq. Ft. 0.63
0.60
11336  [Tiftway 419 Bermuda (See Specs) Per Sq. Ft. 0.65
0.60
Deli d & Installed Deli d & Installed
Item No. Item Description uomMm elivere . nstafle elivere ) nstafle
Price Price
11337 Floratam — St. Augustine (See Per Sq. Ft. 0.50 No Bid
Specs)
Palmetto - St. Al ti S
11338 | o meto ugustine (5ee | persq. Ft. 053 No Bid
Specs)

Delivery Price $200

Delivery Price $200

Delivery Price $200

Delivery Price $200

Delivery Price $200

Delivery Price $200

Delivery Price $200

Delivery Price $200

Delivery Price $200



11622 Citra Blue - St. Augustine (See Per Sq. Ft. S 0l62 No Bid
Specs)
11625 |Ditter Blue-St. Augustine (See Per Sq. Ft. No Bid No Bid
Specs)
11339 [Bahia (See Specs) Per Sq. Ft. S 0.42 No Bid
11610 UltimateFlora - Zoysia Per Sq. Ft. No Bid No Bid
11613 |SeaDwarf - Seashore Paspalum Per Sq. Ft. No Bid No Bid
11342 Bermuda Per Sq. Ft. S 0.66 No Bid
11343 Celebration Per Sq. Ft. S 0.66 No Bid
11344  [Tiftway 419 Bermuda (See Specs) Per Sq. Ft. S 0.68 No Bid
Ground Preparation & Pine Straw
Vendor preparation of surface prior to
sod install of any listed sod (cut/remove
11323  |vegetation & loosen soil) for the Per Sq. Ft. S 0.23 No Bid
following types: Floratam, Bahia and
Bermuda
Bahia Sod (Pegged/Staked) Price
incl taki i
11324 mc-udes staking or pegging sod on Per Sq. Ft. S 0.07 No Bid
various slopes — e.g. canal and lake
banks. Slope exceeds 3:1
11616 |Pine Straw Mulch (See Specs) Per Bale No Bid No Bid
11619 |Pine Straw Mulch (See Specs) Per Truckload No Bid No Bid
MISC ITEMS
11327 |Seed and Mulch (See Specs) Per Sq. Yd. No Bid No Bid
11328 |Hydro Seed (See Specs) Per Sqg. Yd. No Bid No Bid

**Mola Delivery withdrew bid due to $200 delivery fees not accected as part of the bid by Wellington.

Bidder understands and agrees that awarded vendor(s) will be paid based upon items and
quantities actually accepted by owner. All pricing shall include labor, materials, equipment,
pallets, fuel, shipping, delivery, installation (when applicable) and all other necessary items.

*No Pallet minimum orders will apply for sod delivered prices and delivered & installed.




