
Bid Tabulation

Annual Sod Contract ITB #202509

KEY

Primary

Secondary

Tertiary

Quaternary

Item Description

Unit of 

Measure 

(UOM)

Agricultural 

Land Services
Odums Sod

*Mola Delivery 

& Nursery

Gvi Garden 

Center

Agricultural 

Land Services
Odums Sod

Mola Delivery 

& Nursery

Gvi Garden 

Center

Agricultural 

Land Services
Odums Sod

Mola Delivery & 

Nursery

Gvi Garden 

Center

Item Price Price Price Price Item Price Price Price Price Item Price Price Price Price

Floratam - St. Augustine               

(See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12404 0.55$                0.48$                0.45$                0.44$                12405 0.75$              0.52$              0.56$              0.46$                12406 0.98$           0.58$           0.74$                 0.52$                 

Citra Blue - St. Augustine            (See 

Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12410 No Bid 0.59$                0.62$                0.57$                12411 No Bid 0.64$              0.65$              0.59$                12412 No Bid 0.70$           1.00$                 0.65$                 

Surface Prep. Prior to St. Augustine 

Sod Installation             (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Bahia (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12417 0.45$                0.37$                0.35$                0.28$                12418 0.53$              0.39$              0.40$              0.30$                12419 0.55$           0.43$           0.53$                 0.42$                 

Bahia (Pegged/Staked) Price 

includes staking or pegging sod on 

various slopes (canal and lake 

banks, slope exceeds 3:1) Per Sq. Feet N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 12423 0.08$           0.10$           No Bid 0.07$                 

Bermuda (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12425 No Bid 0.62$                0.80$                0.64$                12426 No Bid 0.65$              0.95$              0.66$                12427 No Bid 0.69$           1.00$                 0.70$                 

Certified Celebration (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12431 No Bid 0.62$                0.80$                0.64$                12432 No Bid 0.65$              0.95$              0.66$                12433 No Bid 0.69$           1.00$                 0.70$                 

SeaDwarf - Seashore Paspalum    

(See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12437 No Bid No Bid 1.95$                No Bid 12438 No Bid No Bid 2.00$              No Bid 12439 No Bid No Bid 2.50$                 No Bid

Surface Prep. Prior to Celebration  

and SeaDwarf/Seashore Paspalum 

Turf Installation                         (See 

Specs) Per Sq. Feet

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Seed and Mulch (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12444 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12445 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12446 1.30$           No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydro Seed (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12451 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12452 1.30$           No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Vendor is not within the 25-mile radius of the Village of Wellington for picked-up category.
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Bid Tabulation

Annual Sod Contract ITB #202509

KEY

Primary

Secondary

Tertiary

Quaternary

Item Description

Unit of 

Measure 

(UOM)

Agricultural 

Land Services
Odums Sod

*Mola Delivery 

& Nursery

Gvi Garden 

Center

Agricultural 

Land Services
Odums Sod

Mola Delivery 

& Nursery

Gvi Garden 

Center

Agricultural 

Land Services
Odums Sod

Mola Delivery & 

Nursery

Gvi Garden 

Center

Item Price Price Price Price Item Price Price Price Price Item Price Price Price Price

Floratam - St. Augustine               

(See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12407 0.54$                0.48 0.42$                0.44$                12408 0.74$              0.52$              0.44$              0.46$                12409 0.79$           0.58$           0.72$                 0.50$                 

Citra Blue - St. Augustine            (See 

Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12413 No Bid 0.59$                0.59$                0.57$                12414 No Bid 0.64$              0.63$              0.59$                12415 No Bid 0.70$           1.00$                 0.62$                 

Surface Prep. Prior to St. Augustine 

Sod Installation             (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

12416 No Bid No Bid 1.00$                 0.40$                 

Bahia (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12420 0.42$                0.37$                0.30$                0.28$                12421 0.49$              0.39$              0.32$              0.30$                12422 0.42$           0.43$           0.53$                 0.40$                 

Bahia (Pegged/Staked) Price 

includes staking or pegging sod on 

various slopes (canal and lake 

banks, slope exceeds 3:1) Per Sq. Feet N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 12424 0.08$           0.10$           No Bid 0.07$                 

Bermuda (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12428 No Bid 0.62$                0.77$                0.64$                12429 No Bid 0.65$              0.80$              0.66$                12430 No Bid 0.69$           0.95$                 0.68$                 

Certified Celebration (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12434 No Bid 0.62$                0.77$                0.64$                12435 No Bid 0.65$              0.80$              0.66$                12436 No Bid 0.69$           0.95$                 0.68$                 

SeaDwarf - Seashore Paspalum    

(See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12440 No Bid No Bid 1.90$                No Bid 12441 No Bid No Bid 0.89$              No Bid 12442 No Bid No Bid 2.50$                 No Bid

Surface Prep. Prior to Celebration  

and SeaDwarf/Seashore Paspalum 

Turf Installation                         (See 

Specs) Per Sq. Feet

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

12443 No Bid No Bid 2.00$                 No Bid

Seed and Mulch (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12447 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12448 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12449 0.09$           No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hydro Seed (See Specs) Per Sq. Feet 12453 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12454 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12455 0.12$           No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Vendor is not within the 25-mile radius of the Village of Wellington for picked-up category.
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Orders OVER 4,000 - Per Unit of Measure

Delivered & Installed


