
City of Palm Beach Gardens, Florida

AWARD SUMMARY - LINE ITEM PRICES AND AWARDED VENDORS

 

  

  

D.S. EAKINS FLYING SCOT HINTERLAND GROUP J W CHEATHAM JOHNSON-DAVIS R&D PAVING SAFFOLD PAVING WAYPOINT CONTRACTING

Lake Park, Florida 33403 Wellington, Florida 33414 Riviera Beach, Florida 33404 West Palm Beach, Florida 33413 Lantana, Florida 33462 West Palm Beach, Florida 33401 West Palm Beach, Florida 33407 Miami, Florida 33255

D. Steven Eakins, Jr. Shawn Cunningham Daniel Duke Eddie Giles Melissa Trejo Meagan Martin Ezra Saffold Jorge Lopez

561.346.1549 561.723.5812 954.237.9266 561.239.4553 561.588.1170 561.379.3469 561.848.1110 786.608.1406

steve@dseakins.com shawn@flyingscotinc.com info@hinterlandgroup.com egiles@jwcheatham.com mtrejo@johnsondavis.com meagan@randdpaving.com ezra@saffoldpaving.com info@waypointci.com

NO. UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

 AREAS OF SPECIFIC WORK

1 Removal, saw cut, and disposal of 4" thick concrete SF $4.00 $1.75 $5.00 $5.00 $2.00 $6.90 $3.50 $4.63

2 Removal, saw cut, and disposal of 6" thick concrete SF $5.00 $2.25 $6.00 $6.00 $3.00 $6.90 $4.00 $5.63

3 F&I, 4" concrete with wire SF $8.00 $3.00 $10.00 $8.00 $12.00 $13.05 $6.00 $7.75

4 F&I, 4" concrete without wire SF $7.50 $3.00 $8.00 $7.50 $9.50 $12.55 $5.00 $6.88

5 F&I, 4" concrete with polypropylene fiber mix reinforce SF $8.25 $3.00 $10.00 $9.00 $11.00 $15.00 $6.00 $7.69

6 F&I, 6" concrete with polypropylene fiber mix reinforce SF $8.75 $4.00 $12.00 $10.00 $12.00 $16.00 $7.00 $8.75

7 F&I, 6" concrete with wire SF $9.00 $4.00 $12.00 $9.50 $12.00 $14.20 $7.00 $9.06

8 F&I, 6" concrete without wire SF $8.50 $4.00 $10.00 $9.00 $10.50 $14.00 $6.50 $8.19

9 F&I, 6" pervious concrete SF No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid $70.00 $12.50 $13.13

10 F&I, 4" stamped concrete with wire SF $17.00 $14.00 No Bid $21.00 No Bid $22.00 $11.25 $17.19

11 F&I, 4" stamped concrete without wire SF $16.50 $15.00 No Bid $20.00 No Bid $21.75 $12.00 $17.81

12 F&I, 6" stamped concrete with wire SF $20.50 $17.00 No Bid $26.00 No Bid $24.00 $11.50 $20.00

13 F&I, 6" stamped concrete without wire SF $20.00 $16.00 No Bid $25.00 No Bid $23.50 $11.25 $2.19

14 F&I, 8" pervious concrete SF No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid $90.00 $13.00 $20.00

15 F&I, FDOT concrete bumper guard EA $100.00 No Bid No Bid $54.00 No Bid $175.00 $65.00 $93.75

16 F&I, ADA-compliant detectable surface SF $80.00 No Bid $85.00 $50.00 $50.00 $72.00 $65.00 $56.25

17 F&I, ADA-compliant welded aluminum handrail, FDOT Standard Index 862 - 42" LF $750.00 No Bid No Bid $200.00 $150.00 No Bid $200.00 $131.25

18 F&I, FDOT Type "A" curb - by hand LF $42.00 No Bid $65.00 $37.00 $90.00 $40.00 $34.00 $42.50

19 F&I, FDOT Type "A" curb - by machine LF $42.00 No Bid $55.00 $24.00 No Bid $40.00 $28.00 $40.00

20 F&I, FDOT Type "B" curb - by hand LF $42.00 No Bid $65.00 $40.00 $90.00 $40.00 $30.00 $40.00

21 F&I, FDOT Type "B" curb - by machine LF $42.00 No Bid $55.00 $27.00 No Bid $40.00 $28.00 $38.75

22 F&I, FDOT Type "D" curb - by hand LF $42.00 No Bid $65.00 $38.00 $90.00 $40.00 $29.00 $42.50

23 F&I, FDOT Type "D" curb - by machine LF $42.00 No Bid $55.00 $25.00 No Bid $40.00 $28.00 $41.25

24 F&I, FDOT Type "E" curb - by hand LF $51.00 No Bid $65.00 $43.00 $90.00 $50.00 $30.00 $43.13

25 F&I, FDOT Type "E" curb - by machine LF $51.00 No Bid $55.00 $30.00 No Bid $50.00 $31.00 $42.88

26 F&I, FDOT Type "F" curb - by hand LF $51.00 No Bid $65.00 $43.00 $90.00 $50.00 $32.00 $46.88

27 F&I, FDOT Type "F" curb - by machine LF $51.00 No Bid $55.00 $30.00 No Bid $50.00 $30.00 $43.75

28 F&I, FDOT Valley Gutter - by hand LF $51.00 No Bid $65.00 $42.00 $90.00 $50.00 $28.00 $47.50

29 F&I, FDOT valley Gutter - by machine LF $51.00 No Bid $55.00 $29.00 No Bid $50.00 $27.00 $46.56

30 F&I, FDOT Shoulder Gutter - by hand LF $65.00 No Bid $65.00 $44.00 $100.00 $60.00 $31.00 $50.00

31 F&I, FDOT Shoulder Gutter - by machine LF $65.00 No Bid $55.00 $31.00 No Bid $60.00 $30.00 $48.75

32 F&I, FDOT asphaltic concrete curb LF No Bid No Bid $75.00 $50.00 No Bid $44.00 $27.50 $37.50

33 F&I, conduit - 2" (18" - 24" depth) LF No Bid No Bid $15.00 $25.00 No Bid $20.00 $12.00 $15.00

34 Installation only of conduit - 2" (18" - 24" depth) LF No Bid No Bid $12.00 $15.00 No Bid $15.00 $10.00 $22.50

35 F&I, conduit - 4" (18" - 24" depth) LF No Bid No Bid $22.00 $45.00 No Bid $40.00 $15.00 $22.50

36 F&I, conduit - 6" (18" - 24" depth) LF No Bid No Bid $35.00 $55.00 No Bid $50.00 $17.00 $30.00

37 F&I, conduit - 2" (24" - 36" depth) LF No Bid No Bid $18.00 $30.00 No Bid $26.00 $13.00 $15.13

38 Installation only of conduit - 2" (24" - 36" depth) LF No Bid No Bid $15.00 $20.00 No Bid $20.00 $11.00 $10.06

39 F&I, conduit - 4" (24" - 36" depth) LF No Bid No Bid $24.00 $50.00 No Bid $45.00 $11.50 $30.00

40 F&I, conduit - 6" (24" - 36" depth) LF No Bid No Bid $38.00 $60.00 No Bid $54.00 $11.50 $43.75

41 F&I, 2' x 2' pull boxes (includes weeps and ground rods) EA No Bid No Bid $2,200.00 $3,500.00 No Bid $3,000.00 $750.00 $1,025.00

42 Installation 2' x 2' pull boxes EA No Bid No Bid $1,600.00 $1,750.00 No Bid $1,600.00 $550.00 $656.25

43 F&I, pull wire within conduit LF No Bid No Bid $10.00 $10.00 No Bid $8.00 $3.25 $13.13

44 F&I, tracing wire within conduit (#12 Cu) LF No Bid No Bid $8.00 $3.00 No Bid $3.00 $2.00 $10.00

45 Supply, place and compact clean fill CY $30.00 No Bid $60.00 $40.00 $40.00 $51.00 $25.00 $35.00

46 Stop Sign w/ Street Name Blades Mounted on New Post (R-140A-D) EA No Bid No Bid $450.00 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid $950.00 $8.50

47 Staked Silt Fence LF $4.50 No Bid $6.00 $3.00 $4.00 $8.85 $2.50 $4.75

48 F&I, natural stone riprap w/filter fabric TN $250.00 No Bid $210.00 $300.00 $280.00 $308.00 $115.00 $268.75

49 F&I, broken concrete riprap w/filter fabric TN $200.00 No Bid $180.00 $250.00 $200.00 $220.00 $100.00 $181.25

50 Supply and install sand-cement riprap w/filter fabric CY $900.00 No Bid $450.00 $1,100.00 $800.00 $880.00 $700.00 $937.50

51 Special saw cuts for pavement and concrete LF $5.00 $5.00 $6.00 $10.00 No Bid $19.00 $2.00 $3.75

52 Removal and disposal of existing driveway culvert pipe LF $20.00 No Bid $120.00 $25.00 $30.00 $33.00 $85.00 $71.25

53 Regular Excavation (Including Removal & Disposal) CY $25.00 No Bid $50.00 $40.00 $30.00 $32.00 $25.00 $28.00

54 F&I, Bahia sod - up to 1,000 SF SF $2.00 No Bid $4.00 $1.00 $2.00 $6.00 $0.75 $0.65

55 F&I, Bahia sod - over 1,000 SF SF $1.50 No Bid $3.00 $0.75 $1.00 $3.00 $0.65 $0.56

56 F&I, Floratam sod - up to 1,000 SF SF $2.50 No Bid $6.00 $1.50 $2.50 $7.00 $1.10 $0.90

57 F&I, Floratam sod - over 1,000 SF SF $2.00 No Bid $5.00 $1.00 $1.50 $4.00 $1.00 $0.73

58 F&I, FDOT seed and mulch mix SF $0.50 No Bid $5.00 $0.50 $0.25 No Bid $0.28 $0.44

59 Furnish operator, water truck and irrigate sod or seed mix HR $150.00 No Bid $220.00 $200.00 $150.00 $125.00 $91.00 $125.00

60 FDOT guard rail with no end treatment, FDOT Standard Index 400 LF No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid $41.00 $33.00 $93.75

61 FDOT guard rail with end treatment, FDOT Standard Index 400 LF No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid $87.00 $60.00 $156.25

62 Re-grade swales - up to 1,000 CY CY $20.00 $20.00 $20.00 $40.00 $40.00 $36.00 $14.00 $37.50

63 Re-grade swales - over 1,000 CY CY $15.00 $19.00 $18.00 $40.00 $25.00 $35.00 $13.00 $32.50

64 Canal wash out repair (sand and silt) CY $200.00 No Bid $200.00 $500.00 No Bid $660.00 $150.00 $312.50

65 Canal excavation (60' ROW) - up to 1,000 CY CY $30.00 No Bid $65.00 $20.00 No Bid $50.00 $25.00 $43.75

66 Canal excavation (100' ROW) - up to 1,000 CY CY $30.00 No Bid $95.00 $20.00 No Bid $45.00 $18.00 $47.50

67 Canal excavation (0' ROW) - over 1,000 CY CY $20.00 No Bid $45.00 $20.00 No Bid $35.00 $15.00 $47.50

68 Canal excavation (100' ROW) - over 1,000 CY CY $20.00 No Bid $55.00 $20.00 No Bid $35.00 $15.00 $50.00

69 Lake canal bank restoration (wash out repair) CY $40.00 No Bid $200.00 $2,500.00 No Bid $626.00 $75.00 $218.75

70 F&I, Type SIII asphalt overlay - 1" TN $200.00 No Bid $325.00 $193.00 $250.00 $176.00 $150.00 $368.75

71 Mill existing pavement (3/4" - 1" avg) SY $9.00 No Bid $60.00 $4.00 $30.00 $6.00 $4.00 $15.63

72 Pavement replacement w/2" Type S SY $30.00 No Bid $135.00 $30.00 $50.00 $40.00 $30.00 $22.50

73 Adjust Manholes with riser EA $3,000.00 No Bid $1,200.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid $380.00 $718.75

74 Adjust valve boxes with riser EA $2,500.00 No Bid $850.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid $300.00 $1,800.00

75 Valve Box F&I EA $1,750.00 No Bid $2,200.00 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid $500.00 $4,000.00

76 Jack and bore - 4" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid $75.00 No Bid $66.00 $65.00 $231.25

77 Directional bore - 4" LF No Bid No Bid $38.00 $75.00 No Bid $66.00 $35.00 $106.25

78 Jack and bore - 6" LF No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid $86.00 $75.00 $281.25

79 Directional bore - 6" LF No Bid No Bid $42.00 $100.00 No Bid $86.00 $46.00 $125.00

80 12" stabilized subgrade, LBR 40 - Small Quantity 1 to 100 SY SY $16.00 No Bid $25.00 $50.00 $25.00 $75.00 $10.00 $35.00

81 12" stabilized subgrade, LBR 40 SY $10.00 No Bid $20.00 $17.00 No Bid $23.00 $9.00 $22.50

82 Optional Base Group 4, 6, 9 Small Quantity 1 to 100 SY

(includes excavation ,compaction and material removal)
SY $50.00 No Bid $45.00 $100.00 $36.00 $90.00 $18.00 $45.00

83 Optional Base Group 6 TYPE B-12.5 in place to line & grade (includes excavation ,compaction and material removal) SY No Bid No Bid $65.00 $75.00 No Bid $70.00 $18.00 $25.00

84 Optional Base Group 6  cemented coquina shell base compacted to 98% AASHTO T180, LBR 100, primed & sanded, in place to 

line & grade (Includes excavation)
SY $18.00 No Bid $65.00 $36.00 No Bid $39.50 $20.00 $60.00

85 Optional Base Group 4, Cemented Coquina (LBR100) SY $16.00 No Bid $50.00 $20.00 No Bid $32.00 $20.00 $38.50

86 Optional Base Group 9  Cemented Coquina (LBR 100) SY $20.00 No Bid $75.00 $26.00 No Bid $58.00 $25.00 $42.00

87 Guardrail, galvanized, W-beam with timber post installed to FDOT Specs. LF No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid $45.00 $100.00 $125.00

88 Guardrail, galvanized, W-beam with galvanized steel post installed to FDOT Specs. LF No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid $51.00 $110.00 $225.00

89 Catch Basin, Ditch Bottom Inlet Type-C < 5' EA $5,000.00 No Bid $4,200.00 $5,800.00 $6,000.00 $6,600.00 $5,500.00 $4,895.00

90 Catch Basin, Ditch Bottom Inlet Type-E < 6' EA $7,500.00 No Bid $4,800.00 $8,700.00 $8,500.00 $9,350.00 $7,500.00 $6,500.00

91 Guardrail End Anchorage Treatment, Parallel Segment, Installed to FDOT Index 536 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,100.00 No Bid $4,550.00 $65.00 $850.00

92 Guardrail End Anchorage Treatment, Flared Segment, Installed to FDOT Index 536 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,800.00 No Bid $1,950.00 $65.00 $900.00

93 RCP/Equivalent ERCP, 15" - 24" Small Quantity, 1 to 50 LF LF $182.00 No Bid $210.00 $210.00 $200.00 $220.00 $125.00 $100.00

94 RCP/Equivalent ERCP, 30" - 36" Small Quantity 1 to 50 LF LF $270.00 No Bid $245.00 $310.00 $350.00 $385.00 $145.00 $150.00

95 15" CMP LF $85.00 No Bid $75.00 $100.00 $130.00 $143.00 $89.00 $65.00

96 18" CMP LF $105.00 No Bid $80.00 $120.00 $140.00 $154.00 $100.00 $78.00

97 24" CMP LF $125.00 No Bid $105.00 $145.00 $160.00 $176.00 $100.00 $86.00

98 30" CMP LF $155.00 No Bid $120.00 $180.00 $200.00 $220.00 $125.00 $105.00

99 36" CMP LF $180.00 No Bid $160.00 $210.00 $270.00 $297.00 $145.00 $135.00

100 12" X 18" Elliptical RCP LF $100.00 No Bid $85.00 $115.00 $150.00 $165.00 $100.00 $60.00

101 14" X 23" Elliptical RCP LF $120.00 No Bid $105.00 $140.00 $160.00 $176.00 $100.00 $75.00

102 15" RCP LF $80.00 No Bid $80.00 $92.00 $140.00 $160.00 $225.00 $75.00

103 18" RCP LF $100.00 No Bid $95.00 $115.00 $150.00 $170.00 $100.00 $85.00

104 24" RCP LF $132.00 No Bid $125.00 $152.00 $175.00 $199.00 $125.00 $125.00

105 30" RCP LF $165.00 No Bid $165.00 $190.00 $210.00 $235.00 $135.00 $185.00

106 36" RCP LF $210.00 No Bid $210.00 $242.00 $275.00 $303.00 $145.00 $225.00

107 15" HDPE LF $80.00 No Bid $65.00 $92.00 $120.00 $135.00 $95.00 $275.00

108 18" HDPE LF $100.00 No Bid $75.00 $115.00 $130.00 $145.00 $100.00 $52.00

109 24" HDPE LF $135.00 No Bid $90.00 $156.00 $155.00 $175.00 $125.00 $68.00

110 30" HDPE LF $160.00 No Bid $120.00 $184.00 $200.00 $220.00 $145.00 $75.00

111 36" HDPE LF $190.00 No Bid $135.00 $220.00 $260.00 $286.00 $145.00 $95.00

112 2" PVC LF $20.00 No Bid $25.00 $23.00 $30.00 $33.00 $35.00 $125.00

113 3" PVC LF $30.00 No Bid $28.00 $35.00 $36.00 $40.00 $35.00 $5.00

114 4" PVC LF $40.00 No Bid $38.00 $46.00 $40.00 $44.00 $40.00 $6.00

115 6" PVC LF $50.00 No Bid $48.00 $58.00 $45.00 $50.00 $65.00 $12.00

102 Mitered End Section (15" RCP) EA $3,600.00 $250.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,600.00 $1,500.00 $1,250.00

103 Mitered End Section (18" RCP) EA $3,925.00 $300.00 $2,200.00 $4,600.00 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 $1,900.00 $1,650.00

104 Mitered End Section (24" RCP) EA $5,450.00 $350.00 $2,500.00 $6,300.00 $3,800.00 $4,180.00 $2,000.00 $2,250.00

105 Mitered End Section (30" RCP) EA $7,100.00 $400.00 $3,500.00 $8,200.00 $6,500.00 $7,150.00 $2,700.00 $3,200.00

106 Mitered End Section (36" RCP) EA $7,900.00 $500.00 $4,500.00 $9,100.00 $7,000.00 $7,700.00 $3,000.00 $4,000.00

107 Mitered End Section (12x18 RCP) EA $3,400.00 $300.00 $1,800.00 $4,000.00 $2,400.00 $2,640.00 $1,600.00 $985.00

108 Mitered End Section (14x23 RCP) EA $3,400.00 $350.00 $2,200.00 $4,000.00 $2,800.00 $3,080.00 $2,000.00 $1,300.00

109 Concrete End Walls (Typ. Per FDOT Standard lndex #250) CY $3,500.00 $500.00 $3,200.00 $4,100.00 $2,000.00 $2,200.00 $350.00 $1,200.00

110 Roadway Open Cut-60" Wide X 5' Deep Including Backfill & Base (Typ. Per Martin County Standard Detail R-31A & R-31B) EA No Bid No Bid $22,000.00 $36,000.00 $15,000.00 No Bid $7,500.00 $3,500.00

111 Roadway Open Cut-60" Wide X 5' Deep Including Backfill & Base (Typ. Per Martin County Standard Detail R-31A & R-31B) - 

Without 50' Overlay
EA No Bid No Bid $14,500.00 $24,000.00 $5,000.00 No Bid $7,500.00 $2,000.00

112 Straw Bales (18X18X36) EA $100.00 No Bid $30.00 $25.00 $50.00 No Bid $250.00 $75.00

113 Floating Turbidity Barrier LF $50.00 No Bid $15.00 $100.00 $20.00 No Bid $12.00 $100.00

114 Standard mailbox and/or standard traffic control sign (single post), removal & relocate. EA $500.00 No Bid $250.00 $500.00 $300.00 $150.00 $1,000.00 $500.00

115 Type-F (6x40) Traffic Loop EA No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,500.00 No Bid $2,420.00 $5,000.00 $2,000.00

116 As-Builts/2-Man Survey Crew HR $250.00 No Bid $185.00 $200.00 $180.00 No Bid $500.00 $125.00

117 Infiltration Drainage Crew HR $400.00 No Bid $425.00 $500.00 $650.00 $715.00 $400.00 $65.00

118 Wellpoint System HR $60.00 No Bid $225.00 $100.00 $100.00 $110.00 $100.00 $55.00

119 Asphalt Removal and Restoration SF $8.00 No Bid $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 No Bid $5.00 $10.00

PAVEMENT MARKING   

120 Thermoplastic Pavement Marking, Compound Lines

a Thermo Plastic  Small Quantity Less than 1,000 LF 

(Yellow/White Solid/Skip 6"-18") 
LF $25.00 No Bid No Bid $5.50 No Bid $3,900.00 $4.00 $550.00

b Thermo Plastic  (Yellow Skip 6") 10-30 or 3-9 GM $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid $3,500.00 No Bid $7,550.00 $6.00 $5.25

c Thermo Plastic  (White Skip 6")  10-30 or 3-9 GM $3,500.00 No Bid No Bid $3,500.00 No Bid $7,550.00 $6.00 $5.25

d Thermo Plastic (Yellow Skip 6" ) 10-30 or 3-9 LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid $1.50 $6.00 $1.31

e Thermo Plastic (White Skip 6" )  10-30 or 3-9 LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid $1.50 $6.00 $1.31

f Thermo Plastic (Yellow Solid 6") LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid $1.50 $3.00 $1.31

g Thermo Plastic (White Solid 6" ) LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.75 No Bid $1.50 $1.00 $1.31

h Thermo Plastic (Yellow Solid 8") LF $2.50 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.85 $2.00 $2.19

i Thermo Plastic (White Solid 8" ) LF $2.50 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.85 $2.00 $2.19

j Thermo Plastic (White Solid 12") LF $4.00 No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid $3.60 $2.00 $2.31

k Thermo Plastic (White Solid 18") LF $7.00 No Bid No Bid $7.00 No Bid $3.85 $2.00 $3.81

l Thermo Plastic (Yellow Solid 18") LF $7.00 No Bid No Bid $7.00 No Bid $4.55 $3.00 $3.81

m Thermo Plastic ( Stop Bar 12') EA $125.00 No Bid No Bid $150.00 No Bid $6.65 $200.00 $250.00

n Thermo Plastic (Arrows) EA $150.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $76.00 $126.00 $100.00

o Thermo Plastic (Railroad) EA $600.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $455.00 $500.00 $3,000.00

121 Arrows and Messages - White Only, Furnish & Install

a Turn arrow EA $150.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $76.00 $126.00 $100.00

Corporation Address (State):

Vendor Contact Email 

DESCRIPTION

Vendor Contact 

Vendor Contact Phone Number

ITB No.:  ITB2024-160PS

Bid Title: Miscellaneous Public Works Projects

Prepared by: Km! Ra

VENDOR NAME
Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow (and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary).

Bid Opening Date:  June 7, 2024 @ 3:00 P.M.

mailto:steve@dseakins.com
mailto:shawn@flyingscotinc.com
mailto:info@hinterlandgroup.com
mailto:egiles@jwcheatham.com
mailto:mtrejo@johnsondavis.com
mailto:meagan@randdpaving.com
mailto:ezra@saffoldpaving.com
mailto:info@waypointci.com


 

  

  

D.S. EAKINS FLYING SCOT HINTERLAND GROUP J W CHEATHAM JOHNSON-DAVIS R&D PAVING SAFFOLD PAVING WAYPOINT CONTRACTING

Corporation Address (State):

ITB No.:  ITB2024-160PS

Bid Title: Miscellaneous Public Works Projects

Prepared by: Km! Ra

VENDOR NAME
Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow (and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary).

Bid Opening Date:  June 7, 2024 @ 3:00 P.M.

b Straight arrow EA $150.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $91.00 $126.00 $100.00

c Straight/Turn arrows; combination EA $200.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $156.00 $126.00 $168.75

d Merge message EA $500.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $215.00 $201.00 $218.75

e RXR message EA $350.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $455.00 $201.00 $300.00

f School message EA $350.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $507.00 $301.00 $250.00

g Only message EA $250.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $195.00 $201.00 $188.00

h U-Turn message EA $200.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $98.00 $201.00 $217.75

i Bike lane symbol (diamond, arrow) EA $500.00 No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Bid $455.00 $176.00 $344.00

j Handicap message EA $400.00 No Bid No Bid $500.00 No Bid $215.00 $126.00 $188.00

122 Raised Reflective Pavement Markers - Thermoplastic

a Red and amber; bi-directional EA $10.00 No Bid No Bid $2.50 No Bid $6.50 $11.00 $9.06

b Amber; bi-directional EA $10.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid $5.60 $11.00 $9.00

c White and red; bi-directional EA $10.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid $5.60 $11.00 $8.00

123 Raised Reflective Pavement Markers - Epoxy  

a Red and amber; bi-directional EA $10.00 No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid $8.00 $11.00 $9.00

b Amber; bi-directional EA $10.00 No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid $7.50 $11.00 $9.00

c White and red; bi-directional EA $10.00 No Bid No Bid $11.00 No Bid $7.50 $11.00 $8.00

124 Traffic Paint Lines

a White, 4" LF $1.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.50 $2.00 $0.81

b Yellow, 4" LF $1.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.50 $2.00 $1.00

c White, 6" LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.55 $2.00 $1.06

d Black, 6" LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.55 $1.00 $1.00

e Blue, 6" LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.60 $1.00 $1.00

f Yellow, 6" LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.55 $2.00 $1.00

g White, 18" LF $4.00 No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid $2.00 $2.00 $2.00

h White, 12" LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid $1.60 $2.00 $2.00

i Yellow, 18" LF $4.00 No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid $2.00 $2.00 $2.00

j White , 24" LF $7.00 No Bid No Bid $3.00 No Bid $4.25 $2.00 $2.31

125 Arrows and Messages - White (Furnish and Install)

a Straight/Combo Arrow EA $150.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid $78.00 $126.00 $81.00

b Turn arrow EA $125.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid $52.00 $126.00 $56.00

c Message (Only; School; Merge and Straight Arrow) EA $200.00 No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid $130.00 $201.00 $88.00

d 6" Numbers (Per Digit) EA $15.00 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid $4.00 $51.00 $3.00

e 8" Numbers (Per Digit) EA $20.00 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid $4.00 $65.00 $4.00

f 10" Numbers (Per Digit) EA $20.00 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid $6.00 $75.00 $6.00

g 12" Numbers (Per Digit) EA $20.00 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $6.00 $102.00 $9.00

h 24" Numbers (Per Digit) EA $30.00 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $8.00 $204.00 $9.00

126 Fire Lane and No Parking Messages - Yellow

a 4" Letters (Per Letter) EA $15.00 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid $3.90 $45.00 $3.00

b 6" Letters (Per Letter) EA $15.00 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid $6.00 $51.00 $4.00

c 8" Letters (Per Letter) EA $20.00 No Bid No Bid $4.00 No Bid $6.50 $65.00 $6.00

d 12" Letters (Per Letter) EA $20.00 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $8.00 $102.00 $7.00

e 4' Letters (Per Letter) EA $50.00 No Bid No Bid $12.00 No Bid $26.00 $45.00 $15.00

127 Pavement marking removal

a Traffic Paint  SF $4.00 No Bid No Bid $3.00 No Bid $1.60 $18.00 $3.00

b Thermoplastic  SF $5.00 No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid $2.60 $18.00 $3.00

c Cold (Preformed) Plastic SF $4.00 No Bid No Bid $5.00 No Bid $3.90 $18.00 $4.00

d Construction Tape LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.30 $10.00 $3.00

e Pavement markers EA $3.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $1.30 $20.00 $5.00

128 Preformed (Cold) Plastic (Install Only)

a White, 24" LF $20.00 No Bid No Bid $36.00 No Bid $6.50 $201.00 $11.00

b Message (Only; School; Merge; U-Turn; Bike Lane; etc.) EA $300.00 No Bid No Bid $700.00 No Bid $156.00 $201.00 $575.00

c Turn arrow EA $175.00 No Bid No Bid $400.00 No Bid $39.00 $201.00 $275.00

129 Preformed (Cold) Plastic (Furnish and Install)

a White or Yellow, 6" LF $20.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid $9.00 $150.00 $12.00

b White, 8" LF $20.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid $19.00 $175.00 $16.00

c White or Yellow, 12" LF $25.00 No Bid No Bid $20.00 No Bid $21.00 $201.00 $22.00

d White or Yellow, 18" LF $30.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid $21.00 $201.00 $32.00

e White, 24" LF $35.00 No Bid No Bid $36.00 No Bid $26.00 $201.00 $35.00

f Message (Only; School; Merge; Ramp; U-Turn; etc.) LF $950.00 No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Bid $715.00 $201.00 $938.00

g Turn arrow LF $450.00 No Bid No Bid $350.00 No Bid $425.00 $201.00 $394.00

130 Miscellaneous (Furnish and Install)

a Thermoplastic Rumble Strips (Index 518) EA $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Bid $390.00 $42.00 $844.00

b 9" Contrast tape LF $60.00 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $2.30 $10.00 $20.00

c Flexible Delineators (All Types) EA $300.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00 No Bid $175.00 $126.00 $131.00

d Foil Back Tape LF $5.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.30 $2.00 $4.00

131 Items for FDOT and/or City approved Projects 

a 6" Solid White Paint LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.55 $1.25 $1.00

b 6" Solid White Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50 $1.00 $2.00

c 8" Solid Yellow Paint LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.80 $1.00 $1.00

d 8" Solid White Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $2.25 $1.50 $2.00

e 8" Solid Yellow Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $2.25 $2.00 $2.00

f 12" Solid White Paint LF $4.00 No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid $1.60 $2.00 $1.00

g 12" Solid White Thermoplastic LF $6.00 No Bid No Bid $6.00 No Bid $4.10 $2.10 $3.00

h 18" Solid White Paint LF $4.00 No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid $2.25 $3.00 $3.00

i 18" Solid White Thermoplastic LF $9.00 No Bid No Bid $7.50 No Bid $5.00 $3.00 $4.00

j 24" Solid White Paint LF $8.00 No Bid No Bid $3.50 No Bid $3.90 $4.00 $3.00

k 24" Solid White Thermoplastic LF $15.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 No Bid $8.75 $4.00 $7.00

l 6" Solid Yellow Paint LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.55 $1.50 $1.00

m 6" Solid Yellow Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.50 $1.00 $1.00

n 18" Solid Yellow Paint LF $5.00 No Bid No Bid $1.50 No Bid $2.30 $3.00 $3.00

o 18" Solid Yellow Thermoplastic LF $10.00 No Bid No Bid $7.50 No Bid $5.00 $3.00 $5.00

p 2x4 Skips White Paint LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.60 $3.70 $1.00

q 2x4 Skips White Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.65 $4.00 $1.00

r 6x10 Skips White Paint LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.60 $6.00 $1.00

s 6x10 Skips White Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.65 $6.00 $1.00

t 10x30 Skips White Paint LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.60 $11.00 $1.00

u 10x30 Skips White Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.65 $11.00 $2.00

v 2x4 Skips Yellow Paint LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.60 $5.00 $1.00

w 2x4 Skips Yellow Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.65 $5.00 $2.00

x 6x10 Skips Yellow Paint LF $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.00 No Bid $0.60 $6.00 $1.00

y 6x10 Skips Yellow Thermoplastic LF $3.00 No Bid No Bid $2.00 No Bid $1.65 $6.00 $2.00

z Reflective pavement Markers EA $10.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid $6.50 $11.00 $7.00

aa Directional Arrows Paint EA $100.00 No Bid No Bid $70.00 No Bid $52.00 $36.00 $59.00

ab Directional Arrows Thermo EA $150.00 No Bid No Bid $250.00 No Bid $75.00 $150.00 $106.00

ac Bike lane Symbol w/Arrows Cold Plastic SETS $600.00 No Bid No Bid $550.00 No Bid $425.00 $152.00 $625.00

ad Pavement Messages Paint EA $300.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00 No Bid $195.00 $25.00 $103.00

ae Reflective Paint - Island Nose - White SY $65.00 No Bid No Bid $8.00 No Bid $1.00 $1.00 $34.00

ANNUAL ASPHALT MILLING AND PAVING

132 Asphalt Paving, per 1-inch paving/overlay, Asphalt Type - SP9.5 Lev C or S III TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $204.00 No Bid $176.00 $125.00 $150.00

133 Type SP-9.5 Traffic-C Asphaltic Concrete place by paving machine, including tack material & compaction (Small Quantity 

assignment 20 tons or less)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $500.00 No Bid $421.00 $200.00 $200.00

134 Type SP-9.5 Traffic-C Asphaltic Concrete place by paving machine, including tack material & compaction (20 ton to 50 ton 

assignments)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $430.00 No Bid $359.00 $200.00 $175.00

135 Type SP-9.5 Traffic-C Asphaltic Concrete place by paving machine, including tack material & compaction (51 ton to 150 ton 

assignments)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $262.00 No Bid $238.00 $200.00 $165.00

136 Type SP-9.5 Traffic-C Asphaltic Concrete place by paving machine, including tack material & compaction (151 ton to 499 ton 

assignments)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $193.00 No Bid $183.00 $200.00 $150.00

137 Type SP-12.5 Traffic-C Asphaltic Concrete place by paving machine, including tack material & compaction (Small Quantity 

assignment 20 tons or less)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $500.00 No Bid $422.00 $215.00 $250.00

138 Type  SP-12.5 Traffic-C Asphaltic Concrete place by paving machine, including tack material & compaction (10 ton to 50 ton 

assignments)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $430.00 No Bid $359.00 $215.00 $225.00

139 Type SP-12.5 Traffic-C Asphaltic Concrete place by paving machine, including tack material & compaction (51 ton to 150 ton 

assignments)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $260.00 No Bid $238.00 $215.00 $200.00

140 Type SP-12.5 Traffic-C Asphaltic Concrete place by paving machine, including tack material & compaction (151 ton to 499 ton 

assignments)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $190.00 No Bid $180.00 $215.00 $185.00

141 Miscellaneous Asphalt (placed by hand & compacted under Guardrail & misc. areas) TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,000.00 No Bid $884.25 $215.00 $300.00

142 Asphalt Treated Permeable Base Placed by Track paving Machine (Coarse aggregate stone # 57,asphalt Content 3.5 - 4.0%)(10 

on to 100 ton assignments)
TN No Bid No Bid No Bid $262.00 No Bid No Bid N/A $350.00

143 Asphalt Milling, per 1-inch mill; Including mobilization, TTC & all incidental work & equipment to include hauling off, stockpiling, or otherwise disposing of materialSY No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid $5.00 $5.00 $25.00

144 MOT, Rental of Arrow Board, Electric PER DAY $25.00 No Bid No Bid $20.00 $40.00 $25.00 $30.00 $56.00

145 MOT, Rental of Message Boards, Electric PER DAY $50.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $75.00 $45.00 $75.00 $67.00

146 MOT, Rental of Traffic Cones, 36-inch High (per 50 cones) PER DAY $2.00 No Bid No Bid $64.00 $100.00 $60.00 $100.00 $25.00

147 MOT, Rental of Barricades, Type I ED $2.00 No Bid No Bid $64.00 $2.00 $60.00 $2.00 $0.11

148 MOT, Rental of Barricades, Type II PER DAY $2.00 No Bid No Bid $1.50 $2.00 $1.50 $4.00 $431.00

149 MOT, Rental of Barricades, Type III PER DAY $4.00 No Bid No Bid $2.50 $3.00 $2.75 $5.00 $65.00

150 MOT, Rental of Jersey Barrier PER DAY $600.00 No Bid No Bid $650.00 No Bid $605.00 $85.00 $81.00

151 TTC - Per Flagman Per Day ED $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid $450.00 $500.00 $880.00 $50.00 $750.00

152 Work Zone Sign ED $2.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $2.00 $37.00 $20.00 $0.55

153 Concrete Barrier Wall (Temporary) LF-WK $35.00 No Bid No Bid $15,000.00 $60.00 $14,300.00 $500.00 $120.00

154 Materials Mark-up (for items not in contract valued up to $100,000) % 15% 10% 15% 15% 18% No markup 10% 18.5%

SCHEDULE OF EQUIPMENT AND OPERATOR RATES

1 3-Man Crew w/Pickup Truck HR $300.00 $260.00 $200.00 $200.00 $174.00 No Bid $200.00 $357.00

2 5-Man Crew w/Pickup Truck HR $400.00 $375.00 $525.00 $300.00 $270.00 No Bid $250.00 $535.00

3 Supervisor HR $125.00 $55.00 $120.00 $150.00 $100.00 No Bid $85.00 $109.00

4 Foreman HR $100.00 $65.00 $95.00 $125.00 $80.00 No Bid $75.00 $91.00

5 Welder HR $100.00 No Bid $225.00 $150.00 $80.00 No Bid $95.00 $88.00

6 Skilled L:aborer HR $75.00 $40.00 $65.00 $50.00 $50.00 No Bid $35.00 $60.00

7 Day Laborer (Unskilled) HR $50.00 $35.00 $55.00 $40.00 $36.00 No Bid $28.00 $49.00

8 Gradall HR $200.00 No Bid No Bid $200.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00 $219.00

9 Skid Loader HR $100.00 $90.00 $95.00 $125.00 $64.00 No Bid $80.00 $119.00

10 Rubber Tire backhoe/Loader HR $120.00 No Bid $135.00 $125.00 $106.00 No Bid $100.00 $119.00

11 Track backhoe HR $150.00 No Bid $225.00 $250.00 $150.00 No Bid $130.00 $206.00

12 Dump Truck HR $100.00 $95.00 $225.00 $110.00 $70.00 No Bid $80.00 $100.00

13 Flatbed w/Tractor HR $175.00 No Bid $120.00 $175.00 $172.00 No Bid $100.00 $144.00

14 Flatbed  HR $100.00 No Bid $120.00 $110.00 $150.00 No Bid $50.00 $81.00

15 Wellpoint System HR $60.00 No Bid $250.00 $100.00 $100.00 No Bid $45.00 $94.00

16 Jet Pump HR $60.00 No Bid $165.00 $50.00 $40.00 No Bid $50.00 $94.00

17 Hydraulic Submersible Pump HR $60.00 No Bid $185.00 $100.00 $76.00 No Bid $65.00 $119.00

18 Welding machine HR $60.00 No Bid $85.00 $100.00 $70.00 No Bid $65.00 $98.00

19 Portable Generator HR $60.00 $55.00 $165.00 $100.00 $36.00 No Bid $45.00 $88.00

20 Quick Cut Saw HR $40.00 $55.00 $25.00 $50.00 $16.00 No Bid $25.00 $41.00

21 Asphalt/Concrete Saw HR $50.00 $55.00 $15.00 $50.00 $28.00 No Bid $28.00 $56.00

22 Steel Wheel Roller HR $90.00 $200.00 $125.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid $75.00 $113.00

23 Plate Tamper HR $50.00 $55.00 $25.00 $50.00 $24.00 No Bid $25.00 $56.00

24 Dump Truck (15 - 20 CY) HR $100.00 $95.00 $225.00 $110.00 $100.00 No Bid $125.00 $150.00

25 Chain Saw/Debris Clearing Hand Equipment HR $40.00 $65.00 $10.00 $100.00 $30.00 No Bid No Bid $50.00

a Contractor's Representative(s) D. Steven Eakins, Jr. Shawn Cunningham Chase Rogers; Daniel Duke III Tom Uhrig William Cryer Nancy G. Rosso Ezra Saffold Jorge Lopez

b Telephone Number(s) 561.842.0001 561.723.5812 561.640.3503 561.471.4100 561.588.1170 561.588.6681 561.469.6513 786.723.6140

c Email Address(es) steve@dseakins.com shawn@flyingscotinc.com info@hinterlandgroup.com jwctom@jwcheatham.com ccryer@johnsondavis.com nancy@randdpaving.com ezra@saffoldpaving.com info@waypointci.com
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